

UPSET SALE

THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 22, 2022 AT 10AM

**LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM SALES
TAX CLAIM BUREAU
TAX SALES NOTICE**

TO ALL OWNERS* OF PROPERTY DESCRIBED IN THIS NOTICE AND ALL PERSONS HAVING LIENS, TAX JUDGMENTS OR MUNICIPAL CLAIMS AGAINST SUCH PROPERTIES:

NOTICE is hereby given by ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, as agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau, in and for the COUNTY OF LUZERNE under Sections 601-609 inclusive of the Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, that the Bureau will expose at public sale at the King's College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 N. Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania, at 10:00 A.M., on September 22, 2022 or any date to which the sale may be adjourned, readjusted or continued, for the purpose of collecting unpaid 2020 and any PRIOR REAL ESTATE TAXES, PRIOR LIENS, MUNICIPAL CLAIMS, and all costs hereto, the following described set forth. Please make reference to the Tax Parcel Number and Property Identification Number with all correspondence.

The sale of this property may, AT THE OPTION OF THE BUREAU, be stayed if the owner thereof or any lien creditor of the OWNER, before the date of the sale, enters into an agreement with the BUREAU to pay the TAXES, Claims and Costs in installments in the manner provided by said Act, and the agreement to be entered into. The Bureau is prohibited from entering into a new installment agreement to stay sale within three (3) years of any default on an agreement to stay sale. (Section 603).

These Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

THERE WILL BE NO REDEMPTION PERIOD AFTER THE DATE OF THE SALE.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the TAX CLAIM BUREAU is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the TAX CLAIM BUREAU without any guarantee or warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structure upon the land, the liens, title or any other matter or thing whatever. Elite Revenue, in accordance with the statute, made diligent and reasonable efforts to provide notice to the record owner. Lien holders were not notified and all properties are being sold subject to any existing liens.

It is repeated that there is no redemption after the property is sold and all sales will be final. No adjustments will be made after the property is struck down.

THE PROPERTY MAY BE REDEEMED from the Tax Sale by paying the delinquent taxes, fees, interest penalties and costs prior to the day of the public auction. The payments must be cash, cashier's check, money order or certified check. The right to redeem the property expires on September 22, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.

THERE IS NO RIGHT OF REDEMPTION ON THE DAY OF OR AFTER THE PUBLIC AUCTION. If no payment has been received prior to the time of the sale, the property will be sold on September 22, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.

Pursuant to 68 P.S. 2117(c)(3), properties in the following municipalities may be subject to a trump bid by North East Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority prior to public auction: Avoca Borough, Duryea Borough, Hughestown Borough, Jenkins Township, Pittston City, West Pittston Borough.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County**, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and
2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.
3. Prospective bidders must register prior to sale. **DUE TO NEW LEGISLATION PASSED ON JUNE 25, 2021 AND EFFECTIVE AUGUST 29, 2021, IN THE STATE OF PENNSYLVANIA, REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED IN PERSON AND NO LESS THAN TEN DAYS PRIOR TO EACH TAX SALE. THEREFORE, ALL REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED WITH THE BUREAU NO LATER THAN 4:00 PM ON SEPTEMBER 9, 2022.**
4. A successful bidder shall not tender a bad certified check or money order to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing property in the sale. If this should occur that bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and will be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney's Office for prosecution under Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A §4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.
5. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

PAYMENT BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER IS DUE THE DAY OF SALE AND SHALL BE MADE IN THE FORM OF CASH, CERTIFIED CHECK, OR MONEY ORDER. In the event that a successful bidder does not tender payment in full for any bid by 4:00 p.m. on September 22, 2022, the bid will be nullified and the bidder will not be permitted to bid at future tax sales conducted by the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau.

Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau or on-line at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. Click on Upset Sale and bidder's certification.

IMPORTANT: Right to surplus sale proceeds. If the property is not redeemed from public sale and you are the record owner, then you are entitled to sale proceeds which exceed taxes, interest, penalties, costs, Commonwealth Liens, Municipal Liens, Government Liens and Judgment Liens.

Interest accrues at the rate of 9% per year, at $\frac{3}{4}$ % each month effective February 1, of each year.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

The Scandlon Physical Education Center is a facility accessible to persons with disabilities. Please notify this Tax Claim Bureau if special accommodations are required. The Tax Claim Bureau can be contacted at (570) 825-1512 or by fax at (570) 820-6339, or by TDD (570) 825-1860.

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS AS TO WHAT YOU MUST DO PLEASE CONTACT THE TAX CLAIM BUREAU AT (570) 825-1512.

Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

- * "Owner," the person in whose name the property is last registered, if registered according to law, or, if not registered according to law, the person whose name last appears as an owner of record on any deed or instrument of conveyance recorded in the county office designated for recording, and in all other

cases means any person in open, peaceable and notorious possession of the property, as apparent owner or owners thereof, or the reputed owner or owners thereof, in the neighborhood of such property.

** The successful bidder is also certifying that they are not the owner of the property, as the owner has no right to purchase his own property pursuant to Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law. A change of name or business status shall not defeat the purpose of this section. For the purpose of this section, "owner" means any individual, partner, shareholder, trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association or any trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association that has any individual as part of the business association who had any ownership interest or rights in the property.

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
1	Sale #	Municipality	Parcel	Owner	Property Description	Upset Price	Results	Bidder #
2	22-0010	ASHLEY BORO WARD 1	01-I9SE4 -018-016-000	MORILLO DE CASTRO ROSA A	49 N MAIN ST	\$ 8,769.48	NO BID	
3	22-0001	ASHLEY BORO WARD 1	01-I9SE1 -001-017-000	STEELE DONALD & ARLENE	130 W HARTFORD ST	\$ 7,596.51	NO BID	
4	22-0023	ASHLEY BORO WARD 2	01-J9NE1 -T01-072-000	BODNAR GEOFFREY J &	72 ANDREW DR	\$ 1,682.09	SOLD - \$3,500	37
5	22-0015	ASHLEY BORO WARD 2	01-J9NE1 -003-023-000	COLBCO LLC	Route 00309	\$ 14,436.98	NO BID	
6	22-0030	ASHLEY BORO WARD 2	01-J9NE4 -003-048-000	COLBCO LLC	2300 ROUTE 309 HWY	\$ 360,912.86	NO BID	
7	22-0020	ASHLEY BORO WARD 2	01-J9NE1 -T01-049-000	WYLIE MARLENE	49 ANDREW DR	\$ 4,953.55	SOLD - \$4,953.55	37
8	22-0042	AVOCA BORO WARD 1	02-D12SE4-028-012-000	REED JAMES JR & CYNTHIA	611 THIRD ST	\$ 8,988.10	REMOVED	
9	22-0047	AVOCA BORO WARD 2	02-D12SE4-025-005-000	BARRERA LUIS &	417 GROVE ST	\$ 9,772.45	SOLD - \$11,000	49
10	22-0043	AVOCA BORO WARD 2	02-D12SE1-003-012-000	MILES MARGARET MARY	739 CHESTNUT ST	\$ 5,436.39	SOLD - \$5,436.39	151
11	22-0096	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-I11S2 -003-027-000	BRUM CARLOS T	OLD EAST END BLVD	\$ 4,102.02	NO BID	
12	22-0119	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-N12S2 -005-018-000	SANCHEZ JULIO	ASH LN	\$ 3,848.76	NO BID	
13	22-0077	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1 -007-003-000	ARAGOZA ADRIAN R	IROQUOIS CIR	\$ 3,297.52	NO BID	
14	22-0068	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U4S3 -008-10H-000	BROBST STEVEN & DIANE	BACK RD	\$ 8,280.55	SOLD - \$31,000	7
15	22-0069	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U4S3 -008-10I-000	BROBST STEVEN & DIANE	BACK RD	\$ 3,547.49	SOLD - \$3,547.49	7
16	22-0086	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S5 -005-163-000	CHHANTYAL YASHINA & TAM	163 YAZOO DR	\$ 4,431.71	NO BID	
17	22-0087	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S6 -002-191-000	SIALITSKI DZMITRY	191 DAKOTA DR	\$ 4,210.35	NO BID	
18	22-0080	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S2 -002-005-000	WILLE DETLEF E	248 W LAKE VALLEY DR	\$ 19,066.36	SOLD - \$26,000	82
19	22-0131	BUCK TWP	05-L15 -00A-009-000	GIUGLIANO CAMILLE & RALPH	143 B THORNHURST RD	\$ 17,839.13	SOLD - \$17,839.13	298
20	22-0156	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-Q8S3 -001-10B-000	GONZALEZ RODRIGUEZ ANGEL LUIS	JAMES LN	\$ 2,627.06	NO BID	
21	22-0162	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-R7S6 -001-010-000	LONGO-LOSAVICH MISTY ROSE	W FOOTHILLS DR	\$ 3,889.04	NO BID	
22	22-0135	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-P8S1 -001-630-000	SCOTT MARION AND ZILLA PERSAUD	191 LONG RUN RD	\$ 31,121.86	SOLD - \$147,000	7
23	22-0178	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S9 -008-002-000	BAYNUM PAUL P & LYNN F	9 EDGE ROCK DR	\$ 13,048.80	SOLD - \$38,000	60
24	22-0174	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S12 -006-023-000	DUNCAVAGE JOSEPH A & PAULINE	AVALANCHE LN	\$ 2,220.62	NO BID	
25	22-0175	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S12 -006-024-000	DUNCAVAGE JOSEPH A & PAULINE	SNOW VALLEY DR	\$ 2,447.04	NO BID	
26	22-0171	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8 -00A-09A-000	ZELAYA MANAGEMENT LLC	OFF BUTLER RD	\$ 9,158.44	NO BID	
27	22-0209	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M5S1 -002-003-000	FLOWERS THELMA	LILLY LAKE RD	\$ 3,159.62	NO BID	
28	22-0210	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M5S1 -006-002-000	FLOWERS THELMA	ORCHARD AVE	\$ 3,199.45	NO BID	
29	22-0211	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M5S2 -002-04A-000	MYERS FRANCIS EDGAR	LAKESHORE DR	\$ 2,352.25	SOLD - \$2,352.25	28
30	22-0202	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M4S1 -003-032-000	STINE DONALD L	7 COLUMBUS CIR	\$ 8,608.92	SOLD - \$8,608.92	7
31	22-0214	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-N5 -00A-008-000	TAMAZIGHT TEMPLE TRUST	CEMETARY RD	\$ 46,106.94	SOLD - \$50,000	262
32	22-0215	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-N5 -00A-08A-000	TAMAZIGHT TEMPLE TRUST	343 CEMETARY RD	\$ 42,642.04	SOLD - \$42,642.04	262
33	22-0278	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -001-13B-000	WOLFE ALLEN J & HOLTJE DIANNE E	34 FAWN DR	\$ 15,141.44	SOLD - \$80,000	301
34	22-0228	DALLAS TWP	10-C7S3 -009-015-000	COVERT JACK & ALICE ETAL	352 SECOND ST	\$ 12,573.17	NO BID	
35	22-0242	DALLAS TWP	10-C9 -T02-111-000	GALLUCCI PETER & CURRISSA	111 VALLEY VIEW TRAILER PARK	\$ 1,974.90	SOLD - \$1,974.90	90
36	22-0225	DALLAS TWP	10-C7 -T01-015-000	MUCHA TINA	15 COUNTRY PINE ESTATES	\$ 3,093.39	NO BID	
37	22-0248	DALLAS TWP	10-D8 -00A-23A-000	SHASKAS JOHN R JR & JENNIFER R	1351 LOWER DEMUNDS RD	\$ 30,600.84	SOLD - \$92,000	7
38	22-0223	DALLAS TWP	10-C7 -T01-004-000	SHULTZ DAVID	4 COUNTRY PINE EST	\$ 980.58	REMOVED - PAID	
39	22-0253	DALLAS TWP	10-D8S1 -008-021-000	SWITZER DUSTIN	Route 00309	\$ 5,974.01	NO BID	
40	22-0258	DALLAS TWP	10-D8S6 -001-032-000	SWITZER DUSTIN & JENNIFER	PHEASANT RUN DR	\$ 4,316.89	SOLD - \$4,316.89	14
41	22-0247	DALLAS TWP	10-D8 -00A-075-000	TINSLEY CALVIN J & SUE	101 UPPER DEMUNDS RD	\$ 15,290.07	NO BID	
42	22-0306	DENNISON TWP	13-O12S1 -006-006-000	MONAGHAN ROBERT L & IRENE C	9 SIXTH ST	\$ 9,938.82	NO BID	
43	22-0298	DENNISON TWP	13-N11 -00A-31B-000	SCHLEGEL DAVID & THERESA M	DIXON LN	\$ 12,894.90	SOLD - \$30,000	21
44	22-0348	DUPONT BORO	15-E12NE1-002-005-000	GORACZKA ANNETTE P	125 MAIN ST	\$ 7,805.94	SOLD - \$10,000	246
45	22-0353	DUPONT BORO	15-E12NE4-005-013-000	KUBIK BERTHA	214 CENTER ST	\$ 7,687.70	SOLD - \$29,000	215
46	22-0320	DURYEA BORO WARD 2	14-D12NW2-014-001-000	HERNANDEZ ROCIO D	201 PETTEBONE ST	\$ 5,931.52	SOLD - \$5,931.52	122
47	22-0326	DURYEA BORO WARD 3	14-D12NW3-021-020-000	HAWK JOSEPH J JR	NEW ST	\$ 2,299.37	NO BID	
48	22-0344	DURYEA BORO WARD 5	14-D12NE3-007-011-000	GORZKOWSKI BERNARD	715 YORK AVE	\$ 13,824.78	SOLD - \$13,824.78	7
49	22-0345	DURYEA BORO WARD 5	14-D12NE3-007-013-000	GORZKOWSKI BERNARD	711 YORK AVE	\$ 10,910.00	SOLD - \$10,910.00	7
50	22-0346	DURYEA BORO WARD 5	14-D12NE3-007-014-000	GORZKOWSKI WALTER	709 YORK AVE	\$ 15,880.53	REMOVED - PAID	
51	22-0451	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 3	18-G9S2 -012-049-000	MARTINEZ COLLADO HENRY THOMAS	99 SUMMIT ST	\$ 5,462.86	SOLD - \$26,000	7
52	22-0461	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 5	18-G9S1 -009-033-000	ALSTON BUNN TRACY A	786 MAIN ST	\$ 21,816.43	SOLD - \$42,000	219

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
53	22-0375	EXETER BORO WARD 2	16-E11NW3-009-030-000	LLOYD RUTH	75 PENN AVE	\$ 10,451.04	SOLD - \$19,000	7
54	22-0374	EXETER BORO WARD 2	16-E11NW3-008-030-000	SILIEKUS CHRISTOPHER	46 LINCOLN ST	\$ 13,157.74	SOLD - \$32,000	289
55	22-0398	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-293	A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC	288 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 1,883.27	NO BID	
56	22-0393	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-133	CUPANO RON	131 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 1,073.03	SOLD - \$1,073.03	299
57	22-0396	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-279	DEPROPO JOHN	292 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 2,450.43	SOLD - \$5,000	141
58	22-0400	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-342	DEZINSKI LARRY	300 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 1,599.58	NO BID	
59	22-0392	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-077	HUGHES PRIMO & TINA	269 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 1,696.99	SOLD - \$1,696.99	299
60	22-0404	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-192-000	JACKSON CHARLES WILLIAM	192 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$ 968.62	NO BID	
61	22-0382	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-D10 -T02-039-001	LKS ENTERPRISES LLC	39 MT LOOKOUT TRCT	\$ 2,279.10	NO BID	
62	22-0417	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E11SW1-012-11C-000	PISANO JAMES & FRANCES	1399 SUSQUEHANNA ST	\$ 7,817.87	REMOVED - PAID	
63	22-0426	EXETER TWP	17-B10S3 -002-001-000	HECK ALAN & JOYCE	SUTTON CREEK RD	\$ 2,773.92	SOLD - \$2,773.92	250
64	22-0427	EXETER TWP	17-B10S3 -002-003-000	HECK ALAN & JOYCE	SUTTON CREEK RD	\$ 2,095.07	SOLD - \$2,095.07	250
65	22-0428	EXETER TWP	17-B10S3 -002-004-000	HECK ALAN & JOYCE	SUTTON CREEK RD	\$ 2,164.11	SOLD - \$2,164.11	250
66	22-0438	EXETER TWP	17-C11S3 -002-025-000	HUDOCK DONNA L	PAULINE ST	\$ 1,528.27	NO BID	
67	22-0471	FAIRMOUNT TWP	19-F2 -00A-22F-000	DERBY DONALD & MAX W	830 STATE ROUTE 118	\$ 4,295.23	SOLD - \$12,500	7
68	22-0483	FAIRMOUNT TWP	19-I1 -00A-024-000	ESHLEMAN DUANE C & JANA J	55 SPENCERS RD	\$ 9,078.48	SOLD - \$26,000	7
69	22-0482	FAIRMOUNT TWP	19-H2 -00A-47F-000	HIGGINS LAWRENCE W	BURMA RD	\$ 9,742.91	NO BID	
70	22-0470	FAIRMOUNT TWP	19-F2 -00A-13C-000	PRESTIGE WORLDWIDE X LIMITED	568 STATE ROUTE 118	\$ 9,627.79	NO BID	
71	22-0498	FAIRVIEW TWP	20-L9S2 -007-005-000	HARCHARUFKA JOHN & ANNETTE	12 BROOK LN	\$ 21,446.59	NO BID	
72	22-0501	FORTY FORT BORO WARD 1	21-G10NW4-013-053-000	ELKO JOHN & FRANCES	164 WELLES ST	\$ 13,259.71	BIDDER FORFEIT	
73	22-0502	FORTY FORT BORO WARD 2	21-G9NE2 -006-040-000	JUDGE HEATHER	123 SLOCUM ST	\$ 18,654.55	SOLD - \$62,000	325
74	22-0543	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S1 -005-003-000	ALALI ZAID F	WOODHAVEN DR	\$ 1,243.22	SOLD - \$1,243.22	19
75	22-0550	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S6 -001-005-000	CARAMELLI HEATHER	24 VACATION DR	\$ 9,418.50	REMOVED - PAID	
76	22-0541	FOSTER TWP	23-Q10SW3-003-07A-000	COLLINGWOOD THOMAS R & JUDITH M	251 FOSTER AVE	\$ 8,313.55	SOLD - \$30,000	21
77	22-0576	FOSTER TWP	23-R9NE3 -009-014-000	CULL ROBERT T & ELAINE M	119 CENTER ST	\$ 3,058.68	SOLD - \$3,058.68	99
78	22-0538	FOSTER TWP	23-P11 -00A-005-000	MECKES THEODORE L SR & DAVID	OLEY VALLEY RD	\$ 7,964.64	SOLD - \$7,964.64	21
79	22-0546	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S4 -004-005-000	SEARFOSS KENNETH R SR & SHEILA M	115 S SHEAMAN RD	\$ 6,276.32	REMOVED - PAID	
80	22-0545	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S13-001-009-000	SMUCKER ELMER L & KATIE B	HILLARY DR	\$ 1,223.22	NO BID	
81	22-0585	FRANKLIN TWP	24-B9 -00A-40B-000	BURTON DEBORAH	305 VILLAGE RD	\$ 20,919.00	SOLD - \$53,000	7
82	22-0593	FRANKLIN TWP	24-D10S1 -001-02B-000	LULEWICZ LORI T	REAR BODLE RD	\$ 4,821.05	NO BID	
83	22-0594	FRANKLIN TWP	24-D10S1 -002-020-000	LULEWICZ LORI T	ADJ WM VOSBURG	\$ 2,614.12	NO BID	
84	22-0583	FRANKLIN TWP	24-B9 -00A-043-000	PILLAGA-VERDUGO GRUMILDA D	8TH ST	\$ 5,336.94	NO BID	
85	22-0586	FRANKLIN TWP	24-C9 -00A-028-000	STRAZDUS GREGORY MICHAEL & JOAN	1395 RANSOM RD	\$ 19,374.08	SOLD - \$19,374.08	7
86	22-0509	FREELAND BORO WARD 1	22-R9NE2 -012-04B-000	PGA INCORPORATED	ADJ PUBLIC RD	\$ 19,333.02	REMOVED - PAID	
87	22-0521	FREELAND BORO WARD 3	22-Q9SE4 -013-007-000	DOVAN JOAN & JOHN DOVAN	901 NORTH ST	\$ 8,986.93	SOLD - \$34,000	171
88	22-0531	FREELAND BORO WARD 5	22-R9NE2 -012-004-000	PGA INCORPORATED	SOUTH ST	\$ 113,749.24	NO BID	
89	22-0608	HANOVER TWP WARD 1	25-I8S1 -018-008-000	STYCZEN CHARLOTTE	9 MCCABE ST	\$ 14,145.94	SOLD - \$14,145.94	66
90	22-0623	HANOVER TWP WARD 2	25-I9SE1 -015-013-000	SAMSELSKI JAMES & PAULA	775 HAZLE ST	\$ 178,881.02	NO BID	
91	22-0628	HANOVER TWP WARD 2	25-K10 -00A-002-001	W B RADIO PAGING CO	PENOBSCOTT MTN	\$ 1,104.51	NO BID	
92	22-0644	HANOVER TWP WARD 4	25-I9NW3 -004-043-000	DOMESTIC LLC	37 BARR LN	\$ 4,277.39	SOLD - \$4,277.39	203
93	22-0634	HANOVER TWP WARD 4	25-I9NW1 -004-007-000	FERRI CAREY AVENUE LP	653 CAREY AVE	\$ 4,000.57	SOLD - \$4,000.57	21
94	22-0641	HANOVER TWP WARD 4	25-I9NW2 -003-019-000	THOMAS CHARLES J & CHERYL A	206 DIVISION ST	\$ 5,900.14	SOLD - \$15,500	238
95	22-0651	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-I8NE3 -002-014-000	FLYTE ROSEMARY	554 WILKES BARRE ST	\$ 14,923.78	SOLD - \$30,000	244
96	22-0660	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-I8S2 -011-004-000	FRITZ EDWARD H	13 PHILLIPS ST	\$ 4,349.56	NO BID	
97	22-0657	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-I8S2 -005-01A-000	WHITE DERRICK	385 REAR MAIN RD	\$ 4,725.59	NO BID	
98	22-0678	HANOVER TWP WARD 6	25-K8S2 -002-015-000	NORRIS JAMES	36 HOLLY ST	\$ 7,815.75	SOLD - \$17,500	7
99	22-0686	HANOVER TWP WARD 7	25-I9NW3 -013-017-000	KAIZEN RE CONSULTING GROUP LLC	65 OXFORD ST	\$ 14,043.35	SOLD - \$30,000	7
100	22-2889	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -003-005-000	CARTER MARK	TROLLEY HL	\$ 1,928.90	NO BID	
101	22-2890	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -003-007-000	CARTER MARK	49 TROLLEY HL	\$ 2,184.07	SOLD - \$2,184.07	115
102	22-2892	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -004-007-000	CARTER MARK	TROLLEY HL	\$ 1,495.01	NO BID	
103	22-2893	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -004-010-000	CARTER MARK	49 TROLLEY HL	\$ 2,164.07	SOLD - \$2,164.07	115
104	22-2894	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -004-011-000	CARTER MARK	TROLLEY HL	\$ 4,423.49	NO BID	
105	22-2891	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D6S5 -004-005-000	LAMBROS KONSTANTINOS J &	TROLLEY HL	\$ 2,087.73	NO BID	
106	22-0704	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-R9S1 -004-014-000	BLANYAR MICHAEL & TRUDY	2135 STATE ROUTE 940	\$ 9,329.34	SOLD - \$9,329.34	171

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
107	22-0699	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-R8S2 -002-005-000	DEANGELO RICHARD ETAL	390 PARDEESVILLE RD	\$ 7,688.32	SOLD - \$39,000	243
108	22-0728	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S6 -001-024-000	DIBRA BEQIR & KADRETE	MAIN ST	\$ 10,336.39	SOLD - \$30,000	7
109	22-0729	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S6 -001-23A-000	DIBRA BEQIR & KADRETE	MAIN ST	\$ 3,165.17	SOLD - \$3,165.17	7
110	22-0727	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S6 -001-002-000	LUCENO MICHELLE	3 MAIN ST	\$ 6,392.89	SOLD - \$6,392.89	7
111	22-0708	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-R9S2 -003-005-000	MORALES ROMMEL B	399 SCOTCH HILL RD	\$ 3,837.74	SOLD - \$5,000	82
112	22-0700	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-R8S2 -003-015-000	SUCCESS AUTOBODY LLC	REAR LOWER RD	\$ 1,780.50	NO BID	
113	22-0701	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-R8S2 -003-016-000	SUCCESS AUTOBODY LLC	PARDEESVILLE RD	\$ 1,620.50	NO BID	
114	22-0736	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S7 -001-018-000	WAZAR DEMETRIO &	69 MAIN ST	\$ 4,244.76	SOLD - \$4,244.76	114
115	22-0820	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-202-000	ALCALDE ROSALIE & ALLAN	BUTTONBUSH & WHITE OAK	\$ 3,831.50	NO BID	
116	22-0834	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-364-000	ANG ARTHUR J ANDIMEE T MIPA	WHITE OAK LANE	\$ 4,017.99	NO BID	
117	22-0819	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-195-000	BADILLO HENRY R AND RUTH	SWEET BIRCH LN	\$ 3,918.06	NO BID	
118	22-0818	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-194-000	BADILLO PATRICK H	SWEET BIRCH LN	\$ 3,831.50	NO BID	
119	22-0768	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-371-000	BARROQUILLO VERNA INES AND ZETCHE	SPRING MOUNTAIN RD	\$ 3,705.98	NO BID	
120	22-0757	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-479-000	BASAVA SANKARAIAH S &	ROCK CREST DRIVE	\$ 4,204.44	NO BID	
121	22-0890	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U8S3 -008-002-000	BEISHLINE HAROLD &	320 MAIN ST	\$ 3,906.88	SOLD - \$3,906.88	7
122	22-0891	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U8S3 -008-002-001	BEISHLINE HAROLD ETAL	320 MAIN ST	\$ 1,811.64	SOLD - \$1,811.64	7
123	22-0888	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U8S1 -006-003-000	BEISHLINE LEWIS P	188 MAIN ST	\$ 6,140.49	SOLD - \$17,500	33
124	22-0752	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-300-000	BERTEL JAMES R AND INGRID S MD	MOUNTAIN VIEW & NARROW	\$ 3,521.04	NO BID	
125	22-0800	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-111-000	BONILLA YOLANDA &	ELDERBERRY LN	\$ 5,875.63	NO BID	
126	22-0811	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12 -001-023-000	CAGUIAT JUANITO JR& IDANAN LILIA B	ELDERBERRY LN	\$ 5,944.29	NO BID	
127	22-0812	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12 -001-043-000	CARINO MICHAEL S & ELMA M	SPICEBUSH LN	\$ 3,691.56	NO BID	
128	22-0873	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S6 -007-003-000	CAROLAN MICHAEL & JOANNE	PEBBLE BEACH DR	\$ 5,979.86	NO BID	
129	22-0841	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-078-000	CASAS HENRY &	CRNR HUCKLEBERRY LN	\$ 4,011.36	NO BID	
130	22-0813	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-037-000	CASTILLO CORAZON C &	WHITE OAK LN	\$ 4,346.99	NO BID	
131	22-0848	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-544-000	CASTILLO KYLE JOSHUA & MARIFEL	SWEET BIRCH DR	\$ 3,641.74	NO BID	
132	22-0844	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-147-000	CASTOR MARLO	BLUE SPRUCE DR	\$ 3,831.50	NO BID	
133	22-0756	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-469-000	CHUAN GE CHUAN	ROCK CREST DRIVE	\$ 7,863.19	NO BID	
134	22-0830	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-176-000	CRUZ DAMARYS A AND ROMAN ANGEL A	MAPLE LN	\$ 4,111.20	NO BID	
135	22-0823	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-276-000	CRUZ WILMER E AND ELSA M	BUTTERNUT LANE	\$ 3,784.86	NO BID	
136	22-0817	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-133-000	DE LUNA EDWIN & GLADYS D	SYCAMORE LANE	\$ 4,306.99	NO BID	
137	22-0872	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S6 -003-011-000	DEAN PATRICK B	TURNBERRY LN	\$ 5,015.73	NO BID	
138	22-0764	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-079-000	DELA CRUZ MARIA ELIZABETH A	OFF STONEY MOUNTAIN DR	\$ 3,918.06	NO BID	
139	22-0795	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-015-000	DIONISIO SONNY	MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR	\$ 2,102.64	NO BID	
140	22-0859	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -010-027-000	DOROTAN VINCENT & MIA	GLEN EAGLES DR	\$ 2,921.88	NO BID	
141	22-0846	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-363-000	ENRIQUEZ CARLA S AND ERWIN BRIAN G	HONEYSUCKLE DRIVE	\$ 3,551.69	NO BID	
142	22-0808	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -014-447-000	FINDORLANDOCONDO LLC	LAUREL VLY	\$ 3,812.27	NO BID	
143	22-0855	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S3 -001-008-000	FLT PROPERTIES LLC	E LAKE VALLEY DR	\$ 2,370.01	NO BID	
144	22-0850	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -003-006-000	GARCIA FLORIDAD	16 JANHANNA CIR	\$ 3,057.49	NO BID	
145	22-0760	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-580-000	GEREDDY VIBHEESHAN REDDY	CATAWISSA LN	\$ 6,852.68	NO BID	
146	22-0858	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -006-003-000	GORDONCILLO JULIET	PINE VALLEY DR	\$ 3,430.51	NO BID	
147	22-0836	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-453-000	INGRAM VIRGINIA W	MAPLE LN	\$ 4,017.99	NO BID	
148	22-0797	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-036-000	JARANILLA ADRIAN P AND ELAINE P	MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR	\$ 5,435.32	NO BID	
149	22-0870	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -011-026-000	JASMIN JEMMUEL V & NEVERLY T	LOT 366 EH INVERNESS LN	\$ 3,626.26	NO BID	
150	22-0753	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-360-000	KABUE NATHAN N & MARK M	ROCK CREST DRIVE	\$ 4,337.70	NO BID	
151	22-0863	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -007-004-000	KEAVENEY KIERAN B	TURNBERRY LN	\$ 3,030.85	NO BID	
152	22-0802	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -003-162-000	LACORTE MICHAEL	LAUREL VALLEY DR	\$ 3,559.61	NO BID	
153	22-0826	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-360-000	LEBO IRWIN P & LAURETTE A	LOT 360 THE VISTAS	\$ 4,057.99	NO BID	
154	22-0761	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-623-000	LIU MEI &	APPALACHIAN WAY	\$ 2,678.41	NO BID	
155	22-0803	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -003-253-000	MALLORY PATRICK D AND TERESE M	LAUREL VALLEY DR	\$ 3,644.98	NO BID	
156	22-0860	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -011-006-000	MATTA JOHN M & MARY ANN	GREENBRIAR LN	\$ 4,036.58	NO BID	
157	22-0842	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-094-000	MERIDA LOIDA V & JULIO JONATHAN F	SYCAMORE LANE	\$ 3,944.71	NO BID	
158	22-0799	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-090-000	MWAURA MUROKI & GATHUKU BEDAD K	ELDERBERRY LN	\$ 6,489.05	NO BID	
159	22-0765	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-161-000	NAVARRA GLEN		\$ 3,421.17	NO BID	
160	22-0862	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -003-022-000	NICHOLS JOHN E	CROOKED STICK LN	\$ 3,010.09	NO BID	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
161	22-0892	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U9S1A -004-009-000	NOVATNAK ROSE LEE & ETAL	BOX 132	\$ 6,216.56	SOLD - \$6,216.56	7
162	22-0801	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-135-000	ORTIZ CARLOS & MARIA VICTORIA	ELDERBERRY LN	\$ 4,810.57	NO BID	
163	22-0828	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-117-000	PARAS EFREN C JR	HUCKLEBERRY LN	\$ 4,084.62	NO BID	
164	22-0809	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -015-432-000	PEREZ LEONORA	LAUREL VALLEY DR	\$ 3,980.71	NO BID	
165	22-0875	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7 -003-005-000	PEREZ NANCY	QUAPAW DR	\$ 3,683.86	NO BID	
166	22-0838	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-500-000	PLANCHE SULEIDY MILANES	WHITE OAK LN	\$ 3,878.06	NO BID	
167	22-0769	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-375-000	PLATON ANDREA JESUSA		\$ 3,831.50	NO BID	
168	22-0762	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-017-000	RAMIRO NAPOLEON AND MARY JANE R		\$ 2,868.32	NO BID	
169	22-0861	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -011-015-000	RESPONTE MARITES AVISADO	MERION DR	\$ 4,056.58	NO BID	
170	22-0832	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-278-000	REYNA ANGEL D & ALITA G	CAMELLIA LN	\$ 5,426.04	NO BID	
171	22-0833	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-294-000	RIOS VENUS & RAFAEL	MAPLE LN	\$ 3,971.36	NO BID	
172	22-0798	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-068-000	ROSS HAROLD CHARLES JR	WILD PLUM WAY	\$ 7,458.81	NO BID	
173	22-0814	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-040-000	SANTOS CARMELYNNE AND JOHN PATRICK	WHITE OAK LN	\$ 2,523.80	NO BID	
174	22-0810	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S11 -001-017-000	SHENG SHENG	W PEBBLE BEACH DR	\$ 3,222.73	NO BID	
175	22-0864	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -007-035-000	SHIN SAMUEL K & CHO K	PINE VALLEY LN	\$ 3,299.99	NO BID	
176	22-0804	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -007-319-000	SORIO ORLEAN L & APOLINARIO D	LAUREL VLY	\$ 3,758.26	NO BID	
177	22-0851	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -003-022-000	STOWE NAOMI S &	JANHANNA CIR	\$ 2,862.99	NO BID	
178	22-0849	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-571-000	SWEENEY TIMOTHY E II AND VALERIE L	BLUE SPRUCE DRIVE	\$ 3,924.71	NO BID	
179	22-0821	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-203-000	TOLENTINO MARICAR & MARCELO B JR	BUTTONBUSH LN	\$ 3,831.50	NO BID	
180	22-0869	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -011-005-000	UY CYRIA ANTHONY &	LOT 403 EH TURNBERRY LN	\$ 3,629.04	NO BID	
181	22-0766	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-174-000	VALERIANO VALERIE V AND MARILOU V		\$ 3,579.61	NO BID	
182	22-0763	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-066-000	VILLAREAL ANTHONY G AND JOHANNA		\$ 3,617.01	NO BID	
183	22-0829	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-121-000	VO JONATHAN	SYCAMORE LN	\$ 4,384.34	NO BID	
184	22-2110	HAZLETON CITY WARD 4	71-T8SW34-022-007-000	EHRENBERG CHARLES	117 REAR S CEDAR ST	\$ 4,236.58	SOLD - \$5,500	99
185	22-2115	HAZLETON CITY WARD 4	71-U8NW21-020-01C-000	PLEBAN ANTHONY J	210 E NOBLE ST	\$ 10,064.82	REMOVED - PAID	
186	22-2131	HAZLETON CITY WARD 5	71-U8NW44-001-189-000	DEMSHICK JOHN & DEBORAH	189 BIRCH KNOLL DR	\$ 6,210.97	SOLD - \$15,500	127
187	22-2130	HAZLETON CITY WARD 5	71-U8NW44-001-129-001	LORA FANNY & CARLOS &	129 S PINE TREE RD	\$ 1,306.61	SOLD - \$10,500	111
188	22-2143	HAZLETON CITY WARD 7	71-T8SW24-017-007-000	IGLESIA EVANGELICA CONGREGACIONAL	REAR N LAUREL ST	\$ 1,470.62	SOLD - \$4,000	82
189	22-2133	HAZLETON CITY WARD 7	71-T8SW13-006-01B-000	REIMILLER BARBARA	98 N LEE CT	\$ 6,828.47	SOLD - \$19,500	7
190	22-2148	HAZLETON CITY WARD 8	71-T8SW14-006-02A-000	PAYANO MANUEL	447 REAR W BROAD ST	\$ 6,047.07	SOLD - \$22,000	7
191	22-2187	HAZLETON CITY WARD 11	71-T8SW12-012-04A-000	GUTIC HALIJL	546 N LOCUST ST	\$ 5,739.88	SOLD - \$56,000	52
192	22-2186	HAZLETON CITY WARD 11	71-T8SW11-017-003-000	ZELENACK RAYMOND D JR	816 W THIRD ST	\$ 40,302.02	NO BID	
193	22-2200	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7SE22-004-25A-000	CHIRICO JOHN	566 BRANCH CT	\$ 8,368.07	SOLD - \$59,000	313
194	22-2189	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7NE22-003-006-000	LOPEZ JORGE F	1008 PEACE ST	\$ 11,906.07	SOLD - \$55,000	314
195	22-2198	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7NE33-013-016-000	SHENOSKY AGNES	719 ROOSEVELT ST	\$ 15,908.44	SOLD - \$43,000	52
196	22-2249	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW34-006-005-000	GANTEA IOSIF	566 SEYBERT ST	\$ 10,259.89	SOLD - \$14,500	313
197	22-2246	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW33-002-01A-000	GANTEA IOSIF	316 E FIFTH ST	\$ 9,718.15	SOLD - \$25,000	171
198	22-2247	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW33-002-01B-000	GANTEA IOSIF	314 E FIFTH ST	\$ 9,399.49	SOLD - \$24,000	111
199	22-2236	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW13-003-02A-000	UMBRICA FRANK	N LAUREL ST	\$ 1,565.07	NO BID	
200	22-2240	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW31-011-010-000	ZELENACK RAYMOND D JR	693 REAR CARSON ST	\$ 32,435.12	NO BID	
201	22-2275	HAZLETON CITY WARD 14	71-T8NW34-009-002-000	SAINT JOSEPH CORP	105 E DIAMOND AVE	\$ 4,990.15	SOLD - \$46,000	253
202	22-2271	HAZLETON CITY WARD 14	71-T8NW33-017-10A-000	VILLA GRETTY D	221 E DIAMOND AVE	\$ 3,133.71	SOLD - \$26,000	313
203	22-2281	HAZLETON CITY WARD 15	71-U8NW24-004-015-000	STULB PAUL M & PATRICIA M	E SAMUELS AVE	\$ 2,019.31	SOLD - \$2,019.31	224
204	22-0900	HOLLENBACK TWP	27-O5 -00A-20A-000	KRZYWICKI JOSEPH & MARY	HORSESHOE MOUNTAIN RD	\$ 5,270.17	SOLD - \$5,270.17	149
205	22-0902	HOLLENBACK TWP	27-P5 -00A-01H-000	TRAPANE BENJAMIN S	2 EAGLE RIDGE LN	\$ 9,449.08	SOLD - \$29,000	21
206	22-0946	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J5 -00A-014-000	BAER WILLIAM E & BARBARA J UX	225 CRAGLE HILL RD	\$ 11,691.81	SOLD - \$11,691.81	7
207	22-0939	HUNLOCK TWP	29-I4S1 -004-006-000	TOMKO JOSEPH & HELEN	PARK RIDGE DR	\$ 1,614.09	SOLD - \$1,614.09	263
208	22-0938	HUNLOCK TWP	29-I4S1 -004-005-000	TOMKO JOSEPH V & HELEN F	PARK RIDGE DR	\$ 1,614.09	SOLD - \$2,500	263
209	22-0969	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-J1S1 -001-001-000	EDSON LAURIE	OLD TIOGA TPKE	\$ 6,642.65	SOLD - \$16,500	7
210	22-0979	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-L2 -00A-002-000	LARSEN VAUGHN	746 CHERRY HILL RD	\$ 5,747.13	SOLD - \$5,747.13	266
211	22-0981	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-L2S1 -002-005-000	LARSEN VAUGHN	DODSON CEMETARY RD	\$ 3,027.36	SOLD - \$3,027.36	266
212	22-0971	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-J2 -00A-041-000	MIDDAUGH ZACHERY & ROBYN	BETHEL HILL RD	\$ 4,961.74	NO BID	
213	22-0994	JACKSON TWP	31-H7S2 -001-002-000	ENGLEHART DARLA	3083 ROUTE 29 HWY	\$ 7,958.33	REMOVED - ON AGREEMENT	
214	22-1028	JENKINS TWP	33-F11S1 -010-007-000	EMERPUS LYFE LLC	24 MARKET ST	\$ 2,990.22	SOLD - \$2,990.22	300

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
215	22-1033	JENKINS TWP	33-F12 -001-13B-000	KOCH JOSEPH M	WESTMINISTER RD	\$ 7,985.78	NO BID	
216	22-1015	JENKINS TWP	33-F11 -T01-267-000	MILLER KENNETH	267 HEATHER HIGHLANDS	\$ 2,632.37	NO BID	
217	22-1006	JENKINS TWP	33-E11S2 -001-015-000	MONTUO TITO JR	21 GAUGHAN ST	\$ 8,979.92	SOLD - \$23,000	197
218	22-1066	KINGSTON BORO WARD 5	34-G9SE2 -013-021-000	SCHOOLEY MATTHEW F & JOAN P	574 CHARLES ST	\$ 24,415.93	REMOVED - PAID	
219	22-1100	KINGSTON BORO WARD 7	34-H9NE2 -010-02A-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	65 THIRD AVE	\$ 137,784.44	NO BID	
220	22-1123	KINGSTON TWP	35-E9 -00A-009-504	BLACKWELL REBECCA	504 HUMMINGBIRD DR	\$ 7,445.69	NO BID	
221	22-1135	KINGSTON TWP	35-F9S5 -003-005-000	RUTKIN EDWARD & JEAN	239 MAPLE ST	\$ 10,993.11	SOLD - \$42,000	161
222	22-1131	KINGSTON TWP	35-E9S4 -002-VAR-000	TAMANINI JR ALFRED ETAL	ALFRED RD	\$ 4,092.58	SOLD - \$4,092.58	100
223	22-1140	LAFLIN BORO	36-F11S8 -06A-16B-000	SEBIA ROBERT & MARGARET	REAR CHESTNUTWOOD DR	\$ 4,311.86	NO BID	
224	22-1143	LAKE TWP	37-D6 -00A-022-000	US BANK NATIONAL ASSOC	605 LEHMAN OUTLET RD	\$ 30,631.93	NO BID	
225	22-1145	LAKE TWP	37-E5 -00A-032-000	VOSBURG CHRISTOPHER BRIAN	ROUTE 29 HWY	\$ 1,616.39	SOLD - \$1,616.39	263
226	22-1154	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1	38-H8S1 -007-02A-000	LEE TONYA MARIE	EVANS ST	\$ 1,794.62	NO BID	
227	22-1163	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 2	38-H8S3 -T01-037-000	STEPHANSKI KARL	37 MIDTOWN VLG	\$ 1,608.95	SOLD - \$1,608.95	75
228	22-1164	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 3	38-H8S1 -002-007-000	KOSTY NICHOLAS & HELEN	MCDONALD ST	\$ 3,049.49	NO BID	
229	22-1226	LAUREL RUN BORO	39-I11 -00A-004-000	LEE DRAKE & IVY PER GUARDIANS	1 RD	\$ 1,129.58	SOLD - \$ 1,129.58	176
230	22-1248	LUZERNE BORO WARD 1	41-G9NE3 -005-008-000	GEORGE RODNEY H	58 RYMAN ST	\$ 9,317.95	SOLD - \$13,000	252
231	22-1250	LUZERNE BORO WARD 1	41-G9NE3 -005-08A-000	GEORGE RODNEY H	56 RYMAN ST	\$ 9,228.97	SOLD - \$16,000	252
232	22-1258	LUZERNE BORO WARD 4	41-F9SE4 -017-005-000	MCDADE BARBARA	863 NORTH ST	\$ 7,592.42	SOLD - \$28,000	244
233	22-1270	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1	42-J7NE4 -002-011-000	ROBERTS LISA	29 LOOMIS ST	\$ 14,729.52	NO BID	
234	22-1281	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 2	42-J7NW3 -011-007-000	GAJEWSKI MARY ETAL`	65 HILL ST	\$ 5,666.40	SOLD - \$24,000	76
235	22-1279	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 2	42-J7 -00A-15E-000	WEISS RONALD	MAIN ST	\$ 1,853.35	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
236	22-1296	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 5	42-J7NE4 -004-023-000	KELMER DIANE A & CHARLES G	406 E NOBLE ST	\$ 9,497.35	SOLD - \$9,497.35	273
237	22-1317	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8	42-K7S1 -012-030-000	SAMSELSKI JAMES J & PAULA D	138 ESPY ST	\$ 29,498.33	NO BID	
238	22-1321	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8	42-K7S1 -018-05A-000	THOMAS WAYNE	R SENACE DRIVE	\$ 1,666.92	NO BID	
239	22-1334	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9	42-J7SE2 -014-010-000	CASTERLINE JEANETTE	12 KING CT	\$ 10,821.76	SOLD - \$62,000	7
240	22-1324	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9	42-J7SE1 -023-001-000	EVANS DUANE J	201 E GRAND ST	\$ 12,653.95	SOLD - \$30,000	7
241	22-1333	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9	42-J7SE2 -014-006-000	MALEC JOHN J ETAL	4 KING CT	\$ 48,132.55	BIDDER FORFEIT	
242	22-1330	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9	42-J7SE2 -005-007-000	MINERSVILLE LLC	415 E GROVE ST	\$ 10,339.41	SOLD - \$25,000	153
243	22-1341	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10	42-J7SE1 -029-030-000	SAMSELSKI JAMES J & PAULA D	347 S HANOVER ST	\$ 90,489.35	NO BID	
244	22-1361	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-J7SW3 -001-014-000	WEISS RONALD	6 W MAIN ST	\$ 1,456.28	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
245	22-1369	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12	42-J7SE4 -008-021-000	RHPA HOLDINGS LLC	1213 S HANOVER ST	\$ 11,075.10	SOLD - \$25,000	330
246	22-1379	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 13	42-J7SE4 -018-12A-000	BOYLE FRANCIS & RUBY	1009 S MARKET ST	\$ 5,029.54	SOLD - \$28,000	204
247	22-1387	NESCOPECK BORO	43-P3SW3 -008-021-000	SHAFFER MINERVA J	106 CHESTNUT ST	\$ 3,395.14	REMOVED - COURT ORDER	
248	22-1407	NEWPORT TWP WARD 1	46-K6S3 -03A-001-000	MINERSVILLE LLC	598 NEWPORT ST	\$ 10,835.60	SOLD - \$13,000	7
249	22-1408	NEWPORT TWP WARD 1	46-K6S3 -03A-01B-000	MINERSVILLE LLC	594 NEWPORT ST	\$ 15,722.70	SOLD - \$15,722.70	7
250	22-1431	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -005-002-000	BOVA PASQUALE & MELISSA	5 ARCH ST	\$ 9,944.39	NO BID	
251	22-1438	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -011-012-000	DINOME PATRICK A	106 NEWPORT ST	\$ 9,573.84	SOLD - \$15,500	97
252	22-1447	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -020-017-000	HOOVER MAXINE A	67 1/2 MAPLE ST	\$ 6,872.26	NO BID	
253	22-1444	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -019-017-000	LEE LAWRENCE & VIKTORIIA EVSTAFIEVA	48 NEWPORT ST	\$ 3,300.53	NO BID	
254	22-1451	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -025-010-000	MAJESTIC TELCOM VOIP GROUP LLC	69 71 W MAIN ST	\$ 21,762.09	NO BID	
255	22-1439	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -013-013-000	MAUL MICHAEL	128 W MAIN ST	\$ 7,389.27	NO BID	
256	22-2295	PITTSTON CITY WARD 2	72-D11SE3-003-025-000	CLISHAM ANN M & GERALD T	19 NEW ST	\$ 7,579.06	SOLD - \$13,500	237
257	22-2304	PITTSTON CITY WARD 4	72-E11NE2-021-026-000	GRABOSKY THOMAS	24 WOOD ST	\$ 13,173.82	SOLD - \$29,000	270
258	22-2322	PITTSTON CITY WARD 6	72-E11NE3-028-022-000	CIRIACO LISSETT M	56 1/2 BUTLER ST	\$ 7,377.76	SOLD - \$22,000	196
259	22-2326	PITTSTON CITY WARD 6	72-E11SE2-017-014-000	GILLIS CHRISTOPHER S	239 BROAD ST	\$ 10,746.54	NO BID	
260	22-2327	PITTSTON CITY WARD 6	72-E11SE2-017-015-000	GILLIS CHRISTOPHER S	241 BROAD ST	\$ 11,446.92	NO BID	
261	22-2318	PITTSTON CITY WARD 6	72-E11NE3-003-011-000	HODAKOWSKI ANN MARIE ESTATE	77 MILL ST	\$ 17,120.04	SOLD - \$36,000	325
262	22-2335	PITTSTON CITY WARD 10	72-E11SE1-044-005-000	GARAVITO JOSE	19 E OAK ST	\$ 3,294.01	NO BID	
263	22-2351	PITTSTON CITY WARD 10	72-E11SE4-008-13B-000	HAWK JOSEPH J JR	TEDRICK ST	\$ 2,517.83	NO BID	
264	22-2347	PITTSTON CITY WARD 10	72-E11SE2-025-006-000	SIMS MICHAEL T	97 PINE ST	\$ 12,739.84	SOLD - \$30,000	325
265	22-2350	PITTSTON CITY WARD 10	72-E11SE4-006-001-000	SMIGIEL JOSEPH E & SHARON	8 STOUT ST	\$ 10,228.40	SOLD - \$13,500	49
266	22-2369	PITTSTON CITY WARD 11	72-E11SE1-051-04A-000	BROWNE ROMIO K	120 TOMPKINS ST	\$ 8,623.90	SOLD - \$22,000	210
267	22-2367	PITTSTON CITY WARD 11	72-E11SE1-049-014-000	MENICHINI ANGELO R	152 JOHNSON ST	\$ 9,102.84	SOLD - \$27,000	22
268	22-2360	PITTSTON CITY WARD 11	72-E11SE1-023-05E-000	SPRINKLES & SHAKES ICE CREAM INC	GARFIELD ST	\$ 8,506.32	NO BID	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
269	22-1703	PITTSTON TWP	51-E13 -00A-04N-000	KEENE INC.	COMMERCE RD RD	\$ 125,158.54	NO BID	
270	22-1699	PITTSTON TWP	51-E12SW1-009-004-000	PISANO PAT &	615 WILLIAM ST	\$ 13,592.70	SOLD - \$47,000	7
271	22-1702	PITTSTON TWP	51-E13 -00A-009-000	VOSBURG ALBERT ETAL	LANGAN RD	\$ 2,431.78	SOLD - \$10,000	7
272	22-1632	PLAINS TWP WARD 2	50-G10NE4-014-013-000	HOFFMANN EDWARD B	CENTER DRIVE	\$ 3,076.07	NO BID	
273	22-1647	PLAINS TWP WARD 5	50-G10NE1-011-010-000	CIOLEK ISABELL & JOSEPH	31 HANCOCK ST	\$ 2,321.45	BIDDER FORFEIT	
274	22-1650	PLAINS TWP WARD 5	50-G10NE4-018-008-000	KEMPKA HELEN P	58 ST JAMES ST	\$ 7,107.98	REMOVED - COURT ORDER	
275	22-1648	PLAINS TWP WARD 5	50-G10NE1-016-006-000	RUBINO FRANK	11 BURKE ST	\$ 4,206.34	SOLD - \$32,000	325
276	22-1681	PLAINS TWP WARD 10	50-H11S2 -001-003-000	MANTUSH BETTY JO & LORI	LITCHEY DR	\$ 1,812.17	NO BID	
277	22-1682	PLAINS TWP WARD 10	50-H11S2 -001-004-000	MANTUSH PATRICK L & BETTY JO	38 LITCHEY DR	\$ 3,176.65	NO BID	
278	22-1504	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3	48-H8SE3 -001-002-000	WATKINS DAVID &	219 WILLOW ST	\$ 5,915.65	SOLD - \$16,000	7
279	22-1527	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 7	48-H8SW3 -012-027-000	SPIERS WILLIAM	145 BLAIR ST	\$ 10,494.44	SOLD - \$10,494.44	7
280	22-1545	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 8	48-I8NW3 -001-011-000	PEPE CHRISTOPHER	126 MRAS ST	\$ 11,879.65	SOLD - \$17,000	7
281	22-1548	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9	48-H8SE4 -004-007-000	GARCIA WILSON	210 212 CENTER ST	\$ 9,849.10	SOLD - \$13,500	7
282	22-1551	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 10	48-H8SE4 -025-005-000	AMELLER GEORGE	48 E MAIN ST	\$ 6,799.65	SOLD - \$6,799.65	151
283	22-1568	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12	48-H8SW3 -027-032-000	ORMES JAMES	174 NOTTINGHAM ST	\$ 6,591.44	SOLD - \$14,500	7
284	22-1572	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13	48-H8SW3 -001-006-000	LOPER MARGARETMARY	DENNIS LANE LN	\$ 1,958.25	NO BID	
285	22-1573	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13	48-H8SW3 -001-008-000	LOPER MARGARETMARY	264 TEMPERANCE HL	\$ 5,281.21	NO BID	
286	22-1574	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13	48-H8SW3 -001-009-000	LOPER MARGARETMARY	TEMPERANCE HILL ROAD RD	\$ 1,645.23	SOLD - \$1,645.23	114
287	22-1615	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1 -003-008-000	APONTI JAMES	55 DRISCOLL ST	\$ 5,534.15	NO BID	
288	22-1596	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S2 -012-09A-000	ENGLEHART RICHARD LEE	REAR 42 E POPLAR ST	\$ 1,392.90	SOLD - \$1,392.90	7
289	22-1617	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1 -006-003-000	HARWOOD WALTER C/O MILDRED HOYNOWSK	1016 DEHAVEN ST	\$ 1,718.49	NO BID	
290	22-1591	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S2 -001-002-000	MARTINEZ ARACELA	W POPLAR ST	\$ 4,930.63	NO BID	
291	22-1580	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-H8 -00A-005-000	SIMON CASPER JOHN	MOUNTAIN RD	\$ 3,295.65	NO BID	
292	22-1620	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1A -014-017-000	SZORTYKA STANLEY & PAULO	MILTON AVE	\$ 1,647.73	NO BID	
293	22-1612	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S7 -001-016-000	TRAHER LYNN D & BONNIE G	22 N MILL ST	\$ 6,703.35	SOLD - \$11,500	203
294	22-1613	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S7 -002-012-000	TRAHER LYNN D & BONNIE G	21 N MILL ST	\$ 3,713.44	NO BID	
295	22-1602	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S3 -02A-005-000	TROTH WILLIAM B IV	175 HARVEY ST	\$ 3,757.13	SOLD - \$3,757.13	148
296	22-1730	RICE TWP	53-M8 -T01-110-001	KANIA JOHN	110 VALLEY STREAM MHP	\$ 5,024.95	NO BID	
297	22-1723	RICE TWP	53-M8 -00A-11E-065	WALLACE GEORGE	92 VALLEY STREAM PARK	\$ 1,751.42	NO BID	
298	22-1750	ROSS TWP	54-H4 -00A-23K-000	TRONSUE WAYNE A & RHONDA S	SKURAT RD	\$ 3,274.53	NO BID	
299	22-1796	SALEM TWP	55-P4S1 -003-013-000	DOMESTIC LLC	164 MAIN ST	\$ 4,419.83	NO BID	
300	22-1766	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-016-000	TUBBS JAMES	70 SLEEPY HOLLOW TR PK	\$ 1,533.26	NO BID	
301	22-1767	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-021-000	TUBBS JILL	51 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT	\$ 2,303.23	NO BID	
302	22-1762	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-001-000	TUBBS JUNE	1 SLEEPY HOLLOW TR PK	\$ 1,270.10	NO BID	
303	22-1768	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-025-000	TUBBS JUNE	25 SLEEPY HOLLOW TR PK	\$ 1,270.10	NO BID	
304	22-1801	SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1	56-L4SE1 -018-008-000	DEMARIS JENNIFER MARIE	19 CONYNGHAM ST	\$ 6,463.50	NO BID	
305	22-1799	SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1	56-L4NE4 -001-14A-000	MCGAY GRAIG SCOT	172 CHESTNUT ST	\$ 2,756.19	NO BID	
306	22-1815	SLOCUM TWP	57-M7S1 -003-001-000	DAUBERT SHIRLEY	1001 BLUE RIDGE TRL	\$ 7,454.99	SOLD - \$17,000	7
307	22-1816	SLOCUM TWP	57-M7S1 -003-011-000	DAUBERT SHIRLEY	BLUE RIDGE TRL	\$ 2,540.30	SOLD - \$2,540.30	7
308	22-1813	SLOCUM TWP	57-L7S5 -002-008-000	VANFOSSEN ERIC A	181 B LILLY LAKE RD	\$ 8,802.67	SOLD - \$8,802.67	244
309	22-1814	SLOCUM TWP	57-L7S5 -002-009-000	VANFOSSEN ERIC A	LILLY LAKE RD	\$ 4,595.22	SOLD - \$4,595.22	244
310	22-1820	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-Q6 -00A-005-000	BUCHMAN GENEVIEVE	BUCHANAN LN	\$ 2,474.83	NO BID	
311	22-1846	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-T5S1 -002-06A-000	COXE JOHN P & HEINTZELMAN SAMANTHA	43 SECOND ST	\$ 4,661.05	NO BID	
312	22-1817	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-Q5 -00A-20J-000	REIMILLER AARON & NANCY	CHASE LN	\$ 3,205.67	NO BID	
313	22-1818	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-Q5 -00A-20Q-000	WILLIAMS SHELDON & ELDA	OAK RD	\$ 2,920.34	NO BID	
314	22-1852	SWOYERSVILLE WARD 1	59-F10NW3-010-07A-000	CROFCHICK REALTY LLC	90 OWEN ST	\$ 49,723.52	NO BID	
315	22-1872	SWOYERSVILLE WARD 3	59-F9SE3 -010-013-000	NUTCHE JOHN & HELEN	330 TENER ST	\$ 4,392.76	SOLD - \$26,000	108
316	22-1902	WARRIOR RUN BORO	62-J8SE4 -003-013-000	LEIPHART JASON J	537 FRONT ST	\$ 7,630.03	NO BID	
317	22-1933	WEST HAZLETON WARD 3	63-T7SE2 -014-01C-000	QUINN KELLI	135 REAR W CRANBERRY ST	\$ 27,759.02	SOLD - \$27,759.02	7
318	22-1969	WEST PITTSTON WARD 1	65-D11SW3-002-008-000	DACS GROUP LLC	718 LUZERNE AVE	\$ 20,809.10	SOLD - \$20,809.10	19
319	22-1967	WEST PITTSTON WARD 1	65-D11SE4-01A-008-000	P G ENERGY	SUSQUEHANNA AVE	\$ 3,080.00	NO BID	
320	22-1968	WEST PITTSTON WARD 1	65-D11SE4-01A-009-000	P G ENERGY	SUSQUEHANNA AVE	\$ 3,100.00	NO BID	
321	22-1981	WEST PITTSTON WARD 2	65-E11NW2-012-003-000	LEWIS RICHARD & MARIE	TUNKHANNOCK AVE	\$ 3,905.04	SOLD - \$10,500	325
322	22-1982	WEST PITTSTON WARD 2	65-E11NW2-012-005-000	LEWIS RICHARD & MARIE	531 DELAWARE AVE	\$ 15,735.01	SOLD - \$52,000	237

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
323	22-2020	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-018-001-000	CONRAD FAMILY IRREVOCABLE TRUST	125 CHURCH ST	\$ 23,572.32	REMOVED - ON AGREEMENT	
324	22-2021	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-018-002-000	CONRAD FAMILY IRREVOCABLE TRUST	SUSQUEHANNA ST	\$ 4,080.17	REMOVED - ON AGREEMENT	
325	22-2022	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-018-003-000	CONRAD FAMILY IRREVOCABLE TRUST	SUSQUEHANNA ST	\$ 2,296.46	NO BID	
326	22-2019	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-016-002-000	PGA INCORPORATED	CHURCH ST	\$ 36,171.55	REMOVED - PAID	
327	22-2029	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 2	68-P12NW4-007-008-000	O CONNELL DENNIS	ERIE ST	\$ 2,393.59	SOLD - \$2,393.59	21
328	22-2030	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-H10S1 -002-012-000	ADAMS AVE INC	MUNDY ST	\$ 3,056.39	NO BID	
329	22-2071	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-I9SE2 -005-005-000	COSME ELIZABETH	83 NICHOLSON ST	\$ 3,188.87	NO BID	
330	22-2063	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-I9SE2 -001-032-000	KLISH BARBARA	220 PROSPECT ST	\$ 6,649.59	SOLD - \$17,000	310
331	22-2417	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-024-003-000	CHOPKO ANDREW JR	337 SCOTT ST	\$ 7,813.22	SOLD - \$24,000	121
332	22-2390	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-001-01A-000	CLARK AMEERAH	59 BOWMAN ST	\$ 6,529.90	BIDDER FORFEIT	
333	22-2394	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-004-009-000	TREVETHAN PATRICK R	214 REAR KIDDER ST	\$ 5,047.46	SOLD - \$5,633.54	148
334	22-2413	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-016-20A-000	WATKINS DAVID &	340 SCOTT ST	\$ 8,869.44	SOLD - \$23,000	7
335	22-2422	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW3-003-33L-000	MASHINSKI ROBERT & DIANE LOU	59 WILKES LN	\$ 14,009.47	REMOVED - PAID	
336	22-2433	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-007-027-000	MATIC DENNIS C	120 CUSTER ST	\$ 8,005.53	SOLD - \$8,272.83	127
337	22-2423	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-003-029-000	SILVERNALE JEFFREY P & INGRID	34 DOUGHER LN	\$ 5,060.03	SOLD - \$15,000	7
338	22-2438	WILKES-BARRE WARD 4	73-H9SE2 -018-006-000	CM BURNS 3 LLC	45 N RIVER ST	\$ 236,348.22	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
339	22-2445	WILKES-BARRE WARD 5	73-H10SW1-019-015-000	CM BURNS 3 LLC	16 E UNION ST	\$ 183,152.19	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
340	22-2456	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-H10SW4-023-003-000	BEZBIDA IRINA	46 1/2 S WELLES ST	\$ 11,097.52	SOLD - \$12,160.78	7
341	22-2448	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-H10SW4-011-004-000	MARECA EMERSON	72 S GRANT ST	\$ 2,930.86	SOLD - \$3,554.56	44
342	22-2502	WILKES-BARRE WARD 9	73-H10NW1-024-015-000	PHAM LONG THIEN	123 S EMPIRE ST	\$ 6,297.30	SOLD - \$30,000	294
343	22-2487	WILKES-BARRE WARD 9	73-H10SW4-013-011-000	PHILBIN CHRISTINE J	247 E NORTHAMPTON ST	\$ 15,128.80	SOLD - \$16,500	78
344	22-2520	WILKES-BARRE WARD 10	73-H9SE3 -001-004-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	64 W ROSS ST	\$ 111,492.83	NO BID	
345	22-2539	WILKES-BARRE WARD 10	73-H9SE4 -010-022-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	31 ACADEMY ST	\$ 98,093.94	NO BID	
346	22-2538	WILKES-BARRE WARD 10	73-H9SE4 -010-021-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R JR	27 ACADEMY ST	\$ 36,218.62	NO BID	
347	22-2544	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -005-029-000	JOHN RICHARDO J	51 ORCHARD ST	\$ 11,792.57	SOLD - \$31,000	78
348	22-2542	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE1 -017-11A-000	MAHER PAUL J & JUDY	1 RITA ST	\$ 7,984.66	SOLD - \$21,000	96
349	22-2578	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -033-021-000	PEREZA MILDRED VERAS	21 WALNUT ST	\$ 9,078.88	NO BID	
350	22-2569	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -027-024-000	POKRINCHAK DOUGLAS M	501 S RIVER ST	\$ 10,660.48	SOLD - \$11,751.46	148
351	22-2576	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -033-013-000	REISINGER JOSEPH P	6 MONROE ST	\$ 65,695.92	NO BID	
352	22-2547	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -013-022-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	20 SULLIVAN ST	\$ 93,343.06	NO BID	
353	22-2560	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -025-001-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	448 S FRANKLIN ST	\$ 72,451.69	NO BID	
354	22-2561	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -025-002-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	444 S FRANKLIN ST	\$ 91,681.75	NO BID	
355	22-2562	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -025-003-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	440 S FRANKLIN ST	\$ 231,436.44	NO BID	
356	22-2574	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -033-011-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	14 MONROE ST	\$ 56,941.83	NO BID	
357	22-2575	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -033-012-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	12 MONROE ST	\$ 87,713.10	NO BID	
358	22-2636	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE2 -045-002-000	BRANNEN LOUIS L	96 HICKORY ST	\$ 9,283.23	SOLD - \$23,000	26
359	22-2623	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE2 -031-001-000	GENAO CRISTIAN & SILVIA MEDINA	PARK AVE	\$ 2,823.74	NO BID	
360	22-2595	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE1 -009-008-000	HARDING CHARLES D	86 SPROUCE ST	\$ 8,422.40	SOLD - \$18,000	127
361	22-2596	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE1 -009-009-000	HARDING CHARLES D	82 GROVE ST	\$ 12,919.07	SOLD - \$18,500	127
362	22-2611	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE2 -011-004-000	NOBLES WILLIAM	452 S HANCOCK ST	\$ 6,464.92	SOLD - \$11,500	7
363	22-2627	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-I9NE2 -034-006-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	GROVE ST	\$ 71,755.94	NO BID	
364	22-2662	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE3 -014-006-000	ACHUFF RICHARD	64 ANTHRACITE ST	\$ 8,714.46	SOLD - \$27,000	222
365	22-2664	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE3 -014-06A-000	ACHUFF RICHARD	ANTHRACITE ST	\$ 2,678.51	SOLD - \$4,000	222
366	22-2710	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE4 -029-019-000	DELLACROCE MARVIN & CAROL A	153 POPLAR ST	\$ 10,413.18	NO BID	
367	22-2661	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE3 -014-001-000	HIPPOLYTE JERMENE	BLACKMAN ST	\$ 3,478.50	NO BID	
368	22-2690	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE4 -011-029-000	INNOCENTI DONNA	68 SPROUCE ST	\$ 6,571.88	SOLD - \$18,500	331
369	22-2659	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE1 -031-030-000	JONES PATRICK	18 DODSON LN	\$ 3,071.26	SOLD - \$6,500	33
370	22-2658	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE1 -031-029-000	JONES PATRICK & FLORENCE	20 DODSON LN	\$ 7,028.23	SOLD - \$8,034.07	33
371	22-2654	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE1 -030-010-000	STAPLES SHELLYANN & KIRKLAN M	43 HARKINS LN	\$ 10,034.28	SOLD - \$18,500	7
372	22-2739	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NE1 -002-12A-000	FARRELL JOHN & KLYNOWSKY-DENISE	96 WOOD ST	\$ 2,669.05	SOLD - \$7,000	308
373	22-2771	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -025-005-000	GORNEY PAUL & SANDRA M	234 HORTON ST	\$ 6,687.17	SOLD - \$12,500	44
374	22-2760	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -017-024-000	GREEN DALTON	76 BROOK ST	\$ 11,288.44	SOLD - \$42,000	7
375	22-2728	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-H9SW3 -014-022-000	HIRTHLER JR HAROLD E	99 LOCKHART ST	\$ 2,830.18	SOLD - \$5,000	49
376	22-2763	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -018-024-000	LANGAN JAMES E JR & LURIE	133 WALLER ST	\$ 10,497.98	SOLD - \$11,258.30	49

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
377	22-2777	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -029-001-000	MCGRADY RICHARD R	4 REGENT ST	\$ 9,822.47	SOLD - \$15,500	8
378	22-2729	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-H9SW3 -014-028-000	MINIER JOSE ALBERTO &	270 CAREY AVE	\$ 3,844.87	NO BID	
379	22-2774	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -026-09A-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	126 CARLISLE ST	\$ 300,349.83	NO BID	
380	22-2761	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-I9NW2 -017-031-000	RIVERA EVELYN	267 BARNEY ST	\$ 1,996.15	SOLD - \$1,996.15	115
381	22-2833	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10SW1-006-033-000	ELITE INVESTING GROUP LLC	278 N PENNA AVE	\$ 10,579.79	SOLD - \$12,062.81	59
382	22-2831	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10SW1-005-044-000	GLODZIK PILAR	60 E NORTH ST	\$ 3,857.51	SOLD - \$4,213.78	302
383	22-2808	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW3-019-001-000	JABERS ROBERT S & JEANETTE	94 BUTLER ST	\$ 28,830.83	NO BID	
384	22-2821	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW4-020-038-000	MANNY'S REAL ESTATE LLC	WYOMING ST	\$ 2,539.58	SOLD - \$2,816.78	258
385	22-2817	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW4-007-013-000	SARBAUGH RICHARD & STEVEN	393 N PENNSYLVANIA AVE	\$ 8,122.01	SOLD - \$26,000	7
386	22-2796	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW2-011-016-000	TERPAK WALTER & FLORENCE	758 N PENNA AVE	\$ 2,523.56	SOLD - \$10,000	302
387	22-2838	WILKES-BARRE WARD 17	73-H10NE1-009-007-000	AUSTIN JOSEPH M & CHRISTIANSON DEB	37 KADO ST	\$ 8,772.04	SOLD - \$23,000	7
388	22-2839	WILKES-BARRE WARD 17	73-H10NE1-009-015-000	FONTES VINICIUS	69 KADO ST	\$ 2,158.90	BIDDER FORFEIT	
389	22-2846	WILKES-BARRE WARD 18	73-G10SE4-004-009-000	CAREY DAVID J JR	160 GARDNER AVE	\$ 2,850.29	SOLD - \$12,500	258
390	22-2861	WILKES-BARRE WARD 19	73-G10SE1-014-001-000	NIZIOLEK BENJAMIN	66 W SIDNEY ST	\$ 11,534.06	SOLD - \$29,000	48
391	22-2859	WILKES-BARRE WARD 19	73-G10SE1-012-002-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	25 E MAIN ST	\$ 83,984.48	NO BID	
392	22-2860	WILKES-BARRE WARD 19	73-G10SE1-012-003-000	REISINGER JOSEPH R	29 E MAIN ST	\$ 83,619.95	NO BID	
393	22-2867	WILKES-BARRE WARD 20	73-G10SE2-007-005-000	LAHR ANNA	396 E MAIN ST	\$ 6,647.25	SOLD - \$23,000	142
394	22-1941	WRIGHT TWP	64-L9S3A -003-043-000	NARDONE LAWRENCE G & JEAN	259 NUANGOLA RD	\$ 15,191.99	NO BID	