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Results List Final w/Corrections

Sale Numer Municipality Parcel Owner Property Description Starting Bid Notes
23-0079 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S1 -006-013-000 BONIFACIO ZELPHA P IROQUOIS CIR $1,347.22 sold bidder #336, $4,000
23-0077 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S1 -001-005-000 SORIANO FE M & MANUEL M 2 HURON CIR $1,337.16 sold bidder #364, $5,500
23-2902 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-R4-00A-002-000 KELLER ARNOLD & BONNIE OVERLOOK RD $1,319.66 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0102 BEAR CREEK TWP 04-J11S1 -002-018-000 CHISMAR STEPHEN & MARY 527 ADJ WOODLAND RD $1,431.95 sold bidder #97, $9,500
23-0118 BEAR CREEK TWP 04-K13S1 -005-009-000 KNECHT VINCE E ETAL BEAR CREEK BLVD $1,838.12 sold bidder #463, min bid
23-0119 BEAR CREEK TWP 04-K13S1 -005-011-000 KNECHT VINCENT E BEAR CREEK BLVD $1,579.46 sold bidde #463, min bid
23-0151 BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-Q8S3 -001-10I-000 PANAS OLGA 41 JAMES LN $1,116.85 sold bidder #97, $10,500
23-0155 BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-Q8S3 -001-18B-000 PANAS OLGA JAMES LN $1,105.84 no bid- off to repository
23-0169 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8S11 -004-012-000 BORIS OLIVERY CASTRO MAJANO & DEBBIE DR $1,271.02 sold bidder #97, min bid
23-0172 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8S9 -003-006-000 BORIS OLIVERY CASTRO MAJARO & MINK SPRINGS CT $956.29 sold bidde #118, $3,500
23-0170 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8S11 -004-013-000 KOTCH JOHN W & BONNIE A 164 DEBBIE DR $1,592.56 sold bidder #97, $15,000
23-0185 COURTDALE BORO 07-G9S1 -009-008-000 UREVITCH JOSEPH 252 COURTDALE AVE $1,350.84 sold bidder #394, $11,000
23-0201 CONYNGHAM TWP 09-M5S1 -001-005-000 STRZALKA STANLEY ETAL LILY AVE $1,208.11 no bid- off to repository
23-0217 DALLAS TWP 10-C7S3 -009-008-000 COMISKEY BERNARD WARREN AVE $1,287.20 no bid- off to repository
23-0252 DALLAS TWP 10-E8S2 -006-001-000 DAVIS THOMAS L + HANNAH BROOK ST $1,187.88 no bid- off to repository
23-0216 DALLAS TWP 10-C7S3 -008-006-000 JUBIS SOPHIA HIGGS AVE $3,406.87 no bid- off to repository
23-0247 DALLAS TWP 10-E8S1 -012-007-000 SUSQUEHANNA INVESTORS LIMITED POPLAR ST $1,195.55 no bid- off to repository
23-0335 DUPONT BORO 15-E12NE4-002-010-000 WARUNEK EDWARD J & KENNETH COOLIDGE ST $1,211.62 Trump bid placed by the North East Pennsylvania Land Bank
23-0391 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -T01-243-000 BURNEY LEE TERRI 243 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,687.17 sold bidder #16, min bid
23-0398 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -T01-329-000 DACRI JOSEPH & JULIE 329 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES $1,246.64 sold bidder #397, min bid
23-0372 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-036 FALVO GERALD 224 FOURTH ST $1,397.97 sold bidder #42, $4,500
23-0373 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-047 PARKER SCOTT 229 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,256.02 sold bidder #130, min bid
23-2920 EXETER TWP 17-A10-00A-033-000 ROSS THOMAS & MARGO A 30 MILL HILL RD $1,901.86 sold bidder #460, $23,000
23-0420 EXETER TWP 17-B11S2 -001-030-000 LYNOTT ELIZABETH SULLIVAN TRL $3,683.99 no bid- off to repository
23-0418 EXETER TWP 17-B10S1 -010-002-000 MCNULTY RAYMOND W & JENNIFER RHOLAND RD/PAPER RD $1,147.68 no bid- off to repository
21-0471 EXETER TWP 17-B10S1-008-006-000 KASTNER EDWARD 10 COOLIDGE AVE $2,654.05 no bid- off to repository
23-0457 EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7 18-G9S2 -015-025-000 KAUDAL INVESTMENT CORP 197 GREEN ST $1,188.27 sold bidder #71, $2,500
23-0531 FREELAND BORO WARD 1 22-R9NE2 -012-004-000 PGA INCORPORATED SOUTH ST $3,123.66 sold bidder #73, $125,000
23-0507 FREELAND BORO WARD 1 22-R9NE2 -012-04B-000 PGA INCORPORATED ADJ PUBLIC RD $1,649.98 sold bidder #73, min bid
23-0528 FREELAND BORO WARD 3 22-Q9SE4 -T01-022-000 COPELAND DAVID J & CHERYL PORRECA 22 807 SCHWABE ST $1,380.86 failed to pay- off to repository
23-0527 FREELAND BORO WARD 3 22-Q9SE4 -T01-014-000 KOCKIE ROBERT 14 HAWK HILLS CT $1,804.05 sold bidder #42, $3,500
23-0555 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S1 -009-010-000 BESTRESKI SCOTT A BROOKSIDE DR $1,203.70 no bid- off to repository
23-0567 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S6 -014-016-000 CROGAN CAROL E HOLIDAY DR $1,624.02 sold bidder #353, min bid
23-0568 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S6 -015-005-000 LISZKA MARK & EWELINA WOODHAVEN DR $1,413.93 sold bidder #181, $2,500
23-0579 FOSTER TWP 23-Q12 -00A-011-014 LOUGHERY PATRICK M 14 LADNERS ACRES $1,416.72 sold bidder #340, $2,000
23-0572 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S8 -003-008-000 MARSHALL ALAN PRESCOTT RD $1,228.70 no bid- off to repository
23-0570 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S7 -007-006-000 TOWNSEND MARK T HOLIDAY DR $1,817.77 no bid- off to repository
23-0607 FRANKLIN TWP 24-B9 -00A-07N-000 SCHOOLEY ADAM & JUSINE T 26200 $1,407.05 no bid- off to repository
23-0674 HANOVER TWP WARD 5 25-I8S2 -009-011-000 THOMAS WAYNE 41 RUTTER ST $1,223.46 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-0728 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-S7 -T02-002-000 ARISMENDY SANTANA 310 HOLLY LYNN DR $1,303.11 failed to pay- off to repository
21-0834 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-S7S2-001-08F-000 VIECHEC CHELSEA 110 SOUTH ST $3,892.76 sold bidder #427, $26,000
23-2927 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S1-001-389-000 WRIGHT MELVIN M & MARIE E JR HAWK MOUNTAIN DR $297.88 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0835 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S13 -001-262-000 ABESAMIS JOHN AUGUST RAMO & JOANNE BUTTERNUT LN $1,416.72 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0842 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S14 -001-028-000 AMIL SYLBERT WHITE OAK LN $1,325.14 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0898 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -001-012-000 BRAIDO JOHN W 12 TURNBERRY LN $1,279.78 sold bidder #457, $3,500
23-0896 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -010-004-000 CARINO LEO & MARITES 223 CHIPPEWA DR $1,111.00 failed to pay- off to repository
23-0844 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S14 -001-177-000 CRUZ DAMARYS A MAPLE LN $1,361.19 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0877 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S3 -005-019-000 GIBALDI JOSEPH MUSKEGON CIR $1,317.37 sold bidder #457, $3,500
23-0840 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S13 -001-390-000 HONG YOO JEONG HONEYSUCKLE DR $1,023.07 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0906 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -008-030-000 KELLER MARC J & KAREN G UNAMI CIR $1,382.46 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0863 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S15 -001-353-000 MCELWEE JOHN HONEYSUCKLE DR $1,266.90 sold bidder #457, $1500.00
23-0864 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S15 -001-369-000 MCELWEE JOHN HONEYSUCKLE DR $1,539.85 sold bidder #457, $4,500



23-0833 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S13 -001-102-000 MCKEOWN JAMES AND STEPHANIE MAPLE LN $1,387.18 sold bidder #286, $5,000
23-0910 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U6S1 -003-006-000 MOTOR FULTON FRONT ST $2,633.32 sold bidder #42, min bid
23-0911 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U6S1 -003-007-000 MOTOR FULTON FRONT ST $2,655.32 sold bidder #122, $4,500
23-0912 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U6S1 -003-06A-000 MOTOR FULTON BACK ST $2,675.32 sold bidder #42, min bid
23-0890 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S6 -002-001-000 MROZOSKI JAMES M & DORISH KATHLEEN 398 EH TURNBERRY LN $1,551.80 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0883 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S4 -010-023-000 OSTREA BRIGITTE LIENU L & JOAQUIN P GLEN EAGLES DR $1,434.72 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0849 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S14 -001-256-000 PANGANIBAN JOEL M ALDEN LN $1,343.78 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0922 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-V7S2 -002-06A-000 POON LUCILLA 215 BEAVER BROOK RD $1,111.00 sold bidder #70, $13,000
23-0889 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S5 -012-009-000 RICO FERDINAND TURNBERRY LN $1,089.28 sold bidder #457, $3,000
23-0836 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S13 -001-263-000 ROCCA PATRICK L & ELIANE BUTTERNUT LN $1,434.72 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0847 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S14 -001-198-000 SABALLA MERLY SASSAFRAS LN $1,350.72 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0848 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S14 -001-199-000 VO JONATHAN SASSAFRAS LN $1,414.72 sold bidder #457, min bid
23-0902 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -002-024-000 ZELANO INVESTMENTS 244 CORN SILK AVE $1,371.51 sold bidder #457, $3,500
23-0947 HUGHESTOWN BORO 28-E12NW4-011-004-000 QUICK WAYNE D CENTER ST $1,296.04 sold bidder #171, min bid
23-0954 HUNLOCK TWP 29-H5 -00A-15C-000 CROOP STANLEY ROARING BROOK DR $2,828.67 sold bidder #42, min bid
23-0955 HUNLOCK TWP 29-H5 -00A-15H-000 CROOP STANLEY SWAMP RD $2,708.22 no bid- off to repository
23-0984 HUNLOCK TWP 29-J6S1 -001-015-000 CROOP STANLEY STATE ROUTE 11 $2,837.22 no bid- off to repository
23-0973 HUNLOCK TWP 29-J5S2 -004-05A-000 CROOP STANLEY C SORBERTOWN RD $2,329.71 sold bidder #27, $3,000
23-0979 HUNLOCK TWP 29-J6 -00A-05A-000 GRAY GARY E 371 ROUTE 11 $1,070.11 sold bidder #248, $18,500
23-0966 HUNLOCK TWP 29-I6 -001-001-000 KOONS BERTHA EST ADJ FRED CROOP $3,075.40 no bid- off to repository
23-0989 HUNTINGTON TWP 30-J1 -00A-020-000 LOVETT STANLEY W & CATHERINE S 1367 OLD TIOGA TPKE $1,264.13 sold bidder #12, $40,000
23-0994 HUNTINGTON TWP 30-K2 -00A-09B-000 SPAK JOHN P III 13 OLD KOONS RD $1,295.32 sold bidder #42, $9,000
23-1019 JENKINS TWP 33-E11S1 -003-014-000 BURKE JOHN 422 S MAIN ST $1,071.70 Trump bid placed by the North East Pennsylvania Land Bank
23-1038 JENKINS TWP 33-F11S1 -06A-16A-000 DUDECK GERALD & ROSALIE REAR MAIN ST $1,371.41 Trump bid placed by the North East Pennsylvania Land Bank
18-1483 KINGSTON BORO WARD 7 34-H9NE2-010-02A-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 65-69 THIRD AVE $7,721.74 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-1146 KINGSTON TWP 35-F9S4 -009-08A-000 GOBEL ELIZ C/O MRS THOMAS CONNORS SHADY LN $3,694.37 no bid- off to repository
23-1142 KINGSTON TWP 35-E9S7 -001-002-000 STAR BUILDERS CONTRACTORS INC HARRIS HILL RD $1,377.72 sold bidder #71, min bid
23-1258 LEHMAN TWP 40-G5 -T02-017-000 MORGAN CAROLINE 45 COUNTRY CREST LN $1,241.29 sold bidder #398, min bid
23-1266 LEHMAN TWP 40-G6S2 -004-04A-000 WAWRZYNSKI JOYCE T & LABUS STANLEY MAPLE ST $1,181.97 sold bidder #320, $1,500
23-1323 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8 42-K7S1 -013-16A-000 GORKA ANN F ESPY ST $1,397.50 no bid- off to repository
18-1798 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9 42-J7SE2-003-017-000 Bozinski, Robert 420 E WASHINGTON ST $3,025.02 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-1357 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 42-J7SW2 -014-035-000 GROUP ONE PROPERTIES LLC 148 W BROAD ST $1,203.79 sold bidder #340, $3,500
23-1375 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12 42-J7SE4 -025-022-000 RONDON YAGER & CURETON CHARLOTTE 42 W FIELD ST $1,239.48 sold bidder #265, $4,000
23-1403 NEW COLUMBUS BORO 45-K1S1 -005-002-000 WOODWARD THOMAS OLD TIOGA TPKE $1,237.49 sold bidder #161, $1,500
23-1427 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S1 -010-012-000 BRABANT RAYMOND J 101 NEWPORT ST $2,626.07 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-1428 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S1 -010-013-000 BRABANT RAYMOND J 97 NEWPORT ST $1,989.07 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-1549 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13 48-H8SW3 -014-002-000 KENNEDY HELEN 239 TEMPERANCE ST $1,310.13 sold bidder #353, min bid
23-1600 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-I8S1A -015-014-000 BUICKUS ANNE LANE MORGAN AVE $1,805.28 no bid- off to repository
23-1597 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-I8S1A -000-VAR-000 DELEON WILFRED PLYMOUTH TWP FLTS $1,178.92 no bid- off to repository
19-2256 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-I7S6-005-005-000 Guskiewicz, Charles B. 35 MAUDE ST $2,773.96 sold bidder #466, $58,000
20-2147 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-I7S4-001-012-000 BROJAKOWSKI MICHAEL 1699 W MAIN ST $819.84 sold bidder #317, $29,000
22-1613 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-I7S7-002-012-000 TRAHER LYNN D & BONNIE G 21-29 N MILL ST $1,341.55 sold bidder #175, $3,000
23-1602 PLAINS TWP WARD 1 50-F10S1 -001-019-000 EYET IRWIN HARRIET ST $1,316.83 sold bidder #1, $2,500
23-1629 PLAINS TWP WARD 2 50-G10SW2-002-014-000 LECITSHON FRANCIS P 54 LAUREL ST $2,024.07 Trump bid placed by the North East Pennsylvania Land Bank
23-1712 RICE TWP 53-L8S1 -001-007-000 GOSART CHARLES W& HELEN F THOMAS RD $4,249.25 no bid- off to repository
23-1720 RICE TWP 53-L9S4 -003-005-000 HERITAGE WOODS REAL ESTATE LLC BURMA RD $1,345.21 sold bidder #196, min bid
23-1733 ROSS TWP 54-F4 -00A-027-000 LAMOREAUX RUSSELL & MYRTLE ESTATE HARRIS POND RD $2,627.75 no bid- off to repository
23-1782 SALEM TWP 55-O3 -T02-067-000 CRANE ANGELA MARIE & 67 2ND LN $1,295.55 no bid- off to repository
23-1783 SALEM TWP 55-O3 -T02-419-000 GROSS MARK 19 FOURTH LN $1,451.89 failed to pay- off to repository
23-1772 SALEM TWP 55-M3S1 -003-018-000 HAMMOND PETER HICKORY LN $1,309.05 sold bidder #25, $4,500
23-1797 SALEM TWP 55-P4NW2 -003-008-000 HORNER HAYES 53 MAIN ST $1,424.09 sold bidder #479, $24,000
23-1803 SALEM TWP 55-P4S1 -005-010-000 KAJA HOLDINGS LLC 202 MAIN ST $2,363.32 sold bidder #245, $12,500
23-1766 SALEM TWP 55-M3 -T03-010-000 TUBBS JUNE 10 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT $1,654.11 sold bidder #403, $9,000



23-1768 SALEM TWP 55-M3 -T03-023-000 TUBBS JUNE 47 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT $1,279.10 sold bidder #220, $2,000
23-1813 SLOCUM TWP 57-L7 -00A-044-000 DAVIES MARILYN ETAL SLOCUM RD $609.66 no bid- off to repository
23-2016 WYOMING BORO WARD 3 67-F10NE2-006-015-000 OCONNELL THELMA MONOCANOCK AVE $1,281.33 no bid- off to repository
23-2017 WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1 68-P12 -00A-01A-000 INVESTRAC INC BUFFALO ST $1,168.05 sold bidder #181, $4,500
23-2170 HAZLETON CITY WARD 11 71-T8NW44-020-002-000 MIZENKO JEREMY & STEPHANIE 618 REAR JAMES ST $2,215.44 sold bidder #171, min bid
23-2322 PITTSTON CITY WARD 6 72-E11NE3-002-008-000 RVFM 4 SERIES LLC 18 GEORGE ST $3,719.33 Trump bid placed by the North East Pennsylvania Land Bank
18-3505 WILKES BARRE WARD 10 73-H9SE3-001-004-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 64 W ROSS ST $5,394.42 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
18-3524 WILKES BARRE WARD 10 73-H9SE4-010-022-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 31 ACADEMY ST $5,214.12 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-2564 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SW3 -008-010-000 VIDAL JUAN M 54 MARLBOROUGH AVE $1,232.31 sold bidder #1, $12,500
18-3548 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-025-001-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 448-450 S FRANKLIN ST $4,866.18 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
18-3549 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-025-002-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 444-446 S FRANKLIN ST $5,189.89 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
18-3550 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-025-003-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 440-442 S FRANKLIN ST $5,891.06 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
18-3565 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-033-011-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 14 MONROE ST $7,101.87 sold bidder #232, $16,000
18-3566 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-033-012-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 12 MONROE ST $6,149.93 sold bidder #232, $13,000
18-3567 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-033-013-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 6 MONROE ST $7,219.46 failed to pay- off to repository
18-3538 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-013-022-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 20-22 SULLIVAN ST $4,990.21 sold bidder #364, $11,000
18-3629 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-I9NE2-034-006-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R GROVE ST $5,412.55 sold bidder #171, min bid
21-3119 WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-I9NE1-024-003-000 VALENTI ANTHONY JR & LOUIS M WEIBRECHT 650 S MAIN ST $7,991.18 sold bidder #181, $91,000
23-2646 WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-I9NE3 -029-001-000 SMITH MICHAEL A & CAROL L BLACKMAN ST $1,584.39 sold bidder #171, $2,500
18-3731 WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-I9NE4-035-001-000 KUNCEWICZ LEA B 240-242 BROWN ST $2,578.16 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
18-3824 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-I9NW2-026-09A-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 126 CARLISLE ST $10,373.60 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
17-3908 WILKES-BARRE WARD 17 73-H10NE1-024-002-000 HAVRILOK JOHN & ANNA 60-62 MILL ST $2,683.56 sold bidder #133, $135,000
18-3960 WILKES BARRE WARD 19 73-G10SE1-012-003-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 29-31 E MAIN ST $6,921.91 sold bidder #86, $127,000
18-3959 WILKES BARRE WARD 19 73-G10SE1-012-002-000 REISINGER JOSEPH R 25-27 E MAIN ST $7,027.73 Trump bid placed by the Lower South Valley Land Bank
23-2816 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S1 -001-10A-000 EBBECKE FREDERICK KITCHEN AVE $955.20 sold bidder #202, $1,500
23-2817 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S1 -001-10B-000 EBBECKE FREDERICK KITCHEN AVE $1,415.10 sold bidder #202, min bid
23-2832 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S7 -001-005-078 FRANTZ TIMOTHY JAMES 416 SMITH ST $1,215.50 sold bidder #71, $2,500
23-2833 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S7 -001-005-112 GALLAGHER DESIREE TARISE 307 LARK LN $1,244.66 failed to pay- off to repository
23-2834 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S7 -002-019-000 PUTERBAUGH MABEL E ESTATE GROVE ST $1,192.77 failed to pay- off to repository
23-2831 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S7 -001-005-029 ROBINSON TERRY 206 EAGLE LN $1,344.14 sold bidder #71, $3,000


