JUDICIAL SALE - OCTOBER 17, 2019

NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Northeast Revenue Service, LLC as agent for the
Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE under the Pennsylvania Real
Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 17th day of October, 2019 in
the auxiliary gymnasium at the King’s College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 N.
Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The properties exposed to sale will be sold Free &
Clear of all tax and municipal claims, mortgages, liens, charges and estates of whatsoever kind,
except ground rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of
the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every reasonable effort has been made
to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling
the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without
guarantee of warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and
Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person
is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne
County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is
delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person
is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne
County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is
delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne
County.

3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d),
prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any
municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person
whose landlord license has been revoked.

In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the
owner shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.

TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording
costs shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is completed and must be made in the form



of cash, certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the
close of business on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be
permitted to bid on any properties in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when
purchasing a property in any sale the bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in
future sales and the matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for
prosecution under the Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a
CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE
TAKEN ON THE DAY OF THE SALE. Registration and Certification forms are available in
the Tax Claim Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders
must present one (1) form of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the
Sale. Failure to present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a Prospective
Bidder from being registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale
will prevent the bidder from receiving his bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder
from having the opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who
believes that by no reason of some defect said property should not be exposed to sale, should
immediately make known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin,
sex, religion, age, disability or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax
Claim Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 27, 2018 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2016 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 17,
2018. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2015 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 18,
2017. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 20, 2016 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 19,
2016. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale September 24, 2015 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2013 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader and Standard Speaker on August 21, 2015, and the Luzerne



Legal Register on August 8, 2015. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on
September 11, 2014 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2012 inter alia. Notice of
the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal
Register on August 8, 2014. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on
September 19, 2013 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2011 inter alia. Notice of
the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal
Register on August 16, 2013.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act,
however the following properties were not sold at the respective Upset Sales, because the upset
sale price was not obtained:
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1

Sale # BOROUGH PARCEL # Owners Location Judicial Sale. Notes
2 Amount
3 17-0017 Ashley Borough 01-19SE4-018-011-000 Harold Langan 63 N. Main St. $1,576.75 NO BID
4 18-0021 Ashley Borough 01-19SE4-023-00A-000 Searfoss, David J. E. Hartford St. $1,453.98 NO BID
5 16-0037 Ashley Borough 01-J9-00A-012-000 Paselo Logistics, LLC Main Street $6,765.94 SOLD $8500 - BIDDER #132
6 18-0040 Ashley Borough 01-J9NE1-T01-117-000 Underhill, Alan 117 Donato Dr. $1,442.14 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
7 18-0046 Ashley Borough 01-J9NE1-T01-185-000 Beck, Gary 185 Janet Dr. $1,200.97 NO BID
8 18-0058 Ashley Borough 01-J9NE4-001-021-000 Vanderlick, John Joseph Fall St. $1,165.39 NO BID
9 18-0061 Ashley Borough 01-J9NW2-001-010-000 Peshala, Henry 19 Sively St. $1,195.85 SOLD $4000 - BIDDER #168
10 18-0083 Avoca Borough 02-D12NE4-001-002-000 Polerecki, Edward 593 York Ave. $1,352.49 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
11 18-0087 Avoca Borough 02-D12SE2-016-20A-000 AMB Investments of Pennsylvania John St. $1,305.31 NO BID
12 16-0039 Avoca Borough 02-D12SE4-003-08A-000 Community Banks, N.A., as Custodian for Thomas Lyons, IRA McAlpine St. $3,038.08 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
13 18-0072 Avoca Borough 02-D12SE4-028-012-000 Reed, James Jr. & Cynthia 611 Third St. $1,560.44 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
14 18-0093 Avoca Borough 02-D13NW4-005-005-000 Holmes, Daniel & Kathleen 1416 Plane St. $1,637.72 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
15 18-0108 Black Creek Twp. 03-T4-00A-008-000 Justofin, James J. Mahoney St. $1,298.17 SOLD $10,000 - BIDDER #44
16 18-0117 Black Creek Twp. 03-U453-001-002-000 Karchner, David M. Walnut St. $1,310.61 NO BID
17 18-0118 Black Creek Twp. 03-U4S53-001-003-000 Karchner, David M. Spring St. $1,148.40 NO BID
18 17-0124 | Black Creek Township 03-U5-00A-013-000 Donna Pursel Mountain Rd. $1,456.18 NO BID
19 18-0143 Black Creek Twp. 03-U5S53-001-063-000 Kim Eun Hee & Bock Soon Park Silvercloud Ln. $1,289.76 SOLD $1,289.76 - BIDDER #69
20 18-0144 Black Creek Twp. 03-U553-001-132-000 Winn, Michael J. & Nancy E. Cornsilk Ave. $1,370.76 SOLD $1,370.76 - BIDDER #69
21 18-0153 Bear Creek Twp. 04-H11-00A-015-000 Murgai, Vikram 1000 Pittston Blvd. $1,325.86 NO BID
22 18-0155 Bear Creek Twp. 04-H11-00A-25A-000 Smith, Frank J. & Mary 1301 Pittston Blvd. $1,394.79 NO BID
23 18-0157 Bear Creek Twp. 04-H12-00A-06A-000 Jenkins, Joseph Bald Mountain Rd. $1,365.63 NO BID
24 18-0161 Bear Creek Twp. 04-11152-003-019-000 Smith, Mary Pike Rd. $1,151.38 NO BID
25 18-0162 Bear Creek Twp. 04-11152-003-027-000 Murgai, Vikram Old East End Blvd. $1,264.21 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
26 18-0166 Bear Creek Twp. 04-11451-005-01A-000 Reposh, Daniel West Ave. $1,197.83 NO BID
27 18-0180 Bear Creek Twp. 04-J12 -00A-019-000 Garrahan, Judith 4506 Bear Creek Blvd. $1,187.94 SOLD $2,500 - BIDDER #198
28 18-0191 Bear Creek Twp. 04-)1354-001-006-000 Hall, Charles Beverly, Jr. 1967 Meadow Run Rd. $1,256.86 SOLD $9,500 -BIDDER #184
29 16-0113 Bear Creek Township 04-K12-00A-033-000 Landview Properties Inc Farrington Tract $1,770.17 NO BID
30 16-0114 Bear Creek Township 04-K12-00A-33P-000 Landview Properties, Inc. [No Location] $1,809.03 NO BID
31 17-0188 Bear Creek Township 04-N1252-002-028-000 Helen Bogansky, deceased Fern Ridge Rd. $1,848.17 NO BID
32 18-0199 Bear Creek Twp. 04-N1252-003-004-000 Hanna, Joseph & Diane L. Azalea Trail $1,078.10 SOLD $1,078.10 -BIDDER #153
33 17-0197 Buck Township 05-K14-00A-022-000 Charles J. Murray Chestnut Ln. $2,060.20 SOLD $2,060.20 -BIDDER #57
34 17-0199 Buck Township 05-K14-00A-18A-000 Charles J. Murray 12 Chestnut Ln. $2,060.91 SOLD $16,000 -BIDDER #86
35 18-0207 Buck Township 05-K1451-003-002-000 Four Seasons Funding Group Shades Lane $1,217.15 SOLD $24,000 -BIDDER #191
36 18-0219 Butler Twp. 06-P8S3-007-002-000 Mumwa Lisa 26 Maple St. $1,231.71 NO BID
37 18-0221 Butler Twp. 06-P856-001-090-000 Jude Max & Guerline L. Laurore 13 Rear Sunburst Dr. $1,602.47 NO BID
38 18-0222 Butler Twp. 06-P856-002-016-000 Jude Max & Guerline L. Laurore N/A $1,622.47 NO BID
39 18-0223 Butler Twp. 06-P856-002-017-000 Jude Max & Guerline L. Laurore N/A $1,622.47 NO BID
40 18-0257 Butler Twp. 06-Q8510-004-021-000 Bajramoski, Iljas & Baria Bunyon Springs Ct. $1,273.19 NO BID
41 18-0247 Butler Twp. 06-R7512-002-012-000 Hiller, Karen L. Deephole Rd. $1,309.39 SOLD $1,309.39 -BIDDER #126
42 18-0248 Butler Twp. 06-R753-001-01C-000 Marchetti, Karla 1 W. Butler Dr. $802.68 SOLD $8,500 -BIDDER #227
43 18-0251 Butler Twp. 06-R756-001-010-000 Glodzik, Robert W. Foothills Dr. $1,319.05 SOLD $1,319.05 -BIDDER #121
44 18-0276 Courtdale Borough 07-G951-008-019-000 Cochran, Ginger & Avery 170 Rear Courtdale $1,067.40 SOLD $1,067.40 -BIDDER #63
45 18-0304 | Conyngham Township 09-M551-001-002-000 Boyle, Ernest & Jean Lily Ave. $1,206.38 NO BID
46 18-4031 | Conyngham Township 09-M554-002-003-000 Smith, Ryan E. 312 Pond Hill Mountain Rd. $879.66 SOLD $879.66 -BIDDER #186
47 18-0339 Dallas Twp. 10-C8S5-001-016-000 Martin, Kenneth Jr. 28 Bubbles Lane $1,230.67 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
48 17-0390 Dallas Twp. 10-C9-T02-172-000 James Davenport 172 Valley View Trailer Park $1,743.29 NO BID
49 18-0371 Dallas Twp. 10-D855-011-051-000 Willis, Margaret & Dewitt Goodwin Ave. $1,142.44 NO BID
50 18-0409 Dorrance Twp. 12-M7-00A-40G-000 Wydra, Andrew M. & Patricia A. 1638 St. Mary's Rd. $1,650.65 SOLD $37,000 - BIDDER #126
51 16-0349 Dorrance Twp. 12-N7-00A-33A-000 Michael Habib St. Marys Rd. $1,684.81 SOLD $7,000 -BIDDER #65
52 18-0444 Dennison Twp. 13-011-00A-03K-000 Payton, Beverly J. & Hughes Wm. 140 Tunnel Road $1,801.00 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #14
53 13-0492 Duryea Borough 14-D11S1-001-018-000 Phillips, Bernard J. Jr. & Josephine A. 885 Coxton Rd. $1,272.52 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
54 18-0484 Dupont Borough 15-E12NE3-004-04A-001 Hobbs, Regina 530 Rear Wyoming Ave. $1,497.60 NO BID
55 15-5110 Dupont Borough 15-E12NE4-006-23A-000 Volch, Nancy 190 Main St. $2,023.51 SOLD $2,023.51 -BIDDER #27
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56 18-4042 Dupont Borough 15-E12NE4-014-002-000 Skursky, Jamie 10 Bear Creek Rd. $2,108.44 SOLD $15,000 -BIDDER #118
57 18-0538 Exeter Borough 16-D10-T02-029-001 Mackey John G. 29 Mt. Lookout Trailer Ct. $1,115.27 NO BID
58 18-0550 Exeter Borough 16-E10 -00A-015-234 John Francis Kennedy 141 Birchwood Estates $620.27 SOLD $620.27 -BIDDER #216
59 18-0540 Exeter Borough 16-E10-00A-015-006 Vasil Robert 293 Bichwood Est. $120.13 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
60 18-0549 Exeter Borough 16-E10-00A-015-228 Caruthers, Sarah Ann 233 Birchwood Est. $1,408.47 SOLD $1,408.47 -BIDDER #216
61 13-0631 Exeter Borough 16-E10-00A-015-309 Telley, Richard 238 Birchwood Est. $1,007.48 NO BID
62 18-0561 Exeter Borough 16-E1052-003-001-000 Zurla, Joseph & Alice Etal 93 Strumer St. $1,181.31 SOLD $6,000 -BIDDER #6
63 18-0592 Exeter Township 17-B10 -T01-539-000 Martin & Pam Jordan 539 Rearview VIg. $892.40 NO BID
64 17-0624 Exeter Township 17-B10-00A-019-002 Nellie Mae Williams Box 438 RR4 $1,845.55 NO BID
65 17-0634 Exeter Township 17-B10S3-002-007-000 Cheryl McCloskey, deceased Sutton Creek Rd. $1,620.00 SOLD $2,500 - BIDDER #55
66 18-0599 Exeter Twp. 17-B1152-001-003-000 Terry, Tony R. & Terry A. Sullivan Trl. $1,047.83 NO BID
67 18-0606 Exeter Township 17-C11S3 -001-011-000 Greta E. Von Ahrens Barrett St. $1,164.06 NO BID
68 17-0659 | Edwardsville Borough 18-G952-008-036-000 Keirand Daniels 123 Adj. Bunny Ln. $1,430.98 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
69 16-0531 Edwardsville Borough 18-G9S2-012-027-000 Lewis Casterline, deceased 13 Hillside Ave. $2,702.13 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #118
70 18-0632 Edwardsville Borough 18-G952-016-009-000 Daniels, Keirand 564 Swallow St. $1,016.39 SOLD $4,500 -BIDDER #168
71 18-0622 Edwardsville Borough 18-G9S3-011-023-000 Balakier, John J. 183 Roosevelt St. $941.36 SOLD $28,000 -BIDDER #228
72 18-0750 FREELAND BOROUGH 22-Q9SE4-010-009-000 Marsh John & Amy Way NORTH ST. $1,299.94 SOLD $1,299.94 -BIDDER #23
73 18-0752 FREELAND BOROUGH 22-Q9SE4-010-016-000 Marsh John & Amy Way NORTH ST. $1,257.37 SOLD $1,257.37 -BIDDER #23
74 18-0765 FREELAND BOROUGH 22-R9NE2-016-002-000 Hludzik, George & Mary 360 Center St. $1,457.34 SOLD $8,500 -BIDDER #160
75 18-0778 Foster Twp. 23-Q11-00A-031-000 Cerruti, Michael J. & Suzanne E. Rocks Lane $1,407.94 NO BID
76 18-0790 Foster Twp. 23-Q1152-004-006-000 Montgomery, Ryan Lake Dr. $1,700.91 SOLD $14,000 -BIDDER #184
77 18-0791 Foster Twp. 23-Q1152-005-001-000 Sonntag, Bernard & Akiko Hickory Hills Dr. $1,269.94 NO BID
78 18-0797 Foster Twp. 23-Q1156-006-036-000 Bilancia Bruce & Dimperio Joann 1263 Woodhaven Dr. $1,230.94 NO BID
79 18-0802 Foster Twp. 23-Q1157-005-013-000 Nesgoda, John A. & Candis M. 1217 Woodhaven Dr. $1,406.38 SOLD $13,500 -BIDDER #28
80 18-0810 Foster Twp. 23-Q1158-011-006-000 Shubert, John P. & Wendy Gail Dr. $1,414.94 NO BID
81 17-0844 Foster Twp. 23-R10S1-002-032-000 Michael R. Durange, deceased 264 Highland Main St. $2,205.29 NO BID
82 17-0846 Foster Twp. 23-R1051-003-025-000 Albert Wheeler 18 Highland Vig. $2,299.27 NO BID
83 17-0847 Foster Twp. 23-R1051-003-026-000 Albert Wheeler Adj. 18 Bank Street St. $2,292.01 NO BID
84 17-0848 Foster Twp. 23-R1051-003-027-000 Albert Wheeler Back Street St. $2,266.32 NO BID
85 17-0851 Foster Twp. 23-R11-00A-29K-000 Fantastic, LLC Caplos Rd. $1,672.18 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #29
86 17-0854 Foster Twp. 23-R9-00A-04A-000 Lee D. Belles, deceased 101 St. Anns Dr. $2,233.62 NO BID
87 18-0926 Hanover Twp. 25-1852-009-011-000 Kane Mary 41 Rutter St. $1,281.16 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
88 18-0873 Hanover Twp. 25-19-00A-006-000 Cooney Lynne St. Mary's Rd $1,300.44 SOLD $1,300.44 -BIDDER #156
89 18-0903 Hanover Twp. 25-19NW2-002-024-000 Reese Mark A. & Colleen 36 Dexter St. $1,417.91 SOLD $14,000 -BIDDER #70
90 18-0906 Hanover Twp. 25-1I9NW2-003-022-000 Morales Gabriel A. & Fredy A. 2 Woodbury St. $1,408.79 SOLD $27,000 -BIDDER #201
91 18-0977 Hanover Twp. 25-19NW3-013-017-000 Minersville LLC 65 Oxford St. $1,896.97 SOLD $41,000 -BIDDER #76
92 18-0876 Hanover Twp. 25-19SE1-006-19A-000 Allen Beverly M. 38 E. Liberty St. $1,109.99 SOLD $7,500 -BIDDER #173
93 18-0891 Hanover Twp. 25-19SE4-002-12A-000 Weber David P. 43 Marcy Ct. $2,152.60 SOLD $13,500 -BIDDER #31
94 18-4065 Hanover Twp. 25-195SW1-003-009-000 Norman, Clifford 65 Graham Ave. $1,123.06 SOLD $27,000 -BIDDER #197
95 17-0960 Hanover Twp. 25-)851-001-024-000 Equivest Investment, LLC 3128 S. Main St. $1,587.61 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
96 18-0941 Hanover Twp. 25-J851-002-011-000 Smith, Edward T. 3003 S. Main St. $1,311.28 SOLD $11,500 -BIDDER #118
97 16-0855 Hanover Twp. 25-J9-00A-043-000 Paselo Logistics, LLC Sugar Notch Lands $3,833.38 SOLD $3,833.38 -BIDDER #132
98 17-0972 Hanover Twp. 25-K8-00A-08D-000 RJ Investments LLC Slope St. $2,519.44 SOLD $2,519.44 -BIDDER #129
99 18-0991 Hazle Twp. 26-R852-001-009-000 Odell Roy Inc. Scamper St. $1,450.93 NO BID
100 18-0992 Hazle Twp. 26-R951-002-012-000 Prokop Margaret E. 66 First St. $1,789.24 SOLD $1,789.24 -BIDDER #63
101 17-1015 Hazle Twp. 26-S7-1T02-004-000 Debra Loomis 4 Holly Lynn Mbhlhm Park $1,749.07 NO BID
102 17-1035 Hazle Twp. 26-5855-001-007-000 Francisca Rodriguez 78 W. Main St. $1,741.83 NO BID
103 18-1047 Hazle Twp. 26-5859-003-010-000 Disabella Anthony & Nicoleen 1075 James St. $1,226.45 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #223
104 18-1095 Hazle Twp. 26-T8NW2-006-013-000 Capriotti James N. & Vercusky Thomas Morrison Circle $1,256.77 SOLD $1,256.77 -BIDDER #75
105 18-1099 Hazle Twp. 26-T951-002-011-000 Girosky Michelle 536 Stockton Mountain Rd $1,417.15 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
106 18-1106 Hazle Twp. 26-U5510-002-241-000 Losbanos Teresita Laurel Valley Rd. $1,221.16 SOLD $5,000 -BIDDER #142
107 16-0971 Hazle Twp. 26-U5510-007-353-000 Marion Harvey Laurel Valley Rd. $1,816.95 SOLD $1,816.95 -BIDDER #69
108 18-1115 Hazle Twp. 26-U5510-014-455-000 Degrace Patricia Laurel Valley Rd. $1,310.16 SOLD $1,310.16 -BIDDER #69
109 17-1152 Hazle Twp. 26-U5512-001-078-000 Carter Stewart J. & Winie A. Buttonbush Ln. $1,796.04 SOLD $4,500 -BIDDER #69
110 18-1129 Hazle Twp. 26-U5513-001-168-000 Tellez Garry Sweet Birch Lane $1,135.56 SOLD $1,135.56 -BIDDER #69
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111 17-1182 Hazle Twp. 26-U5514-001-197-000 Virginia Granados, deceased Sassafras Ln. $2,217.18 SOLD $2,217.18 -BIDDER #69
112 18-1140 Hazle Twp. 26-U5514-001-275-000 Gao Jing & Gao Thomas Camella Lane $1,310.47 SOLD $2,500 -BIDDER #69
113 18-1145 Hazle Twp. 26-U5514-001-500-000 Lagutin Peter G. & Judy D. White Oak Lane $2,973.03 SOLD $3,500 -BIDDER #211
114 18-1172 Hazle Twp. 26-U553-006-009-000 Gonzales Leonardo S. & Filiaz A Musk Cir. $1,380.23 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
115 18-1175 Hazle Twp. 26-U554-001-027-000 Ayala Yemele Pine Valley Lane $1,314.71 NO BID
116 18-1179 Hazle Twp. 26-U554-005-011-000 Gonzales Leonardo S. & Filiaz A GLEN EAGLE DR. $1,268.02 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
117 18-1188 Hazle Twp. 26-U554-011-016-000 Cruz Ma Cristina Jennifer L. Merion Dr. $1,231.42 SOLD $1,231.42 -BIDDER #69
118 18-1191 Hazle Twp. 26-U554-012-034-000 Nano Tessie Souther Hill Ct. $1,209.10 SOLD $1,209.10 -BIDDER #69
119 18-1204 Hazle Twp. 26-U557-003-012-000 Abreu Francisco Quapaw Dr. $1,333.88 SOLD $1,333.88 -BIDDER #69
120 17-1252 Hazle Twp. 26-U557-003-079-000 Keirand Daniels Kickapoo Dr. $1,534.58 SOLD $1,534.58 -BIDDER #69
121 18-1219 Hazle Twp. 26-U558-006-017-000 Gitau Hannah W. Turnberry Lane $1,187.36 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
122 18-1221 Hazle Twp. 26-U559-001-041-000 Shah Daniel Turnberry Lane $1,225.00 SOLD $1,225.00 -BIDDER #69
123 18-1242 Hazle Twp. 26-U853-006-002-001 Beishline Alvin & Mary 10 Rear E. Church St. $2,005.00 NO BID
124 17-1279 Hazle Township 26-U853-001-006-000 Michael DeMelfi, deceased Main St. $2,311.35 SOLD $2,311.35 -BIDDER #75
125 17-1343 Hunlock Township 29-1451-004-007-000 Robert J. Kozlowski Park Ridge Dr. $1,897.36 NO BID
126 18-1313 Hunlock Twp. 29-)6-00A-07B-000 Stahl Barbara Route 00011 $894.13 SOLD $894.13 -BIDDER #153
127 18-1318 Hunlock Twp. 29-J651-003-054-000 Mazur Andrew Garden Dr. $1,076.45 SOLD $1,076.45 -BIDDER #87
128 18-1353 Jackson Twp. 31-G8-00A-046-000 Hunter Donn L. Sr. & Brenda 138 Weavertown Rd. $1,160.39 SOLD $2,000 -BIDDER #156
129 18-1386 Jenkins Twp. 33-F11-T01-209-001 Yankay Ronald 209 Heather Highland Park $1,191.39 NO BID
130 18-1389 Jenkins Twp. 33-F11-T01-332-000 Dehaven Beverly 332 Heather Highalnds $1,209.98 NO BID
131 18-1403 Jenkins Twp. 33-F11S1-010-007-000 Shane Julia & Joseph 24 Market St. $1,316.08 SOLD $1,316.08 -BIDDER #174
132 18-1414 Kingston Borough 34-G9SE1-002-018-000 Bucholtz Kevin J. 280 Pringle St. $804.16 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
133 17-1481 Kingston Borough 34-G9SE4-016-032-000 Kimberly Flynn, deceased 925 Market St. $2,036.47 SOLD $6,500 -BIDDER #235
134 18-1489 Kingston Borough 34-H9NE3-005-013-000 Bednarski John 63 S. Dawes Ave. $1,143.60 SOLD $8,000 -BIDDER #99
135 18-1498 Kingston Twp. 35-E8-00A-000-000 Anthracite Scenic Trails Assoc S Memorial Highway $669.75 Removed due to assessment/mapping issue
136 17-1589 Kingston Twp. 35-E9-00A-009-117 Janusko Edmund 144 Robin Dr. $1,626.33 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
137 17-1595 Kingston Twp. 35-E9-T01-071-000 Lou Forte 71 Cardinal Circle-Pad 71 $1,672.38 NO BID
138 18-1557 Lake Twp. 37-F5-00A-38A-003 Segeda John & Sophia Off Cemetery Rd. $1,187.65 NO BID
139 18-1614 Larksville Boro 38-G951-002-027-000 Daniels Donald & Jeffrey 31 Murray St. $1,257.28 SOLD $1,257.28 -BIDDER #27
140 18-1598 Larksville Boro 38-H855-008-02A-000 Morton Dollie R. & Redguard Kisha Chestnut St. $1,309.61 NO BID
141 16-1405 Larksville Boro 38-H855-008-012-000 Bucha Jannell K. 501 E. Main St. $1,032.15 SOLD $4,000 -BIDDER #6
142 17-1669 Larksville Boro 38-H855-009-002-000 Earl Wallace, deceased 295 Poplar St. $1,905.75 SOLD $8,500 -BIDDER #19
143 18-1634 Laurel Run Boro 39-110S6-001-008-000 Anstett Erica & Mark Bozentka Oliver Mls. $1,373.26 NO BID
144 18-1653 Lehman Twp. 40-F5-00A-10A-000 Coolbaugh Ronald A Sr. 67 Trojan Rd. $1,353.32 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #145
145 13-1941 Lehman Township 40-G551-015-006-000 King, William A. Jr. & April L. Pearl St. $1,214.14 SOLD $3,000 -BIDDER #118
146 17-1745 Lehman Twp. 40-G5-T02-010-000 Fogarty Madeline 16 Country Crest Lane $1,514.50 NO BID
147 18-1715 Nanticoke City 42-)7NE3-002-013-000 Grohowski John S. 129 Loomis St. $1,523.48 SOLD $1,523.48 -BIDDER #174
148 18-1744 Nanticoke City 42-)7NE4-026-030-000 Griffiths Sterling & Brenda 265 E. Spring St. $1,274.48 NO BID
149 17-1823 Nanticoke City 42-J7NW2-009-021-000 Thomas Romanchik 158 Garfield St. $1,832.69 SOLD $3,500 -BIDDER #181
150 18-1808 Nanticoke City 42-)J7SE1-027-31A-000 Burger Mae C. Crnr S. Hanover St. $1,929.14 SOLD $1,929.14 -BIDDER #199
151 18-1803 Nanticoke City 42-J7SE2-006-009-000 Lagun William A. Sr. 1018 College St. $1,655.65 SOLD $12,500 -BIDDER #56
152 18-1804 Nanticoke City 42-)7SE2-015-007-000 Sanders Susan E Grove St. $1,050.19 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
153 17-1894 Nanticoke City 42-)7SE2-006-006-000 Alfons T. Ormanowski, deceased 383 Grove St. $2,018.05 SOLD $13,000 -BIDDER #65
154 17-1812 Nanticoke City 42-)7SW2-001-003-000 Steven Greco 334 W. Main St. $2,048.43 SOLD $8,000 -BIDDER #34
155 18-1764 Nanticoke City 42-K751-008-27A-000 Tobin Amanda 134 Pine St. $1,078.70 SOLD $9,500 -BIDDER #118
156 17-1965 Nescopeck Township 44-Q3-00A-075-000 Brenda L. Steinruck Overlook Rd.-Black Creek Rd. $2,156.16 NO BID
157 18-1934 Newport Twp. 46-K651-001-007-000 Rand Caroline 116 W. Enterprise St. $2,206.38 SOLD $2,206.38 -BIDDER #62
158 18-1940 Newport Twp. 46-K651-007-018-000 Martin Kevin J. Christopher Murray 8 Rock St. $1,311.43 SOLD $1,311.43 -BIDDER #187
159 18-1947 Newport Twp. 46-K651-014-007-000 Octavia Henry 113 W. Enterprise St. $1,372.23 NO BID
160 18-1951 Newport Twp. 46-K651-018-020-000 Grohowski John S. 34 Newport St. $1,405.20 NO BID
161 17-2015 Newport Twp. 46-K651-004-002-000 Craig J. Pollick 5 Enterprise St. $1,576.41 NO BID
162 17-2017 Newport Twp. 46-K651-004-03A-000 Craig J. Pollick 7 Enterprise St. $1,561.76 NO BID
163 18-1961 Newport Twp. 46-K652-001-039-000 Kreidler Jonathon R. 58 Arch St. $1,432.76 SOLD $1,432.76 -BIDDER #34
164 16-1642 Newport Twp. 46-K655-005-002-000 Hunter Jeremy & Lawrence D. Hodges 450 Old Newport St. $1,633.21 SOLD $9,000 -BIDDER #209
165 17-1994 Newport Twp. 46-K7NW2-005-010-000 Frank J. Capozzi Sr. 138-140 Robert St. $1,598.50 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #66
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166 16-1650 Newport Twp. 46-K752-005-020-000 Clem J. Krzynefski 96 Newport Ave. $580.36 SOLD $16,500 -BIDDER #147
167 18-2082 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE1-006-001-000 Ted L. Obrien 276 Gardner St. $1,291.86 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
168 18-1992 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE2-007-004-000 Burgos Jose 61 Pierce St. $1,303.41 SOLD $7,000 -BIDDER #254
169 18-2017 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE2-008-03A-000 Sinkewicz Jerome J. 107 Washington St. $1,313.16 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
170 18-2019 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE4-023-016-000 Golightley Lora D. 115 E. walnut St. $1,168.16 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
171 18-2020 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE4-023-017-000 Golightley Jeffrey & Sheila Etal 113 E. Walnut St. $1,770.01 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
172 17-2098 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SE4-047-004-000 Joseph E. Swartwood 63 Center Ave. $1,590.41 SOLD $11,000 -BIDDER #118
173 18-2060 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SW3-013-012-000 New Life Community Church 181 Franklin St. $1,483.23 SOLD $3,500 -BIDDER #116
174 18-2098 Plymouth Borough 48-H8SW3-017-015-000 Wolf Malia 461 Second St. $1,158.53 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
175 18-2048 Plymouth Borough 48-183NE1-002-013-000 Parker Robert S. Sr. 364 Salsburg Ln $901.41 SOLD $901.41 -BIDDER #116
176 18-2049 Plymouth Borough 48-18NE1-002-13A-000 Parker Robert S. Revocable Trust 366 Salsburg Ln $1,183.21 SOLD $1,183.21 -BIDDER #102
177 17-2127 Plymouth Borough 48-18NW2-013-011-000 Chinh Vo a/k/a David Vo 89 Coal St. $2,400.92 SOLD $8,000 -BIDDER #118
178 18-4123 Plymouth Township 49-1752-001-002-000 Sorber, Karen Lee W. Poplar St. $1,225.86 SOLD $1,225.86 -BIDDER #62
179 16-1809 Plymouth Township 49-1754-002-016-000 Parcelnomics 1457 W. Main St. $1,764.10 SOLD $1,764.10 -BIDDER #162
180 18-2169 Plymouth Twp. 49-1851-003-007-000 Suchowierski John & Stella Hemlock St. $1,276.72 NO BID
181 18-2226 Plains Twp. 50-G10SE1-009-005-000 Slowik Mark 12 E. Charles St. $1,385.58 SOLD $6,500 -BIDDER #174
182 18-2285 Plains Twp. 50-G11-T02-167-000 Meehan Michael 167 E. Mountain Ridge MHP $1,025.06 NO BID
183 18-2325 Pittston Twp. 51-E12-00A-01F-000 AMD Land Development LLC Oak St $921.13 NO BID
184 17-2371 Pittston Township 51-E1255-002-013-000 Rosemary Borkowski Laurel St. $1,513.97 NO BID
185 17-2491 Salem Twp. 55-0451-003-004-000 Herbert Estus Salem Bivd. $1,541.76 NO BID
186 18-2465 Salem Twp. 55-P3NW2-008-002-000 Morgan Darlene E. E Eighth St. $1,112.19 NO BID
187 17-2504 Salem Township 55-P3SW1-007-029-000 Frank P. Mazza and Cristina M. Brown 437-439 E. Second St. $1,918.55 SOLD $1,918.55 -BIDDER #56
188 18-2485 Shickshinny Boro. 56-L4NE4-001-019-000 McDaniels Harold A. Etal Chestnut Rd. $1,357.72 NO BID
189 18-2486 Shickshinny Boro. 56-L4NE4-001-01A-000 McDaniels Harold A. Etal Chestnut Rd. $982.49 NO BID
190 18-2489 Shickshinny Boro. 56-L4SE1-006-001-000 McDaniels Harold A. Etal Chestnut Rd. $1,727.52 NO BID
191 18-2490 Shickshinny Boro. 56-L4SE1-006-006-000 McDaniels Harold A. Etal Chestnut Rd. $984.33 NO BID
192 18-2488 Shickshinny Boro. 56-L4SE1-003-006-000 Hunter William E. 9 Nicely St. $1,198.74 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
193 17-2548 Sugarloaf Township 58-Q5-00A-16A-000 Roland E. Wenner, deceased & Rita Wenner Merry L Dr. $1,620.88 NO BID
194 17-2700 | West Hazleton Borough 63-T7SE2-006-012-000 June A. Lehman 50 Tamarack St. $2,214.30 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #179
195 17-2683 | West Hazleton Borough 63-T7SE2-023-003-000 Richard Gould 210 E. Green St. $826.34 SOLD $17,500 -BIDDER #100
196 17-2719 | West Hazleton Borough 63-T7SE2-026-014-000 Bernard Gaizick 111S. Broad St. $2,154.88 SOLD $15,000 -BIDDER #48
197 14-3468 West Pittston Boro. 65-D11SE4-016-018-000 Speece, Roy G. & Mary Ann Ann St. $1,273.32 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
198 14-3469 West Pittston Boro. 65-D11SE4-016-019-000 Speece, Roy G. & Mary Ann 138 Ann St. $1,439.89 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
199 18-2752 West Pittston Boro. 65-E11NE1-020-030-000 Heller Frederick J. 27 Stanton St. $1,249.98 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
200 15-3176 | West Wyoming Boro. 66-E£1051-001-006-000 Remblish, Casey J. 10-12 Cooper Hill Rd. $886.06 SOLD $16,000 -BIDDER #81
201 17-2887 Wilkes-Barre Twp. 69-110NW4-008-055-000 Morio Stephen T 442 Rear Francis St. $1,168.40 SOLD $2,500 -BIDDER #34
202 15-3287 Wilkes-Barre Twp. 69-110NW4-008-056-000 Morio Stephen T 442 Francis St. $965.72 SOLD $9,500 -BIDDER #34
203 18-2874 Wilkes-Barre Twp. 69-110SW1-002-005-000 Masterman Todd 815 Lehigh St. $1,373.24 SOLD $8,500 -BIDDER #96
204 17-2909 Yatesville Borough 70-F1153-001-042-000 Donna Maria Cresho 26 Stout St. $1,802.18 SOLD $8,500 -BIDDER #96
205 18-3126 Hazleton City 71-T8NE14-006-04A-000 Andujar Kelly O. Monges St. $1,279.64 SOLD $1,279.64 -BIDDER #75
206 15-3680 Hazleton City 71-T8NE44-007-002-000 Robert Zukowski 504-506 E. Diamond Ave. $1,776.07 SOLD $1,776.07 -BIDDER #188
207 18-3109 Hazleton City 71-T8NW31-010-10A-000 Kostic David P. & Elizabeth Rear Carson St. $1,225.47 NO BID
208 18-3001 Hazleton City 71-T8NW34-010-07B-000 Alexander Mary Lou 547 N. Church St. $1,041.46 SOLD $7,000 -BIDDER #72
209 17-3090 Hazleton City 71-T8NW41-002-11A-000 Dorel Valentin Screciu 817 Hanover Ct. $1,501.56 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #223
210 18-3026 Hazleton City 71-T8SW12-002-16A-000 Villafana Joel 555 Rear N. Vine St. $1,146.35 NO BID
211 17-2990 Hazleton City 71-T8SW13-017-01A-000 Carmen Genao 77 N. Vine St. $1,579.31 SOLD $26,000 -BIDDER #154
212 18-3017 Hazleton City 71-T8SW21-008-04B-000 Tarantino Norman 154 N. Lee Ct. $1,283.80 SOLD $1,500 -BIDDER #215
213 18-4158 Hazleton City 71-T8SW31-015-010-000 Northeast Kitches, Inc. 41-44 E. Chestnut St. $2,682.19 REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
214 18-2914 Hazleton City 71-T8SW34-020-02A-000 Witalis Alexandra 124 E. Juniper St. $1,223.30 SOLD $5,000 -BIDDER #139
215 18-2954 Hazleton City 71-U8-T01-134-000 Perez Francisco J. & Nelsida Garcia Duarte 134 S. Pine Tree Rd. $880.14 SOLD $14,500 -BIDDER #247
216 18-3204 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE2-002-08A-000 Chacko John & Maryann 156 Panama St. $1,548.47 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
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217 18-3212 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE2-005-033-000 Leyshon Edward J. & Sharon J. 4 Division St. $1,165.43 SOLD $1,165.43 -BIDDER #187
218 18-3215 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE2-013-005-000 Butch Delores N Main St. $1,320.10 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
219 18-3246 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE3-018-002-000 Nationwide Tire Recyclers Inc. 91 Mill St. $1,477.33 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
220 18-3248 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE3-020-020-000 Whipple Wendy Carrol St. $1,492.74 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
221 18-3270 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11NE3-027-039-000 Valyo Joseph 31 Prospect Pl $1,228.28 NO BID
222 18-3279 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11SE1-008-027-000 Yatko Kristopher 10 Cherry St. $1,369.44 SOLD $4,000 -BIDDER #116
223 18-3289 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11SE1-045-09B-000 Healey Francis A 31 E. Frothingham St. $1,398.29 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
224 18-3277 PITTSTON CITY 72-E11SE2-013-001-000 13 Market LLC 13 Market St. $1,725.91 NEPA Land Bank Authority Purchase
225 18-3951 Wilkes-Barre City 73-G10SE1-006-007-000 Krawczyk Mary Etal 14 W Sidney St. $1,285.86 SOLD $21,000 -BIDDER #229
226 18-3958 Wilkes-Barre City 73-G10SE1-011-024-000 Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corp. 1384 Rear N. Washington St. $1,062.20 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
227 17-3933 Wilkes-Barre City 73-G10SE2-006-005-000 Elma L. Jerr Cleveland St. $1,483.78 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
228 17-3935 Wilkes-Barre City 73-G10SE2-011-001-000 James W. Conroy, deceased 191 Maycock St. $2,211.73 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #173
229 18-3844 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW2-011-002-000 Kwak Kurt J. 792 N Penna Ave. $1,069.57 SOLD $3,500 -BIDDER #123
230 18-3329 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW2-018-026-000 View Joleen 3 Auburn St. $1,336.98 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
231 17-3837 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW3-012-006-000 Patrick J. Conway & Jeanne M. Conway 269 Madison St. $2,272.17 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
232 18-3884 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW4-018-029-000 Martin Ellon X. 212 Madison St. $1,015.19 SOLD $1,015.19 -BIDDER #233
233 16-3195 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW4-019-008-000 Norman Waters, deceased 129 Madison St. $2,459.54 SOLD $17,000 -BIDDER #229
234 17-3875 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW4-020-038-000 Martin Reyes 214 Wyoming St. $1,506.15 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
235 18-3909 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW1-006-002-000 Branzuela Dawn M. & Burgit Patricia 25 Wyoming St. $1,797.38 SOLD $13,500 -BIDDER #106
236 18-3911 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW1-006-005-000 Doughtery Jacob 37 Wyoming St. $1,621.11 SOLD $15,000 -BIDDER #25
237 17-3895 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW1-007-003-000 Keirand Daniels 257-259 N. Penna Ave. $2,419.72 SOLD $8,000 -BIDDER #193
238 17-3347 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW1-010-001-000 Ted Turon 112 Scott St. $2,290.59 SOLD $15,000 -BIDDER #34
239 17-3357 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW2-008-006-000 Lillian Searles 81 Spring St. $1,811.19 SOLD $14,000 -BIDDER #39
240 17-3363 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW2-012-009-000 Luis Saavedra 171 Scott St. $2,047.81 NO BID
241 18-3377 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW2-017-034-000 Dinoski Anthony & Mary Ann 30 Mundy St. $1,430.62 SOLD $9,000 -BIDDER #79
242 18-3401 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10SW4-017-029-000 Lee Mary M. Etal 12 Hayes Lane $1,314.04 SOLD $16,500 -BIDDER #123
243 18-4185 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H9SE1-003-10A-000 Swoboda, Catherine & Richard 26 Irving PI. $1,418.82 SOLD $46,000 -BIDDER #30
244 18-3560 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H9SE4-027-14A-000 Smith Phyllis Rear S. River St. $1,147.31 SOLD $1,147.31 -BIDDER #143
245 16-2904 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H9SE4-004-023-000 Debra Hoskins and Lori-Marie Speight 244 Academy St. $2,944.20 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
246 18-3568 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H9SE4-033-021-000 Dale Kathryn Louise 21 Walnut St. $1,484.98 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #59
247 18-3403 Wilkes-Barre City 73-110NW1-004-013-000 Kostrzewski Sophia N Empire St. $1,231.26 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
248 18-3443 Wilkes-Barre City 73-110NW1-014-007-000 Arnonoe Chas E. 417 New Market St. $1,432.37 SOLD $12,000 -BIDDER #94
249 15-4081 Wilkes-Barre City 73-110NW1-014-016-000 William P. Kratz & Molly E. Kratz 445 New Market St. $2,624.34 SOLD $26,000 -BIDDER #90
250 18-3444 Wilkes-Barre City 73-110NW1-014-017-000 Dunay Jos & Rose Ann 449 New Market St. $1,631.30 SOLD $19,500 -BIDDER #106
251 15-4487 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE1-020-004-000 Diane J. Beaton 114 Westminster St. $3,982.71 SOLD $6,000 -BIDDER #20
252 18-2143 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE1-037-003-000 Omack, Kristin Lee 11 McCarragher St. $1,456.46 SOLD $11,500 -BIDDER #204
253 18-3618 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-024-019-000 Bankes Bradley 10 Howard St. $1,445.98 SOLD $15,000 -BIDDER #90
254 15-4317 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-032-044-000 Stephenson Robert Louis 264 Hazle St. $1,518.39 Continued by Court Order to November 7, 2019
255 18-3627 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-032-44B-000 Stephenson Robert Louis 266 HAZLE ST $1,209.52 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
256 17-3612 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-023-023-000 Jason Cohen & Linda J. Jaremko 150 Park Ave. $2,243.02 SOLD $14,500 -BIDDER #5
257 17-3613 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-027-008-000 Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano Almond Ln. $1,611.22 SOLD $4,500 -BIDDER #191
258 17-3614 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE2-027-009-000 Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano 151 Almond Ln. $2,244.83 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #191
259 16-2995 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE3-003-010-000 Perillo Angelo 471 S. Grant St. $1,611.46 SOLD $33,000 -BIDDER #98
260 18-3712 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NE4-021-010-000 Jones David W. & Deborah 109 Jones St. $1,498.83 SOLD $34,000 -BIDDER #98
261 18-3792 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NW2-005-003-000 McArdle William & Francis 48 Gates St. $1,515.01 SOLD $22,000 -BIDDER #229
262 18-3799 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NW2-011-044-000 WZJ Construction LLC 34 Rowland St. $1,302.50 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
263 18-3828 Wilkes-Barre City 73-1I9NW2-030-001-000 Carey Charles M. 56 Regent St. $1,345.08 SOLD $30,000 -BIDDER #98
264 16-3131 Wilkes-Barre City 73-19NW2-018-018-000 Sheila Greco 113 Waller St. $3,270.84 SOLD $21,000 -BIDDER #45
265 18-3837 Wilkes-Barre City 73-1I9NW3-005-012-000 All Phases Home Imp Assiants LLC 24 Cherry St. $1,160.73 RE-EXPOSE NOVEMBER 7TH
266 16-2730 Wilkes-Barre City 73-H10NW1-005-007-000 Sebastianelli Michelle A 51 W. Hollenback St. $980.79 SOLD $25,000 -BIDDER #262
267 18-3982 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C651-002-18A-000 Morrissey William Sooby Ave. $1,026.56 SOLD $1,026.56 -BIDDER #153
268 18-3987 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C651-005-010-000 Barcheski Albert 99 Second St. $1,152.17 SOLD $2,500 -BIDDER #246
269 18-3990 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C651-005-09A-000 Barcheski Albert Second St. $934.71 SOLD $934.71 -BIDDER #153
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270 18-3991 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C651-007-016-000 Jones Merwyn E. Kitchen Ave. $1,114.63 NO BID

271 18-3999 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C654-010-010-000 Whitelonis Leonard Maple St. $1,962.87 SOLD $2,500 -BIDDER #46
272 18-4000 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C654-010-011-000 Whitelonis Leonard Maple St. $2,197.12 SOLD $4,000 -BIDDER #34
273 18-4001 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-C654-011-010-000 Whitelonis Leonard Maple St. $1,990.60 SOLD $4,500 -BIDDER #34
274 18-4011 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-D6512-005-002-000 Kendrick Dennis Upper Cease St. $1,321.00 SOLD $5,500 -BIDDER #248
275 18-4040 Harveys Lake Boro. 74-D756-004-028-000 Kachmar Joseph & Josephine Off Carpenter Rd. $1,128.59 NO BID

276
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