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NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Northeast Revenue Service, LLC as agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE
under the Pennsylvania Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 9th day of August, 2018 on the third floor of the King’s
College Sheehy-Farmer Campus Center, 105 North Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The properties exposed to sale will be sold Free & Clear of all
tax and municipal claims, mortgages, liens, charges and estates of whatsoever kind, except ground rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every
reasonable effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST
and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without guarantee of warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on
behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. Inaccordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting
on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.

3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord
license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the owner shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.
TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording costs shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is

completed and must be made in the form of cash, certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the close of business
on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing a property in any sale the bidder shall not be
permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and the matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under the
Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.
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Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN ON THE DAY OF THE SALE. Registration and
Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders must present one (1) form
of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the Sale. Failure to present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a
Prospective Bidder from being registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the bidder from receiving his
bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who believes that by no reason of some defect said property should
not be exposed to sale, should immediately make known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability or familial status in employment
or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2015 inter alia.
Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 18, 2017. Petitioner exposed
certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 27, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on March 24, 2017.Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale
on September 20, 2016 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader,
Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 19, 2016.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act, however the following properties were not sold at the
respective Upset Sales, because the upset sale price was not obtained:
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A ] B C [ D | E [ F [ G
1 Docket # PIN No. Owner Location Minimum Bid Notes
2 |2018-02061 01-19SE4-001-049-000 Nancy Bernal 98 R. Ashley St. Ashley Borough $1,136.85 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 37| 2017-14243 01-195E4-002-004-000 John W. Dixon 103 Manhattan St. Ashley Borough $2,646.79 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 4 | 2018-02062 01-195E4-002-16B-000 Augustino Albanese Brown St. Ashley Borough $1,159.11 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 5 | 2018-02063 01-195E4-007-015-000 Margaret Popadick 44 Conyngham St. Ashley Borough $1,377.39 SOLD $9,000 / Bidder #267
| 6 |2018-02031 01-195E4-018-011-000 Harold Langan & Carol Langan 63 N. Main St. Ashley Borough $1,159.00 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 7 | 2018-02064 01-195E4-009-012-000 Mark J. Clinton 29 N. Main St. Ashley Borough $1,585.62 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 8 | 2018-02085 01-J9NE1-002-007-000 Mark & Charmaine Forgach 28 Hazleton St. Ashley Borough $1,463.89 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 9 | 2018-02086 01-J9NE1-003-015-000 Thomas R. Mercadante & Annette M. Griffith 75 Hazleton St. Ashley Borough $1,389.70 NO BID
10| 2018-02087 01-J9NE1-T01-104-000 Sharon Josefowicz 104 Donato Dr. Ashley Borough $1,206.74 NO BID
111 [ 2018-02114 01-J9NE1-T01-165-000 David Koonrad 165 Janet Dr. Ashley Borough $1,428.95 NO BID
|12 2018-01998 02-D125E4-009-002-000 Brian J. Connolly & Debra A. Connolly 528 Grove St. Avoca Borough $709.41 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
|13 2018-02134 02-D12NE4-001-003-000 Robin Slusser York Ave. Avoca Borough $1,188.23 NOBID
| 14| 2018-02133 02-D12NE4-001-004-000 Robin Slusser York Ave. Avoca Borough $1,341.23 NOBID
115 | 2018-02117 03-U5-00A-013-000 Donna Pursel Mountain Rd. Black Creek Township $1,128.54 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|16 | 2018-02116 03-U551A-007-035-000 Francis J. Hutta, Jr. W. Tuscarora Dr. Black Creek Township $1,338.02 NOBID
17| 2018-02019 03-U553-001-094-000 Ronald Dalley & Lorrie Dalley Turnberry Ln. Black Creek Township $1,571.18 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
118 ]2018-02021 03-U553-001-118-000 James N. Dibiase & Theresa Dibiase Cornsilk Ave. Black Creek Township $1,868.74 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
19| 2018-02056 03-U553-001-177-000 Carroll Moog & Joseph Aguilar Pawnee Ave. Black Creek Township $1,105.58 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
| 20| 2018-02016 04-11453-006-013-000 Anthony Denessi & Margaret Denessi S. Second St. Bear Creek Township $1,198.38 NO BID
| 21]2018-02014 04-K1351-002-001-000 Leonard Pribula Maple Ave. Bear Creek Township $1,117.97 NOBID
| 22| 2018-02053 04-N1252-001-005-000 Robert E. Hughes 105 Old Ford Rd. Bear Creek Township $1,226.21 NO BID
| 23] 2018-02023 04-N1252-002-028-000 Helen Bogansky, George M. Bogansky & Paul J. Bogansky Fern Ridge Rd. Bear Creek Township $1,309.37 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 24| 2018-02313 05-11451E-012-014-000 R.R. Investments LLC Indian Lake Trl. Buck Township $1,123.07 NOBID
| 25 2018-02036 05-K1354-001-08A-000 Barbara Gillespie & Alfred Krieger Buck Birch Ln. Buck Township $1,190.28 NO BID
| 26| 2018-02312 05-K14-00A-022-000 Charles J. Murray & Gail A. Murray Chestnut Ln. Buck Township $1,362.26 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 27 2018-02310 05-K14-00A-18A-000 Charles J. Murray & Gail A. Murray 12 Chestnut Ln. Buck Township $1,387.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 287 2018-02311 05-K14-00A-19A-000 Charles J. Murray & Gail A. Murray Chestnut Ln. Buck Township $1,302.27 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|29 2018-02035 06-Q853-001-10R-000 Robert L. Eubanks James Ln. Butler Township $1,222.14 NOBID
E 2018-02033 06-R7-00A-16A-000 Timothy J. Roman & Alan Roman 448 Foothills Dr. Butler Township $2,078.15 SOLD $39,000 / Bidder #368
| 31{2018-02305 06-R854-001-028-000 Walter David Heckrote W. Footbhills Dr. Butler Township $1,648.29 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 32|2018-02139 06-R854-001-029-000 Walter Heckrote W. Footbhills Dr. Butler Township $1,576.50 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
33|2018-02222 06-R854-001-032-000 Walter D. Heckrote W. Footbhills Dr. Butler Township $1,637.30 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
34| 2018-02141 06-Q8-00A-09A-000 George Alberts, Jr. Off Butler Rd. Butler Township $1,463.83 NO BID
35| 2018-02221 06-Q8510-006-012-000 Heather Emerson Bear Run Dr. Butler Township $1,192.44 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
36 | 2018-02334 09-M453-002-008-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 144 Lincoln St. Conyngham Township $1,467.03 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
37 2018-02335 09-M4$4-01C-015-000 IIK Development Co. 21 Nicely St. Conyngham Township $1,849.95 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #326
| 38 2018-03538 09-M554-006-002-000 Marie Rule 301 Pond Hill Mountain Rd. Conyngham Township $1,310.55 SOLD $30,000 / Bidder #264
39 2018-02013 10-C752-004-037-000 Mark Novak & Brenda F. Novak Clearview Villa Dallas Township $1,583.35 NO BID
40| 2018-02012 10-C752-004-038-000 Mark Novak & Brenda F. Novak Clearview Villa Dallas Township $1,583.35 NO BID
| 41| 2018-02011 10-C752-004-039-000 Mark Novak & Brenda F. Novak Clearview Villa Dallas Township $1,583.35 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #360
| 42 2018-02001 10-C9-T02-172-000 James Davenport 172 Valley View Trailer Park Dallas Township $1,426.77 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 43]2018-02000 10-D8-T03-025-000 Stephine Price 25 Dallas Park Dallas Township $1,807.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 44 2018-01999 10-D8-T03-039-000 Ralph R. May, Sr. 39 Dallas Mobile Home Park Dallas Township $901.62 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 45 | 2018-02488 10-D855-013-012-000 Andre M. Vanyo Higgs Ave. Dallas Township $1,561.65 NO BID
| 46 | 2018-02057 13-011-00A-007-000 Thomas S. Snyder Peat Moss Rd. Dennison Township $1,492.41 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
| 47 2018-02010 14-D11NE3-001-011-000 Dolores Griffin 803 N. Main St. Duryea Borough $1,077.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 48 | 2017-14280 14-D11NE3-002-005-000 David Keller 815 Rear N. Main St. Duryea Borough $2,322.41 NO BID
E 2018-02007 14-D12NW3-011-014-000 Leonard J. Vrabel & Josephine P. Vrabel 210 Cherry St. Duryea Borough $1,831.32 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #252
| 50 [ 2018-02006 14-D12NW3-011-020-000 Gerald Hulse & Janet Hulse 277 Columbia St. Duryea Borough $1,722.70 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
512018-02004 15-E12NE3-004-04A-000 Frances Hobbes 530 Wyoming Ave. Dupont Borough $1,363.26 SOLD $6,500 / Bidder #321
E 2018-02003 15-E12NE4-015-01A-000 Luzerne Investment 2014 Trust 237 Curtain St. Dupont Borough $1,373.72 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #163
53

2018-02058 16-D10-T02-027-001 Robert J. Fox 27 Mount Lookout Tr. Ct. Exeter Borough $1,189.99 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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| 54 |2018-02060 16-E10-00A-015-297 Raymond Heil & Denise Daubert 309 Birchwood Est. Exeter Borough $442.42 NO BID
| 552018-02166 17-B10-00A-019-002 Nellie Mae Williams Box 438 RR4 Exeter Township $1,455.85 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 56 |2018-02172 17-B10S3-002-007-000 Cheryl McCloskey Sutton Creek Rd. Exeter Township $1,260.51 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 57 |12018-02324 17-C1153-001-004-000 Edwin Foersch Pauline St. Exeter Township $2,076.29 NO BID
| 58 12018-02168 17-D10-00A-36M-000 Carol A. Norwig & William C. Norwig Box 342 Campground Rd. Exeter Township $1,083.42 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #266
| 5912018-02169 18-G951-004-017-000 Bassam Safi 44 E. Grove St. Edwardsville Borough $1,143.03 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #357
| 60 |2018-02167 18-G952-008-036-000 Keirand Daniels 123 Adj. Bunny Ln. Edwardsville Borough $1,092.53 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 61]2018-03537 18-G954-008-012-000 John M. Yudiski & Susan Carey Yudiski 288 Hillside Ave. Edwardsville Borough $1,553.63 SOLD $20,000 / Bidder #357
| 62 |2018-02163 19-G2-00A-020-000 James Philip Kester & Lisa Ann Kester Rear Bethel Hill Rd. Fairmount Township $1,350.21 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 63 |2017-14297 19-H2-00A-47E-000 Kevin Hoffman & Jacqueline Hoffman 54 Burma Road Fairmount Township $5,123.17 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 64 |12018-02162 19-H3-00A-01C-000 Kenneth F. Walter & Mary Ann Walter Huntington Creek Rd. Fairmount Township $1,088.65 NO BID
| 65 |2018-02226 19-12-00A-022-001 Timothy Leon Robbins & Susan Diane Robbins 186 Giza Rd. Fairmount Township $1,496.78 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 66 |2018-02316 21-GINE2-002-001-000 Joseph D. Scovish & Carol A. Scovish 169 Slocum St. Forty Fort Borough $1,326.75 SOLD $42,000 / Bidder #143
2017-14474 22-Q9SE3-012-001-000 Thomas J. Mulhearn and James A. Lawson, Co-Partners, t/a ;)¢ o ey Freeland Borough $3,643.90 CONTINUED TO JANUARY 2019
| 67 | Tandem Industries
2018-02208 22-Q9SE3-012-007-000 Thomas J. Mulhearn and James A. Lawson, Co-Partners, t/a . o\ o Freeland Borough $1,396.14 CONTINUED TO JANUARY 2019
| 68 | Tandem Industries
2018-02174 22-Q9SE3-012-008-000 Thomas J. Mulhearn and James A. Lawson, Co-Partners, t/a | o\ o Freeland Borough $1,366.89 CONTINUED TO JANUARY 2019
169 | Tandem Industries
| 70 |12018-02143 22-RINE2-028-007-000 Gregory Guarino 709-711 Main St. Freeland Borough $4,099.14 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 71[2018-02306 22-R9NE1-014-026-000 Carrie S. Klatt 649 Vine St. Freeland Borough $665.08 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
| 7212018-02151 22-RINE1-020-005-000 Donna M. Schlauch & Raymond J. Schlauch Hemlock St. Freeland Borough $861.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 73 12018-02152 22-RINE1-020-006-000 Donna M. Schlauch & Raymond J. Schlauch 693 Hemlock St. Freeland Borough $1,561.93 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 7412018-02142 22-RINE2-019-009-000 Gregory Guarino 622 Center St. Freeland Borough $4,783.90 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 75]2018-02154 23-Q10-T01-117-000 Luis Conner-Figueroa 117 Red Maple Ln. Foster Township $1,547.17 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 76 |2018-02145 23-Q11-00A-26B-000 White Haven Estates, LLC Hillary Dr. Foster Township $3,359.62 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 77 12018-02322 23-Q1151-005-001-000 Michael J. Cerruti & Suzanne E. Cerruti Woodhaven Dr. Foster Township $1,737.27 NOBID
| 78 12018-02138 23-Q1155-008-004-000 Sara Perez Villegas Shade Tree Rd. Foster Township $1,552.56 NO BID
| 79 |2018-02321 23-Q1156-004-003-000 Michael Ruger & Maria Ruger Sunshine Dr. Foster Township $1,506.08 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #324
50 | 201802323 23-Q1157-010-007-000 ﬁa"z:a(i:'”frau’ Debra A Kratz, Joseph J. Smallwood, and .\, 01 Dr. & Sunshine Dr.  Foster Township SL3757 0 1 Minimum Bid / Bidder #324
E 2018-02220 23-Q1158-010-008-000 Joann Braumann 25 Gail Dr. Foster Township $1,375.61 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 82 |2018-02229 23-R1051-002-032-000 Michael R. Durange & Margaret Pavlovich Durange 264 Highland Main St. Foster Township $1,582.28 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 83 |2018-02752 23-R1051-003-025-000 Albert Wheeler & Linda Wheeler 18 Highland Vig. Foster Township $1,581.02 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 84 |2018-02463 23-R1051-003-026-000 Albert Wheeler & Linda Wheeler Adj. 18 Bank Street St. Foster Township $1,540.66 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 85 |2018-02722 23-R1051-003-027-000 Albert Wheeler & Linda Wheeler Back Street St. Foster Township $1,521.62 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 86 |2018-02230 23-R11-00A-29K-000 Fantastic, LLC Caplos Rd. Foster Township $1,316.00 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 87 |12018-02462 23-R9-00A-04A-000 Lee D. Belles 101 St. Anns Dr. Foster Township $1,583.03 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 88 12018-02337 23-RINE3-009-012-000 Cynthia R. Hicks 107 Center St. Foster Township $1,186.00 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 89 |2018-02338 23-51052-001-009-000 Keith D. Lowery & Diane E. Shoemaker 9 S. Hazlebrook Rd. Foster Township $1,333.24 SOLD Minimum BID / Bidder #370
| 90 | 2018-02521 24-C9-T02-021-000 Joann Baker 21 Valley View Park Franklin Township $1,134.30 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 912018-02520 24-D9-00A-015-000 Thomas Zibuck & Arlene Zibuck Mt. Olive Rd. Franklin Township $1,283.84 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 92 |2018-02522 25-1851-017-009-000 William Amann & Anita Wanyo 521 High St. Hanover Township $1,598.52 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 93 |2018-02523 25-1853-T01-023-001 Terry Armithage & Kevin Armithage 23 Sans Souci Tr. Ct. Hanover Township $1,201.27 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 94 |2018-02636 25-1853-T01-029-000 Drinker Realty Corp. 29 Sans Souci Ct. Hanover Township $1,189.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 95 |2018-02459 25-19SE1-014-014-000 Stephen W. Danowski 12 E. Newport St. Hanover Township $1,646.97 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
| 96 |2018-02753 25-1852-005-012-000 Kareena Davenport & Susan Davenport 339 Main Rd. Hanover Township $175.00 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
| 97 |12018-02865 25-1852-009-006-000 Cherie L. Cruz 17 Rutter St. Hanover Township $1,148.46 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #366
ﬂ 2018-02464 25-)851-001-024-000 Equivest Investment, LLC 3128 S. Main St. Hanover Township $1,227.68 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 99 |2018-02466 25-1852-010-003-000 St. David the Builder Georgian Orthodox Church 55 Stanley St. Hanover Township $349.21 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1100 2018-02232 25-K8-00A-08D-000 RJ Investments LLC Slope St. Hanover Township $1,617.32 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1101 2018-02254 25-K7-00A-0A1-000 Reading Company Near Hanover Township $1,368.18 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1102 2018-02534 26-57-T02-004-000 Debra Loomis 4 Holly Lynn Mbhlhm Park Hazle Township $1,306.89 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
103|2018-02468 26-5855-001-007-000 Francisca Rodriguez 78 W. Main St. Hazle Township $1,279.97 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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1104]| 2018-02533 26-5857-001-020-000 Anthony Kasarda Main St. Hazle Township $1,305.45 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #332
1105 2018-02512 26-5857-003-006-000 Anthony Kasarda 241 Ebervale Rd. Hazle Township $1,240.81 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1106]| 2018-02513 26-5953-002-015-000 Sandra A. Tausendferunbt & William E. Herwig 39 Main St. Hazle Township $1,312.59 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1107 2018-02549 26-T551-001-088-000 Ellen Lim-Gaviola Stoney Mt. Drive Hazle Township $1,223.25 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1108 2018-02550 26-T551-001-094-000 Henri H. Zerbib & Deborah R. Zerbib Appalachian Way Hazle Township $1,147.86 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #327
1109 2018-02542 26-T551-001-240-000 Elizabeth Muigai & Gad M. Muchai Buck Mountain Blvd. Hazle Township $1,280.75 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1110 2018-02449 26-T551-001-489-000 Melissa P. Pineda Rock Crest Dr. Hazle Township $1,275.06 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #327
|111]2018-02451 26-T551-001-649-000 Ben D. Zhu & Jing Chen Green Mountain Dr. Hazle Township $1,356.07 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1112 2018-02537 26-T951-002-003-000 Andrew G. Grega 2 Ashmore Rd. Hazle Township $1,298.92 NO BID
|113]2018-02538 26-T951-002-03A-000 Susanne Grega & Andrew B. Grega 4 Ashmore Rd. Hazle Township $1,199.01 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #320
|114]2018-02528 26-U5510-001-011-000 Srikanth Reddy-Singireddy & Srujana Bobba Mountain Laurel Dr. Hazle Township $1,353.95 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1115 2018-02529 26-U5510-001-018-000 Maria Carmelita Almirante-Mariano Mountain Laurel Dr. Hazle Township $1,090.99 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1116 2018-02531 26-U5510-001-023-000 Aileen Abaa & Jars Junjie S. Ibanez Mountain Laurel Dr. Hazle Township $1,317.79 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
|117]2018-02532 26-U5510-001-078-000 Osman B. Lawalli & Lydia F. Tambis Elderberry Ln. Hazle Township $937.00 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1118 2018-02536 26-U5510-001-090-000 Juan Miguel K. Lizares & Corcelie T. Lizares Elderberry Ln. Hazle Township $1,442.82 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #327
1119 2018-02474 26-U5510-002-192-000 Pauline K. Kingoina & Caroline G. Osoro Laurel Valley Rd. Hazle Township $419.00 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1120| 2018-02476 26-U5510-010-488-000 Peter A. Collins Buttonbush Ln. Hazle Township $1,425.41 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1121 2018-02527 26-U5512-001-078-000 Stewart J. Carter & Winie A. Carter Buttonbush Ln. Hazle Township $1,317.73 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1122 2018-02525 26-U5513-001-037-000 Oscar J. Singayan & Marie E. Singayan White Oak Ln. Hazle Township $1,295.07 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
11231 2018-02908 26-U5513-001-080-000 Jiji Caparaz & Armando Savio Hickory Ln. Hazle Township $458.91 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1124 2018-02458 26-U5513-001-139-000 Marc Miller & Madhavan Madhusudhan Sycamore Ln. Hazle Township $979.39 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1125 2018-02472 26-U5513-001-143-000 Shabnam Sachdeva Sycamore Ln. Hazle Township $1,225.45 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1126]| 2018-02509 26-U5513-001-181-000 Felisa A. Mapa & Lorenzo S. Mapa Sweet Birch Ln. Hazle Township $1,357.42 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1127]2018-02496 26-U5513-001-215-000 Yolanda C. Dangallo & Hernani D. Dangallo Buttonbush Ln. Hazle Township $1,408.33 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1128 2018-02480 26-U5513-001-341-000 Ik Cho Kwon Lot 341 The Vistas Hazle Township $1,364.73 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1129 2018-02486 26-U5514-001-157-000 Liza Jane Stevenson & Gradie E. Stevenson Maple Ln. Hazle Township $885.97 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1130/ 2018-02864 26-U5514-001-177-000 Damarys A. Cruz Maple Ln. Hazle Township $836.53 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1131 2018-02863 26-U5514-001-197-000 Virginia Granados Sassafras Ln. Hazle Township $1,467.01 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1132 2018-02862 26-U5514-001-259-000 Maria Janeth Cando & Jose Alfredo Trono Alden Ln. Hazle Township $1,238.79 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1133|2018-02861 26-U5514-001-355-000 Anthony K. Gachao & Agatha N. Mwando White Oak Ln. Hazle Township $1,301.16 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1134]2018-02860 26-U5514-001-465-000 Pio L. Orig & Mamor E. Orig Maple Ln. Hazle Township $1,005.07 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #327
1135 2018-02430 26-U5515-001-041-000 Keun T. Suh & Won Seo Suh Lot 41, TW - Eagle Rock Resort  Hazle Township $1,380.74 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1136 2018-02514 26-U5515-001-323-000 Ranell T. Santa Cruz & Criselda A. Dela Pena Blue Spruce Dr. Hazle Township $1,664.67 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1137 2018-02879 26-U5515-001-357-000 Peregrino Apilando, Jr. & Jane Apilando Honeysuckle Dr. Hazle Township $1,227.02 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #327
1138 2018-02469 26-U5515-001-519-000 Donato Villanueva, Jr. & Maria A. Villanueva Tulip Tree Ln. Hazle Township $1,319.21 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #327
1139 2018-02859 26-U552-004-002-000 Rosalyn Balazon, Dante P. Miranda & Francisco B. Mendoza 6 J Janhanna Cir. Hazle Township $1,270.20 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1140 2018-02856 26-U552-008-017-000 Ruth Coachi E. Tuscarora Dr. Hazle Township $1,221.33 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #327
|141] 2018-02773 26-U553-001-010-000 Alexandra Schaeffer & Nicholas Korkantzis E. Lake Valley Dr. Hazle Township $1,132.62 NOBID
|142] 2018-02694 26-U553-001-011-000 Alexandra Schaeffer & Nicholas Korkantzis E. Lake Valley Dr. Hazle Township $1,132.62 NOBID
1143 2018-02540 26-U554-006-004-000 Anjanette G. Zozobrado Pine Valley Dr.-Eagle Rock Hazle Township $1,360.76 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|144]| 2018-02693 26-U554-010-001-000 Ariel B. Valderrama & Benedicta D. Lim Merion Dr. Hazle Township $356.29 SOLD $1,500 / Bidder #327
|145| 2018-02774 26-U555-010-005-000 Ernesto Diongzon Inverness Ln. Hazle Township $1,240.12 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
|146]| 2018-02647 26-U557-003-079-000 Keirand Daniels Kickapoo Dr. Hazle Township $1,210.41 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
| 147 2018-02510 26-U558-001-019-000 Gregory G. Perkins & Ellen E. Perkins 19 Turnberry Ln. Hazle Township $1,293.84 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1148 2018-02638 26-U853-001-006-000 Michael DeMelfi & Catherine DeMelfi Main St. Hazle Township $1,467.99 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|149] 2018-02687 26-V752-002-06A-000 James F. Tuggle, Jr. & Mattie M. Tuggle 215 Beaver Brook Rd. Hazle Township $1,304.64 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1150/ 2018-02219 28-E12NW4-005-026-000 Peter Czerkas and Jane Czerkas 45 Laurel St. Hughestown Borough $1,231.80 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #313
1151 2018-02516 28-E12NW4-010-004-000 William Jo Weitz & Marian Weitz Drake St. Hughestown Borough $1,158.77 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|152| 2018-02231 29-H5-00A-28N-000 Helen Czajkowski Swamp Rd. Hunlock Township $1,134.26 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1153 2018-02255 29-1451-004-007-000 Robert J. Kozlowski Park Ridge Dr. Hunlock Township $1,519.89 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
154 2018-02256 29-1552-003-027-000 I:fsl’v'lbur V- Shields and Ernestine F. Shields Revocable LIVIng g g+ 12 . Hunlock Township $1,126.17 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
155 2018-02258 31-H752-001-015-000 Gina Svoboda 55 B State Route 29 Jackson Township $278.60 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
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[156]
[157]
[158|
[159|
[160|
[161]
[162|
[163]
[164]
[165]
[ 166|

1167|
[168|
[169|
[170|
[171]
172]
173]
[174]
[175]
[176]
177]
[178]
[179|
18|
[181]
[182]
183
[184]
[185|
[186]
[187|
|188|
189
[190|
[191]
[192]
193]
[194]
[195]
[196]

1197|
[198]
[199]
[200|
[201]
[202|
[203]
[204]
[205|
[206|
207

2018-02336 33-E1152-003-016-000
2018-02252 33-F10S3-001-017-000
2018-02250 33-F11S1-010-018-000
2018-02518 34-G9SE1-010-007-000
2018-02745 34-G9SE1-033-005-000
2018-02747 34-G9SE4-001-013-000
2018-02539 34-G9SE4-016-032-000
2018-02452 34-G9SE1-031-063-000
2018-02723 34-G9SE2-001-015-000
2018-02481 34-GINE3-002-01A-000
2016-03195 34-GINE3-005-009-000

2018-02483 34-GINE3-016-016-000

2018-02749 34-G9SE2-002-027-000
2018-02741 34-G9SE2-018-037-000
2018-02750 34-G9SE3-08A-008-000
2018-03319 34-G9SE4-008-01A-000
2018-02554 34-H9NE1-011-019-000
2018-02742 34-HINE1-011-047-000
2018-03313 35-D1051-001-18A-000
2018-02906 35-E9-T01-071-000
2018-02482 37-E5-00A-032-000
2018-02688 38-H853-001-049-000
2018-03345 38-H8S5-007-010-000
2018-03330 38-H8S5-009-002-000
2018-03317 38-H854-005-006-000
2018-03315 38-H854-005-011-000
2018-03311 38-G9S1-004-010-000
2018-02631 39-110-T01-426-000
2018-02869 41-F9SE4-007-01A-000
2018-02867 42-)7SW2-001-003-000
2018-02874 42-)7SW2-002-009-000
2018-02695 42-J7NW2-009-021-000
2018-03458 42-)7NE4-008-008-001
2018-02696 42-)7SE1-038-015-000
2018-02697 42-)7SE1-038-15A-000
2018-02698 42-)7SE2-006-006-000
2018-02692 42-)7SE1-028-011-000
2017-14026 42-)7SE4-006-003-000
2018-02881 42-)7SW2-008-027-000
2018-02909 42-)7SE1-014-001-000
2018-02857 43-P3SW3-008-12A-000
2018-02686 44-Q3-00A-075-000
2018-02684 44-R4-00A-01E-000
2018-02715 46-K654-002-04A-000
2018-02651 46-K7NW2-005-010-000
2018-03456 46-K551-004-004-000
2018-03457 46-K551-004-005-000
2018-02650 46-K651-004-002-000
2018-02649 46-K651-004-03A-000
2018-02778 46-K651-018-31A-000
2018-02776 46-K651-025-025-000
2018-02904 46-K651-025-09A-000

Joseph Valyo

Keirand Daniels

Solomon Goldiamond

Northeast Investors Group, Inc.
Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Target Table Industries, Inc.

Kimberly Flynn

Samuel A. Austin & Helene L. Austin
Daniel F. Sweeney

Albert Cheskiewitz & Mary E. Cheskiewitz
Christopher Roberto

Raymond N. Stemrich & Rosalie Stemrich t/d/b/a Stemrich Real

Estate Properties

Mountain Vista Rentals Inc.
Romanowski Development Co. Inc.
James J. Sterner, Jr. & Helen Sterner
Rose Marie Kreider

Joseph Kearney

Westside Property Group Capital
Alice Solinsky

Lou Forte

Earl Lozier & Mary Ann Lozier
William Davison & Deborah Davison
Frank Shibilski & Stephen Vigorito
Earl Wallace & Mae Wallace
Laureen Yeager Pierce

Laureen Yeager Pierce

Helen Fertal & Margaret Fertal
Walter Baran

Agatha Kwedar

Steven Greco & Pei Pei Liu

George R. Seletski

Thomas Romanchik

Tree of Life Christian Fellowship
Joseph F. Skipkoski

Joseph F. Skipkoski

Alfons T. Ormanowski & Jean C. Ormanowski
John F. Jaikes, Jr.

Edward M. Petroski, Sr. & Edward Petroski, Jr.

Randy Casey & Kileigh Casey
Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Kyle Watkins

Brenda L. Steinruck

David A. Kachurka & Stacie L. Kachurka
James Griffith & Janet Griffith

Frank J. Capozzi Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser
Geraldine Repotski

Geraldine Repotski

Craig J. Pollick

Craig J. Pollick

Dorothy Knowles Kile & Cynthia Sherrill
Daniel Masakowski

Peter Przekop

1232 Main St.
15 Tennant St.
31 Main St.

48 Pulaski St.
232 Pringle St.
130 Cuba St.
925 Market St.
153 Pringle St.
584 Schuyler Ave.
62 Railroad Ave.
132 Walnut St.

782 Wyoming Ave.

111 Sharpe St.

51 Academy Ln.

549 N. Gates Ave.

50 E. Hoyt St.

40S. Loveland Ave.
65-67 S. Goodwin Ave.
1623 W. Eighth St.

71 Cardinal Circle-Pad 71
Route 29

417-419 Carver Rd.

240 Buttonwood Ln.

295 Poplar St.

35-37 Fifth St.

57-59 Fifth St.

21 Franklin St.

426 Rock HI.

103 Diamond St.

334 W. Main St.

268 W. Main St.

158 Garfield St.

124 Walnut St.

164 E. Ridge St.

166 E. Ridge St.

383 Grove St.

S. Market St.-W. Noble St.
1206-1208 S. Prospect St.
104-106 W. Ridge St.

63 W. Union St.

Vine St.

Overlook Rd.-Black Creek Rd.

28 Overlook Rd.
1050 W. Main Ave.
138-140 Robert St.
Newport St.
Newport St.

5 Enterprise St.

7 Enterprise St.

45 Church St.

26 Orchard St.

73 W. Main St.

Jenkins Township
Jenkins Township
Jenkins Township
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough

Kingston Borough

Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Township
Kingston Township
Lake Township
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Laurel Run Borough
Luzerne Borough
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nescopeck Borough

Nescopeck Township
Nescopeck Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township

$1,388.38 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,384.88 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,691.64 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #313
$1,235.27 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #169
$1,324.27 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,453.85 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,474.05 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,208.54 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,208.54 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE}
$1,372.74 SOLD $10,000 / Bidder #163
$1,496.04 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE}

$1,593.19 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

$1,515.51 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,265.59 SOLD $16,000 / Bidder #311
$2,167.29 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,396.81 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,425.93 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,309.15 SOLD $19,000 / Bidder #139
$1,802.90 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,247.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,115.85 SOLD Minimum BID / Bidder #148
$1,346.90 NOBID
$1,976.94 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #278
$1,404.80 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,212.07 SOLD $16,000 / Bidder #330
$1,239.43 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #246
$1,554.73 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #265
$1,471.77 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE
$1,174.43 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #268
$1,425.12 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,646.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,366.66 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,283.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$3,034.83 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$2,983.18 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,459.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,119.86 NOBID

$1,778.87 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE
$1,228.05 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,476.59 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,187.80 NOBID

$1,616.36 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

$1,210.56 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,381.54 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,189.96 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,466.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,458.18 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #360

$1,216.95 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,213.69 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,212.09 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #169

$1,263.55 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
$1,264.78 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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208|2018-02933 46-K652-008-003-000 146 E Main, LLC 146 E. Main St. Newport Township $1,635.13 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
E 2018-02770 47-L854-004-08A-000 Mark A. Evancho 12 Meyers St. Nuangola Borough $1,631.90 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
210|2018-02903 48-H8SE2-011-13A-000 John M. Grohowski 107 Pierce St. Plymouth Borough $1,239.56 SOLD $4,500 / Bidder #263
211] 2018-02932 48-H8SE2-012-007-000 Robert Weaver 144 Nesbitt Ln. Plymouth Borough $1,224.37 NOBID
212] 2018-02931 48-H8SE3-004-004-000 EYW Global, LLC 63-65 Mechanics Ln. Plymouth Borough $1,157.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
213] 2018-02767 48-H8SE3-014-003-000 Jon A. Boyes & Frances Boyes 326 Palmer St. Plymouth Borough $1,134.71 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #174
214] 2018-02763 48-H8SE2-001-010-000 Keri Occhipinti 203 McGinnis St. Plymouth Borough $1,254.53 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
215] 2018-02756 48-H8SE4-011-004-000 Sustainable Wyoming Valley Inc. 111-113 E. Main St. Plymouth Borough $1,020.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
B 2018-03320 48-H8SE4-047-004-000 Joseph E. Swartwood & Beverly A. Swartwood 63 Center Ave. Plymouth Borough $1,198.38 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
217] 2018-03322 48-H8SE4-030-035-000 Thomas A. Billings 42 Turner St. Plymouth Borough $1,328.42 SOLD $13,000 / Bidder #367
218] 2018-03334 48-H8SE4-030-036-000 Thomas A. Billings 44 Turner St. Plymouth Borough $1,319.81 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #367
E 2018-03336 48-18NW2-013-011-000 Chinh Vo 89 Coal St. Plymouth Borough $1,666.84 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1220 2018-03455 48-H8SE1-012-001-000 Victor Judzikowski & Judy Judzikowski 106 Adj. Shawnee Ave. Plymouth Borough $1,274.96 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
221(2018-03544 48-H8SE1-012-01A-000 Victor Judzikowski & Judy Judzikowski Shawnee Ave. Plymouth Borough $1,227.81 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
222] 2018-03339 48-H8SE4-005-016-000 Leonard Young & Mary A. Young 227 Cameron St. Plymouth Borough $2,182.81 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
223] 2018-03507 48-H8SE1-006-002-000 Bradley M. Potoeskie, Sr. 275 Duffy St. Plymouth Borough $1,524.44 NO BID
224] 2018-03304 48-H8SE4-003-001-000 Stanley Judzikowski Duffys Ln. Plymouth Borough $1,220.04 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
225] 2018-03303 48-H8SE4-003-019-000 Rita Judzikowski 242 Duffy Ln. Plymouth Borough $1,201.27 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #264
226] 2018-03309 49-1751A-004-004-000 Stephen Hussa 390 E. Canal St. Plymouth Township $1,281.30 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
z 2018-03503 49-1755-005-019-000 Roy L. Smith, Il & Ruth E. Smith 23-27 McDonald St. Plymouth Township $1,191.06 NO BID
|228(2018-03506 50-F1054-001-04E-000 Rachel M. Rovinski 23 E. Clarks Ln. Plains Township $1,655.28 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
229(2018-03545 50-F10SE4-002-004-000 Federal Home Loan Mortgage Corporation 171 Courtright St. Plains Township $1,090.09 REMOVED BY COURT ORDER
1230] 2018-03522 50-F10SE4-007-009-000 David B. Solovey 274 River St. Plains Township $1,668.97 SOLD $9,500 / Bidder #313
231] 2018-03524 50-F10SE4-007-010-000 David B. Solovey 274 Adj. River Rd. Plains Township $1,279.63 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #313
E 2018-03528 50-G10NE1-017-003-000 Donald Tregaskis & Marion Tregaskis 192 Rear N. River St. Plains Township $1,519.88 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
|233]2018-03534 50-G1153-001-001-000 Gerald T. Matinas 162 Laflin Rd. Plains Township $1,995.66 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
|234]| 2018-03332 50-G1154-000-000-000 James Centini & Josephine Augustine 149 Ridgewood Road St. Plains Township $1,484.65 NO BID
1235 2018-03509 50-G10NE3-010-009-000 Walter Winiewicz & Bertha Winiewicz 16 Crow St. Plains Township $1,885.86 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #362
236(2018-03511 50-G11-T02-208-001 Theodore Mosier 209 E. Mountain Ridge MHP Plains Township $1,044.44 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
237] 2018-03513 50-G11-T02-307-000 Amber Miller 307 E. Mountain Ridge MHP Plains Township $1,143.70 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2018-03517 50-G11-T02-308-001 Cynthia Leonhardt & Albert Leonhardt 308 E. Mountain Ridge MHP Plains Township $1,449.42 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
239(2018-03519 50-G11-T02-409-000 Madeline Ward 409 Pocono Trailer Ct. Plains Township $1,446.14 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
240] 2018-03521 50-G11-T02-418-001 Tammy Bidding & Duane Pellm 418 E. Mountain Ridge Plains Township $1,357.89 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2018-03518 51-E1255-002-013-000 Rosemary Borkowski Laurel St. Pittston Township $1,171.32 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
242(2018-03515 53-L851-008-001-000 Lois Pelczar Baron Church Rd. Rice Township $1,211.52 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #365
243] 2018-03512 53-1852-001-001-000 R.R. Investments LLC Mary St. Rice Township $1,126.81 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #266
|244] 2018-03510 54-G5-00A-05J-000 Luzerne Investment 2014 Trust 106 Pall Rd. Ross Township $1,220.35 SOLD $9,500 / Bidder #365
245] 2018-02754 55-0451-003-004-000 Herbert Estus Salem Blvd. Salem Township $1,157.97 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
246] 2018-02910 55-P35W1-006-018-000 Stephen D. Lynch 501 E. Front St. Salem Township $1,405.23 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
247] 2018-02751 55-P35W1-007-029-000 Frank P. Mazza & Cristina M. Brown 437-439 E. Second St. Salem Township $6,083.95 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1248 2018-02748 55-P4S1-003-013-000 Helena E. Shultz 164 Main St. Salem Township $989.61 NO BID
249] 2018-02746 56-L45E1-002-001-000 Helena E. Shultz Rockview Ave. Shickshinny Borough $1,136.49 NO BID
E 2018-02682 56-L4SE1-002-009-000 Christopher M. Parris 22 Baer Aly Shickshinny Borough $1,022.47 NO BID
51| 2018-02902 58-5-00A-16A-000 5\7;?1?115 Wenner, Rita Wenner, Clyde L. Wenner & Barbara | | Sugarloaf Township $1,207.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2018-02676 61-K4-00A-04D-000 John Morgan Belles, Jr. 80 Reyburn Rd. Union Township $312.29 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1253 2018-02858 63-T7SE2-023-003-000 Richard Gould 210 E. Green St. West Hazleton Borough $1,643.33 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
254 2018-02644 63-T7SE2-006-007-000 Rosa Guzman 22 Tamarack St. West Hazleton Borough $1,339.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1255| 2018-02877 63-T7SE2-006-012-000 June A. Lehman 50 Tamarack St. West Hazleton Borough $9,188.60 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
256 2018-02633 63-T7SE1-007-008-000 Hazleton Homes, Inc. 516 W. Green St. West Hazleton Borough $2,394.41 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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ﬂ 2018-02635 63-T7SE1-007-009-000 Hazleton Homes, Inc. 514 W. Green St. West Hazleton Borough $1,282.79 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1258 2018-02632 63-T7SE2-026-014-000 Bernard Gaizick & Sharon Gaizick 111 S. Broad St. West Hazleton Borough $1,169.43 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1259 2018-02674 65-D11SW3-009-029-000 Linda R. Tilley 850 Foundry St. West Pittston Borough $1,169.43 SOLD $13,000 / Bidder #368
260] 2018-02453 65-E11NE1-016-008-000 Edward Prebola 321 Washington St. West Pittston Borough $2,509.14 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1261 2018-02664 65-E11NE1-020-002-000 Max J. Laurore & Guerlin Laurore 227 Linden St. West Pittston Borough $1,269.01 SOLD $6,500 / Bidder #139
1262 2018-02743 66-E10NE4-001-007-000 Jean Butler 733 W. Eighth St. West Wyoming Borough $1,252.88 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #313
1263 2018-02725 66-E10SE1-007-011-000 Rose Marie Mudrian 415 W. 6th St. West Wyoming Borough $1,219.21 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
264 201803318 69-110NW3-007-029-000 Eugene Gray & Joseph Antulov 796 E. Northampton St. Wilkes-Barre Township $1,625.10 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1265] 2018-02642 70-F1153-001-042-000 Donna Maria Cresho 26 Stout St. Yatesville Borough $1,349.96 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
266| 2018-02641 71-T8SW31-011-025-000 Michael D. Bono & Margaret Ann Bono 9 E. Broad St. Hazleton City $2,096.05 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1267| 2018-02217 71-T8SW43-018-15A-000 William Cate 189S. Lee Ct. Hazleton City $1,180.59 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #362
268| 2018-02640 71-USNW44-001-045-000 James Kokinda & Patricia Kokinda 45 Newport Cir. Hazleton City $1,295.66 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #138
1269] 2018-02843 71-T8SW13-017-01A-000 Carmen Genao 77 N. Vine St. Hazleton City $931.29 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
270] 2018-02653 71-T8SW42-002-02A-000 Hazleton Partners, L.P. 117 Rear W. Broad St. Hazleton City $1,844.37 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
271] 2018-02724 71-T8SW21-008-04E-000 Paula Loidy 152 N. Lee Ct. Hazleton City $1,283.48 NO BID
272| 2018-02721 71-T8NW43-006-004-000 Gregory A. Tutko & Ronnie A. Tutko 336 W. Fourth St. Hazleton City $1,427.77 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
273 2018-02719 71-T8NWA41-002-11A-000 Dorel Valentin Screciu 817 Hanover Ct. Hazleton City $1,168.86 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
274] 2018-02655 71-T8NWA41-005-006-000 Michael J. Scherff & Laura J. Scherff 710 N. Locust St. Hazleton City $1,485.00 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1275 2018-03307 71-T8NW42-009-013-000 Thomas E. Donahue 673 Alter St. Hazleton City $2,973.21 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬁ 2018-02755 71-T8NW24-003-02H-000 Gino L. Andreuzzi Meade St. Hazleton City $1,228.51 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
277| 2018-02912 71-TBNW33-009-013-000 M & H Properties 346 E. Diamond Ave. Hazleton City $1,396.65 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
278]| 2018-02914 71-TBNW33-009-014-000 M & H Properties 348 E. Diamond Ave. Hazleton City $4,778.26 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
279]| 2018-02780 71-T8NW33-018-008-000 William Eric Leth 221 Crnr. Seybert St. Hazleton City $1,858.20 SOLD $7,000 / Bidder #270
280| 2018-02771 71-USNW31-009-005-000 Yeremy Denis Carleton Ave. Hazleton City $1,149.36 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #320
281] 2018-02901 72-D11SE2-013-024-000 James Robert Horchos 93 Union St. Pittston City $1,506.20 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
ﬁ 2018-03508 72-D11SE2-005-030-000 Matthew S. Poplawski 599 N. Main St. Pittston City $1,528.38 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
283] 2018-02766 72-E11NE2-002-016-000 Vikki Lynn McGrade & Edward E. McGrade, Jr. 188 Panama St. Pittston City $1,183.65 NO BID
284] 2018-02762 72-E11NE3-028-031-000 David A. Walsh & Meghan Walsh 10 Sand St. Pittston City $1,505.92 SOLD $9,000 / Bidder #253
1285 2018-02760 72-E11SE1-009-007-000 Eleanor Theresa Cawley Evans 123 Vine St.-60 Oak St. Pittston City $1,446.66 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1286| 2018-02759 72-E11SE1-030-026-000 Robert J. Kearns 154 S. Main St. Pittston City $1,763.65 NO BID
287| 2018-02758 72-E11SE1-033-038-000 Paula Fuhrman 19 Rear Swalow St. Pittston City $1,176.83 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
288| 2018-02930 72-E11NE4-008-009-000 Angelo Parente & Lena Parente 27 Elizabeth St. Pittston City $1,530.17 SOLD $4,500 / Bidder #313
@ 2018-02928 73-H10NW1-005-014-000  Ruth Clarke Schmitt 32-34 O'Neill Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,404.88 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
290(2018-02929 73-H10NW1-005-025-000  Ruth Clarke Schmitt 59 W. Hollenback St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,429.40 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1291| 2018-02927 73-H10NW2-019-025-000 Shane Jerominski 688 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,030.62 SOLD $9,000 / Bidder #158
E 2018-02926 73-H10NW2-019-026-000 Shane Jerominski 686 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $343.39 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
293] 2018-02657 73-H10NW4-016-026-000  Edward J. Gurchak 132 Adj. Court St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,082.15 CONTINUED 70 OCTOBE
ﬁ 2018-02925 73-H10NW4-026-011-000 Toni Tenebruso 316 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,414.25 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
295| 2018-02924 73-H10NW3-010-023-000 Doris Jane Flowers 258 Bowman St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,599.30 SOLD $19,000 / Bidder #140
296] 2018-02923 73-H105W1-010-001-000 Ted Turon 112 Scott St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,662.22 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
297 2018-02922 73-H10SW2-003-023-000  Merle Reitz 150-154 Kidder St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,631.23 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE
298| 2018-02921 73-H105W2-008-006-000 Lillian Searles 81 Spring St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,397.65 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
299] 2018-02920 73-H105W2-012-009-000 Luis Saavedra 171 Scott St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,519.80 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1300| 2018-02918 73-H9SE2-024-01A-201 Maura E. Gill 201 E. Northampton St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,874.21 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬁ 2018-03523 73-H9SE1-005-016-000 Peter Moses & Jean Moses 47-49 Terrace St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,086.07 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
302| 2018-02652 73-H9SE4-021-003-000 Joseph J. Salusky, Jr. 210 Academy St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,442.52 SOLD $22,000 / Bidder #150
1303] 2018-03527 73-H9SE4-021-014-000 Frank J. Capozzi, Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser 168-170 Academy St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,314.39 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
304] 2018-03533 73-H9SEA4-021-054-000 Earl ). Wenner & Henrietta L. Wenner Magnolia Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,160.72 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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305/ 2018-03535 73-H9SE4-024-029-000 Aparna A. Galilio & Malti R. Kathuria 75-77 Sullivan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,362.64 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
306 2018-03548 73-H9SE4-033-004-000 Cherie L. Cruz 42-44 Monroe St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,383.35 CONTINUED TO OCTOBE
1307| 2018-03547 73-H9SE4-033-005-000 Cherie L. Cruz 38 Monroe St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,123.06 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #316
1308] 2018-03539 73-H9SE4-033-035-000 Loukas Kominis & Olga Kominis 19-21 Elizabeth St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,673.57 SOLD $3,000/ Bidder #170
1309 2018-03461 73-H9SE4-034-032-000 Mark Zaccone & Wendy Zaccone 46-48 Alexander St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,664.25 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #239
310] 2018-03484 73-H9SW2-006-017-000 Megan Jardine 119-121 Old River Rd. Wilkes-Barre City $2,183.34 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1317 2018-03483 73-19NE1-004-008-000 Frank J. Capozzi Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser 580-582 S. Franklin St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,814.83 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
312] 2018-03481 73-19NE1-025-19A-000 Michael J. Bush 57 Shiber Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,288.80 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
313] 2018-03478 73-19NE1-028-09A-000 Gasper Segundo Mayancela Yupa & Rosa E. Alvarez Loja 71 Prospect St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,271.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
314] 2018-03462 73-19NE1-037-006-000 Patrick Cunningham 19 McCarragher St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,578.46 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
1315 2018-03306 73-19NE2-011-026-000 Anthony Albert Lovecchio & Donna Lee Kalson 280 Moyallen St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,348.69 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
316| 2018-03337 73-19NE2-013-04A-000 Bassam Safi 379 Park Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,445.29 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #262
1317] 2018-03340 73-19NE2-017-010-000 Brandon P. Gabriel 135 McCarragher St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,356.57 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #262
318] 2018-03338 73-19NE2-023-023-000 Jason Cohen & Linda J. Jaremko 150 Park Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,573.01 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
319] 2018-03492 73-19NE2-027-008-000 Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano Almond Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,108.54 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
320] 2018-03491 73-19NE2-027-009-000 Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano 151 Almond Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,591.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
321] 2018-03342 73-19NE2-030-004-000 Matthew F. Coppola & Matthew P. Coppola 396 S. Hancock St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,364.37 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #274
322] 2018-03333 73-19NE2-036-017-000 Kevin Flippines & Joan Flippines Columbus Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,265.38 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
323] 2018-03490 73-19NE3-011-001-000 C.T. Connell Properties, LLC 280-282 Sheridan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,817.75 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
324] 2018-03488 73-19NE3-011-002-000 C.T. Connell Properties, LLC 485 Dana St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,303.28 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1325] 2018-03487 73-19NE3-024-008-000 Adham Abdel Rahman 484 S. Grant St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,660.81 SOLD $12,000 / Bidder #273
1326 2018-03485 73-19NE4-011-031-000 Steven R. Shrader & Jane Shrader 64 Spruce St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,934.79 SOLD $26,000 / Bidder #239
327] 2018-03471 73-19NE4-018-040-000 Shannon R. Allen, Jr. 86-88 Poplar St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,684.01 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
328 2018-03470 73-19NE4-026-028-000 Michael Ranieli 333 Andover St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,366.20 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
329] 2018-03468 73-19NE4-029-014-000 Daniel Peters 131 Poplar St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,119.82 NOBID
330] 2018-03466 73-19NE4-029-14A-000 Daniel Peters 133 Poplar St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,050.87 NO BID
E 2018-03465 73-19NE4-029-14B-000 Daniel A. Peters 129 Poplar St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,091.57 NO BID

James M. Farrell, Lois E. Farrell, Michael Farrell, Lois A. Farrell . .
332] 2018-03300 73-H9SW3-014-025-000 & Mary Kerr 278 Carey Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,864.35 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #368

James M. Farrell, Lois E. Farrell, Michael Farrell, Lois A. Farrell . .
1333] 2018-03305 73-H9SW3-014-026-000 & Mary Kerr 274-276 Carey Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,872.38 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #276

James M. Farrell, Lois E. Farrell, Michael Farrell, Lois A. Farrell . .
1334 2018-03344 73-H9SW3-014-027-000 & Mary Kerr 276 1/2-278 1/2 Carey Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,830.77 SOLD $13,000 / Bidder #250

James M. Farrell, Lois E. Farrell, Michael Farrell, Lois A. Farrell . .
335 2018-03343 73-H9SW3-014-028-000 & Mary Kerr 270-272 Carey Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,205.06 SOLD $4,500 / Bidder #362
E 2018-03464 73-19NW2-005-012-000 Dawn F. Eicher 24 Gates St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,956.74 SOLD $9,500 / Bidder #364
337|2018-03452 73-19NW2-015-004-000 Sharon L. Kipiel 136 Regent St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,772.86 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
338] 2018-03446 73-H10NW2-023-22F-000 USA Home Offer, LLC 310 Clyde Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,248.49 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #366
339] 2018-03445 73-H10NW3-012-006-000 Patrick J. Conway & Jeanne Conway 269 Madison St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,670.38 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1340] 2018-03443 73-H10NW4-006-002-000 Nicholas J. Owens 229 Madison St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,431.15 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #156
341] 2018-03475 73-H10NWA4-020-038-000 Martin Reyes 214 Wyoming St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,044.95 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2018-03476 73-H10NW4-022-024-000 Edward Laux 298-300 N. Washington St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,399.31 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
343|2018-03473 73-H10NW4-023-025-000  Stephen Browski 279-81 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,858.40 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
344] 2018-03460 73-H105W1-007-003-000 Keirand Daniels 257-259 N. Penna Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,671.17 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2018-03502 73-G10SE2-006-005-000 Elma L. Jerr Cleveland St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,164.50 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1346| 2018-03453 73-G10SE2-011-001-000 James W. Conroy & Martha L. Conroy 191 Maycock St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,524.67 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
347| 2018-03505 73-G10SE3-008-005-000 Albert Trinisewski & Stella Trinisewski 1263 Scott St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,578.36 REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
348 2018-02898 74-C657-003-004-000 Edward Pickutoski Noxen Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $1,109.73 NO BID
E 2018-02897 74-C6S8-002-063-000 Edward Azarovich & Charlotte Azarovich Gaynor Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $848.15 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
15| 2018-02896 74-D6-00A-02A-004 Robert Sorber ::Old takeRd.-3430ldLake o eys Lake Borough $1,640.16 0 o
351| 2018-02895 74-D6-00A-02A-005 Robert P. Delconte & Samuel Roberts 103 Mohawk Ln.-Parks Row Harveys Lake Borough $1,453.70 NO BID
352] 2018-02894 74-D652-011-025-000 Marianne Brozena Beech St. Harveys Lake Borough $1,103.68 NO BID
353] 2018-02892 74-D655-003-005-000 Kathy Wynne & Joe Wynne Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,386.85 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018




Page 8

A B [ C E F G
1354]| 2018-02891 74-D655-003-007-000 Valerie Brown 49 Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,234.08 NO BID
1355 2018-02917 74-D655-004-007-000 Joseph Wynne & Cathy Wynne Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,207.36 NO BID
1356| 2018-02890 74-D655-004-008-000 Valerie Brown 49 Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,259.82 NO BID
1357]2018-02889 74-D655-004-009-000 Valerie Brown 49 Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,236.20 NO BID
1358 2018-02888 74-D655-004-010-000 Valerie Brown 49 Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,234.08 NO BID
1359 2018-02885 74-D655-004-011-000 Frank J. Capozzi, Sr. & Krisandra L. Capozzi Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,243.97 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
360|2018-02916 74-D756-004-029-000 Edward Yanchulis & Jenna Yanchulis Carpenter Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $1,249.67 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018




