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NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Northeast Revenue Service, LLC as agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE
under the Pennsylvania Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 28th day of June, 2018 in the King’s College Sheehy-Farmer
Campus Center, 105 North Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The properties exposed to sale will be sold Free & Clear of all tax and municipal claims,
mortgages, liens, charges and estates of whatsoever kind, except ground rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every
reasonable effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST
and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without guarantee of warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. Inaccordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on
behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting
on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.

3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord
license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the owner shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.
TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording costs shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is

completed and must be made in the form of cash, certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the close of business
on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing a property in any sale the bidder shall not be
permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and the matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under the
Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.
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Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN ON THE DAY OF THE SALE. Registration and
Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders must present one (1) form
of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the Sale. Failure to present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a
Prospective Bidder from being registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the bidder from receiving his
bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who believes that by no reason of some defect said property should
not be exposed to sale, should immediately make known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability or familial status in employment
or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2015 inter alia.
Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 18, 2017. Petitioner exposed
certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 27, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on March 24, 2017. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale
on September 20, 2016 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader,
Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 19, 2016. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 18, 2016 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2013 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne
Legal Register on March 18, 2016. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 24, 2015 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax
years 2013 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 21, 2015.
Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 23, 2015 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2012 inter alia. Notice of the
Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on March 20, 2015. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of
land to Upset Sale on September 11, 2014 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2012 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The
Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 8, 2014. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 19,
2013 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2011 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and
the Luzerne Legal Register on August 16, 2013. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 25, 2013 upon delinquent tax claims filed for
the tax years 2010 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader on March 23, 2013, the Standard Speaker on March 22, 2013 and
the Luzerne Legal Register on March 22, 2013. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 20, 2012 upon delinquent tax claims
filed for the tax years 2010 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader on August 17, 2012, the Standard Speaker on August 17,
2012 and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 12, 2012. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on November 10, 2011, continued from
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September 2011, upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2009 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader on August 22,
2011, the Standard Speaker on August 22, 2011 and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 19, 2011.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act, however the following properties were not sold at the
respective Upset Sales, because the upset sale price was not obtained:



A B C D E [ F [ G

1 | Docket No. Parcel No. Owner Address Municipality Minimum Bid RESULTS/NOTES

2

3| 2017-14243 01-19SE4-002-004-000 John W. Dixon 103 Manhattan St. Ashley Borough $2,646.79 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO AUGUST 9, 2018

4 | 2017-05838 01-19SE4-018-016-000 Clement & Therese Androckitis 49 N. Main St. Ashley Borough $1,521.53 NO BID

5| 2017-14224 01-J9NE1-010-026-000 George Nichols 134-136 S. Main St. Ashley Borough $1,378.27 CONTINUED DUE TO BANKRUPTCY

6 2016-02702 01-J9NE1-011-015-000 Edward & Marja Satkowski 15 Rodgers Ave. Ashley Borough $2,234.64 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

7 | 2017-05753 01-J9NE1-T01-186-000 Donna Gyle 186 S. Grafton Way Ashley Borough $1,481.92 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

8 | 2017-05776 02-D12NE3-001-019-000  Ann B. Luvender, Eugene Ross & Cheryl Ross 1131 Grove St. Avoca Borough $2,295.47 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #172

C ity Banks, N.A., as Custodian for Th .

o | 2017-05754  02-D125E4-003-08A-000 L;;:r:‘:;'\y anks as Lustodian for Thomas McAlpine St. Avoca Borough $2,005.49 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-05847 . . . .

10 03-S3-00A-08A-000 Barry Carty Mountain Rd.-Hilltop Rd. Black Creek Township $1,461.65 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #132

11 2017-05848 03-U452-003-001-000 Vincent A. & Ann Catrone 1418 Tomhicken Rd. Black Creek Township $1,796.11 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-05841 . . . ;

12 03-U454-001-03A-000 Valerie L. Hollis Nuremberg Mountain Rd. Black Creek Township $1,211.57 NO BID

13 2017-14255 04-K12-00A-033-000 Landview Properties Inc Farrington Tract Bear Creek Township $1,479.56 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

14 2017-14254 04-K12-00A-33P-000 Landview Properties, Inc. Bear Creek Township $1,518.69 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

15 2017-14471 04-N12S2-002-010-000 Jack D. & Pearl V. Thomas Azalea Trl. Bear Creek Township $2,017.66 NO BID

16 2017-05809 04-N12S3-004-001-000 Robert A. & Allen V. Bell Old Ford Rd. Bear Creek Township $1,385.15 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

17| 2017-06494 05-J14S1E-009-028-000 Louis & Jean DiPierdomenico Indian Lake Trl. Buck Township $1,847.14 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

18| 2017-06496 05-J14S1E-009-029-000 Louis & Jean DiPierdomenico Indian Lake Trl. Buck Township $1,895.14 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

19| 2016-02733 06-Q751-004-017-000 Robert N. & Ruth F. Bartow 63 Glendale Ln. Butler Township $1,994.33 SOLD $29,000 / Bidder #35

20| 2017-07257 06-Q7S2-001-05B-000 RR Investments LLC Klingers Rd. Butler Township $1,337.95 NO BID

21| 2017-14293 06-Q8-00A-010-000 William Lubrecht, 11l & Dorothy D. Lubrecht Route 309 Butler Township $3,332.96 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #136

22| 2017-06279 06-Q8S10-006-025-000 Theodore Greschner Bear Run Dr. Butler Township $1,423.13 NO BID

23| 2017-06276 06-Q8510-009-029-000 Restney Acosta 10 BLK3 Covey Ln. Butler Township $1,407.37 NO BID

24| 2017-06488 06-Q8S11-003-020-000 John & Helen Kirschbaum Buck Ridge Ln. Butler Township $1,408.32 NO BID

25| 2017-06487 06-Q859-008-006-000 Arcangelo & Santa Cervini 15 Edge Rock Dr. Butler Township $1,315.68 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #168

26| 2017-06559 06-Q9S2-004-002-000 Loan Recovery Inc. Bear Run Dr. Butler Township $1,334.22 NO BID

27 | 2017-07200 06-R7-00A-052-000 James L. Gallagher Christman Rd. Butler Township $1,739.56 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #215

28| 2017-06270 06-R7510-002-019-000 Joanne Margaret & Philip Carl Craigle 18 W. Valley View Dr. Butler Township $2,552.92 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER

29| 2017-06553 06-R754-002-065-000 Casa Dominicana Inc. High Meadow Dr. Butler Township $1,808.01 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-06273 . " s .

30 06-R954-001-12B-000 David & Tanya Lee Bell L2 - Maso Minor Subdivision  Butler Township $1,471.65 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

31| 2017-06275 07-G951-008-19B-000 Ginger & Avery Cochran Rear Courtdale Ave. Courtdale Borough $1,355.04 NO BID

32| 2017-06486 07-G952-004-001-000 R.R. Investments, LLC 38 Courtdale Ave. Courtdale Borough $1,326.14 NO BID
2017-06238 . . - .

33 08-56510-002-007-000 Louis N. Debise 5 Twain Circle Rd. Conyngham Borough $1,517.62 SOLD $4,500 / Bidder #302
2017-06278 . .

34 09-M4S3-002-005-000 IIK Development Co. 43 Italy St. Conyngham Township $2,105.01 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #162
2017-07243 09-M551-003-007-000 Peter J. Waichulis Pond Hill Mountain Rd. Conyngham Township $1,496.57 NO BID
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36 2017-06485 09-05-00A-007-001 Paul A. Glasser Smith Mtn. Rd. Conyngham Township $1,657.25 NO BID
7 2017-14451 10-B8-00A-07D-000 Sal, Gaetano & Jose Dolcemascolo Godsmith Rd. Dallas Township $1,743.25 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #140
38| 2017-14247 10-C7-T01-011-000 Robert & Catherine Purdy 11 Country Pine Est. Dallas Township $1,245.75 NO BID
E 2017-06470 10-C7S3-006-001-000 Equity Builders II Warren Ave. Dallas Township $1,293.52 NO BID
40| 2017-14241 10-D8-00A-072-000 Mountainside Manor Real Estate Associates, LLC Route 309 Dallas Township $6,496.45 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
41| 2017-06532 10-D8$1-003-012-000 Stephen Brokenshire 20 Skyview Dr. Dallas Township $1,389.99 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #253
| James M., Lois E., Michael, & Lois A. Farrell and Mary
42 2017-06533 10-D852-008-015-000 Kerr Garden Ave. Dallas Township $1,451.15 NO BID
43| 2017-06534 10-D8$4-008-006-000 James J. & John J. Peipon Maplewood Hts. Dallas Township $1,488.42 NO BID
44| 2017-06267 10-D8S4A-006-001-000 Alice & Randy C. Miller Harris St. Dallas Township $1,861.70 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #209
E 2017-06535 10-D8S5-006-019-000 Adam Lowe Crnr. Lower Demunds Rd. Dallas Township $1,586.79 NO BID
46| 2017-06536 10-D8S7-005-005-000 Paul Phillips Garbutt Ave. Dallas Township $1,570.64 NO BID
7 2017-06537 10-E8S3-011-005-000 Maria C. Cromer Freedman Ave. Dallas Township $1,260.63 NO BID
E 2017-14265 10-E854-003-008-000 John M. Emil, Jr. & Brenda M. Emil 6 Shaver St. Dallas Township $1,792.37 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #161
49| 2017-06552 11-ES8NE1-003-09A-000 Blanche Parsons Main St. Dallas Borough $1,271.19 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #211
E 2017-06272 11-E8NW2-009-032-000 Donna Cooper Davenport St. Dallas Borough $1,253.27 NO BID
51| 2017-05747 12-N7-00A-33A-000 Michael Habib St. Marys Rd. Dorrance Township $1,352.70 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
52| 2017-14280 14-D11NE3-002-005-000  David Keller 815 Rear N. Main St. Duryea Borough $2,322.41 CONTINUED TO AUGUST 9, 2018
E 2017-05748 14-D12NW1-002-022-000 Michael E. Komensky 236 Church St. Duryea Borough $1,751.77 SOLD $10,000 / Bidder #35
| 54| 2017-14057 14-D12NW2-010-19A-000 John & Marie Yaverski 241 1/2 Rear Main St. Duryea Borough $2,165.23 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
201714245 14-D12NW2-014-017-000 - Bank N-A., as Trustee of the Security National 254 Swetland St. Duryea Borough $1,582.12 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #195
55 Mortgage Loan Trust 2004-2
56| 2017-07273 14-D12NW3-004-01A-000 T.P. Corporation Foote Ave. Duryea Borough $9,363.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
7 2017-02409 16-D10-T02-024-001 Janet Leader 24 Mt Lookout Trailer Ct. Exeter Borough $1,748.38 NO BID
E 2017-02416 16-D10-T02-084-001 Benjamin Mora, Jr. 84 Mount Lookout Exeter Borough $1,413.89 NO BID
| 59| 2017-14023 16-D1151-005-011-000 William & Grace Kudrako 1119 Exeter Ave. Exeter Borough $2,196.64 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #258
60 2017-14024 16-D11S1-005-11A-000 William & Grace Kudrako 1119 Exeter Ave. Exeter Borough $2,095.22 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #258
W 2017-14050 16-E10-00A-015-038 Robert Warmen 182 Birchwood Est. Exeter Borough $1,304.79 NO BID
62| 2017-14034 16-E10-00A-015-126 Kristin Young & Anthony Darienzo 334 Birchwood Est. Exeter Borough $1,842.40 NO BID
63| 2017-14246 16-E10-00A-015-309 Richard Telley 238 Birchwood Est. Exeter Borough $994.22 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
64| 2017-14467 16-E10-T01-331-000 Ralph Ream & Linda Wells 331 Birchwood Est. Exeter Borough $1,731.64 NO BID
E 2017-02808 16-E10S2-004-05A-000 John F. & Catherine J. Farrell 19 Washington St. Exeter Borough $2,191.92 SOLD $36,000 / Bidder #7
66| 2017-14248 16-E11NWA4-004-018-000 Edward A. Prebola 178 Mason St. Exeter Borough $2,509.12 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018|
F 2017-14215 16-E11NW4-011-002-000 Kristin A., Nicole, Joseph & Brian Alu 33 Mason St. Exeter Borough $2,342.40 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14291 17-B10S1-008-05A-000 Thomas Ksiezopolski & Joyce Wash 206 B Coolidge St. Exeter Township $2,139.89 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-06236 . . . .
1 69| 18-G9S1-007-006-000 Units Best LLC 3 Atlantic Ave. Edwardsville Borough $1,232.38 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #9
2017-06234 . .
1 70 | 18-G952-006-003-000 Roger & Donna O'Connor 584 Cherry St. Edwardsville Borough $1,648.32 SOLD $19,000 / Bidder #15
2017-14296 . . ] .
| 71] 18-G9S2-012-020-000 Raymond Piotek 574 Main St. Edwardsville Borough $1,760.21 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #177
2017-05717 . . I .
1 72| 18-G9S2-012-027-000 Lewis & Cerena Casterline 13 Hillside Ave. Edwardsville Borough $1,907.48 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-06232 S . . . .
A 18-G9S2-015-010-000 Richie Lee Kioske, Jr. & Anne Kioske 179 Green St. Edwardsville Borough $1,900.88 SOLD $19,000 / Bidder #150
74 2017-14230 18-G9S3-002-015-000 Joseph A. Ballo 98 R. Zerby Ave. Edwardsville Borough $1,520.11 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #177
2017-05840 . .
75 18-G9S3-011-017-000 Bethann Rae Concusky 169 Meyers St. Edwardsville Borough $2,302.83 SOLD $11,000 / Bidder #170
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2017-14297 . . ; .

1 76| 19-H2-00A-47E-000 Kevin & Jacqueline Hoffman 54 Burma Rd. Fairmount Township $5,123.17 CONTINUED TO AUGUST 9, 2018

;| 2017-14474  22-Q9sE3-012-001-000 lTnh;qu::S' Mulhearn and James A. Lawson t/a Tandem ) ¢ o ey s, Freeland Borough $3,643.90 CONTINUED TO AUGUST 9, 2018
W 2017-02415 23-Q11S6-006-034-000 Henry & Mabel Peterson 1267 Woodhaven Dr. Foster Township $1,367.44 NO BID
W 2017-02756 23-Q11S7-006-038-000 Thomas A. Martin Woodhaven Dr. Foster Township $1,392.60 NO BID
E 2017-14249 23-Q11S8-007-018-000 Edward W. Paschik 36 Hillary Dr. Foster Township $1,831.05 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
H 2017-02816 23-Q12-00A-01A-000 NEB Investments, LLC Lakeside Rd. Foster Township $634.47 NO BID
E 2017-02836 23-Q951-007-004-000 Edward G. Decker 99 Main St. Foster Township $2,203.29 NO BID
83| 2017-02837 23-RONE1-003-004-000 Frank Krenc & Shirley Tarbett Cedar St. Foster Township $1,471.70 NO BID
E 2017-02412 23-R9NE1-003-005-000 Frank Krenc & Shirley Tarbett 613 Cedar St. Foster Township $1,386.70 NO BID

85| 2017-14453 24-MINACT-00A-000-001 Barry K. Reese Franklin 3 Quarry Franklin Township $2,225.80 REMOVED - INVALID PARCEL
E 2017-14454 24-MINACT-00A-000-002  Barry K. Reese Reese 1 Quarry Franklin Township $2,273.12 REMOVED - INVALID PARCEL
E 2017-14455 24-MINACT-00A-000-003  Barry K. Reese Reese 2 Quarry Franklin Township $2,847.69 REMOVED - INVALID PARCEL

88| 2016-12326 25-18NE3-003-14B-000 Ralph & Sally Pavone 208-210 Ferry St. Hanover Township $1,732.12 NO BID
E 2017-14220 25-1851-05A-006-000 Stanley P. Tarutis, Jr. & Molly T. Tarutis Clifton Ct. Hanover Township $5,939.58 SOLD $49,000 / Bidder #199
90| 2017-07240 25-1852-009-010-000 Cherie L. Cruz 37 Rutter St. Hanover Township $1,845.19 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #160
91| 2017-14019 25-1852-009-10A-000 Henry S. & Sophie Horbaczewski 35 Rutter St. Hanover Township $1,752.68 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #160
E 2017-14287 25-19NW1-014-003-000 Edward Waligorski 5 Norwood Ave. Hanover Township $1,720.27 SOLD $19,000 / Bidder #142
93| 2017-14040 25-19NW1-014-018-000 Kenneth H. Gribble 27 Goeringer Ave. Hanover Township $2,355.77 CONTINUED DUE TO BANKRUPTCY
94| 2017-02414 25-19NW2-003-009-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 21 1/2 Dexter St. Hanover Township $1,984.48 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
95| 2017-14463 25-19NW2-004-014-000 Ennis Johnson 7 Woodbury St. Hanover Township $1,375.36 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
96| 2017-14232  25-19NW3-004-043-000 Kevin Donnelly 37 Barr Ln. Hanover Township $1,597.21 NO BID
F 2017-14281 25-19NW3-009-003-000 Stephen L. Brozena 1226 S. Main St. Hanover Township $1,675.39 SOLD $22,000 / Bidder #34
98| 2017-14260 25-19NWA4-003-034-000 Christopher Ziemba 58 W. St. Mary's Rd. Hanover Township $1,532.46 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
E 2017-14048 25-19NW4-005-014-000 Richard J. Scalice 256 Lee Park Ave. Hanover Township $2,564.29 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #309
100 2017-14045 25-19NW4-012-001-000 Joseph A. Mital as life tenant, remainder to Angela Petix 1128 Sans Souci Pkwy. Hanover Township $1,608.40 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

2017-02759  25-19SE1-006-008-000 Francis William & Deborah Eyerman and Gustave & /o) o Hanover Township $1,638.56 SOLD $7,500 / Bidder #21

101 Helen Tagnani
[102| 2017-02741 25-195E1-013-003-000 Vito N. & Helene A. Quaglia 14 Spring St. Hanover Township $1,721.36 SOLD $18,000 / Bidder #295
E 2016-02146 25-19SE1-013-008-000 John, Maria C. & John M. Hannon 707 Hazle St. Hanover Township $2,473.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-02760 25-19SE1-03A-001-000 Business Loan Center, LLC Spring St. Hanover Township $1,961.11 SOLD $4,500 / Bidder #309
ﬁ 2017-07221 25-)852-001-001-000 Stephen Flood, deceased S. Main St. Hanover Township $1,699.62 NO BID
1106 2017-14468 25-K851-006-005-000 Kimberly Demchak, deceased 166 Tomko Ave. Hanover Township $1,490.50 NO BID

107| 2017-14274 26-S7-T02-014-000 Ryan James Morresi 14 Holly Lynn Cir. Hazle Township $1,204.29 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
(108| 2017-14294 26-57-T02-015-000 Carina German 15 Holly Lynn Hazle Township $1,551.30 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
(109| 2017-02772 26-5751-002-010-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,664.98 NO BID
(110| 2017-02773 26-5751-003-017-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,877.98 NO BID
(111| 2017-02775 26-5751-003-019-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,883.98 NO BID
(112| 2017-02789 26-5751-003-020-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,883.98 NO BID
(113| 2017-02790 26-5751-004-020-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,812.98 NO BID
(114] 2017-02792 26-5751-004-022-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,883.98 NO BID
E 2017-02793 26-S751-004-023-000 Joseph S. & Jacqueline A. Hyduk Hollywood Blvd. Hazle Township $1,883.98 NO BID

116] 2017-14021 26-S8-00A-032-000 Remmel W. LaBar, Arthur C. James & Israel Wagner Harleigh Terrace Hazle Township $2,237.48 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
(117| 2016-02166 26-T852-001-041-000 Hazle Spring Properties, LLC Sunset Blvd. Hazle Township $1,840.59 NO BID
[118| 2017-02426 26-U5510-007-352-000 Marion Harvey & Edmund D. Callaghan Laurel Vly. Hazle Township $1,409.78 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[119| 2017-02829 26-U5510-007-353-000 Marion Harvey & Edmund D. Callaghan Laurel Vly. Hazle Township $1,399.78 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[120| 2017-02827 26-U5512-001-049-000 Roberto & Cynthia Grandeza Spice Bush Dr. Hazle Township $1,445.37 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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2017-02408 o . ) - . .

121 26-U853-006-002-000 Doris Beishline, Stephanie Stubbs & Alvin Beishline, Jr. 10 E. Church St. Hazle Township $1,744.22 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #168
E 2017-14466 29-H5-00A-37G-000 James M. Lowcavage Prichards Rd. Hunlock Township $2,033.63 SOLD $41,000 / Bidder #35
1123 2017-02830 29-15-00A-47G-001 Ronald Evans 71 Sunset Lake Rd. Hunlock Township $1,598.82 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #166
1124 2017-07225 29-J651-001-001-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,741.62 NO BID
1125 2017-07220 29-J651-001-002-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,652.11 NO BID
1126 2017-07219 29-J651-001-007-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,695.87 NO BID
1127 2017-07238 29-J651-001-014-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,694.38 NO BID
1128 2017-07236 29-J651-001-018-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,713.18 NO BID
1129 2017-07226 29-J651-001-046-000 Stephen Flood Route 11 Hunlock Township $1,683.97 NO BID

130 2016-03255 30-J2-00A-027-000 Leonard & Betty I. Dzock Adj. Pine Creek Huntington Township $1,303.20 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[131] 2017-14216 32-5952-004-008-000 Luke Lindon Casella 31 Highland St. Jeddo Borough $1,639.83 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #31
E 2017-14472 33-E11S3-001-01A-000 Michael J. Thorek River Rd. Jenkins Township $1,881.23 NO BID

133 2017-14084 33-F11-00A-07H-000 Isabell & Ronald Kishel Laflin St. Jenkins Township $696.56 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[134] 2016-03195 34-GINE3-005-009-000 Christopher Roberto 132 Walnut St. Kingston Borough $1,496.04 SOLD $42,000 / Bidder #256
[135| 2017-14029 35-D10-00A-14C-000 Edward A. Prebola Carverton Rd. Kingston Township $1,679.87 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
(136| 2017-14292 35-F955-007-012-000 William Wylie 359 Cliffside Ave. Kingston Township 1,820.33 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
E 2017-14217 37-E4-00A-010-022 Nancy L. Kempa 140 Evergreen Estates Dr. Lake Township $1,213.87 NO BID
(138| 2017-14227 38-H851-007-016-000 David L. Sutton, Jr. & Susan M. Sutton 51 Barney St. Larksville Borough $980.83 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14037 38-H8S3-001-047-000 William B. Davison, Jr. & Deborah A. Davison Adj. Carver St. Larksville Borough $1,429.44 NO BID

140 2017-03122 38-H854-004-027-000 Asa J. & Marian J. Ellsworth 70 E. Broadway St. Larksville Borough $301.78 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018|
E 2017-03084 41-G9NE1-008-044-000 Kenneth Trudgen, Jr. & Mary Trudgen 471 Vaughn St. Luzerne Borough $2,506.98 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

142 2017-14234 42-J7NE3-002-007-000 Richard & Marsha Dixon 117 Loomis St. Nanticoke City $1,599.69 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #176
E 2017-05759 42-J7NE4-022-011-000 Aleksander Momotlivyy 277 State St. Nanticoke City $1,986.34 SOLD $24,000 / Bidder #309

144| 2017-05728 42-J7SE1-027-033-000 Eleanor Szydlowski & George R. Seletski 521 S. Hanover St. Nanticoke City $2,303.90 SOLD $5,000 / Bidder #295
E 2017-14026 42-)7SE4-006-003-000 Edward M. Petroski, Sr. & Edward Petroski, Jr. 1206-1208 S. Prospect St. Nanticoke City $1,778.87 CONTINUED TO AUGUST 9, 2018
(146| 2017-05805 42-J7SE4-008-021-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 1213 S. Hanover St. Nanticoke City $2,267.88 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
(147| 2017-03010 42-J7SE4-015-001-000 John & John J. Wojciechowski 126 Rear W. Washington St. Nanticoke City $2,842.24 NO BID
(148| 2017-05729 42-175E4-025-022-000 Gregory & Lynn Wiepa 42 W. Field St. Nanticoke City $1,491.34 SOLD $2,000 / Bidder #238
E 2017-05715 42-J7SW2-003-004-000 Janice L. & James A. Kittrick 221 W. Main St. Nanticoke City $1,080.38 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #176
1150 2016-04907 42-J7SW2-015-016-000 Grace Nagle 135 Rear W. Broad St. Nanticoke City $2,817.90 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬂ 2017-14074 43-Q3NW1-001-008-000 Martin L. & Laverne R. Michael Broad St. Nescopeck Borough $2,287.52 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1152] 2017-05829 44-P4-00A-040-000 John H. Ghannam River Rd. Nescopeck Township $1,264.77 NO BID

2017-14242 . . .

153 44-Q3-00A-044-000 Louis A. Carville, llI Black Creek Rd. Nescopeck Township $1,848.37 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
(154| 2017-02802 46-K551-003-006-000 Mark & Donna Kamionka 239 W. Main St. Newport Township $2,406.56 NO BID
[155| 2017-03225 46-K651-002-032-000 Stephen & Eunice L. Glushefski 30 W. Enterprise St. Newport Township $1,409.13 NO BID
(156| 2017-03191 46-K651-007-013-000 Pauline Albina Bailey 84 Coal St. Newport Township $1,578.92 NO BID
ﬁ 2017-14298 46-K651-010-009-000 Steven D. & Susan L. Bonar 115-117 Newport St. Newport Township $2,007.24 NO BID
(158| 2016-04922 46-K651-013-11A-000 John Johanson 116 W. Main St. Newport Township $1,559.31 NO BID
E 2017-03131 46-K6S1-017-004-000 Robert & Ruth A. Novak 15 W. Main St. Newport Township $1,651.51 NO BID
|160[ 2017-03143 46-K651-025-010-000 Matthew Ruch 69-71 W. Main St. Newport Township $2,419.49 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

161| 2017-03099 46-K652-007-009-000 Matthew H. Ruch Revocable Living Trust 68 Ridge St. Newport Township $1,427.70 NO BID
[162| 2017-14289 46-K652-009-013-000 Minersville, LLC 145-147 E. Main St. Newport Township $2,071.38 NO BID
E 2017-14257 46-K654-005-001-000 Linda Gray 162 Brown Row Newport Township $1,473.08 NO BID
m 2017-14258 46-K654-005-01A-000 Linda Gray 161 Brown Row Newport Township $1,454.43 NO BID
[165| 2017-03226 46-K655-005-002-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 450 Old Newport St. Newport Township $2,376.17 REMOVED BY COURT ORDER
166] 2017-03230 46-K752-005-020-000 Clem J. Krzynefski 96 Newport Ave. Newport Township $645.43 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
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167 2017-03231 46-K753-001-006-000 William C. & Patti Rae Stewart 41 W. Railroad St. Newport Township $2,410.79 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #185
168| 2016-05027 47-L851-008-011-000 Annie Bohlin Gay Ave. Nuangola Borough $1,411.91 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[169| 2017-03218 47-L851-008-043-000 Albert L. & Theresa A. Deno 107 Gay Rdg. Nuangola Borough $1,778.95 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #288
(170| 2017-05814 48-H8SE3-010-006-000 Russell Case & Jody Stash 238 Beade St. Plymouth Borough $1,491.11 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
(171| 2017-05712 48-H8SE3-015-016-000 Wills Mowatt 18-20-22 Jeanette St. Plymouth Borough $1,500.58 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #169
E 2017-14025 48-H8SE4-019-017-000 Troy Franklin 123 Rear Academy St. Plymouth Borough $1,493.40 NO BID
173| 2017-14306 48-H8SE4-024-018-000 Stephen Starcun 159 Willow St. Plymouth Borough $912.50 SOLD $1,500 / Bidder #203
(174] 2017-14279 48-H8SEA4-030-002-000 Javier Hurtado Rear 118 Turner St. Plymouth Borough $2,454.29 NO BID
(175| 2017-05810 48-H8SE4-037-014-000 Anthony Frederick Smith 90 High St. Plymouth Borough $1,512.54 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #203
E 2017-05710 48-H8SE4-037-12A-000 Ronnie Petricevich 78 High St. Plymouth Borough $1,235.05 NO BID
177| 2017-05778 48-H8SW3-023-019-000 Victor Cruz 126 Nottingham St. Plymouth Borough $1,633.55 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[178| 2017-05835 48-18BNW2-025-011-000 William & Phyllis Stock 606 W. Main St. Plymouth Borough $2,003.09 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
[179| 2017-06491 49-1752-001-010-000 Christina Shatrousky W. Poplar St. Plymouth Township $1,562.25 NO BID
E 2017-06492 49-1752-001-011-000 Christina Shatrousky W. Poplar St. Plymouth Township $1,862.11 NO BID
181| 2017-06558 49-1752-002-004-000 Robert & Marion L. Jones 73 W. Poplar St. Plymouth Township $1,383.07 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #141
E 2016-04831 49-1754-001-013-000 Regina Wypasek & Michael J. Brojakowski 99 W. Main St. Plymouth Township $2,274.62 SOLD Minimum Bid / bidder #187

2017-06526 49-1755-002-017-000 Joseph Maday, life tenant, and Leonard J. & Celia 93 McDonald St. Plymouth Township $1,603.31 NO BID
1183] O'Rourke, remaindermen
184| 2017-06269 49-1851A-001-010-000 Leonard E. Kantor Paul Ave. Plymouth Township $1,611.80 NO BID
[185| 2017-06527 49-1851A-00H-016-000 Thomas R. & Joan E. Potoski Jaroschak St. Plymouth Township $1,236.84 NO BID
[186] 2017-06528 49-1852-002-016-000 David W. Ives Smith Row Plymouth Township $1,362.37 NO BID
W 2016-03370 50-G10NE4-009-008-000 Thomas Swiecicki 23 Bank St. Plains Township $2,113.68 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #52
(188| 2016-03389 50-G10SE1-011-018-000 Pritesh V. & Kekul P. Patel 71-73 Maffet St. Plains Township $2,348.50 SOLD $36,000 / Bidder #259
[189| 2017-14231 50-G11-T02-314-000 Lina Genovese-D'Onofrio 314 E. Mountain Ridge MHP Plains Township $1,405.23 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
W 2016-05037 51-E11S5-002-12A-000 Edward J. Kaushas 995 Sunrise Dr. Pittston Township $2,264.30 SOLD $115,000 / Bidder #225
E 2017-03194 52-G9S1-012-001-000 James M. Lowcavage Pringle & Connors St. Pringle Borough $1,069.42 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #128
1192 2017-03198 54-F3-00A-037-001 Belva Ferrey & Susan Strachan 510 Kyttle Pike Ross Township $1,495.08 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1193 2017-14020 55-L451-009-002-000 Herbert L. & Shirley J. Derby 1006 Shickshinny Valley Rd. Salem Township $1,422.19 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
104 2017-14043  55-1451-009-003-000 Herbert L. & Shirley J. Derby ;z(.)s Adj. Shickshinny Valley - Township $1,308.72 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2016-03211 55-P3NW2-009-001-000 Henry Morgan E. Ninth St. Salem Township $2,127.38 NO BID
196 2017-14028 56-L4SE1-004-006-000 John & Kay Baskett 20 Search St. Shickshinny Borough $1,587.47 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1197] 2017:05771 56-L4SE1-005-009-000 Steven Cohan 35 Search St. Shickshinny Borough $1,851.83 NO BID

2017-03012 ’ . . ;
1198| 56-L4SE1-016-008-000 Catalina Elena Naforeanu 54 W. Union St. Shickshinny Borough $1,400.33 NO BID

2017-14252 . . .
1199] 56-L4SE1-021-020-000 Robert A. McLaughlin 30 R. Susquehanna Ave. Shickshinny Borough $1,896.21 NO BID

2017-14251 . . ;
200 56-L4SE1-021-022-000 Robert A. & Karen L. McLaughlin 26 Susquehanna Ave. Shickshinny Borough $1,894.73 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-05827 57-M6-00A-074-000 Adam Lowe 130 Lily Lake Rd. Slocum Township $1,556.75 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #173
202 2017-07211 58-S5-00A-050-000 Fred Kirchdoerfer Rock Glen Rd. Sugarloaf Township $1,373.50 NO BID
E 2017-03220 61-J4-00A-39E-000 Northeast Investors Group, Inc. Map 73P34 Union Township $1,564.02 NO BID
1204 2017-14250 61-K451-013-015-000 One Way Vacations, Inc. Route 239-McKendee Rd. Union Township $1,326.34 NO BID

2017-03206
1205 63-T7NE3-016-005-000 Roberto E. Vargas N. Broad St. West Hazleton Borough $568.05 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

2017-03232
206 63-T7NE3-016-006-000 Roberto E. Vargas N. Broad St. West Hazleton Borough $388.81 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
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207 2017-03146 63-T7SE2-012-005-000 James R. & Joan Isabel Roberts 18 E. Clay Ave. West Hazleton Borough $3,940.21 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #308

208 2017-14244 64-1L9-00A-08A-000 Lindsi West Burma Rd. Wright Township $1,721.79 NO BID

209 2017-03208 64-M9S12-VAR-VAR-000  NEB Investments, LLC Cooksey Plot Wright Township $644.24 NO BID
2017-14022 . .

210 65-E11NE1-008-022-000 Kathryn G. Grossman 36 Exeter Ave. West Pittston Borough $1,603.30 SOLD $23,000 / Bidder #309
2017-03211 - .

211 65-E11NE1-014-020-000 Kathleen Mary McGinnis 307 Montgomery Ave. West Pittston Borough $1,514.62 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-14452 . .

212 65-E11NE1-018-015-000 Alan P. & Eileen C. Rosen 115 York Ave. West Pittston Borough $1,617.14 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-03213 . .

213 66-E10NE4-004-005-000 Joseph & Kathleen Marstell 718 W. Eight St. West Wyoming Borough $2,002.95 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-14226 . . .

214 66-E10SE2-003-005-000 Edward A. Prebola W. Sixth St. West Wyoming Borough $3,669.40 SOLD $12,000 / Bidder #52
2017-14219 . .

215 66-E10SE2-003-07A-000 Edward A. Prebola 206 Sixth St. West Wyoming Borough $3,280.61 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
2017-14303 . .

216 66-E10SE2-004-016-000 Edward A. Prebola Sixth St. West Wyoming Borough $2,533.29 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
2017-14304 . .

217 66-E10SE2-004-017-000 Edward A. Prebola Sixth St. West Wyoming Borough $2,620.58 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
2016-05024 - . .

218 66-E10SE2-004-17A-000 Georgi Nikoloff, Jr. Bridge St. West Wyoming Borough $1,336.43 NO BID

219 2017-07252 67-E10SE3-001-002-000 JPM Realty, Inc. 55 W. Seventh St. Wyoming Borough $3,059.57 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
2017-14464 .

220 68-P12NW1-031-007-000 Steve & Carol Bentham 433 Rear Buffalo St. White Haven Borough $1,644.35 NO BID
2016-05038 . ) . .

221 69-110NW3-001-009-000  Allstate Asset 1037 Rear Willow St. Wilkes-Barre Township $2,013.30 SOLD $8,500 / Bidder #158
2016-04986 . . . .

222 69-110NW4-008-056-000  Stephen T. Morio 442 Francis St. Wilkes-Barre Township $1,071.10 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
2016-04994 . . . .

223 69-110SW1-006-009-000 Eric L. & Donna Reese 158 S. Walnut St. Wilkes-Barre Township $1,673.68 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #237

224| 2017-14017 71-S8SW34-003-007-000 John Lettiere, Jr. Meade Ct. Hazleton City $1,436.30 NO BID

225 2016-04942 71-T8NE42-003-006-000 John & Iris Orbach Thompson St. Hazleton City $1,455.21 NO BID

226 2016-05002 71-T8NE44-007-002-000 Robert Zukowski 504-506 E. Diamond Ave. Hazleton City $1,439.42 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

227| 2017-14018 71-T8NW24-004-007-000  Frank & Elizabeth Kudasik 783 Seybert St. Hazleton City $1,645.94 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #115

228 2017-05843 71-T8NW34-006-005-000 losif Gantea 566 Seybert St. Hazleton City $674.44 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

229| 2017-07213 71-T8NW34-010-007-000 Lisa C. Michael V. Krouse 546 N. Lee Ct. Hazleton City $1,690.39 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #180

230| 2017-05734 71-T8NW44-019-010-000 Marco Lavezzari 621 Peace St. Hazleton City $3,843.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

231 2016-04829 71-T8SW12-008-10A-000 Efrain Muniz 407 W. Oak St. Hazleton City $1,499.73 SOLD $26,000 / Bidder #206

232| 2017-07276 71-T8SW13-008-007-000  Ganija Gianni & Muradija M. Vucetovic 133 W. Green St. Hazleton City $2,612.02 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

233| 2017-07274 71-T8SW13-008-07A-000 Ganija Gianni Vucetovic 139 W. Green St. Hazleton City $1,897.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

234 2017-14456 71-T8SW24-002-005-000 Thomas J. Bond, Jr. & Rosalie A. Bond 152 N. Wyoming St. Hazleton City $1,534.89 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #308

235| 2017-14285 71-T8SW24-012-004-000  Abigail & Robert Ward 138 N. Wyoming St. Hazleton City $1,930.37 SOLD $51,000 / Bidder #308

236| 2017-14228 71-T8SW24-012-005-000  Abigail & Robert Ward 136 N. Wyoming St. Hazleton City $2,240.37 SOLD $31,000 / Bidder #308

237| 2017-06239 71-T8SW24-013-10A-000 Ruth M. James 128 N. Fulton Ct. Hazleton City $1,537.27 SOLD $2,000 / Bidder #299

238| 2017-14031 71-T8SW31-016-010-000 Dorothy I. Buckery 34-36 E. Broad St. Hazleton City $2,570.19 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

239| 2017-05727 71-T8SW31-06A-08A-000 Joseph W. Sanon 326 1/2 E. Broad St. Hazleton City $1,665.94 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018

240| 2017-14465 71-T8SW32-004-006-001  Anthracite Mason Supply Co. E. Spruce St. Hazleton City $1,799.68 NO BID

241| 2017-05749 71-T8SW33-008-005-000 Kevin & Kathryn Pursel 413 E. Walnut St. Hazleton City $2,024.64 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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242 2017-05780 71-T8SW34-004-01C-000 David & Teresa Sterenchock 167 S. Pine St. Hazleton City $1,764.45 SOLD $13,000 / Bidder #308
E 2017-05750 71-T8SW34-015-04C-000 Aurelio & Maria C. Hernandez 309 E. Elm St. Hazleton City $1,474.00 SOLD $28,000 / Bidder #308
244 2017-07265 71-T8SW34-018-05C-000 Tilson O. Almonte & Israel Reyes 132 S. Cedar St. Hazleton City $2,551.30 SOLD $31,000 / Bidder #300
245| 2017-07277 71-T8SW42-001-008-000 Ganija Vucetovic & Adam Lizbinski 328 W. Broad St. Hazleton City $2,648.63 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
246| 2017-07278 71-T8SW42-001-009-000 Ganija Vucetovic & Adam Lizbinski 320 W. Broad St. Hazleton City $1,522.22 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14262 71-T8SW42-002-001-000 Hazleton Partners, LP 141 W. Broad St. Hazleton City $12,760.49 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
248| 2017-14237 71-U8NW14-001-003-000 William G. & Robert F. Dougherty S. Church St. Hazleton City $2,174.54 REMOVED BY COURT ORDER
249| 2017-05721 71-USNW34-007-009-000 Hugh & Corinne M. Jeffrey 232 Thirwell Ave. Hazleton City $1,859.59 SOLD $40,000 / Bidder #308
E 2017-14032 71-U8NW34-007-021-000 Lewis Alcala 520-522 S. Poplar St. Hazleton City $1,888.87 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #168
251 2017-14038 72-D11SE2-001-022-000 Andrew & Lizzie German 108 Cliff St. Pittston City $2,042.62 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
252| 2017-03095 72-E11NE2-014-013-000 Zevel, LLC 273 N. Main St. Pittston City $1,487.00 NO BID
253| 2017-02805 72-E11NE2-014-014-000  Shawn Granahan 277 N. Main St. Pittston City $1,950.60 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #289
254| 2017-03094 72-E11NE2-024-005-000 Jerome M. & Lois Romanski 65 Parsonage St. Pittston City $1,816.52 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-03106 72-E11NE3-017-003-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 19 Carroll St. Pittston City $1,683.04 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
256 2016-05000 72-E11SE1-010-001-000 James & Georgina Costanzo 136 Vine St. Pittston City $1,582.28 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
1257| 2017-03116 72-E11SE1-014-002-000 Carol Sincavage 21 Nafus St. Pittston City $1,695.62 SOLD $21,000 / Bidder #309
E 2017-03093 72-E11SE1-030-002-000 Anthony M. Zambetti 5 E. Columbus Ave. Pittston City $2,030.80 SOLD $7,000 / Bidder #301
1259 2017-14075 72-E11SE1-030-008-000 Joseph San Angelo, deceased 33 E. Columbus Ave. Pittston City $1,557.57 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #127
260 2017-14469 72-E11SE1-037-002-000 Sprinkles & Shakes Ice Cream, Inc. Elizabeth St. Pittston City $1,423.50 NO BID
261 2017-07272 73-G10SE1-013-010-000 William Walter Savage, Jr. 51 Thomas St. Wilkes-Barre City $3,540.31 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14225 73-G10SE2-011-002-000 Michael Yedinak, Sr. 165 Thomas St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,766.02 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬂ 2017-14044 73-H10NE1-015-020-000 Michael Kleyman, deceased 106 George Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $2,067.78 SOLD $7,500 / Bidder #239
264 2017-06554 73-H10NW1-004-011-000 Carol Depolo, deceased 32 Kulp St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,707.51 SOLD $10,000 / Bidder #289
E 2017-06555 73-H10NW1-005-007-000 Michele A. Sebastianelli 51 W. Hollenback St. Wilkes-Barre City $627.78 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-06556 73-H10NW2-005-009-000 Gregory Koval 23 W. Chestnut St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,608.85 SOLD $7,500 / Bidder #154
1267 2017-14067 73-H10NW2-011-014-000 Stella Mycek & Deborah V. Terpak 762 N. Penna Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,872.54 SOLD $7,000 / Bidder #156
@ 2017-06557 73-H10NW2-019-20A-000 Thomas & Henrietta Flaherty 12 W. Chestnut St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,235.12 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
269 2017-14077 73-H10NW2-030-001-000 Dolores Grabko 579 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,147.65 SOLD $17,000 / Bidder #34
E 2016-04989 73-H10NW3-016-011-000 Ruby Mac, LLC 43 Henry St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,388.83 NO BID
271 2017-05846 73-H10NW3-020-003-000 Evelyn & John J. Banas 537 N. Penn Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $2,002.79 SOLD $10,000 / Bidder #265
272| 2017-03149 73-H10NW3-023-16A-000 Majestic Eagle Enterprises 34 Rear Thompson St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,627.18 SOLD $6,000 / Bidder #245
ﬁ 2017-14261 73-H10NWA4-003-012-000 Frederick N. Shaffer, Jr. & Pat Shaffer Priestly St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,682.63 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
274] 2017-14238 73-H10NWA4-004-021-000 Virgil & Victoria Argenta 41 Courtright St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,242.39 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
275| 2017-14079 73-H10NWA4-006-019-000 Harry E. Williams 54 Butler St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,001.07 SOLD $2,500 / Bidder #175
276] 2017-14060 73-H10NWA4-006-028-000 John A. & Marietta Sninsky 36 Butler St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,881.87 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
z 2017-06499 73-H10NW4-013-012-000 William J. Cook 257 N. River St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,017.13 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
278 2017-06501 73-H10NWA4-017-006-000 Douglas J. McMichael 416 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,602.97 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #175
279| 2016-02790 73-H10NWA4-018-011-000 Virgil E. Argenta, Jr. & Victoria C. Argenta 321 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,429.59 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14080 73-H10NW4-018-017-000 Virgil E. Argenta, Jr. & Victoria C. Argenta 345 N. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $3,629.31 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
281 2017-14066 73-H10NW4-019-008-000 Norman & Evelyn Waters 129 Madison St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,874.40 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
282| 2016-12341 73-H10NWA4-019-021-000 Frank Fico 165 Madison St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,305.40 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #201
283| 2017-14307 73-H10NWA4-022-025-000 Johann Lingl 296 N. Washington St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,960.13 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14081 73-H10SW1-006-023-000 Virgil E. & Victoria Argenta 97 Wyoming St. Wilkes-Barre City $3,301.02 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
285 2017-14064 73-H10SW1-006-033-000 Kathryn M. Gildea 278 N. Penna Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $3,233.48 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #176
286] 2017-14063 73-H10SW1-006-045-000 Allstate Asset 232 N. Penna Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $2,093.04 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018|
287| 2017-06512 73-H10SW1-012-002-000 Darik Johnson & Nataya Cottle 280 New Hancock St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,699.13 CONTINUED DUE TO BANKRUPTCY
288| 2017-06259 73-H10SW2-003-009-000 Ashley Lynn Mink & Jessica Marie Price 211 Bowman St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,669.16 SOLD $6,500 / Bidder #137
289| 2017-06260 73-H10SW2-007-015-000 Dawn & Joseph S. Zavec 50 Schoolhouse Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,517.95 NO BID
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290| 2017-07202 73-H10SW2-013-025-000 Thomas M. Sokolas 206 Scott St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,438.52 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
291| 2017-06265 73-H10SW2-018-027-000 James A. Niski, Jr. 122 Spring St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,558.27 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #293
292| 2017-06264 73-H10SW2-018-028-000 James A. Niski, Jr. 124 Spring St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,566.06 NO BID
293| 2017-14213 73-H10SW2-020-016-000 Yvonne Deets Fisher 82 Chapel St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,522.19 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
294| 2017-06268 73-H10SW4-004-033-000 Justine Austin 68 N. Grant St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,682.73 SOLD $13,000 / Bidder #137
295| 2016-04826 73-H10SW4-012-016-000 Romayne McLaughlin 127 S. Grant St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,130.27 SOLD $18,000 / Bidder #62
E 2017-06529 73-H10SW4-019-008-000 Justine & Jeff Austin 35 N. Sherman St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,199.33 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #188
E 2017-06530 73-H10SW4-019-009-000 Justine & Jeff Austin 37 N. Sherman St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,492.98 SOLD $10,000 / Bidder #241
298| 2017-06473 73-H10SW4-019-010-000 Justine & Jeff Austin 39 N. Sherman St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,487.38 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #239
E 2017-14282 73-H9SE3-018-029-000 Main Street Warehouse & Storage, LLC 257-259 S. Main St. Wilkes-Barre City $5,418.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
% 2017-06252 73-H9SE3-025-004-000 John L. Grohowski 75 Park Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $2,933.03 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-06476 73-H9SE4-004-023-000 Debra Hoskins & Lori-Marie Speight 244 Academy St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,265.22 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
302| 2017-14276 73-H9SE4-013-015-000 James S. Buziak & Darlene Tomasura 104 Sambourne St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,452.58 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #175
ﬁ 2017-14286 73-H9SE4-030-009-000 Tandum E. Nardone 69 Orchard St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,939.87 SOLD $3,500 / Bidder #210
ﬁ 2017-06509 73-H9SE4-033-007-000 Darrell Williams 32 Monroe St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,512.82 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER
305| 2017-14295 73-H9SE4-033-034-000 Phyllis L. Smith 71 Race St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,290.08 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
306| 2017-14299 73-H9SEA4-033-33A-000 Phyllis L. Smith 67 Race St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,399.67 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
307| 2017-06477 73-H9SEA4-034-017-000 Arden E. Fahey 102 Carey Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $1,849.02 SOLD $9,000 / Bidder #201
@ 2017-14082 73-110NW1-002-07A-000  Curtis H. Cobbs 63 S. Fulton St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,820.16 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
309 2017-06253 73-110NW1-013-016-000 Joseph & Phyllis Rossick 29 Hillside St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,491.59 SOLD $8,500 / Bidder #218
310| 2017-14457 73-110NW1-014-016-000  William P. & Molly E. Kratz 445 New Market St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,049.05 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬁ 2017-14076 73-110NW1-021-022-000  Curt W. Schwarzwalder 112 S. Meade St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,942.09 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬁ 2016-13118 73-19NE1-003-005-000 Bernard, Harriet, Howard & Jeffrey Rockman 12 Oregon St. Wilkes-Barre City $7,840.70 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
ﬁ 2017-06480 73-19NE1-004-029-000 Roy S. & Sara E. Howey 195 1/2 Sambourne St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,746.47 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #69
314| 2016-12314 73-19NE1-005-002-000 Opportunity, Inc. 230 Sambourne St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,194.91 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #293
E 2017-06497 73-19NE1-011-008-000 Stephen E. Patrovich, Sr. & Wendy L. Patrovich 117 Prospect St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,189.01 SOLD $12,000 / Bidder #195
316 2017-14061 73-19NE1-012-006-000 Matthew Ruch 16 Lloyds Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,817.61 SOLD $4,000 / Bidder #175
317| 2016-12363 73-19NE1-020-004-000 Diane J. Beaton 114 Westminster St. Wilkes-Barre City $3,173.88 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
318| 2016-12321 73-19NE1-027-014-000 Douglas Neyman 119 Grove St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,022.80 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #175
319| 2017-14461 73-19NE1-027-022-000 Stephen & Wendy Patrovich 60 Prospect St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,851.28 SOLD $17,000 / Bidder #231
@ 2017-14308 73-19NE1-029-015-000 Cesar Santana 187 Stanton St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,434.52 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
Lpq| 201714223 73-19NE2-032-044-000 Etoet;e;;::: Stephenson & Naja Channell Grierson- ) o ole st. Wilkes-Barre City $1,226.43 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-06540 73-19NE2-034-020-000 Maria Rosa Osorio 205 Hazle St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,718.70 SOLD $5,500 / Bidder #68
E 2017-06229 73-19NE2-037-015-000 Robin Shumway 208 Park Ave. Wilkes-Barre City $2,179.40 SOLD $9,500 / Bidder #76
324| 2016-12358 73-19NE2-038-008-000 Thuong Truong 245-247 S. Grant St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,316.58 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
] Ruthe Howard Green and Michael A. & Aaron P.
325| 2016-12368 73-19NE2-042-008-000 Howard 120 Hickory St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,144.30 NO BID
326] 2017-06522 73-19NE2-042-011-000 Frank Puglisi & Owen Grady 112 Hickory St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,268.68 SOLD $11,000 / Bidder #175
327| 2017-14459 73-19NE2-043-023-000 Anthony & Gullermina Dapas 218 Dana St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,857.08 REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
E 2017-14458 73-19NE3-002-021-000 Lana E. & Zachary J. Chromey 350 Stanton St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,602.84 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #27
1329 2017-14062 73-19NE3-005-002-000 Joseph Malinowski 167 Almond Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,832.17 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #35
330 2017-06524 73-19NE3-011-023-000 John Zedock, Jr. 286 S. Sheridan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,722.82 SOLD $15,000 / Bidder #223
E 2017-06230 73-19NE3-027-022-000 Alan & Jacqueline Rinehimer 156 Kent Ln. Wilkes-Barre City $1,928.37 SOLD $14,000 / Bidder #175
E 2017-07207 73-19NE4-013-004-000 Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges 19 Gilligan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,913.46 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
333| 2017-07205 73-19NE4-025-007-000 Geo J. & Leona Glaser 63 Spruce St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,595.14 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #238
E 2017-14236 73-19NE4-033-01B-000 Eugene D. Sitkowski, Jr. 323 Blackman St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,449.20 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
335| 2017-07269 73-19NE4-037-029-000 Mayer Hirsch 244 MclLean St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,093.56 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-07261 73-19NE4-038-06A-000 Raymond Garney & Denise Perillo Rear 24 Mayer Wilkes-Barre City $1,269.89 NO BID
337 2017-06258 73-19NW2-005-032-000 Lorraine & Mark Stelma 247 Horton St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,718.96 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
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338| 2017-14239 73-19NW2-011-002-000 William C., Julia M., Eugene R., & Jeanette V. Raineri 126 Hanover St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,847.69 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-07260 73-19NW2-013-016-000 Vincent P. & Helen Macri 848 S. Franklin St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,055.68 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
% 2017-02806 73-19NW2-017-020-000 Robert P., Diane L., & Clifford J. Thomas 84 Waller St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,653.83 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
341| 2017-14263 73-19NW2-018-018-000 Sheila Greco 113 Waller St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,216.68 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
E 2017-14235 73-19NW2-025-019-000 Carol & Walter Tomolonis 129 Carlisle St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,846.38 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #289
343 2017-14264 73-19NW2-032-011-000 Robert A. & Carol A. Frail 164 Carlisle St. Wilkes-Barre City $2,217.92 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
% 2017-14283 73-19NW3-005-006-000 David C. & Priscilla Lehman 120 E. Division St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,892.82 SOLD $7,500 / Bidder #245
E 2017-07218 73-19SE1-005-001-000 Business Loan Center, LLC 173 Gilligan St. Wilkes-Barre City $8,500.00 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #309
346| 2017-07254 73-195E1-005-012-000 Wyoming Valley Land Trust 219 Gilligan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,358.59 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #67
347| 2017-07217 73-195E1-006-001-000 Business Loan Center LLC Gilligan St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,646.15 NO BID
% 2017-14058 73-19SE1-006-018-000 Terrific Transport, LLC 659 Hazle St. Wilkes-Barre City $3,006.60 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
% 2017-07255 73-19SE2-002-016-000 Darrell Williams 58 Frederick St. Wilkes-Barre City $1,633.90 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018
350| 2016-04887 74-C752-013-007-000 Helen Czajkowski Rear Second St. Harveys Lake Borough $1,362.25 NO BID
E 2017-03004 74-D6S52-001-006-000 Lakewood Development Inc Taylor St. Harveys Lake Borough $1,429.87 NO BID
1352 2017-14030 74-D652-002-022-000 Henry Cerquozzi Northview Ave. Harveys Lake Borough $1,688.41 NO BID
353 2017-14290 74-D6S52-011-040-000 Preston Thompson Beech St. Harveys Lake Borough $1,261.20 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #216
ﬁ 2017-07266 74-D654-020-004-000 William R. & Judith Davis 223 Noble St. Harveys Lake Borough $1,741.10 SOLD $8,000 / Bidder #195
355| 2017-03017 74-D655-002-012-000 George L. Strickland & Kelly Shaw 388 Old Lake Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $2,354.30 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #309
356| 2017-03018 74-D655-002-013-000 George L. Strickland & Kelly Shaw 388 Old Lake Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $2,021.59 SOLD $3,000 / Bidder #309
357| 2017-03019 74-D655-002-014-000 George L. Strickland & Kelly Shaw 388 Old Lake Rd. Harveys Lake Borough $2,022.87 SOLD Minimum Bid / Bidder #309
358| 2017-03135 74-D655-002-023-000 George L. Strickland & Kelly Shaw Rear Oneonata Hill Harveys Lake Borough $1,975.12 NO BID
359| 2017-14301 74-D655-004-005-000 Kathy & Joe Wynne Trolley HI. Harveys Lake Borough $1,308.70 CONTINUED TO OCTOBER 25, 2018




