

<u>Sale number</u>	<u>Municipality</u>	<u>Parcel</u>	<u>Owner</u>	<u>Property Description</u>	<u>Starting Bid</u>	<u>Results</u>
25-0007	ASHLEY BORO WARD 1	01-I9SE4 -001-011-000	BARZILAY KFIR & GALIT	119 W HARTFORD ST	\$ 1,308.04	No bid
25-0010	ASHLEY BORO WARD 1	01-I9SE4 -004-010-000	RIVAS ANITA & GREGORY	N MAIN ST	\$ 1,175.81	No bid
25-0047	ASHLEY BORO WARD 3	01-J9NE1 -010-25A-000	GAVILANES EDWIN & TARSHA LEGRAND	142 S MAIN ST	\$ 1,242.20	No bid
25-0078	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-S4 -00A-25A-000	REYES ALEIDA M	CEDAR HEAD RD	\$ 1,233.62	No bid
25-0095	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1 -008-020-000	REYES ALEIDA M	IROQUOIS CIR	\$ 1,313.16	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-0097	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1A -009-008-000	VARGAS MARIA ANGELES & SYLVIA DELAPAZ	WALDEN DR	\$ 1,335.24	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,335.24
25-0101	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S3 -001-035-000	GETUBA CARREN N	TURNBERRY LN	\$ 1,287.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,287.50
25-0104	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S3 -001-175-000	REYES ALEIDA M	PAWNEE AVE	\$ 1,309.60	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,309.60
25-0107	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S4 -001-035-000	FITZPATRICK VINCENT G	WALDON CT	\$ 1,306.59	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0108	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S4 -001-037-000	WILSON LAURENE A & WILLIAM J III	WALDON CT	\$ 1,462.71	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0110	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S5 -003-060-000	DULOG EUSEBIO C & ROSARIO S	TURNBERRY LN	\$ 1,451.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,451.50
25-0117	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S6 -003-127-000	LI DAYONG & HUANHONG XIA	127 TURNBERRY LN	\$ 1,345.17	Sold to bidder #50 for \$4,000.00
25-0118	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S6 -003-143-000	PATHURI SRINIVAS & RAJA	143 YAZOO DR	\$ 1,295.09	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,295.09
25-0162	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-N12S2 -003-004-000	OELKE HAILEY	AZALEA TRL	\$ 1,647.08	Sold to bidder #459 for \$5,500.00
24-0155	BUTLER TOWNSHIP WARD 1	06-Q8S3-001-18A-000	GIACOBE JOSEPH & SANDRA KUCERA	JAMES LN	\$ 1,385.88	No bid
25-0198	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S9 -001-012-000	MOLINA DURAN JENNY	EDGE ROCK DR	\$ 1,496.33	No bid
25-0201	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S9 -007-002-000	LEE CHRISTOPHER ALEXANDER & VIVIAN NATALI BREIDING	TOMMYS CT	\$ 1,407.31	No bid
25-0219	CONYNGHAM BORO	08-S6 -00A-34A-000	LAGARA JUANA	BROOK HILL RD	\$ 1,254.70	No bid
25-0235	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M5 -00A-20B-000	TANEY CARL D & JOSHUA DANIEL	43 PLANTATION RD	\$ 1,263.62	Sold to bidder #270 for \$7,500.00
25-0275	DALLAS TWP	10-C7S1 -006-009-000	ROO RIOS JUAN J	KUNKLE ALDERSON RD	\$ 1,186.45	No bid
25-0313	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S5 -005-015-000	ROO RIOS JUAN J	RESERVOIR RD	\$ 1,194.95	Sold to bidder #482 for \$1,194.95
25-0317	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-007-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,168.28	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,168.28
25-0318	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-008-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0319	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-009-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0320	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-010-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0321	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-011-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0322	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-012-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0323	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-013-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,168.60	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,168.50
25-0324	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-014-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0325	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-015-000	DUDA PAUL	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0326	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-016-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,148.60	Sold to bidder #210 for \$3,000.00
25-0327	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -006-017-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW ST	\$ 1,167.24	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,167.24
25-0329	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -008-007-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW AVE	\$ 1,099.92	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,099.92
25-0330	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -008-008-000	DUDA PAUL	PINE VIEW AVE	\$ 1,285.92	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,285.92

25-0331	DALLAS BORO	11-E8NW1 -008-009-000	DUDA PAUL R	PINE VIEW AVE	\$ 1,094.30	Sold to bidder #210 for \$1,094.30
25-0334	DORRANCE TWP	12-M7S1 -006-001-000	SHERIDAN THOMAS B & NANCY	SUNSET HLS	\$ 1,157.31	Sold to bidder #44 for \$1,157.31
25-0382	DURYEA BORO WARD 4	14-D12NE4-002-17E-000	ROSA DEBORAH	[NO LOCATION]	\$ 1,180.10	Trump Bid placed by North East Pennsylvania land Bank
25-0370	DURYEA BORO WARD 3	14-D12NW3-012-001-000	REYES MAGDALENA ALEIDA MOTO	204 MEADE ST S	\$ 948.14	Trump Bid placed by North East Pennsylvania land Bank
25-0455	EXETER TWP	17-C10 -00A-03E-000	CONKLIN ERNEST C & CAROLE	BOX 450 MT ZION RD	\$ 1,199.30	Sold to bidder #44 for \$1,199.30
25-0568	FREELAND BORO WARD 3	22-Q9SE4 -T01-027-000	DEWALL BLAKE & SHANNON PROBERT	807 SCHWABE ST	\$ 1,444.61	Sold to bidder #220 for \$36,000.00
25-0573	FREELAND BORO WARD 4	22-R9NE1 -012-08B-000	FERKO RITA	WALNUT ST	\$ 1,175.92	Sold to bidder #26 for \$3,000.00
25-0606	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S6 -008-019-000	MCCARTNEY JOHN JR & CLAIRE	WOODHAVEN DR	\$ 1,222.63	No bid
25-0608	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S7 -005-007-000	THOMAS ARTHUR	83 HOLIDAY DR	\$ 1,201.47	No bid
25-0615	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S8 -005-019-000	JUMPER MICHAEL	WOODHAVEN DR	\$ 1,201.47	No bid
25-0617	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S8 -007-004-000	MATIAS LADISLAO & IRIS	8 HILLARY DR	\$ 1,201.47	No bid
25-0643	FOSTER TWP	23-S10S2 -001-002-000	DZIAK ROBERT GEORGE	HAZLEBROOK	\$ 1,274.94	No bid
25-0654	HANOVER TWP WARD 1	25-I8S1 -004-020-000	BUENANO JOHANNA	156 PARK ST	\$ 1,146.47	No bid
25-0743	HANOVER TWP WARD 7	25-I9NW3 -016-01A-000	CHRIST UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH		\$ 1,152.23	No bid
25-0674	HANOVER TWP WARD 2	25-I9SE1 -004-10A-000	REYES ALEIDA M	SPRING ST	\$ 1,162.60	No bid
25-0683	HANOVER TWP WARD 2	25-I9SE3 -003-010-000	CACERERA PAULINO NILSAN R	ADJ JOHNSON ST	\$ 951.01	No bid
25-0772	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S5 -001-007-000	NEEW INVESTMENT & PROPERTIES LLC	78 W MAIN ST	\$ 1,151.88	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-0797	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-013-000	REYES ALEIDA M	MOUNTAIN VIEW DR	\$ 1,473.57	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0808	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1 -001-470-000	CRUZ JOSE A	ROCK CREST DRIVE	\$ 1,471.74	Sold to bidder #44 for \$1,471.74
25-0818	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-033-000	CRISOL GEORGE	[no location]	\$ 1,273.47	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,273.47
25-0820	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-066-000	VILLAREAL ANTHONY G	[no location]	\$ 1,331.99	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,331.99
25-0825	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2 -001-161-000	NAVARRA GLEN	[no location]	\$ 1,473.86	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0851	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T8S2 -003-003-000	NEW WAY PROPERTY MANAGEMENT LLC	Route 00924	\$ 1,192.48	No bid
25-0856	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-042-000	CRUZ JOSE A	MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR	\$ 1,437.64	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,000.00
25-0858	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-068-000	ROSS HAROLD CHARLES JR	WILD PLUM WAY	\$ 1,467.16	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0860	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -001-134-000	AMANCIO WILFREDO	ELDERBERRY LN	\$ 1,258.49	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0861	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -002-228-000	REYES ALEIDA M	LAUREL VALLEY RD	\$ 1,342.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0862	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10 -002-232-000	SANTANA EVELIN	LAUREL VALLEY RD	\$ 1,275.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0867	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S11 -001-043-000	ROYALTY DECK INC	PEBBLE BEACH DR	\$ 1,314.73	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-0868	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12 -001-035-000	SALES CHRISTOPHER M & FLOCY Y	SPICE BUSH DR	\$ 1,366.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0871	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12 -001-137-000	SANCHEZ RAYMOND	BUTTONBUSH LN	\$ 1,455.88	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0873	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12 -001-187-000	GUANZON GERARD Y	SPICE BUSH DR	\$ 1,285.08	Sold to bidder #50 for \$4,500.00
25-0875	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-128-000	BLANCO LANI	N SYCAMORE LN	\$ 1,379.33	Sold to bidder #50 for \$4,500.00
25-0877	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-189-000	BANDAYREL ROMULO T & MIRASOL B	SWEET BIRCH LN	\$ 1,329.06	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00

25-0878	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-258-000	BAYONA EMMANUEL H & WINDY G	BUTTERNUT LN	\$ 1,344.83	Sold to bidder #210 for \$4,000.00
25-0883	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13 -001-350-000	HASSANZOY AHMAD NABI	LOT 350 THE VISTAS	\$ 1,268.04	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0892	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-067-000	FRILLYA GRACENIA F	WHITE OAK LN	\$ 1,027.16	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0894	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-091-000	ABRAHAM MARY JOY C	HUCKLEBERRY LN	\$ 1,097.06	Sold to bidder \$50 for \$2,000.00
25-0896	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-117-000	PARAS EFREN C JR	HUCKLEBERRY LN	\$ 1,387.60	Sold to bidder #50 for \$1,387.60
25-0897	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-121-000	VO JONATHAN	SYCAMORE LN	\$ 1,378.31	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0898	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-180-000	REYES KATHERINE GRACE C & MARICAR SUNSHINE S PEREZ	HICKORY LN	\$ 1,003.49	Sold to bidder \$50 for \$2,000.00
25-0901	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-213-000	EUSEBIO ULLOA ARACELIS & LUIS	TAMARILLO CIRCLE	\$ 1,295.03	Sold to bidder #86 for \$4,000.00
25-0907	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14 -001-366-000	FRAYNA SANDRA G & WONG WING	WHITE OAK LANE	\$ 1,397.26	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0910	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-072-000	EAGLE ROCK RESORT CO	SWEET BIRCH LN	\$ 1,262.06	Removed due to assessment issue
25-0913	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-152-000	BODNARCHUK JOHN DAVID & LISA M CIROCCO	BUTTONBUSH LN	\$ 1,504.60	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0915	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-296-000	VAZQUEZ BERRIOS CRYSTAL	CRANBERRY LN	\$ 1,351.83	Sold to bidder #86 for \$4,000.00
25-0917	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-344-000	BARKATAKI SANGJUCTA & DEVARSHI	HONEYSUCKLE DRIVE	\$ 1,405.42	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0920	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-402-000	BARRILLI VINCENT WM & DANIELLE MARI	HUCKLEBERRY & HONEYSUC	\$ 1,499.01	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0925	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15 -001-554-000	BEARD JAMES E	BLUE SPRUCE DRIVE	\$ 1,451.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0926	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -001-007-000	HAKKI SHEREEN	JANHANNA CIR	\$ 1,343.66	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0928	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -004-018-000	TIU DOREEN	JANHANNA CIR	\$ 1,317.42	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0929	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -004-019-000	BRONSTEIN MOLLY K & DAVID J	45 J JANHANNA CIR	\$ 1,196.78	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0932	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -007-002-000	QIAN JIPENG & DANPING FANG	TUSCARORA DR	\$ 1,268.73	Sold to bidder #50 for \$2,500.00
25-0936	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -008-016-000	SANCHEZ RAYMOND	E TUSCARORA DR	\$ 1,249.78	Sold to bidder #175 for \$4,500.00
25-0937	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2 -009-001-000	SANCHEZ RAYMOND	CALUMET DR	\$ 1,253.85	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0941	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -002-005-000	GISMA EULOGIO G	135 PINE VALLEY LN	\$ 1,323.16	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0943	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -003-001-000	BAMBICO EFREN M & EMELDA L	CROOKED STICK LN	\$ 1,322.17	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0945	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -004-018-000	ELEUTERI KAREN	CROOKED STICK LN	\$ 1,339.49	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0951	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -010-027-000	DOROTAN VINCENT & MIA	GLEN EAGLES DR	\$ 1,390.22	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0952	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4 -011-015-000	RESPONTE MARITES AVISADO	MERION DR	\$ 1,323.16	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0959	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5 -006-003-000	BAGUNO MAGNALIA	SHINNECOCK HILLS LN	\$ 1,331.36	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0967	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S6 -004-021-000	ROMERO REY GENEROSO V & JOCELYN	CYPRESS POINT RD	\$ 1,386.71	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0968	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S6 -006-012-000	RODULFA ANTONIO MAHINAY & LEILA VILLANUEVA	POPPY HILLS RD	\$ 2,528.33	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0970	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7 -002-023-000	HASHEM MOHAMED	QUAPAW DR	\$ 1,167.56	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0973	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7 -003-069-000	BUENSUCESO CRISTINA D	KICKAPOO DR	\$ 1,302.50	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0975	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7 -005-008-000	ABRAHAM THOMAS O & MARIAMMA	147 CHEROKEE DR	\$ 1,420.97	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0981	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S8 -001-022-000	DICELY K COURTNEY & JANICE	22 TURNBERRY LN	\$ 1,381.29	Sold to bidder #50 for \$3,500.00
25-0989	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U7 -00A-031-004	LOBITZ STANLEY	BIRCH KNOLL DR	\$ 1,206.98	No bid
25-1038	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J5 -00A-16C-000	MACIEJASZEK JOSEPH G	170 CRAGLE HILL RD	\$ 1,134.50	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository

25-1048	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J6 -00A-07B-000	OELKE ROBYN	Route 00011	\$ 1,409.44	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-1053	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-K2 -00A-062-000	BOGERT RUTH ARLENE	393 DODSON CEMETERY RD	\$ 1,319.74	Sold to bidder #357 for \$7,000.00
25-1280	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7	38-G9S1 -005-04A-000	RODRIGUEZ BIANGIE	88 THOMAS ST	\$ 1,236.82	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-1365	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 2	42-J7 -00A-15E-000	WEISS RONALD	MAIN ST	\$ 1,523.41	No bid
18-1717	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1	42-J7NE3-002-13A-000	GROHOWSKI JOHN S	LOOMIS ST	\$ 4,803.18	Removed by Court Order
25-1443	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-J7SW3 -001-014-000	WEISS RONALD	6 W MAIN ST	\$ 1,496.12	Sold to bidder #220 for \$26,000.00
25-1464	NESCOPECK TWP	44-P4 -00A-018-000	STEWERT DAWUD	BERWICK HAZLETON HWY	\$ 853.43	No bid
25-1468	NESCOPECK TWP	44-R4 -00A-005-000	CHURA WILLIAM J & JAMES	TANK RD	\$ 1,149.11	No bid
25-1528	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1	48-H8SE2 -006-020-000	GUESTO GARY & EMMA	46 PIERCE ST	\$ 1,139.44	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-1529	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1	48-H8SE2 -006-20A-000	GUESTO GARY & EMMA	46 R PIERCE ST	\$ 1,202.37	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-1533	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1	48-H8SE2 -012-013-000	JONES DEBRA L	353 PALMER ST	\$ 1,257.31	No bid
25-1536	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1	48-H8SE3 -003-023-000	NUNEZ LIRIANO JOSEL RAUL	39 WASHINGTON AVE	\$ 1,301.55	No bid
25-1560	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 5	48-H8SE4 -047-032-000	DANNERT MARK	REAR CENTER AVE	\$ 1,274.02	No bid
24-1630	PLYMOUTH TOWNSHIP	49-I7S2-012-29A-000	BEATO LUIS M	47 ALLAN ST	\$ 1,349.42	Sold to bidder #26 for \$4,500.00
25-1652	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1 -003-004-000	WILLIAMS EQUAN LAMONT	HUNLOCK ST	\$ 1,227.67	No bid
25-1660	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1A -014-008-000	ROO RIOS JUAN J	MILTON AVE	\$ 1,165.79	No bid
24-1704	PLAINS TOWNSHIP WARD 8	50-G11S4-002-10A-000	BORDECK LANA ETAL	52 KEYSTONE VILLAGE	\$ 1,297.10	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-1724	PITTSTON TWP	51-D13S2 -001-04A-000	SPANO PETER J AND LINDSAY		\$ 1,433.62	Sold to bidder #314 for \$6,000.00
25-1737	PITTSTON TWP	51-F13S1 -001-028-000	IANNEILLO ANTHONY		\$ 1,198.74	No bid
25-1754	RICE TWP	53-L8S2 -001-016-000	BOLTON JENNIFER	MARY ST	\$ 1,491.32	No bid
25-1755	RICE TWP	53-L8S2 -001-017-000	BOLTON JENNIFER	MARY ST	\$ 1,547.93	Sold to bidder #111 for \$5,000.00
25-1770	RICE TWP	53-M8S3 -001-013-000	WILK EDWARD T	3335 BLYTHEBURN RD	\$ 1,643.11	Sold to bidder #345 for \$46,000.00
25-1774	ROSS TWP	54-E3 -00A-002-000	THOMAS JOHN B ETAL	REAR STATE ROUTE 118	\$ 1,334.97	No bid
25-1806	SALEM TWP	55-O3 -T02-008-000	GOLOMB FRANCIS	8 1ST LN	\$ 1,173.88	No bid
25-1808	SALEM TWP	55-O3 -T02-076-000	BELLES STEVE	76 2ND LN	\$ 1,259.27	No bid
23-1805	SHICKSHINNY BOROUGH WARD 1	56-L4SE1-019-001-000	MOYER EVA R	SEARCH ST	\$ 2,620.68	No bid
25-1846	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-Q5S2 -002-014-000	ROTH KENNETH R	CINDY DR	\$ 1,264.46	Sold to bidder #314 for \$3,000.00
23-2018	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-006-009-000	ROLDAN GEORGIA	21 WILKES BARRE ST	\$ 3,909.45	Sold to bidder #28 for \$66,000.00
25-2064	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-H10S1 -002-11A-000	BARTOLI ALLEN K ETAL	MUNDY ST	\$ 1,998.23	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-2271	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW13-004-006-000	KONTROVICH MICHAEL & SHERYL	N LAUREL ST	\$ 1,172.77	Trump Bid placed by City of Hazleton Land Bank
25-2143	HAZLETON CITY WARD 4	71-T8SW34-018-07B-000	RODRIGUEZ FRANCISCA	S PINE ST	\$ 1,244.98	No bid
25-2777	WILKES-BARRE WARD 19	73-G10SE1-011-024-000	LARIOS CASTILLO WILSON N	1384 REAR N WASHINGTON ST	\$ 1,247.20	No bid
25-2724	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW2-008-029-000	KOPEC JOSEPH A	BROOKSIDE ST	\$ 1,457.47	No bid
24-2765	WILKES BARRE CITY WARD 16	73-H10NW2-029-023-000	STONERUN REALTY & HOLDINGS, LLC	766-770 N WASHINGTON ST	\$ 1,414.46	Sold to bidder #54 for \$10,000.00

25-2415	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW1-011-002-000	KASPER DONALD	129 SCOTT ST	\$ 2,179.54	Trump Bid placed by Lower South Valley Land Bank
25-2430	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-017-015-000	PERALTA ARELIS MEJIA ISRAEL	33 SCHOOLHOUSE LN	\$ 1,169.26	Sold to bidder #153 for \$6,500.00
25-2465	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-H10SW4-022-001-000	ORAVIC DONALD	E NORTHAMPTON ST	\$ 1,359.54	No bid
25-2538	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -027-14A-000	SKIRVEN JAMES A	REAR S RIVER ST	\$ 1,250.51	No bid
25-2545	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -033-035-000	REID JAMIE	19 ELIZABETH ST	\$ 1,247.43	Trump Bid placed by Lower South Valley Land Bank
25-2622	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-I9NE3 -023-035-000	DREVENAK JOSEPH	MURRAY ST	\$ 1,215.42	Sold to bidder #54 for \$1,215.42
17-3674	WILKES BARRE CITY WARD 14	73-I9NE4-002-005-000	MARX SHEET METAL & MECHANICAL INC	38 BRADFORD ST	\$ 1,990.04	Trump Bid placed by Lower South Valley Land Bank
24-2739	WILKES BARRE CITY WARD 15	73-I9NW2-032-011-000	WEISS YOEL	164 CARLISLE ST	\$ 1,625.71	Sold to bidder #471 for \$10,000.00
25-2794	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S1 -002-18A-000	OELKE ROBYN	SOOBY AVE	\$ 1,404.28	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository
25-2798	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S11 -001-003-000	SGARLAT CAROL	SGARLAT AVE	\$ 1,275.40	Sold to bidder #314 for \$3,000.00
25-2819	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-D7S6 -003-012-000	LAGARA JUANA	REAR CARPENTER RD	\$ 1,119.39	bidder forfeit parcel off to repository