Sale number
25-0007
25-0010
25-0031
25-0047
25-0059
25-0163
25-0164
25-0165
25-0162
25-0159
25-0167
25-0114
25-0102
25-0109
25-0105
25-0110
25-0107
25-0094
25-0101
25-0106
25-0117
25-0096
25-0115
25-0084
25-0118
25-0078
25-0095
25-0104
25-0113
25-0097
25-0076
25-0108
25-0176
25-0189
25-0190
25-0201
25-0198
25-0197
25-0219
25-0238
25-0235
25-0332
25-0325
25-0330
25-0317
25-0318
25-0319
25-0320
25-0321
25-0322
25-0323
25-0324
25-0326
25-0327
25-0329
25-0331

Municipality

ASHLEY BORO WARD 1
ASHLEY BORO WARD 1
ASHLEY BORO WARD 2
ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
AVOCA BORO WARD 1
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BUTLER TWP WARD 1
BUTLER TWP WARD 1
BUTLER TWP WARD 1
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
CONYNGHAM BORO
CONYNGHAM TWP
CONYNGHAM TWP
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO
DALLAS BORO

Parcel

01-19SE4 -001-011-000
01-19SE4 -004-010-000
01-J9NE1 -T01-040-001
01-J9NE1 -010-25A-000
02-D12SE4-022-008-000
04-N12S2 -003-005-000
04-N12S2 -003-006-000
04-N12S2 -003-007-000
04-N12S2 -003-004-000
04-K13S1 -004-009-000
04-N12S3 -004-001-000
03-U5S5 -005-163-000
03-U5S3 -001-055-000
03-U5S5 -001-225-000
03-U5S3 -001-233-000
03-U5S5 -003-060-000
03-U5S4 -001-035-000
03-U5S1 -004-005-000
03-U5S3 -001-035-000
03-U5S3 -007-002-000
03-U5S6 -003-127-000
03-U5S1 -010-001-000
03-U5S5 -006-094-000
03-U4S3 -002-004-000
03-U5S6 -003-143-000
03-S4 -00A-25A-000
03-U5S1 -008-020-000
03-U5S3 -001-175-000
03-U5S5 -005-160-000
03-U5S1A -009-008-000
03-S4 -00A-035-000
03-U5S4 -001-037-000
06-Q7 -00A-13K-000
06-R7S9 -002-009-000
06-R7S9 -002-010-000
06-Q8S9 -007-002-000
06-Q8S9 -001-012-000
06-Q8512 -005-040-000
08-S6 -00A-34A-000
09-M5S2 -009-002-000
09-M5 -00A-20B-000
11-E8NW2 -016-002-000
11-E8NW1 -006-015-000
11-E8NW1 -008-008-000
11-E8NW1 -006-007-000
11-E8NW1 -006-008-000
11-E8NW1 -006-009-000
11-E8NW1 -006-010-000
11-E8NW1 -006-011-000
11-E8NW1 -006-012-000
11-E8NW1 -006-013-000
11-E8NW1 -006-014-000
11-E8NW1 -006-016-000
11-E8NW1 -006-017-000
11-E8NW1 -008-007-000
11-E8NW1 -008-009-000

Owner

BARZILAY KFIR & GALIT

RIVAS ANITA

RICHARDS JAYDON

GAVIANES EDWIN &

REYNOLDS MICHAEL

KEMMISH GEOFFREY & FRANCES
KEMMISH GEOFFREY & FRANCES
KEMMISH GEOFFREY & FRANCES
OELKE HAILEY

TORIBO RAMON

VIDAL ESTATES LLC
ADJEI-ACQUAH MAXWELL &
AQUINO CHEERIE

DEL ROSARIO DIVINA

DUCLAYAN MARIA LIZA & FROILAN D
DULOG EUSEBIO C AND ROSARIO S
FITZPATRICK VINCENT G

GARAY MARIA E

GETUBA CARREN N

LEE DOO HUN

LI DAYONG & HUANHONG XIA
LIU CHRISTINE

NJUKI JENNIFER &

PALUMBO ALAN J & KELLY
PATHURI SRINIVAS & RAJA
REYES ALEIDA M

REYES ALEIDA M

REYES ALEIDA M

SONG XIANGLI

VARGAS MARIA ANGELES &
WALUKIEWICZ EDWARD
WILSON LAURENE A & WILLIAM J 11
STIRLING THOMAS E &

STIRLING THOMAS E & MARGARET ALISA
STIRLING THOMAS E & MARGARET ALISA
LEE CHRISTOPHER ALEXANDER &
MOLINA DURAN JENNY
SPRENGERS DAVID JACOB
LAGARA JUANA

ORNOSKI ALAN J & LORI

TANEY CARL D & JOSHUA DANIEL
CEASE CHRISTIAN ALLEN

DUDA PAUL

DUDA PAUL

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAULR

DUDA PAUL R

Property Description
119 W HARTFORD ST

N MAIN ST

40 TAMARA HILLRD
142 'S MAIN ST

706 MCALPINE ST
PROMONOTORY DR
PROMONOTORY DR
PROMONOTORY DR
AZALEA TRL

BEAR CREEK BLVD
OLD FORD RD

163 YAZOO DR
SILVERCLOUD LN
225 DAKOTA DR
SLIVERCLOUD LN
TURNBERRY LN
WALDON CT
HURON CIR
TURNBERRY LN

2 LAKE VALLEY DR
127 TURNBERRY LN
24 -A ARAPAHOE CIR
94 TONKAWA DR
11TOPST

143 YAZOO DR
CEDAR HEAD RD
IROQUOIS CIR
PAWNEE AVE
YAZOO DR
WALDEN DR

W COUNTY RD
WALDON CT

270 N OLD TURNPIKE RD
18 S GRECO DR
DORAL DR
TOMMYS CT

EDGE ROCK DR
AVALANCHE LN
BROOK HILL RD
CENTER AVE

43 PLANTATION RD
142 E FRANKLIN ST
PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW AVE
PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW ST

PINE VIEW AVE
PINE VIEW AVE

Upset Price

$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$
$

2,996.32
1,759.46
3,937.82
2,778.96
9,066.09
3,726.75
3,921.43
3,898.48
5,019.65
1,710.96
5,086.62
3,823.89
3,340.20
4,099.45
3,309.43
9,668.06
2,485.79
3,513.83
3,810.65
3,303.66
4,213.87
3,349.76
3,955.45
6,727.82
3,920.09
3,686.68
3,408.21
3,302.66
3,825.93
3,350.63
3,252.85
3,271.59
43,673.27
18,921.46
3,860.06
2,914.30
2,008.00
1,789.00
14,374.69
1,874.77
3,760.72
14,658.50
1,158.46
850.41
1,189.69
1,158.46
1,158.46
1,158.46
1,158.46
1,158.46
1,200.07
1,158.46
1,180.07
1,158.46
850.41
690.74

Results

No bid

No bid

Property removed

No bid

Sold to bidder #427 for $31,000.00
Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $11,500.00
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #278 for $10,500.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $320,000.00
Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #80 for $11,000.00
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #24 for the minimum
Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Sold to bidder #80 for $37,000.00
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid
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25-0328
25-0311
25-0252
25-0253
25-0263
25-0265
25-0267
25-0268
25-0270
25-0293
25-0275
25-0313
25-0250
25-0276
25-0288
25-0356
25-0345
25-0346
25-0334
25-0370
25-0382
25-0383
25-0485
25-0484
25-0490
25-0492
25-0434
25-0424
25-0422
25-0455
25-0463
25-0466
25-0451
25-0511
25-0533
25-0643
25-0615
25-0617
25-0606
25-0632
25-0596
25-0605
25-0604
25-0608
25-0649
25-0568
25-0567
25-0573
25-0572
25-0657
25-0654
25-0683
25-0674
25-0675
25-0694
25-0692
25-0698

DALLAS BORO

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

DENNISON TWP
DENNISON TWP
DENNISON TWP
DORRANCE TWP
DURYEA BORO WARD 3
DURYEA BORO WARD 4
DURYEA BORO WARD 4
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 5
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER TWP

EXETER TWP

EXETER TWP

EXETER TWP
FAIRMOUNT TWP

FORTY FORT BORO WARD 1

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FRANKLIN TWP
FREELAND BORO WARD 3
FREELAND BORO WARD 3
FREELAND BORO WARD 4
FREELAND BORO WARD 4
HANOVER TWP WARD 1
HANOVER TWP WARD 1
HANOVER TWP WARD 2
HANOVER TWP WARD 2
HANOVER TWP WARD 2
HANOVER TWP WARD 4
HANOVER TWP WARD 4
HANOVER TWP WARD 5

11-E8NW1 -007-007-000
10-E8S2 -009-016-000
10-C7 -T01-007-000
10-C7 -T01-008-000
10-C7 -T01-032-000
10-C7 -T01-036-000
10-C7 -T01-039-000
10-C7 -T01-040-000
10-C7 -T01-043-000
10-C9 -T02-172-000
10-C7S1 -006-009-000
10-E8S5 -005-015-000
10-C7 -T01-004-000
10-C7s4 -001-006-000
10-C9 -T02-119-000
13-012S2 -T01-035-002
13-N10S1 -004-018-000
13-N10S1 -004-019-000
12-M7S51 -006-001-000
14-D12NW3-012-001-000
14-D12NE4-002-17E-000
14-D12NW2-008-001-000
18-G9S2 -008-033-000
18-G9S2 -008-018-000
18-G9S2 -015-026-000
18-G9S1 -009-01B-000
16-E10S2 -007-01B-000
16-E10 -00A-015-209
16-E10 -00A-015-142
17-C10 -00A-03E-000
17-C11S3 -001-002-000
17-D10 -00A-022-000
17-B10S3 -001-004-000
19-H2 -00A-47B-000
21-G10NW4-003-024-000
23-510S2 -001-002-000
23-Q11S8 -005-019-000
23-Q11S8 -007-004-000
23-Q11S6 -008-019-000
23-R10S1 -003-014-000
23-Q11 -00A-26B-000
23-Q11S6 -008-007-000
23-Q11S6 -002-011-000
23-Q11S7 -005-007-000
24-C9 -T02-057-000
22-Q9SE4 -T01-027-000
22-Q9SE4 -T01-002-000
22-R9NE1 -012-08B-000
22-R9NE1 -012-008-000
25-1851 -009-017-000
25-18S1 -004-020-000
25-19SE3 -003-010-000
25-19SE1 -004-10A-000
25-19SE1 -006-001-000
25-I19NW2 -006-009-000
25-19NW2 -003-019-000
25-I8NE2 -007-016-000

WOODLAND SPRINGS BIRD SANCTUARY

BLOSE WILLIAM H ETAL
DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DALLAS MHP LLC

DIXON ANTHONY

ROO RIOS JUAN J

ROO RIOS JUAN J

SHULTZ DAVID

SHULTZ LILLIAN

TRIGASKIS MARION
CARDOZZA CALIZTO & TARA
MILLER WILLIAM & MARIE
MILLER WILLIAM B & ROBERT W
SHERIDAN THOS + NANCY
REYES MAGDALENA ALEIDA MOTO
ROSA DEBORAH

SALEK JOHN B UX

BRENNER MARILYN

MARCY REIKO T

STEICH ROBERT P JR

GOSS PEARLM

GALLAGHER JOSEPH J & KAREN
IANNI JOSEPH

MCGRATH SCOTT A

CONKLIN ERNEST C & CAROLE
EVANS MOLLIE

FOUNTAIN RICHARD & DONNA
KEMPER EDWARD W III &P
WALSH WILLIAM P

QUICK KELLIE

DZIAK ROBERT GEORGE
JUMPER MICHAEL

MATIAS LADISLAO & IRIS
MCCARTNEY JOHN JR & CLAIRE
POPA IOANA

RICHARD WILLIAM &

SANCHEZ DEYSIS ENCARNACION
STUBER DARLENE

THOMAS ARTHUR

KULP JOSEPH JOHN JR

DEWALL BLAKE &

DEYO LORI

FERKO RITA

FERKO RITAR

ADONIZIO PHILIP CHARLES JR
BUENANO JOHANNA
CACERERA PAULINO NILSAN R
REYES ALEIDA M

REYES ROSANA

FANINI JOSE MIGUEL RODRIGUEZ
THOMAS CHARLES J ESTATE
POLITZ JEFF

MAPLEWOOD AVE

LOWER DEMUNDS RD

7 COUNTRY PINE EST

8 COUNTRY PINE EST

32 COUNTRY PINE EST

36 COUNTY PINE TRAILER CT
39 COUNTY PINE TRAILER CT
40 COUNTY PINE TRAILER CT
43 COUNTRY PINE EST

172 VALLEY VIEW TRAILER PARK
KUNKLE ALDERSON RD
RESERVOIR RD

4 COUNTRY PINE EST

974 KUNKLE RD

119 VALLEY VIEW PARK

SUE ANN RD
SUE ANN RD
SUNSET HLS
204 MEADE ST S

631 ANN ST

143 BUNNY LN

120 CHURCH ST

191 GREEN ST
ATLANTIC AVE
ANTHRACITE AVE

332 BIRCHWOOD EST
200 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES
BOX 450 MT ZION RD
OBERDORFER RD
MAZUNAITIS-SEARFOSS
SUTTON CREEK RD

28 STONEWALL LN

87 WELLES ST
HAZLEBROOK
WOODHAVEN DR

8 HILLARY DR
WOODHAVEN DR

31 HIGHLAND DR
HILLARY DR

1268 WOODHAVEN DR
6 WHISPER DR

83 HOLIDAY DR

57 VALLEY VIEW PARK
807 SCHWABE ST

2 CHERONE TRAILER CT
WALNUT ST

947 WALNUT ST

530 CHESTNUT ST

156 PARK ST

ADJ JOHNSON ST
SPRING ST

694 HAZLE ST

3 LUZERNE ST

206 DIVISION ST

528 FELLOWS AVE

LIRS T Y N T S T SR T Y ¥ S Y ¥ Y Y S R ¥ A Y NV A ¥ S T A S ¥ Y Y RV Y Y S ¥ Y Y R T AV Y SV S SV RV N RV SV Y RV RV SV RV SRV SV LV SRV LV Y

1,611.46
1,674.22
842.89
992.12
1,152.05
1,279.91
970.82
1,535.72
832.26
820.27
2,164.55
2,399.05
969.46
10,333.02
662.69
1,668.70
2,498.94
2,355.71
2,071.32
3,723.47
2,692.03
12,657.12
8,057.91
6,485.87
6,452.36
1,437.88
3,264.51
2,120.08
2,345.29
3,639.71
2,075.51
4,662.42
2,515.97
4,047.80
15,170.80
2,217.00
1,245.48
1,245.48
1,158.29
19,034.81
614.32
10,612.75
4,122.89
1,245.48
814.20
1,407.39
724.14
1,860.11
3,497.77
2,949.63
1,920.40
2,230.84
1,153.64
37,206.57
8,954.03
8,593.44
12,088.22

Sold to bidder #33 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #158 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #370 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #276 for $48,000.00
Sold to bidder #136 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #245 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #229 for $76,000.00
Sold to bidder #155 for $55,000.00
Sold to bidder #6 for $38,000.00

Sold to bidder #54 for $26,000.00

No bid

Sold to bidder #187 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #279 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #158 for $82,000.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #478 for $29,000.00
Sold to bidder #169 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #478 for $46,000.00

No bid

Sold to bidder #370 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Property has been condemned - No bid
No bid

No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #229 for $35,000.00
Property has been condemned - Sold to bidder #256 for $13,000.00
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25-0714
25-0717
25-0743
25-2806
25-2804
25-2819
25-2800
25-2794
25-2798
25-2799
25-0757
25-0755
25-0772
25-0785
25-0894
25-0975
25-0910
25-0891
25-0885
25-0834
25-0860
25-0959
25-0909
25-0943
25-0877
25-0917
25-0920
25-0809
25-0878
25-0925
25-0875
25-0913
25-0982
25-0929
25-0973
25-0923
25-0960
25-0790
25-0818
25-0808
25-0856
25-0880
25-0933
25-1001
25-0981
25-0950
25-0869
25-0951
25-0956
25-0921
25-0945
25-0855
25-0908
25-0901
25-0845
25-0907
25-0892

HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 7
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HARVEYS LAKE BORO
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

25-J851 -001-004-000
25-J851 -002-14B-000
25-19NWS3 -016-01A-000
74-C6S6 -004-018-000
74-C6S6 -001-002-000
74-D7S6 -003-012-000
74-C6S4 -004-15D-000
74-C6S1 -002-18A-000
74-C6S11 -001-003-000
74-C6511 -001-025-000
26-S7 -T02-159-000
26-S7 -T02-018-000
26-58S5 -001-007-000
26-5857 -003-034-000
26-U5514 -001-091-000
26-U5S7 -005-008-000
26-U5515 -001-072-000
26-U5514 -001-061-000
26-U5513 -001-364-000
26-T5S2 -001-272-000
26-U5510 -001-134-000
26-U5S5 -006-003-000
26-U5514 -001-478-000
26-U554 -003-001-000
26-U5513 -001-189-000
26-U5515 -001-344-000
26-U5515 -001-402-000
26-T551 -001-479-000
26-U5513 -001-258-000
26-U5515 -001-554-000
26-U5513 -001-128-000
26-U5515 -001-152-000
26-U5S8 -001-026-000
26-U5S2 -004-019-000
26-U5S7 -003-069-000
26-U5515 -001-452-000
26-U5S5 -009-020-000
26-57510 -T04-008-000
26-T552 -001-033-000
26-T551 -001-470-000
26-U5510 -001-042-000
26-U5513 -001-276-000
26-U5S2 -007-004-000
26-V7S3 -T01-002-000
26-U5S8 -001-022-000
26-U554 -010-005-000
26-U5512 -001-074-000
26-U554 -010-027-000
26-U5S5 -002-063-000
26-U5515 -001-407-000
26-U554 -004-018-000
26-U5510 -001-025-000
26-U5514 -001-469-000
26-U5514 -001-213-000
26-T7SE1-013-018-000
26-U5514 -001-366-000
26-U5514 -001-067-000

BENNETSKI MARY EST

SORBER HARRY

CHRIST UNITED PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH
ABDUKADYROV AHMATIJAN &
KINNEY EVAN & THERESA

LAGARA JUANA

LITCHAUER JEAN

OELKE ROBYN

SGARLAT CAROL

SGARLAT CAROL

CASTELLANO DENISE M

MANZUETA MARIE

NEEW INVESTMENT & PROPERTIES LLC
VANDERHOOF CLARENCE & RUTH
ABRAHAM MARY JOY C

ABRAHAM THOMAS O

ADECER EDWINA A

ALCANTARA ZENAIDA CATALAN
ALVAREZ LAWRENCE & ETHEL
ALVAREZ MA LORICEN

AMANCIO WILFREDO

BAGUNO MAGNALIA

BALINA MARIA TERESA A

BAMBICO EFREN M & EMELDA L
BANDAYREL ROMULO T & MIRASOL B
BARKATAKI SANGJUCTA & DEVARSHI
BARRILLI VINCENT WM & DANIELLE MARI
BASAVA SANKARAIAH S &

BAYONA EMMANUEL H & WINDY G
BEARD JAMES E

BLANCO LANI

BODNARCHUK JOHN DAVID AND
BRAHJA JAMES

BRONSTEIN MOLLY K & DAVID J
BUENSUCESO CRISTINA D

CHARLES DENNIS G

CONNOR WILLIAM M & SHEILA BRENNAN
COSTA KAREN ANN

CRISOL GEORGE

CRUZ JOSE A

CRUZ JOSE A

CRUZ WILMER E AND ELSA M

DELAS ALAS ELMER & MARICEL
DENICOLA MAURICE

DICELY K COURTNEY & JANICE
DILIGENCIA ELIZA PHOLLA

DIOLATA ARIEL G &

DOROTAN VINCENT & MIA

DULTRA MARINA & FERDINAND
DUVALL RONALD E AND MARIE J
ELEUTERI KAREN

ELIASSON KEVIN T & MAUREEN M
ESGUERRA CHARLIE & LIBERTY
EUSEBIO ULLOA ARACELIS & LUIS
FRANKLIN CHERIE

FRAYNA SANDRA G & WONG WING
FRILLYA GRACENIA F

44 LEOPOLD ST
MIDDLE RD

1523 LAKESIDE DR
REAR SPRUCE ST
REAR CARPENTER RD
BAIRD ST

SOOBY AVE
SGARLAT AVE
SGARLAT AVE

147 HOLLY LYNN DR
78 W MAIN ST

240 EVERVALE RD
HUCKLEBERRY LN
147 CHEROKEE DR
SWEET BIRCH LN
WHITE OAK LANE
LOT 364 THE VISTAS

ELDERBERRY LN
SHINNECOCK HILLS LN
WHITE OAK LN
CROOKED STICK LN
SWEET BIRCH LN
HONEYSUCKLE DRIVE

HUCKLEBERRY & HONEYSUC

ROCK CREST DRIVE
BUTTERNUT LN
BLUE SPRUCE DRIVE
N SYCAMORE LN
BUTTONBUSH LN
26 TURNBERRY LN
45 J JANHANNA CIR
KICKAPOO DR
HONEYSUCKLE DR
TURNBERRY LN

8 VALMONT PARK

ROCK CREST DRIVE
MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR
BUTTERNUT LANE
SEMINOLE CIR

1204 FOUR SEASONS CT
22 TURNBERRY LN
MERION DR
BUTTONBUSH LN

GLEN EAGLES DR
ROYAL ABERDEEN DR
HONEYSUCKLE DR
CROOKED STICK LN
MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR
WHITE OAK LN
TAMARILLO CIRCLE
735 WINTERS AVE
WHITE OAK LANE
WHITE OAK LN

5,684.10
4,556.25
1,251.38
10,273.63
4,134.07
1,497.62
11,337.59
1,678.90
4,024.16
25,213.15
2,287.93
3,192.57
6,547.83
5,896.53
3,781.35
3,740.05
3,587.94
3,525.71
4,089.46
3,259.06
4,046.00
3,827.37
3,741.79
3,432.24
3,416.53
4,000.51
4,509.57
4,337.20
4,076.73
4,124.82
4,490.37
3,370.68
5,115.61
3,961.30
4,124.82
4,781.33
3,624.65
1,157.20
2,681.70
8,943.91
7,972.46
3,884.32
3,718.76
2,332.30
5,115.61
4,144.82
3,834.21
3,567.67
2,263.39
4,625.73
3,355.31
4,144.82
4,798.13
3,828.70
13,862.58
4,317.20
4,115.20

Property has been condemned - Sold to bidder #80 for $6,500.00
Sold to bidder #345 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #459 for $77,000.00
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #130 for $61,000.00
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #130 for $54,000.00
No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid

Sold to bidder #398 for $23,000.00
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #232 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #46 for $78,000.00
No bid

No bid
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25-0916
25-0852
25-0941
25-0872
25-0873
25-0926
25-0970
25-0883
25-0899
25-0918
25-0854
25-0876
25-0884
25-0886
25-0887
25-0816
25-0889
25-0989
25-0890
25-0822
25-0814
25-0836
25-0912
25-0819
25-0826
25-0828
25-0902
25-0954
25-0825
25-0924
25-0851
25-0893
25-0966
25-0817
25-0879
25-0978
25-0896
25-0835
25-0977
25-0932
25-0799
25-0806
25-0952
25-0797
25-0861
25-0898
25-0968
25-0967
25-0974
25-0858
25-0867
25-0859
25-0868
25-0942
25-0946
25-0871
25-0936

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

26-U5S515 -001-333-000
26-T9S1 -002-011-000
26-U554 -002-005-000
26-U5512 -001-183-000
26-U5512 -001-187-000
26-U5S2 -001-007-000
26-U5S7 -002-023-000
26-U5513 -001-350-000
26-U5514 -001-185-000
26-U5515 -001-352-000
26-U5510 -001-023-000
26-U5513 -001-141-000
26-U5513 -001-360-000
26-U5513 -001-372-000
26-U5513 -001-373-000
26-T551 -001-620-000
26-U5513 -001-382-000
26-U7 -00A-031-004

26-U5514 -001-016-000
26-T5S2 -001-096-000
26-T5S1 -001-544-000
26-T5S2 -001-381-000
26-U5515 -001-120-000
26-T5S2 -001-049-000
26-T5S2 -001-166-000
26-T5S2 -001-183-000
26-U5514 -001-219-000
26-U554 -012-032-000
26-T5S2 -001-161-000
26-U5515 -001-548-000
26-T8S2 -003-003-000
26-U5514 -001-069-000
26-U5S6 -004-005-000
26-T551 -001-631-000
26-U5513 -001-266-000
26-U5S7 -009-019-000
26-U5514 -001-117-000
26-T5S2 -001-375-000
26-U5S7 -009-017-000
26-U5S2 -007-002-000
26-T5S1 -001-135-000
26-T551 -001-447-000
26-U554 -011-015-000
26-T551 -001-013-000
26-U5510 -002-228-000
26-U5514 -001-180-000
26-U5S6 -006-012-000
26-U5S6 -004-021-000
26-U5S7 -004-002-000
26-U5510 -001-068-000
26-U5S11 -001-043-000
26-U5510-001-119-000
26-U5512 -001-035-000
26-U554 -002-035-000
26-U554 -004-023-000
26-U5512 -001-137-000
26-U5S2 -008-016-000

GALLEGOS IRMA TRISHA

GIROSKY MICHELE

GISMA EULOGIO G

GONZALES NIDA G

GUANZON GERARD Y

HAKKI SHEREEN

HASHEM MOHAMED

HASSANZOY AHMAD NABI

IKIARA SOSPETER KARANI

JIMENEZ CESAR &

JIMENEZ CLARIVEL MARIA &

JOSE MA RUTH ROSALYN

LEBO IRWIN P & LAURETTE A

LEDDY THOMAS

LEDDY THOMAS

LIU SHAOLIN

LIWANAG GENEVIEVE

LOBITZ STANLEY

LOREN KEVIN MARSHAL &
MALUENDA ANTHONY

MARAMAG MARTHA L &

MARTINEZ CASIANO Z & MARY LOREDEL
MATHEW TOM &

MICHEL JOHNNY AND

MIGUEL WENDY AGUILAR
MONASTERIO MARELLA & GINA
NABUA RODOLFO R & CRISPINA F
NARANJO SARMIENTO ROBINSON
NAVARRA GLEN

NERI NATALIE B

NEW WAY PROPERTY MANAGEMENT LLC
ODUOR BEATRICE A

OLIVER MARSHA JULIENE

OSEBE PARTICK O &

PAGULAYAN ALANLANE B & JANET M
PALANCA MARGARET A

PARAS EFREN CJR

PLATON ANDREA JESUSA

PWANI DAN OLUKO

QIAN JIPENG & DANPING FANG

QUE ZHONGYI

RAYMUNDO BELARMINO MA CRISTINA &
RESPONTE MARITES AVISADO

REYES ALEIDA M

REYES ALEIDA M

REYES KATHERINE GRACE C &
RODULFA ANTONIO MAHINAY
ROMERO REY GENEROSO V & JOCELYN
ROSENSHINE ROBERT & SUSAN

ROSS HAROLD CHARLES JR

ROYALTY DECK INC

SALAZAR AMADOR

SALES CHRISTOPHER M AND FLOCY Y
SALONGA MARIA LEA C

SAMPER MARDIGRAS R & QUEEN ANNE C
SANCHEZ RAYMOND

SANCHEZ RAYMOND

BLUE SPRUCE DR

536 STOCKTON MOUNTAIN RD
135 PINE VALLEY LN
SPICE BUSH DR

SPICE BUSH DR
JANHANNA CIR
QUAPAW DR

LOT 350 THE VISTAS
HICKORY LN
HONEYSUCKLE DR
MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR
SYCAMORE LN

LOT 360 THE VISTAS
LOT 372 THE VISTAS
LOT 373 THE VISTAS
APPALACHIAN WAY
LOT 382 THE VISTAS
BIRCH KNOLL DR
WHITE OAK LN

LINE MTN RD

SWEET BIRCH DRIVE

TAMARILLO CIR
SOUTHERN HILLS CT

SWEET BIRCH DR
Route 00924
WHITE OAK LN
SPYGLASS DR
APPALACHIAN WAY
BUTTERNUT LN

218 CHIPPEWA DR
HUCKLEBERRY LN

214 CHIPPEWA DR
TUSCARORA DR
GREEN MT DR
NARROWLEAF DR
MERION DR
MOUNTAIN VIEW DR
LAUREL VALLEY RD
HICKORY LN

POPPY HILLS RD
CYPRESS POINT RD
127 KICKAPOO DR
WILD PLUM WAY
PEBBLE BEACH DR
ELDERBERRY LN
SPICE BUSH DR

125 GLEN EAGLES DR
CROOKED STICK LN
BUTTONBUSH LN

E TUSCARORA DR

LIRS T Y N T S T SR T Y ¥ S Y ¥ Y Y S R ¥ A Y NV A ¥ S T A S ¥ Y Y RV Y Y S ¥ Y Y R T AV Y SV S SV RV N RV SV Y RV RV SV RV SRV SV LV SRV LV Y

2,866.20
9,915.70
4,144.01
6,250.59
2,509.56
3,067.48
3,619.29
3,741.79
4,124.82
3,307.16
4,124.82
4,011.20
4,124.82
4,942.42
4,769.97
4,269.04
3,534.75
855.14
4,115.95
3,185.48
2,047.11
3,576.51
3,932.42
3,442.65
4,028.61
3,043.39
3,295.63
4,172.95
3,529.17
3,741.79
2,367.83
4,144.82
4,691.80
4,289.04
4,124.82
3,445.69
4,192.95
3,932.42
4,411.36
2,481.50
1,817.00
4,269.04
4,164.01
7,876.97
4,144.82
4,066.00
12,041.86
5,269.49
4,048.61
7,694.26
3,903.56
5,856.96
4,144.82
3,197.84
3,355.31
8,491.83
2,624.23

No bid
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
No bid
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25-0937
25-0961
25-0862
25-0948
25-0800
25-1002
25-0983
25-0928
25-0915
25-0919
25-0820
25-0904
25-0897
25-0888
25-0922
25-2143
25-2182
25-2191
25-2225
25-2253
25-2249
25-2239
25-2271
25-2305
25-2310
25-1009
25-1010
25-1011
25-1012
25-1038
25-1048
25-1053
25-1058
25-1055
25-1113
25-1091
25-1093
25-1118
25-1133
25-1177
25-1220
25-1200
25-1221
25-1224
25-1225
25-1249
25-1263
25-1265
25-1280
25-1308
25-1315
25-1316
25-1319
25-1339
25-1340
25-1343
25-1370

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLETON CITY WARD 4
HAZLETON CITY WARD 8
HAZLETON CITY WARD 9
HAZLETON CITY WARD 11
HAZLETON CITY WARD 12
HAZLETON CITY WARD 12
HAZLETON CITY WARD 12
HAZLETON CITY WARD 13
HAZLETON CITY WARD 14
HAZLETON CITY WARD 15
HUGHESTOWN BORO
HUGHESTOWN BORO
HUGHESTOWN BORO
HUGHESTOWN BORO
HUNLOCK TWP

HUNLOCK TWP
HUNTINGTON TWP
HUNTINGTON TWP
HUNTINGTON TWP
JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

KINGSTON BORO WARD 1
KINGSTON BORO WARD 2
KINGSTON BORO WARD 6
KINGSTON TWP
KINGSTON TWP
KINGSTON TWP
KINGSTON TWP
KINGSTON TWP
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7
LEHMAN TWP

LEHMAN TWP

LEHMAN TWP

LEHMAN TWP

LUZERNE BORO WARD 2
LUZERNE BORO WARD 2
LUZERNE BORO WARD 3
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 2

26-U5S2 -009-001-000
26-U5S5 -010-020-000
26-U5510 -002-232-000
26-U554 -006-027-000
26-T5S1 -001-148-000
26-V7S3 -T01-008-000
26-U5S8 -003-018-000
26-U5S2 -004-018-000
26-U5515 -001-296-000
26-U5515 -001-356-000
26-T5S2 -001-066-000
26-U5514 -001-289-000
26-U5514 -001-121-000
26-U5513 -001-380-000
26-U5515 -001-432-000

71-T85W34-018-07B-000
71-T85W14-005-001-000
71-T8NW34-002-01D-000
71-T85W12-011-002-000
71-T8NW41-002-003-000
71-T8NW14-007-016-000

71-T7SE23-001-002-000

71-T8NW13-004-006-000
71-T8NW33-018-008-000
71-U8NW34-004-003-000
28-E12NW1-002-002-000
28-E12NW1-002-003-000
28-E12NW1-002-004-000
28-E12NW1-002-005-000

29-]5 -00A-16C-000
29-J6 -00A-07B-000
30-K2 -00A-062-000
30-K3 -00A-53A-000
30-K2 -00A-41J-000
33-F11S5 -T03-016-000
33-F11 -T01-017-000
33-F11 -T01-139-000

34-G9SE1 -013-001-000
34-G9SE4 -019-020-000
34-HI9NE1 -014-003-000
35-F10 -00A-02A-000
35-E8S7 -004-04A-000
35-F8S5 -001-001-000
35-F9S4 -005-007-000
35-F9S4 -005-05A-000
38-H8S1 -005-022-000
38-H8S5 -003-002-000
38-H8S5 -003-023-000
38-G9S1 -005-04A-000

40-F7

-00A-22B-000

40-G5 -T02-015-000

40-G5

-T02-026-000

40-G5 -T02-052-000

41-G9NE1 -009-009-000
41-G9NE1 -009-010-000
41-G9NE1 -003-006-000
42-J7SW2 -002-020-000

SANCHEZ RAYMOND

SANGUEZA ALEXANDER & VIVIAN
SANTANA EVELIN

SERVIN MIGUEL ALVAREZ

SOLIS RACHELLE AB
TAYLORKEITH A

TINAZA EVANGELINER &

TIU DOREEN

VAZQUEZ BERRIOS CRYSTAL
VAZQUEZ ELIZABETH

VILLAREAL ANTHONY G

VINES SHELIA LATONYA

VO JONATHAN

WANG RICK S & BETHEL R QUEROL WANG
WANGWE SYLVIA AND SOLOME MUKOYA
RODRIGUEZ FRANCISCA
REIMILLER NANCY & PAISLEY JUDITH
ALCANTARA DEYSI

COLETTA MICHAEL & BARBARA
PEREZ JULIO C

PRINGLE D'ANGELO

SPOHR BERNICE H

KONTROVICH MICHAEL & SHERYL
READSOTO INVESTMENT

ROGA HOMES LLC

GRANTEED SAMUEL MATTHEW
GRANTEED SAMUEL MATTHEW
GRANTEED SAMUEL MATTHEW
GRANTEED SAMUEL MATTHEW
MACIEJASZEK JOSEPH G

OELKE ROBYN

BOGERT RUTH ARLENE

DERBY DWAYNE E & JOANNA
HAKANSON ISABEL C

BURGOS KELVIN

PAYNE MARIE

REID JOSEPH

ANDROSKY FRANK A & ELEANOR M
YURKASITIS LORIE

NORRIS DAVID & KARLA
KENZAKOWSKI JOSEPH

KOHLER BARBARA L

MORGAN RICHARD

OLIVERI ANTHONY JR & DEBRA
OLIVERI ANTHONY JR & DEBRA
PFEIFER FAITHAN M

DUDA BETHANNE

DUDA BETHANNE

RODRIGUEZ BIANGIE

EVANS MARCY R

LAMOREUX ROBIN

MASI JERRY

PYETT LEONARD THOMAS CAMPANA
ROSENKO PAULJ

ROSENKO PAULJ

POPE MICHAEL & ALBINA
GRABINSKI DEBRA

CALUMET DR

ROYAL ABERDEEN DR

LAUREL VALLEY RD
GREENBRIAR LN

BUCK MTN BLVD

1216 FOUR SEASONS TRAILER CT
222 CORNSILK AVE

JANHANNA CIR

CRANBERRY LN

HONEYSUCKLE DR

CAMELLIA LN
SYCAMORE LN

LOT 380 THE VISTAS

S HONEYSUCKLE DR

S PINE ST

450 W GREEN ST

30 REAR W SEVENTH ST
535 PENN CT

826 N JAMES ST

821 N JAMES ST

940 W FIRST ST

N LAUREL ST

221 CRNR SEYBERT ST
412 KIEFER AVE

241 PARSONAGE ST
247 PARSONAGE ST
DRUMMOND ST

251 PARSONAGE ST
170 CRAGLE HILL RD
Route 00011

393 DODSON CEMETERY RD
692

301 TOWN HILLRD

16 QUIET COVE PARK
17 HEATHER HIGHLANDS
139 HEATHER HIGHLANDS MHPK
271 PRINGLE ST

310 WYOMING AVE
18 BOWMAN ST
KINGSTON TWP. LINE
211 N MAIN ST

125 LEHIGH ST

105 CARVERTON RD
CARVERTON RD

48 MORGAN ST

301 OAK ST

OAK ST

88 THOMAS ST
JACKSON RD

23 COUNTRY CREST LN
50 COUNTRY CREST LN
102 THIRD LN

490 VAUGHN ST
VAUGHN ST

116 HUGHES ST

230 W MAIN ST

LIRS T Y N T S T SR T Y ¥ S Y ¥ Y Y S R ¥ A Y NV A ¥ S T A S ¥ Y Y RV Y Y S ¥ Y Y R T AV Y SV S SV RV N RV SV Y RV RV SV RV SRV SV LV SRV LV Y

2,739.66
2,885.74
3,979.07
3,403.39
4,192.17
1,115.25
3,298.58
3,980.51
4,096.73
3,643.82
3,711.17
3,980.51
4,461.47
4,529.57
5,076.66
6,158.81
11,777.26
2,001.25
11,996.06
10,088.27
9,244.01
5,578.42
2,164.23
27,092.96
11,612.71
3,181.24
20,279.65
2,032.52
3,502.85
3,651.67
1,979.19
8,129.09
8,432.79
8,579.96
991.64
4,087.52
4,522.89
11,239.38
10,944.20
13,690.67
11,783.96
8,178.48
2,690.99
24,097.32
1,712.44
9,758.02
9,451.53
944.07
10,318.64
11,618.31
1,309.88
1,620.30
728.70
3,421.38
12,099.94
8,378.21
11,933.89

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #232 for $2,500.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $73,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for $3,000.00

Property removed - bankruptcy filed

Sold to bidder #46 for $42,000.00

Sold to bidder #46 for $112,000.00

Sold to bidder #4 for $66,000.00

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #46 for $124,000.00

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $17,500.00

Sold to #80 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #188 for $1,500.00

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #124 for $63,000.00

Property has been condemned - Sold to bidder #80- for $24,000.00
Sold to bidder #229 for $81,000.00

Sold to bidder #17 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #276 for $35,000.00

No bid

Sold to bidder #6 for $53,000.00

Sold to bidder #6 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #321 for $31,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for $68,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum

No bid

Sold to bidder #33 for $40,000.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #493 for $36,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for $47,000.00
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25-1365
25-1381
25-1384
25-1386
25-1388
25-1409
25-1407
25-1408
25-1443
25-1451
25-1468
25-1464
25-1475
25-1489
25-1473
25-1509
25-1520
25-1514
25-2323
25-2327
25-2328
25-2332
25-2345
25-2344
25-2356
25-2357
25-2379
25-1737
25-1720
25-1723
25-1724
25-1738
25-1679
25-1678
25-1677
25-1710
25-1706
25-1713
25-1528
25-1529
25-1533
25-1534
25-1536
25-1539
25-1555
25-1560
25-1564
25-1592
25-1609
25-1606
25-1661
25-1622
25-1628
25-1637
25-1636
25-1660
25-1659

NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12
NESCOPECK TWP
NESCOPECK TWP
NEWPORT TWP WARD 1
NEWPORT TWP WARD 1
NEWPORT TWP WARD 1
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
PITTSTON CITY WARD 2
PITTSTON CITY WARD 3
PITTSTON CITY WARD 3
PITTSTON CITY WARD 4

5

5

6

I AENESIENFNIN

PITTSTON CITY WARD
PITTSTON CITY WARD
PITTSTON CITY WARD
PITTSTON CITY WARD 6
PITTSTON CITY WARD 11
PITTSTON TWP
PITTSTON TWP
PITTSTON TWP
PITTSTON TWP
PITTSTON TWP

PLAINS TWP WARD 2
PLAINS TWP WARD 2
PLAINS TWP WARD 2
PLAINS TWP WARD 10
PLAINS TWP WARD 10
PLAINS TWP WARD 10
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 5
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP

42-)7 -00A-15E-000
42-J7NW2 -009-021-000
42-J7NW2 -011-002-000
42-J7NW2 -012-010-000
42-J7NW2 -012-09B-000
42-K751 -015-007-000
42-K7S1 -012-028-000
42-K751 -013-008-000
42-J7SW3 -001-014-000
42-)7SE4 -012-01B-000
44-R4  -00A-005-000
44-P4  -00A-018-000
46-K6S3 -003-018-000
46-K7S3 -004-003-000
46-K6  -00A-009-000
46-K6S2 -001-025-000
46-K6S2 -008-26A-000
46-K6S2 -005-011-000
72-D11SE4-002-004-000
72-D11SE3-012-017-000
72-D11SE3-012-018-000
72-E11NE2-021-026-000
72-E11NE3-019-029-000
72-E11NE3-019-028-000
72-E11NE3-029-015-000
72-E11NE3-029-016-000
72-E11SE1-018-012-000
51-F1351 -001-028-000
51-D13S1 -001-010-006
51-D13S1 -T06-004-000
51-D13S2 -001-04A-000
51-G13 -00A-01A-000
50-G10SW2-006-004-000
50-G10SW2-002-020-000
50-G10SE1-010-010-000
50-G11 -T02-403-000
50-G10 -00A-016-000
50-G11S1-001-17C-000
48-H8SE2 -006-020-000
48-H8SE2 -006-20A-000
48-H8SE2 -012-013-000
48-H8SE2 -012-13A-000
48-H8SE3 -003-023-000
48-H8SE3 -006-04A-000
48-H8SE4 -024-01A-000
48-H8SE4 -047-032-000
48-H8SW3 -010-032-000
48-H8SE4 -037-015-000
48-H8SW3 -018-002-000
48-H85W3 -005-018-000
49-1852 -002-026-000
49-H6 -00A-056-000
49-H8SE1 -002-001-000
49-1753 -02A-003-000
49-17S3 -002-001-000
49-1851A -014-008-000
49-18S1A -006-001-001

WEISS RONALD

PINA CARLA

SNYDER RONALD G

WAHL JOAN

WAHL JOAN

221 PINE LLC

ARTIS LINDA

NOVAKOWSKI MARY EST

WEISS RONALD

SNYDER RICHARD S & JOHANNA N
CHURA WILLIAM J & JAMES
STEWERT DAWUD

EDWARDS WILLIAM
IANNANTUONI BARBARA E
PODESZWA IRENE

GRAPEFRUIT LEGENDS OF GUAM INC
MILLER ALFRED R & EDNA L
ROSENGRANT GIANA

STEFANKO JOHN J & PATRICIA ANN
BIEBLE KATHY & LEONARD

BIEBLE KATHY M & LEONARD F JR
GRABOSKY THOMAS

GALLI FREDERICK CHARLES JR
GALLI HELEN S.

KELLY MICHAEL J JR

KELLY MICHAEL J JR

CASTRO ROAMOS CARLA M & SANTOS JOEL
IANNEILLO ANTHONY

MANGIONE BRENDA ANNE
MORALES ERIC

SPANO PETER J AND LINDSAY
THOMPSON WALTER CHAS
CASTRO DENNY

OBOVYLE JAMES J

PRETZMAN DUANE &

BALOGA DON & JOAN
KENZAKOSKI JOSEPH

LEWIS GENE WILSON

GUESTO GARY & EMMA

GUESTO GARY & EMMA

JONES DEBRA L

JONES DEBRA L

NUNEZ LIRIANO JOSEL RAUL
OGIN REBECCA ANN

REESE ELAINE M & EDMUND D
DANNERT MARK

ROCHE JOHN & ELAINE

UNITED REAL ESTATE ACQUISITIONS LLC
LOVENDUSKI CHESTER & MARY JANE
NOVAK HENRIETTA (ESTATE)
EHRENZELLER MORGAN &

FOOSE EDITH & WM

GALLAGHER DANIEL

KOLLARICK DONNA

REILLY SHAWN R

ROO RIOS JUAN

SANTOS GISSEL

MAIN ST

158 GARFIELD ST
264 RIVER ST

95 GARFIELD ST
GARFIELD ST
221 PINE ST

134 ESPY ST

131 ESPY ST

6 W MAIN ST
1045 LINCOLN AVE
TANK RD
BERWICK HAZLETON HWY
1219 CENTER ST
74 LAUREL ST
STERNS ST

31 ARCH ST
ENGLE ST
SPRING ST

584 N MAIN ST
421 N MAIN ST
N MAIN ST

24 WOOD ST
180 MILL ST

182 MILL ST

102 BUTLER ST
43 SAND ST

85 PLANK ST

6 GLEN ROCK MHPK
18 JIMMY LN

SUSCON RD

311 MAFFETT ST

31 LAUREL ST

9 CHARLES ST

403 E MOUNTAIN RIDGE MHP
BALD MOUNTAIN RD
1105 CHARLES ST

46 PIERCE ST

46 R PIERCE ST

353 PALMER ST

351 PALMER ST

39 WASHINGTON AVE
337 PALMER ST

134 ENO ST

REAR CENTER AVE
344 FAIRVIEW ST

94 HIGH ST

251 ORCHARD ST
NOTTINGHAM ST

6 SMITH ROW

293 MIZDAIL RD

300 COOL ST

155 HARVEY ST

175 VALLEY VIEW AVE
MILTON AVE
MORGAN AVE
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3,419.02
6,997.79
8,153.38
6,632.93
1,672.06
14,869.85
38,593.47
7,248.18
2,750.14
19,416.67
3,782.77
3,401.67
1,080.54
5,133.10
1,649.72
6,564.19
3,353.72
2,530.51
11,091.19
49,816.70
6,921.28
21,877.48
14,441.60
11,380.45
12,361.84
2,556.67
10,349.82
1,123.34
1,206.93
944.87
5,627.42
8,893.42
17,005.36
5,226.14
9,043.46
927.19
1,999.98
10,375.01
3,854.54
1,884.53
2,789.41
2,812.85
3,272.68
11,061.40
8,005.10
897.37
4,496.76
4,959.66
11,397.36
1,071.31
6,084.10
7,498.17
5,337.14
8,149.60
5,680.60
1,639.23
1,512.82

No bid

Sold to bidder #140 for #30,000.00
Sold to bidder #226 for $33,000.00
Sold to bidder #193 for $23,000.00
Sold to bidder #193 for the minimum
Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Sold to bidder #37 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #80 for $53,000.00

No bid

Sold to bidder #258 for $67,000.00
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #239 for $2,500.00
Sold to bidder #80 for $30,000.00
Sold to bidder #411 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #193 for $28,000.00
Sold to bidder #184 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #401 for $30,000.00
No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #229 for $63,000.00
Sold to bidder #256 for $21,000.00
Sold to bidder #256 for $26,000.00
Sold to bidder #80 for $61,000.00
Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #356 for $58,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #31 for the minimum
No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #58 for $74,000.00
Sold to bidder #269 for $27,000.00
Sold to bidder #443 for $60,000.00
Sold to bidder #102 for the minimum
No bid

Sold to bidder #360 for $70,000.00
Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Sold to bidder #77 for $4,000.00
Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Sold to bidder #193 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #80 for $24,000.00

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $47,000.00
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #193 for $27,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #300 for the minimum
Sold to bidder #80 for $11,000.00
Sold to bidder #300 for $10,000.00
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #269 for $16,000.00
No bid

Sold to bidder #439 for the minimum
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25-1652
25-1754
25-1755
25-1756
25-1767
25-1770
25-1783
25-1784
25-1789
25-1786
25-1782
25-1774
25-1808
25-1816
25-1806
25-1820
25-1811
25-1830
25-1910
25-1904
25-1905
25-1863
25-1846
25-1880
25-1899
25-1897
25-1933
25-1925
25-1935
25-1975
25-1995
25-2029
25-2053
25-2062
25-2064
25-2422
25-2415
25-2430
25-2427
25-2448
25-2447
25-2465
25-2479
25-2475
25-2541
25-2515
25-2516
25-2545
25-2538
25-2569
25-2570
25-2599
25-2598
25-2558
25-2622
25-2627
25-2654

PLYMOUTH TWP
RICE TWP
RICE TWP
RICE TWP
RICE TWP
RICE TWP
ROSS TWP
ROSS TWP
ROSS TWP
ROSS TWP
ROSS TWP
ROSS TWP
SALEM TWP
SALEM TWP
SALEM TWP
SALEM TWP
SALEM TWP

SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1

SUGAR NOTCH BORO
SUGAR NOTCH BORO
SUGAR NOTCH BORO
SUGARLOAF TWP
SUGARLOAF TWP
SWOYERSVILLE WARD 1
SWOYERSVILLE WARD 3
SWOYERSVILLE WARD 3
UNION TWP

UNION TWP

WARRIOR RUN BORO

WEST HAZLETON WARD 3

WEST PITTSTON WARD 1
WEST WYOMING BORO

WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1
WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 2

WILKES-BARRE TWP

WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

0D WWNNNN

0o

49-1851 -003-004-000
53-1852 -001-016-000
53-1852 -001-017-000
53-1852 -001-018-000
53-M8 -T01-080-000
53-M8S3 -001-013-000
54-G4 -00A-72A-000
54-G4 -00A-91A-000
54-H4S1 -009-016-000
54-G4S4 -003-001-000
54-G4 -00A-42F-000
54-E3 -00A-002-000
55-03 -T02-076-000
55-P3NW4 -004-01A-000
55-03 -T02-008-000
55-P4 -00A-017-000
55-03 -T02-261-000
56-L4SE1 -004-005-000
60-J9SW1 -004-01A-000
60-J8SE3 -001-006-000
60-J8SE3 -001-05A-000
58-56512 -004-13E-000
58-Q5S2 -002-014-000
59-F10NW3-011-07A-000
59-F9SE4 -001-008-000
59-F9SE3 -001-007-000
61-K4S1 -013-015-000
61-J351 -004-005-000
62-J8SE4 -003-015-000
63-T7SE2 -015-028-000
65-D11SE4-015-004-000
66-E10SE1-015-023-000
68-P12NW1-021-001-000
68-P12NW4-006-001-000
69-H10S1 -002-11A-000
73-H10SW2-009-004-000
73-H10SW1-011-002-000
73-H10SW2-017-015-000
73-H10SW2-012-009-000
73-H10SW4-007-027-000
73-H10SW4-006-036-000
73-H10SW4-022-001-000
73-H9SE3 -031-007-000
73-H9SE2 -009-005-000
73-H9SE4 -032-025-000
73-H9SE4 -018-008-000
73-H9SE4 -018-010-000
73-H9SE4 -033-035-000
73-HI9SE4 -027-14A-000
73-19NE1 -036-001-000
73-19NE1 -036-029-000
73-19NE3 -024-019-000
73-19NE3 -024-016-000
73-19NE1 -011-007-000
73-19NE3 -023-035-000
73-19NE4 -002-031-000
73-19NE4 -030-042-000

WILLIAMS EQUAN LAMONT
BOLTON JENNIFER

BOLTON JENNIFER

HARDIMAN JOHN & JENNIFER
JONES THOMAS L & DENISE ANN
WILK EDWARD T

HAUZE DAVEY W

HAUZE DAVEY W

ROAN IMMACULATE C

SPENCER RONALD & BARBARA
STURCHIO LAWRENCE & FAWN
THOMAS JOHN B ETAL

BELLES STEVE

DELEON WILFRED

GOLOMB FRANCIS

INTEGRITY SOLUTIONS REALTY LLC
LUTZ JAMES A

TITUS JENNIE M

FRITZ EDWARD JR

RICHARDS MARK

RICHARDS MARK

MATULEVICH JOSEPH & ELIZABETH
ROTH KENNETHR

FOUNTAIN RICHARD F & DONNA
BOYER NATHAN LEE

TATTERSALL MICHAEL T

AVCI MEHMET NURI

STOUT ANTHONY W

HUSTI LUCA MIHAI VASILE
ZATORSKY GEORGE S & CAROL ANN
SALAVANTIS STEPHEN H

GIANNINI THOMAS L & BETSY C
CUNNINGHAM JOSHUA
UNI-MARTS INC

BARTOLI ALLEN K ETAL

JAMES FREDDIE JR &

KASPER DONALD

PERALTA ARELIS MEJIA ISRAEL
PEREZ CEREZO PILAR

365 MUIR LLC

TOLUBA PATRICIA & FRED

ORAVIC DONALD

DOMESTIC VIOLENCE SERVICE CTR INC
OUJDA LLC

JONES NICOLE E

MOWICH VINELAND INC

MOWICH VINELAND INC

REID JAMIE

SKIRVEN JAMES A

ASOCIACION PARA EL DESARROLLO
ASOCIACION PARA EL DESARROLLO
CABRERA CASTILLO STEVEN M
CABRERA STEVEN

CAMACHO CRYSTAL

DREVENAK JOSEPH

GATTUSO JOANN

P&G REAL ESTATE ASSOCIATES LLC

HUNLOCK ST

MARY ST

MARY ST

196 MARY ST

80 VALLEY STREAM
3335 BLYTHEBURN RD
GRAY RD

GRASSY POND RD
SYLVAN LAKE RD

5 BROADWAY RD

91 PEAT MOSS RD
REAR STATE ROUTE 118
76 2ND LN
JOHNSON AVE
81STLN

95 RIVER RD

61 SECOND LN

24 SEARCH ST
BROAD HEAD AVE
900 REAR MAIN ST
900 REAR MAIN ST
ARDDENNES LN
CINDY DR

228 REAR HUGHES ST
157 DIAMOND ST
412 MAIN ST

195 ROUTE 239 HWY
CHEROKEE DR

525 FRONT ST

241 RIDGE AVE

706 EXETER AVE

945 SHOEMAKER ST
312 BUFFALO ST

651 CHURCH ST
MUNDY ST

17 PENN ST

129 SCOTT ST

33 SCHOOLHOUSE LN
171 SCOTT ST

120 CUSTER ST

94 N MEADE ST

E NORTHAMPTON ST
S MAIN ST

92 S MAIN ST

475 S FRANKLIN ST
NEW ELIZABETH ST
201 CAREY AVE

19 ELIZABETH ST
REAR S RIVER ST

178 1/2 HIGH ST
HIGH ST

HUBER ST

21 HUBER ST

113 PROSPECT ST
MURRAY ST

46 BRADFORD ST
143 BRADFORD ST

881.80
2,454.69
3,603.22
4,255.40
1,892.70

14,863.02
1,047.67
1,330.57
1,616.78
8,483.44
7,681.32
1,251.17
1,825.47
5,006.04

893.59

13,916.30

780.43
2,370.27
9,109.47

12,954.11

969.55
4,755.95
3,679.81
4,069.57
7,959.72
6,382.37
6,248.49
4,806.02

13,570.65
9,219.89
15,015.00
17,661.14
10,212.27
1,193.52
19,894.30
8,048.92
29,699.47
2,068.47
2,729.84
2,343.89
7,249.08
2,660.35
5,839.64
8,215.89
33,058.25
6,907.42
22,158.09
3,256.45
2,931.62
18,165.58
1,577.86
750.31
18,855.02
13,827.69
7,386.23
7,281.85
6,112.95

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #485 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #485 for the minimum

No bid

Removed per Court Order

Sold to bidder #80 for $17,500.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid

No bid

Property has been condemned - No bid

Sold to bidder #269 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #269 for the minimum

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #286 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #478 for $23,000.00

Sold to bidder #389 for $53,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #80 for $53,000.00

Sold to bidder #257 for the minimum

No bid

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

No bid

No bid

Sold to bidder #2 for the minimum

Sold to bidder #229 for $91,000.00

No bid

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #80 for $104,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for $12,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for $100,000.00

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

No bid

Sold to bidder #80 for $40,000.00

Sold to bidder #80 for the minimum

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #194 for $88,000.00

No bid

Property removed - taxes have been paid in full
Sold to bidder #204 for $51,000.00
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25-2680
25-2681
25-2704
25-2712
25-2709
25-2737
25-2750
25-2727
25-2724
25-2777
25-2783

WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 19
WILKES-BARRE WARD 19

73-I9NE1 -001-021-000
73-19NE1 -001-022-000
73-19NW2 -018-24A-000
73-19NW2 -030-024-000
73-19NW2 -024-002-000
73-H10NW3-019-007-000
73-H10NW4-020-34A-000
73-H10NW2-020-014-000
73-H10NW2-008-029-000
73-G10SE1-011-024-000
73-G10SE4-003-17A-000

JONES NICOLE E

JONES NICOLE E

LANGAN EDWARD & ANN
NAUGLE GEORGE

NJ VASQUEZ INVESTOR LLC
ACOSTA MARIO FERNANDO
CRUZ CHERIE L

DREIER JOSEPH ANTHONY
KOPEC JOSEPH A

LARIOS CASTILLO WILSON N
SMOOTH DREAMS LLC

121 HANOVER ST

123 HANOVER ST

131 WALLER ST

58 REGENT ST

536 CAREY AVE

247 WYOMING AVE

65 BUTLER ST

806 N WASHINGTON ST
BROOKSIDE ST

1384 REAR N WASHINGTON ST
ST CLAIR ST

13,753.77
9,056.14
9,515.73
7,399.36

13,920.63
3,437.50

12,812.62
3,120.47
2,858.74
2,067.52
3,510.01

Sold to bidder #202 for $49,000.00
Sold to bidder #360 for $51,000.00
Sold to bidder #280 for $50,000.00
Sold to bidder #28 for $42,000.00
Sold to bidder #262 for $93,000.00
Sold to bidder #297 for $66,000.00
Sold to bidder #27 for $38,000.00
No bid

No bid

Bidder forfeit - off to judicial

Sold to bidder #187 for the minimum
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