|Sa|e number | Municipality Parcel Owner Property Description Starting Bid
24-0057 AVOCA BORO WARD 3 02-D12NE4-001-003-000 KIBUI LOUIE YORK AVE $1,176.26 | Trump bid placed by Northeast Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority
24-0058 AVOCA BORO WARD 3 02-D12NE4-001-004-000 KIBUI LOUIE YORK AVE $1,176.26 | Trump bid placed by Northeast Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority
24-0091 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S3 -001-194-000 BACKUS FREDERICK D & MARGARET M MANAYUNK AVE $830.24 | Property is removed - taxes paid in full
24-0096 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S6 -002-171-000 BASILY SAMUEL & AMANY 171 YAZOO DR $1,372.47 |Sold to bidder #85 for $1,372.47
24-0088 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S3 -001-066-000 CHUNG TERRY W B & HELEN H A SILVERCLOUD LN $1,295.44 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,295.44
24-0089 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S3 -001-114-000 FULMER LARRY W & VICKIE J CORNSILK AVE $1,194.92 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,194.92
24-0097 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S6 -002-183-000 GULAY CAROLE WOITYLA 183 DAKOTA DR $1,317.23 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,317.23
24-0086 BLACK CREEK TWP 03-US5S1A -009-007-000 VARGAS REYNALDO JR & BRANDON WALDEN DR $1,319.90 | Property is removed - taxes paid in full
23-0087 BEAR CREEK TWP 04-H12-00A-05N-000 KD LAND LLC & STEPHEN A CHILCOTE BALD MOUNTAIN RD $4,617.84 | Sold to bidder #253 for $5,500.00
23-0129 BUCK TWP 05-K1451-002-010-000 WHITEMEN PAUL MARGRUM LN $2,103.20 | No bid - off to repository
24-0138 BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-Q7 -00A-032-000 BREEZY ACRES REAL ESTATE DEV CO ROTOWANIS RD $1,290.86 |Sold to bidder #13 for $1,290.86
24-0175 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q9S2 -003-003-000 CHIN HERMAN & NGON MEE SHINGLE MILL DR $1,260.37 | No bid - off to repository
240171 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8512 -005-012-000 COLON JAIME JR SNOW VALLEY DR $1,272.75 | No bid - off to repository
24-0178 BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-R954 -001-003-000 KUTCHI STEPHEN J & ANN M TERRACE RD $1,262.83 | No bid - off to repository
24-0217 DALLAS TWP 10-C7S3 -009-006-000 COVERN JENELLE WARREN AVE $1,157.12 |Sold to bidder #141 for $1,157.12
24-0249 DALLAS TWP 10-E851 -015-016-000 LINSINBIGLER MARK FERN ST $1,346.98 | No bid - off to repository
24-0215 DALLAS TWP 10-C7S3 -002-003-000 MARTIN MARITA ZIM WARREN AVE $1,317.00 | No bid - off to repository
24-0248 DALLAS TWP 10-E851 -003-008-000 MCGOUGH PATRICK J JR + AUDREY 1 ADJ SUMMIT ST $1,173.90 | Bidder forfeit - off to repository
24-0209 DALLAS TWP 10-C7S2 -005-014-000 ONUFER JOSEPHINE KUNKLE ANDERSON RD $1,215.41 | No bid - off to repository
24-0242 DALLAS TWP 10-D8 -T03-054-000 STEIDINGER MARTHA 13 DALLAS MHP $1,164.61 | No bid - off to repository
24-0208 DALLAS TWP 10-C7 -T01-048-000 WILLIAMS JOHN 48 COUNTRY PINE EST $1,243.76 | No bid - off to repository
24-0240 DALLAS TWP 10-D8 -T03-044-000 WYNN CHARLES WALTER JR 73 DALLAS PARK $1,224.40 |No bid - off to repository
24-0259 DORRANCE TWP 12-M751 -006-006-000 GROZIA ROZELLA BLUE RIDGE RD $1,221.70 |No bid - off to repository
24-0303 DURYEA BORO WARD 2 14-D12NW2-014-031-000 | FENIMORE BETTY JEAN 221 PETTEBONE ST $1,328.44 | Trump bid placed by Northeast Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority
24-0387 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -T01-230-000 BAKER PETIT GEORGIA 230 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,317.23 |Sold to bidder #93 for $1,317.23
24-0390 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10S2 -007-01C-000 GALLAGHER JOSEPH J & KAREN ANTHRACITE STREET $1,245.53 | Trump bid placed by Northeast Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority
24-0407 EXETER TWP 17-B10S3 -001-003-000 KEMPER EDWARD W Il & SUTTON CREEK RD $1,245.71 |Sold to bidder #369 for $1,245.71

Department of Environmental Protection sent notice of hazardous substances on premises. - No bid, off

24-0551 FOSTER TWP 23-Q10 -00A-21D-000 26 STONESTAND LLC CAWLEY RD $1,505.50 | to repository.
24-0562 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1154 -007-01C-000 AG-MAR ESTATES INC 23-572-4A-2-D2 $1,390.75 | No bid - off to repository
24-0565 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1156 -006-027-000 BRENNAN JOHN P 1281 WOODHAVEN DR $1,208.79 | No bid - off to repository
24-0578 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1158 -012-007-000 NIGRO RICHARD & PEGGY LEE RD $1,250.02 | No bid - off to repository
24-0555 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S2 -002-015-000 REYNOLD DONALD DEER CROSS RD $1,208.79 | No bid - off to repository
24-0569 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S7 -008-013-000 RHUDE CARL E & GWYNNETH DEHAVEN HOLIDAY DR $1,239.02 | No bid - off to repository
24-0575 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1158 -010-001-000 SOKOL PAUL W & JO ANN C PRESCOTT RD $1,272.79 | No bid - off to repository
24-0576 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1158 -010-006-000 TEJEDA JOSE FRANCISCO PEREZ PRESCOTT RD $1,226.79 | No bid - off to repository
24-0593 FOSTER TWP 23-R10S1 -003-026-000 WHEELER ALBERT & LINDA ADJ 18 BACK STREET ST $977.24 |Sold to bidder #441 for $4,500.00
24-0594 FOSTER TWP 23-R10S1 -003-027-000 WHEELER ALBERT & LINDA BACK STREET ST $961.73 |Sold to bidder #225 for $961.73
24-0619 HANOVER TWP WARD 1 25-1851 -004-018-000 POLANCO PEDRO PARK ST $1,158.04 | No bid - off to repository
24-0727 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-57 -00A-028-000 ALL-PRO AIRPORT ROAD LP 26-1-1316-9 $599.53 |Sold to bidder #136 for $2,000.00
24-0731 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-57 -T02-152-000 HEMANDEZ JOSE PAD 152 $1,298.01 | No bid - off to repository
24-0763 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-U5S2 -006-006-000 NAVARRA ARLEEN V LAKE VALLEY DR $1,758.45 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,758.45
24-0907 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-572-000 ATKINSON GRETCHEN & SABRIAN & BRIAN BLUE SPRUCE DRIVE $1,377.20 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,377.20
24-0844 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -007-348-000 BAILEY PHILIP D & LINDA A LAUREL VLY $1,409.68 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0897 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-170-000 BRANCO EUGENIO AND ROSA BUTTONBUSH LN $1,399.51 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,399.51
24-0787 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-582-000 BRILLANTES GAILYN & SHERWIN CATAWISSA LN $1,356.43 | Property is removed - taxes paid in full
24-0842 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -003-268-000 CAJULIS RAYMOND S & CORAZON B LAUREL VALLEY DR $1,810.98 |Sold to bidder #379 for $5,000.00
24-0770 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-033-000 CALAGUIO CHERYLLJ APPALACHIAN WAY $1,435.27 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,435.27
24-0867 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-080-000 CAPARAZ JIJI & ARMANDO SAVIO HICKORY LN $1,424.77 |Sold to bidder #379 for $6,000.00
24-0918 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S3 -008-001-000 CHEN HU LAKE VALLEY DR $1,275.69 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0789 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-653-000 COHEN PHILLIP E AND LINDA A RED MOUNTAIN DR $1,574.80 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0958 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -008-025-000 CUMMINS DANIEL J TURNBERRY LN $1,313.79 |Sold to bidder #379 for $5,500.00
24-0901 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-329-000 DAVID VIVENCIO R AND LOURDES O BLUE SPRUCE DRIVE $1,284.57 |Sold to bidder #379 for $5,500.00
24-0941 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -003-080-000 DAYAO MARGRET J KICKAPOO DR $1,162.95 |Sold to bidder #379 for $5,000.00
24-0959 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S9 -001-019-000 FARISCAL EDGARDO B AND YOLANDA D TURNBERRY LN $1,434.00 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,434.00
24-0868 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-123-000 FARISCAL YOLANDA D SYCAMORE LN $1,382.52 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0874 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-370-000 FARISCAL YOLANDA D LOT 370 THE VISTAS $1,324.55 |Sold to bidder #85 for $5,500.00
24-0854 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5511 -001-006-000 GABRIEL AHAB E PEBBLE BEACH DR $1,308.91 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0862 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5512 -001-141-000 GUANZON GERARD BUTTONBUSH LN $1,531.67 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0921 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U554 -005-017-000 HOGAN JAMES C & DONNA GLEN EAGLE DR $1,324.60 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0865 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-061-000 IMSON GLENDALE M AND GLORIA M SASSAFRAS LN $1,380.24 | Sold to bidder #379 for $5,000.00
24-0786 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-558-000 JIANG HONGXIN AND FENG YAPING MOUNTAIN VIEW DR $1,890.71 |Sold to bidder #379 for $6,000.00
24-0945 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -006-011-000 KILAYKO RAFAEL JR & APRIL & 168 CHINOOK DR $1,486.93 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,486.93
24-0976 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-V753 -T01-011-000 KRAUS MAUREEN 1319 FOUR SEASONS TRAILER CT $1,305.86 |Sold to bidder #40 for $1,305.86
24-0772 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-092-000 LAPPAY LEILA A APPALACHIAN WAY $1,225.39 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0790 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-662-000 LI LANPING AND MOUNTAIN VIEW DR $1,485.11 |Sold to bidder #379 for $7,000.00
24-0866 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-076-000 LIM RONALDO ANDY HICKORY LANE $645.48 | Property is removed - taxes paid in full
24-0955 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -004-017-000 LIU YANGJIAN MANAYUNK AVE $1,279.27 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0780 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-363-000 MCELWEE JOHN & DONNA NARROWLEAF $1,762.89 |Sold to bidder #379 for $6,000.00
24-0953 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -003-031-000 MERCADO CHRISTOPHER G MANAYUNK AVE $1,368.02 | Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0935 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S6 -006-010-000 NATIVIDAD VICENTE P POPPY HILLS RD $1,203.73 | Sold to bidder #262 for $5,000.00




24-0925 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S5 -006-013-000 ORGO OSWALD PINE VALLEY LN $1,342.16 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0856 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5512 -001-024-000 PUERIE FERNANDO & ELDERBERRY LN $1,368.39 | Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0852 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -014-447-000 RITIKA PROPERTIES LLC LAUREL VLY $1,250.44 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-0822 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T8NW2 -006-013-000  |RODAS EULALIA MORRISON CIRCLE $1,162.58 |Sold to bidder #136 for $1,162.58
24-0837 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -002-199-000 SALADAGA LUCRECIA LAUREL VALLEY RD $1,393.41 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,393.41
24-0841 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -002-241-000 SARITA ALEJANDRO HIRALDO LAUREL VALLEY RD $1,726.73 |Sold to bidder #136 for $4,000.00
24-0917 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S3 -006-015-000 SHINSATO IVANETTE G MUSKEGON CIR $1,283.68 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,283.68
24-0949 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -010-016-000 SIOCO SERAFIN R & ELENITA M 235 CROW ST $1,286.01 |Sold to bidder #212 for $4,000.00
24-0931 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S5 -011-010-000 SMART EQUITY PARTNERS LLC LOT 408 EH TURNBERRY LN $1,249.63 |Sold to bidder #379 for $1,249.63
24-0950 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -002-012-000 SMART EQUITY PARTNERS LLC 256 TURNBERRY LN $1,290.19 |Sold to bidder #212 for $5,000.00
24-0843 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -006-294-000 SPRAUVE LIDIA LAUREL VALLEY DR $1,297.08 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0892 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-037-000 STAUBACH CAROL A SWEET BIRCH DR $1,387.55 |Sold to bidder #85 for $1,387.55
24-0777 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-228-000 SUAZO EMMANUEL B & ANELYN C BUCK MOUNTAIN BLVD $463.50 |Sold to bidder #379 for $2,500.00
24-0802 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S2 -001-246-000 SY CESAR B & LETICIA C AND 26-C-27-1-D1-R2-D919 $1,839.84 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0788 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-650-000 TANG JASON J GREEN MOUNTAIN DR $1,351.03 |Sold to bidder #379 for $5,500.00
24-0835 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -001-136-000 TORIBIO RAMON ELDERBERRY LN $1,325.68 |Sold to bidder #379 for $3,500.00
24-0833 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510-001-122-000 TRINIDAD ALBERTO A AND ELIZABETH O ELDERBERRY LN $1,865.08 |Sold to bidder #379 for $6,000.00
24-0803 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S2 -001-291-000 VAN GILST ERIK & BROOKE 26-C-27-1-D1-R2-D634-1 $1,356.19 |Sold to bidder #379 for $4,500.00
24-1008 HUNLOCK TWP 29-H5 -00A-30G-000 TATTERSALL STEVEN R & NICOLE C VALLEY VIEW DR $1,344.75 | Sold to bidder #77 for $4,500.00
24-1031 HUNTINGTON TWP 30-K2 -00A-14A-000 PEREZ DANTE ALIGHIERI 420 SHICKSHINNY LAKE RD $1,264.26 | Bidder forfeit - off to repository
24-1190 LAFLIN BORO 36-F11S8 -06A-16B-000 SEBIA ROBERT & MARGARET REAR CHESTNUTWOOD DR $1,304.76 |Sold to bidder #454 for $2,000.00
24-1198 LAKE TWP 37-D6 -00A-022-000 PUCHALSKY DAVID E & LEHMAN OUTLET RD $2,740.56 |Removed per assessment

24-1211 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1 38-H851 -008-019-000 DOLIVA JANE E 619 W STATE ST $3,529.95 |Sold to bidder #223 for $65,000.00
24-129 LEHMAN TWP 40-G5 -T02-005-000 KITTLE WILLIAM 9 COUNTRY CREST LN $1,241.65 |Sold to bidder #136 for $1,241.65
24-1312 LEHMAN TWP 40-G6S2 -002-05A-000 KOVALESKI BENJAMIN J Il NORSTEDT ST $1,587.75 | No bid - off to repository

23-1323 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8 42-K751-013-16A-000 GORKA ANN F ESPY ST $2,141.06 |Sold to bidder #124 for $2,141.06
24-1494 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S2 -001-033-000 OZEHOWSKI ANNA & MARY A 42 ARCH ST $1,232.61 | No bid - off to repository

24-1518 NUANGOLA BORO 47-1851 -008-011-000 BURMAN RICHARD L JR GAY AVE $935.79 |Sold to bidder #245 for $935.79
24-1553 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6 48-H8SE4 -016-008-000 VENTURA DE MENA SANTA 300 POWELL ST $1,161.52 |Sold to bidder #211 for $1,161.52
24-1581 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9 48-H8SE1 -007-012-000 BEVAN EUGENIA 41 REAR HILLSIDE AVE $1,612.28 | No bid - off to repository

24-1582 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9 48-H8SE1 -007-014-000 BEVAN EUGENIA 283 CAMERON ST $1,587.48 |Sold to bidder #311 for $1,587.48
24-1585 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11 48-H8SE1 -001-001-000 SANTIAGO NANCY ANNETTE & GILBERT 319 GARDENER $1,311.08 |Sold to bidder #320 for $35,000.00
24-1644 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1851 -003-002-000 GOVERN JANELLE HUNLOCK ST $1,146.63 | No bid - off to repository

24-1652 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1851A -001-005-000 KOZLOWICHN B PAUL AVE $1,185.80 | No bid - off to repository

24-1658 PLAINS TWP WARD 1 50-F10S1 -001-018-000 EYET IRWIN HARRIET ST $1,250.85 | Trump bid placed by Northeast Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority
23-1660 PLAINS TWP WARD 8 50-G1154-002-006-000 FRANCIS LENORE F RIDGEWOOD RD $2,815.79 | No bid - off to repository

23-1661 PLAINS TWP WARD 8 50-G1154-03A-12A-000 FRANCIS LENORE F R RIDGEWOOD RD $2,706.29 | No bid - off to repository

24-1790 ROSS TWP 54-F4S1 -008-035-000 COBLEIGH GREG M OLIVER RD $1,171.70 |Sold to bidder #253 for $4,500.00
24-1842 SALEM TWP 55-P4 -00A-022-000 CRISPELL JAMES L RIVER RD $1,366.18 |Sold to bidder #163 for $1,366.18
24-1839 SALEM TWP 55-P3SW1 -006-031-000 HOWARD RANDAL A 432 E FRONT ST $1,316.45 | Sold to bidder #215 for $4,000.00
24-1814 SALEM TWP 55-M351 -002-013-000 SZAKONYI JOSEPH & VALERIE HICKORY LN $1,232.04 |Sold to bidder #85 for $3,500.00
24-1851 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 56-L4NE4 -001-011-000 ANTES ROSETTA 129 CHESTNUT ST $1,402.25 |Sold to bidder #102 for $1,402.25
24-1850 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 56-L4NE4 -001-010-000 EYERLEY CLAYTON 125 CHESTNUT ST $1,402.25 |Sold to bidder #102 for $3,500.00
24-1852 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 56-L4NE4 -001-013-000 VOGELBACHER RONALD & JANE 145 CHESTNUT ST $1,792.32 |Sold to bidder #102 for $33,000.00
23-1805 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 56-L4SE1-019-001-000 MOYER COMMODORE ESTATE SEARCH ST $1,734.44 | No bid - off to repository

24-1860 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 4 56-L4SE4 -001-007-000 GLECO LANCE JON 47 GRANT ST $1,196.95 |Sold to bidder #212 for $1,196.95
24-1921 SWOVYERSVILLE WARD 2 59-F9SE2 -009-009-000 FOSTER EDWARD DOUGLAS IV BARBER ST $1,420.45 | Property is removed per Court Order
24-1921 SWOVYERSVILLE WARD 2 59-F10SW1-020-008-000  |HADDICK CHARLES 26 SIDNEY ST $4,057.48 | Property is removed per Court Order
24-2086 WILKES-BARRE TWP 69-H10S5 -001-019-000 RB WILKES BARRE LLC MUNDY ST $1,589.58 |Sold to bidder #245 for $1,589.58
24-2287 HAZLETON CITY WARD 14 71-T8NE14-006-04A-000 RODAS EULALIA MONGES ST $1,193.69 |Sold to bidder #215 for $2,000.00
24-2475 WILKES-BARRE WARD 8 73-HISE3 -004-009-000 D&D REALTY GROUP SCRANTON LLC 49 E NORTHAMPTON ST $1,791.83 | Property is removed per Court Order
24-2508 WILKES-BARRE WARD 10 73-HISE4 -008-053-000 KAPUSTENSKY REALTY LLC 121 ACADEMY ST $1,414.40 | Property is removed - taxes paid in full
24-2580 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -021-012-000 CONCEPCION LISSETTE C VENTURA LEHIGH ST $1,440.27 | Trump bid placed by Lower South Valley Land Bank
24-2559 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1 -025-19A-000 WEISS YOEL 57 SHIBER LN $1,365.54 | Trump bid placed by Lower South Valley Land Bank
24-2795 WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 73-H10SW1-006-045-000 | KELLMAN MAKILA 232 N PENNA AVE $2,893.06 | Property is removed per Court Order
24-2832 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S1 -001-010-000 EBBECKE FREDERICK KITCHEN AVE $1,181.63 |Sold to bidder #311 for $1,181.63
24-2833 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C651 -001-011-000 EBBECKE FREDERICK KITCHEN AVE $1,161.63 |Sold to bidder #311 for $3,000.00
24-2842 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S6 -010-005-000 MCLAUGHLIN CHRISTOPHER J MAPLE ST $1,197.67 |Sold to bidder #290 for $1,197.67
24-2847 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6S2 -011-026-000 RIZZI JOSEPH ETAL BEECH ST $1,395.20 |Sold to bidder #454 for $3,500.00
24-2843 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C657 -T01-008-000 WORK REVECCA 420 SMITH ST $1,267.75 | Bidder forfeit - off to repository




