LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM SALES
TAX CLAIM BUREAU
TAX SALES NOTICE

TO ALL OWNERS* OF PROPERTY DESCRIBED IN THIS NOTICE AND ALL PERSONS HAVING
LIENS, TAX JUDGMENTS OR MUNICIPAL CLAIMS AGAINST SUCH PROPERTIES:

NOTICE is hereby given by NORTHEAST REVENUE SERVICE, LLC, as agent for the Luzerne County Tax
Claim Bureau, in and for the COUNTY OF LUZERNE under Sections 601-609 inclusive of the Real Estate Tax
Law of 1947, as amended, that the Bureau will expose at public sale at the King’s College Scandlon Physical
Education Center Auxilary Gym, 14 West Jackson Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania, at 10:00 A.M., on
September 27, 2018 or any date to which the sale may be adjourned, readjourned or continued, for the purpose
of collecting unpaid 2016 and any PRIOR REAL ESTATE TAXES, PRIOR LIENS, MUNICIPAL CLAIMS, and
all costs hereto, the following described set forth. Please make reference to the Tax Parcel Number and
Property Identification Number with all correspondence.

The sale of this property may, AT THE OPTION OF THE BUREAU, be stayed if the owner thereof or any
lien creditor of the OWNER, before the date of the sale, enters into an agreement with the BUREAU to pay the
TAXES, Claims and Costs in installments in the manner provided by said Act, and the agreement to be entered
into. The Bureau is prohibited from entering into a new installment agreement to stay sale within three (3)
years of any default on an agreement to stay sale. (Section 603).

These Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.
THERE WILL BE NO REDEMPTION PERIOD AFTER THE DATE OF THE SALE.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any
property in which they may be interested. Every effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error.
However, in every case the TAX CLAIM BUREAU is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is
offered for sale by the TAX CLAIM BUREAU without any guarantee or warranty whatever, either as to
structure or lack of structure upon the land, the liens, title or any other matter or thing whatever. Northeast
Revenue, in accordance with the statute, made diligent and reasonable efforts to provide notice to the record
owner. Lien holders were not notified and all properties are being sold subject to any existing liens.

It is repeated that there is no redemption after the property is sold and all sales will be final. No
adjustments will be made after the property is struck down.

THE PROPERTY MAY BE REDEEMED from the Tax Sale by paying the delinquent taxes, fees, interest
penalties and costs prior to the day of the public auction. The payments must be cash, cashiers check, money
order or certified check. The right to redeem the property expires on September 27, 2018.

THERE IS NO RIGHT OF REDEMPTION ON THE DAY OF OR AFTER THE PUBLIC AUCTION. If no
payment has been received prior to the time of the sale, the property will be sold on September 27, 2018.

Pursuant to 68 P.S. 2117(c)(3), properties in the following municipalities may be subject to a trump bid by
North East Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority prior to public auction: Avoca Borough, Duryea Borough,
Hughestown Borough, Jenkins Township, Pittston City, West Pittston Borough.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 56860.619a, a successful bidder
shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real
estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County**, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another
individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne
County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder
shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying
municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of
another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities
within Luzerne County.



3. Prospective bidders must register prior to sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN THE DAY OF
THE SALE.

4. A successful bidder shall not tender a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing property in the
sale. If this should occur that bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and will
be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under Pennsylvania Crimes
Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A §4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

5. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders
must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and
that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

PAYMENT BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER IS DUE THE DAY OF SALE AND SHALL BE MADE
IN THE FORM OF CASH, CERTIFIED CHECK, OR MONEY ORDER. In the event that a successful
bidder does not tender payment in full for any bid by 4:00 p.m. on September 27, 2018, the bid will be nullified
and the bidder will not be permitted to bid at future tax sales conducted by the Luzerne County Tax Claim
Bureau.

Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau or on-line at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com.
Click on Upset Sale and bidder’s certification.

IMPORTANT: Right to surplus sale proceeds. If the property is not redeemed from public sale and you are
the record owner, then you are entitled to sale proceeds which exceed taxes, interest, penalties, costs,
Commonwealth Liens, Municipal Liens, Government Liens and Judgment Liens.

Interest accrues at the rate of 9% per year, at %% each month effective February 1, of each year.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age,
disability, or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

The Luzerne County Courthouse is a facility accessible to persons with disabilities. Please notify this Tax
Claim Bureau if special accommodations are required. The Tax Claim Bureau can be contacted at (570) 825-
1512 or by fax at (570) 820-6339, or by TDD (570) 825-1860.

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS AS TO WHAT YOU MUST DO PLEASE CONTACT THE TAX CLAIM
BUREAU AT (570) 825-1512.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

* “Owner,” the person in whose name the property is last registered, if registered according to law, or, if
not registered acording to law, the person whose name last appears as an owner of record on any deed
or instrument of conveyance recorded in the county office designated for recording, and in all other
cases means any person in open, peaceable and notorious possession of the property, as apparent owner
or owners thereof, or the reputed owner or owners thereof, in the neighborhood of such property.

**  The successful bidder is also certifying that they are not the owner of the property, as the owner has no right to
purchase his own property pursuant to Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law. A change of name or
business status shall not defeat the purpose of this section. For the purpose of this section, “owner” means any
individual, partner, shareholder, trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business
association or any trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association that has
any individual as part of the business association who had any ownership interest or rights in the property.



Sale # |

18-0011
18-0022

Municipality
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 1
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 1

fASHLEY BORO WARD 2
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 2

Parcel
1-19SE4 -014-007-000
1-J9NE1 -T01-116-000

1-J9NE1 -T01-185-000
1-J9NE1 -T01-063-000

MALONE KEVIN

Property Description

63 ANDREW DR

Upset Price

1,468.50

1,490.99

3,638.94

RESULTS

ASHLEY BORO WARD 2
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 2
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
ASHLEY BORO WARD 3

i 1-19SE4 -020-020-000

{01-J9NE1 -009-010-000

1-J9NE1 011 039 000
1-J9NW2 -001-010-000

MERCADANTE JOSEPH & KELLY

PESHALA HENRY

SZOSTAK RICHARD F ETAL

6 BROWN ST

68 COOK ST

1,981.16

5 374. 04

18-0083

{ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
{ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
AVOCA BORO WARD 1

{AVOCA BORO WARD 3

1-JONE4 -001-021-000

2-D12SE4-028-012-000

2-D13NW4-004-09A-000

2-D13NW4-005-005-000
2-D12NE4-001-002-000

VANDERLICK JOSEPH JOHN

POLERECKI EDWARD

FALL ST

593 YORK AVE

1,882.36

7,778.28

18-0204

BEAR CREEK TWP
{BEAR CREEK TWP
iBEAR CREEK WP

BEAR CREEK TWP

:04 N12S3 -004-019-000

4-K13S2 -002-07B-000
4-J12 -00A-019-000

-004-

BENNIE KATHLEEN A

AZALEA TRL

3,318.25

18-0194
18-0157

18-0153
18-0162

{BEAR CREEK TWP
iBEAR CREEK TWP

{BEAR CREEK TWP

4-K13S1 -007-008-000
4-H12 -00A-06A-000

4-H11l -00A-015-000
4-11152 -003-027-000

5,625.12

5.437.31

18-0166 :BEAR CREEK TWP 4-114S1 -005-01A-000 REPOSH DANIEL J WEST AVE S 1,765.38 iNO BID
18-0155 BEAR CREEK TWP i04-H11 -00A-25A-000 SMITH FRANK J + MARY 1301 PITTSTON BLVD S 6,203.06 iNO BID
18-0161 ,BEAR CREEK TWP 4-11152 -003-019-000 S 1,807.62 iNO BID

18 0146

iBLACK CREEK WP

BLACK CREEK TWP

{03-U5S3 -001-183-000

3-U5S1 -002-004-000

DELACRUZ LORENZO JR & CHERYL M

PAWNEE AVE

2,017.33

2,813.98

NO BID

18-0105

18-0136

18-0110

iBLACK CREEK TWP

iBLACK CREEK TWP
iBLACK CREEK TWP

103-T3

-00A-04B-000

-009-013-000

GREAT HORIZON INC

97 PARK ST

56,014.81

1492.83

SOLD $56,014.81 / BIDDER # 300

18-0118
18-0143

BLACK CREEK TWP
,BLACK CREEK TWP

-001-003-000
-001-063-000

NO BID

NO BID

1
18 0152 BLACK CREEK TWP -001-015-000 TEODORO TEDORO & AGNES TURNBERRY LN S 1,835.54 :iNO BID
18-0148 :BLACK CREEK TWP 03 U5S5 -005-156-000 WALKER JOHN 156 YAZOO DR S 3,765.59 iNO BID

iBUTLER TWP WARD 1

:06-R7S6 -001-010-000

5-K14S1 -003-002-000

GLODZIK ROBERT

W FOOTHILLS DR

218716

3,385.24

NO BID




18-0247

18-0231

18-0221

{BUTLER TWP WARD 1

iBUTLER TWP WARD 1
{BUTLER TWP WARD 1

{BUTLER TWP WARD 1
{BUTLER TWP WARD 1

R7512 -002-012-000

6-Q7S2 -001-03A-000

6-P8S6 -001-090-000

6-R7S3 -001-01C-000

6-P8S3 -007-002-000

HILLER KAREN L

MUMAW LISA

DEEPHOLE RD

26 MAPLE ST

S 5,241.24

3,095.62

BUTLER TWP WARD 2
iBUTLER TWP WARD 2
:CONYNGHAM BORO

CONYNGHAM TWP

i 6-Q8510 -004-021-000

{09-M454 -001-005-000

BAJRAMOSKI ILJAS & BARIA

BOYLE ERNEST & JEAN

CARDONA HENRY R

BUNYON SPRINGS CT

72 MAIN ST

$
$ 2,621.03

3 825. 75

NO BID

{CONYNGHAM TWP
{COURTDALE BORO

9-05S1 -002-028-000

HASHAGEN JOANN

425 MAIN ST

5,858.86

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

18-0326 :DALLAS TWP i 0-C7 -T01-010-001 FORESTER HEATHER 10 COUNTRY PINE ESTATE 6,553.32 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018
18-0344 DALLAS TWP $10-€857 -003-001-000 GOODLEIGH MANOR HOMEOWNERS ASSOC NATURE PRESERVE CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

{DALLAS TWP
iDALLAS TWP

DALLAS TWP

-003-005-000

R

MEADOW IEW D

$
S 12,670.87
$

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-0349

iDALLAS TWP

18-0350

18-0340
18-0339

18-0390

iDALLAS TWP

iDALLAS TWP

iDALLAS TWP

-003-010-000

-001-052-000

-007-003-000

WALLACE WILLIAM J & KRISTIN

19 E OVERBROOK AVE

REAR MANORVIEW DR

6,326.90

6,914.92

14,115.82

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-0367

18-0371

DALLAS TWP
{DALLAS TWP
iDENNISON TWP

i10-D8S2 -006-004-000

0-D8S5 -011-051-000

i13-011

WESTFIELD HENRY & ALICE

90 CLAUDE ST

14,339.76

2,458.22

18 1630611

18 0444 DENNISON TWP -00A-03K-000 PAYTON BEVERLYJ & HUGHES WM 140 TUNNEL RD NO BID
18-0409 :DORRANCE TWP i12-M7 -00A-40G-000 WYDRA ANDREW M & PATRICIA A 1638 ST MARY'S RD S 10,307.69 iNO BID

18-0469

18-0622

iDURYEA BORO WARD 3
{EDWARDSVILLE WARD 1

BALAKIER JOHN J

SIN CH

7,902.15 B

18-0632
18-0631

18 0653

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 3
,EDWARDSVILLE WARD 3

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7

-016-009-000

-014-011-000

"014-023-000

DANIELS KEIRAND

BF.{‘E)WN RENEE & ROBERT

187 HILLSIDE AVE

"2.409.86

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

18-0661

{EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7

EXETER BORO WARD 1
EXETER BORO WARD 4
:EXETER BORO WARD 4

-008-002-000

:16-E10 -00A-015-228

JORDAN MARIELLEN K

CARUTHERS SARAH ANN

342 HILLSIDE AVE

233 BIRCHWOOD EST

7,491.88

6,306.36

S 1,008.43

NO BID

NO BID




18-0564 {EXETER BORO WARD 4

18-0541 :EXETER BORO WARD 4

18-0550 {EXETER BORO WARD 4

{EXETER BORO WARD 4

{EXETER BORO WARD 4

116-E10S2 -007-01B-000

-00A-015-234

-T01-230-000

-00A-015-209

GALLAGHER JOSEPH J & KAREN

SMITH JEFFREY

ANTHRACITE AVE

332 BIRCHWOOD EST

S 2,788.54 iNO BID
S B0 INO D e
S 1,863.68 iNOBID

1799.14

1,823.42

EXETER BORO WARD 4
:EXETER BORO WARD 4
{EXETER TWP

-00A-015-006

{EXETER TWP

EXETER TWP

7-B11S2 -001-003-000

{17-C1153 -001-011-000

VASIL ROBERT

TERRY TONY R & TERRY A

VON AHRENS GRETA E

293 BIRCHWOOD EST

BARRETT ST

1,366.01

2 915. 89

fEXETER TWP

{FAIRMOUNT TWP
FAIRMOUNT TWP

{FORTY FORT BORO WARD 2

18-0708

7-B10S1 -007-009-000

1-F10SW4-009-017-000

ZELLNER MARGARET A &

SHARA ERNEST JOHN

RIVERSIDE DR

33 BEDFORD ST

1,497.24

12,948.20

18-0797 FOSTER TWP

i FOSTER TWP

iFOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

:23 Q1156 -006-036-000

3-RINE2 -008-11A-000
3-Ql1l -00A-031-000

-011-

BILANCIA BRUCE & DIMPERIO JOANN

1263 WOODHAVEN DR

17H LLAR DR

1,123.85

18-0807 :FOSTER TWP

18-0785 {FOSTER TWP

180789
18-0802

{FOSTER TWP

18-0799 iFOSTER TWP

3-Q11S8 -009-012-000
3-Q11511-003-006-000

3-Q11S2 -003-005-000
3-Q11S7 -005-013-000
3-Q11S6 -016-006-000

PHILLIPS DEBORAH HAMILTON

HILLARY DR

WOODHAVEN DR

3,821.42

1123.85

6,911.03 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

18-0800

18-0816

FOSTER TWP

i FOSTER TWP

iFOSTER TWP

18 0827 :FOSTER TWP

123-Q1156 -016-007-000

3-R10S1 -003-014-000
3-Q11S6 -006-038-000

i23-RINE2 -005- 013 000

PHILLIPS DEBORAH HAMILTON

SINNOTT KIMBERLY A

WOODHAVEN DR

309 PARK ST

HE 8,514.88

$
S 9,034.93 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

SOLD $8,514.88 / BIDDER # 317

18-0791

iFOSTER TWP

18-0735

:FREELAND BORO WARD 1

{FREELAND BORO WARD 2

18-0739

123-Q1152 -005-001-000

2-RINE2 -028-001-000
2-Q9SE3 -016-21A-000

SONNTAG BERNARD & AKIKO

HICKORY HILLS DR

1,153.85 :NOBID

4,167.10 .

18-0762 FREELAND BORO WARD 5 '22 RIONE2 -030-001-000 S 15,867.96 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018
1%_3-0761 ,FREELAND BORO WARD 5 2-R9NE2 -015-011-000 6,494.65 .. ICONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

18
18 0855 HANOVER TWP WARD 1 :25-1851 -004-002-000 COOK THOMAS 201 GROVE ST 8,660.14 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018
18-0867 :HANOVER TWP WARD 1 525-I8S3 -T01-009-001 EISENHAUER DEANN 9 SANS SOUCI TR CT S 1,035.74 :iNO BID

HANOVER TWP WARD 2

HANOVER TWP WARD 2

tHANOVER TWP WARD 2

5-19 -00A-006-000
5-19NE4 -001-001-000

:25-19SE1 -015-012-000

STUBBLEBINE HOWARD

773 HAZLE ST

712027

S 12,426.69 iNO BID




18-0891 {HANOVER TWP WARD 2

18-0897 :HANOVER TWP WARD 3

19SE4 -002-12A-000 WEBER DAVID P 43 MARCY CT S 24,740.08 iNO BID

5-JONE4 -003-02A-000 BRISLIN CHARLES 44 HIGH ST S 1,828.77 iNO BID

MORALES GABRIEL A & FREDY A 2 WOODBURY ST S 9,667.36 iNOBID

18-0906 {HANOVER TWP WARD 4 5-19NW2 -003-022-000

tHANOVER TWP WARD 5 5-18NE3 -004-002-000 9,315.08"

{HANOVER TWP WARD 5 5-1852 -009-011-000 KANE MARY 41 RUTTER ST 1,828.77 :iNO BID

$
HANOVER TWP WARD 5 i25-19NW4 -009-006-000 KRISCH PAUL 13 LEUDER ST S 9,627.89 :iCONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
tHANOVER TWP WARD 5
{HANOVER TWP WARD 5

BARROW BERNIE

i25-1852 -008-008-000 SKIRO ANTHONY & ERNESTINE 2621 S MAIN ST

HANOVER TWP WARD 6 9 467. 02 NO BID

tHANOVER TWP WARD 6

{HANOVER TWP WARD 7 5-19NW4 -007-004-000

5-19NW3 -011-010-000

5-J8S1 -002-011-000 SMITH EDWARD T 3003 S MAIN ST

6,712.97 iNOBID

5-19NW3 -017-001-000

4-C6S1 -005-010-000

18-3990 {HARVEYS LAKE BORO 4-C6S1 -005-09A-000 BARCHESKI ALBERT SECOND ST

3,284.82 :iNOBID

1,933.50 :NOBID

,HARVEYS LAKE BORO 4-D7S6 -004-028-000

{HARVEYS LAKE BORO 4-D6S12 -005-002-000

$
18-3991 :HARVEYS LAKE BORO i74-C651 -007-016-000 JONES MERWYN E KITCHEN AVE S
$

HARVEYS LAKE BO O

18-4026 :HARVEYS LAKE BORO

18-3998 {HARVEYS LAKE BORO

4-D6S4 -019-005-000

4-C654 -010-008-000

18-4001
18-4034

4-C654 -011-010-000

4-D7S10A-005-020-000

{HARVEYS LAKE BORO

18-1002 {HAZLE TWP WARD 1 6-S7 -T02-042-000 ARRIAGA CINDY 205 HOLLY LYNN DR S 2,547.45
18-1000 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 i26-57 -T02-031-000 HEINTZELMAN SAMATHA & 109 HOLLY LYNN DR S 2,157.19 iNOBID
18-0991 ,HAZLE TWP WARD 1 6-R852 -001-009-000 S

{HAZLE TWP WARD 1

6-5856 -001-019-000

18 1134 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i26-U5513 -001-262-000 ABESAMIS JOHN AUGUST RAMO & JOANNE BU'I'I'ERNUT LN ; S ) 3,548.66w NO BID

18-1204 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i26-U557 -003-012-000 ABREU FRANCISCO & QUAPAW DR 3,540.67 iNOBID

Z-l8—1149 tHAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5515 -001-124-000 1,697.54"

18-1180 {HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U554 -006-007-000

18-1109 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 {26-U5510 -006-310-000 NO BID
18-1125 ,HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5512 -001-155-000 _iNoBID

72,053.89 iNO BID

181171 {HAZLE TWP WARD 2 "007-019-000 BERMUDO WILLIAM & MAYLENE TUSCARORA DR Y
S

18-1222 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 ZG U5S9 -001-058-000 BRADOKA JOHN SCOTT & LITTNER ROBERT LITTLE LEAF CT 4,730.08 :iNO BID

HAZLE TWP WARD 2 2,554.50

18-1073 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2

18-1165 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 126-U5S52 -003-006-000 CALDERON PAZ ETAL 16 JANHANNA CIR S 1,334.53 isSOLD $1,334.53/ BIDDER # 1




18-1095

18-1117

18-1208

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2
fHAZLE TWP WARD 2
{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

126-T8NW2 -006-013-000

6-U5511 -001-039-000

6-U557 -003-064-000

6-U557 -005-015-000

CAPRIOTTI JAMES N & VERCUSKY THOMAS

MORRISON CIRCLE

s 172354
3 298873
S 322984

2,354.13

18-1140

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U5514 -001-275-000

GAO JING & GAO THOMAS

CAMELLIA LN

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i 6-U5510 -014-455-000 DEGRACE PATRICIA LAUREL VLY S 3,548.66 :NO BID
HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i26-U5513 -001-052-000 DEL MENDO LENI P & w,ﬂm&g;hw,mw,mwm ﬂim . ,,"31:9.:”,5,;03 N B
,HAZLE TWP WARD 2 SEMINOLE CIR S 3,183.87 :iNOBID
Enr T — ] ————————
T N— T IOOATAARELGE S T
HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -003-010-000 DISABELLA ANTHONY & NICOLEEN 1075 JAMES ST S 1,555.38 :NOBID
*HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -003-011-000 DISABELLA NICHOLEEN & ANTHONY P 1075 JAMES ST S 14,417.76 :iNOBID

2,932.57

18-1116

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
,HAZLE TWP WARD 2
{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i

:26 U5510 -015-435-000

6-T9S1 -002-011-000

6-U558 -006-017-000

GATBONTON ANNABEL E & ALBERTO

LAUREL VALLEY DR

G

MU KEGO CIR

2,437.64

18-1193

18-1104

181201

iHAZLE TWP WARD 2
{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U5S5 -008-021-000

6-U5510 -002-216-000

6-U556 -009-037-000

PINE VALLEY LN

3,558.52

2.637.75

18-1207 {HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U557 -003-049-000 KINGSLY KELLY MUA KICKAPOO DR S 3,841.63 iNOBID

18-1145HAZLETWPWARD2 .................... G.U5514.001.500.000 ........... LAGUT|N PETERGANDJUDYD .................................. WHlTE oAKLN ................................... $9,29061 NOB|D .............................................................................
18-1056 HAZLElmﬁg%wrmwrﬂgéﬂagﬂarmw LAO EVELYN BUCK MOUNTAIN BLVD ”im 3064, N BID
18-1174 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S3 -007-025-000 S 1,833.68 iNO BID

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-T552 -001-032-000

..3,979.04

3,996.83

18 1139 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i26-U5514 -001-269-000 LOPEZ CONRADO JR NO BID
18-1075 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i26-T552 -001-143-000 LOQUELLANO MERCY & S 2,857.14 iNOBID

18-1097

18-1054

iHAZLE TWP WARD 2
{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-T9S1 -001-002-000

6-T5S1 -001-030-000

4,267.25

181135 HAZLE,IM&BP"{“MMMLEETHEﬂE;?P},mQQMW NOBID e ererrreeeeereeesreeseessese e sese s
18-1130 iHAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5513 -001-218-000 347691 iNOBID

2 -

181160 26-U5515 -001-379 ) 3

18-1081 {HAZLE TWP WARD 2 126-T552 -001-314-000 MORENO DANIEL BALTAZAR AND $ 3,213.87 iNOBID

181091 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 126-T7SE1 -004-017-000 MUNOZ MELVIN $ 444334 inoeiD

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

tHAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U554 -012-034-000

6-U5515 -001-149-000

126-U5515 -001-565-000

PASION JOSE J &

HONEY LOCUST LANE

2,637.92

3,359.27

NO BID




18-1078
18-1084
18-1173

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

-001-241-000

-007-024-000

-001-633-000

6-U5512 -001-099-000

PELIGRIN ARLENE T & RAUL

RAZA SHEIKH TAHIR & RUBINA TAHIR

BUTTONBUSH LN

2 e 70037
3 302257
S 193686

312934

2,606.31

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

,HAZLE TWP WARD 2
iHAZLE TWP WARD 2

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

i 6-U5S8 -004-014-000

i26-V752 -002-001-000

RECTO BELLA & RENE

REGINOJULIE ANN

RODRIGUEZ MCARTHUR & EMMA B

SADOSKI GLADYS

MANAYUNK AVE

453 BEAVER BROOK RD

2,953.89

6 408. 97

18-1120

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U5515 -001-378-000

6-S859 -010-009-000

6-T5S1 -001-615-000

6-U5510 -011-470-000

6-U5512 -001-122-000

SANCHEZ TEDDY & MINDA

SHRESTHA SANJAY K AND RASHMI

HONEYSUCKLE DR

BUTTONBUSH LN

1,609.47

3,676.18

18-1121

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

,HAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

HAZLE TWP WARD 2 i

:26 U5512 -001-123-000

6-T5S1 -001-590-000

6-U552 -003-013-000

-339-

SHRESTHA SANJAY K AND RASHMI

BUTTONBUSH LN

3,574.44

18-1096
18-1123

181202

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-T9S1 -000-000-000

6-U5512 -001-151-000

6-U557 -001-004-000

2,977.47

1833.68

18-1127 {HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5513 -001-045-000 TULINGAN JOEL WHITE OAK LN S 3,236.52 iNOBID

18-1083HA2LETWPWARD2 .................... G.T552.001.361.000 ............ V|ADOJANET&ALYANA ........................................... SPRlNGMTNRD ................................ $2’75902 NOB|D .............................................................................
18-1209 HAZLElM&B&LW,m",EQHi?ﬂi 081-000  :VILLANUEVALINDO & AVELINA KICKAPOO DR ”im 20357 N BID
18-1068 :HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-T5S1 -001-667-000 S 3,638.19 iNOBID

18 1205

{HAZLE TWP WARD 2

HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U554 -012-006-000

i26-U557 -003-018-000

YEE DEXTER

KICKAPOO DR

2,816.04

3146.25

NO BID

18-1156

Z-l8-2912

18-2914

fHAZLE TWP WARD 2

fHAZLETON CITY WARD 2

{HAZLETON CITY WARD 2

126-U5515 -001-330-000

YUZON ERIKA ANGELI S ETAL

BLUE SPRUCE DR

2,419.29

7,462.87

REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID

NO BID

18-2971
18-2995

HAZLETON CITY WARD 7

,HAZLETON CITY WARD 8

{71-T85W13-018-05A-000

i71-T85W14-016-017-000

5431.23

SOLD $3,000 / BIDDER # 342

SOLD $5,431.23 / BIDDER # 317

1
18 3016 HAZLETON CITY WARD 9 :71-T8SW21-005-03A-000 SANTANA FRANCISCA 9 ARBUTUS ST S 6,325.39 iNOBID
18-3017 :HAZLETON CITY WARD 9 171-T85W21-008-04B-000 TARANTINO NORMAN 154 N LEE CT S 2,151.47 iNOBID

HAZLETON CITY WARD 10

HAZLETON CITY WARD 11

tHAZLETON CITY WARD 12

1-T8SW12-002-16A-000

1-T8NW44-020-009-000

171-T8SW14-001-002-000

EVANCHO WILLIAM JOSEPH

916 W FIRST ST

2,417.49

4,097.22

REMOVED - AGREEMENT




18-3056

18-3062

18-3099

{HAZLETON CITY WARD 12
fHAZLETON CITY WARD 12
{HAZLETON CITY WARD 13

tHAZLETON CITY WARD 14
{HAZLETON CITY WARD 14

71-T8NW11-006-15A-000

1-T8NW13-019-006-000

1-T8NW12-006-014-000

1-T8NW32-015-006-000

1-T8NE44-014-004-000

KUTCHMARICK YOLANDA

ANDRASKI MARGARET A

945 N LOCUST ST

615 E DIAMOND AVE

S 12,932.27

2,225.22

8,631.86

5143.00

SOLD $30, 000 / BIDDER # 317

SOLD $21,000 / BIDDER #315

HAZLETON CITY WARD 14
tHAZLETON CITY WARD 1
tHAZLETON CITY WARD 14

HAZLETON CITY WARD 14

i 1-T8NE14-006-04A-000

i71-T8NE44-011-003-000

ANDUJAR KEILLY O

GRAYNO NANCY & JOYCE

JIMENEZ LISSETTE

MONGES ST

554 HARRISON ST

$
$ 2,260.66

8 696. 65

NO BID

SOLD $8,696.65 / BIDDER # 317

18-1337

fHAZLETON CITY WARD 15

{HAZLETON CITY WARD 15

{HUNTINGTON TWP

1-USNW43-001-005-000

-00A-11F-000

BENNETT MELANIE L

ALLARD KELLY A

133 THIRWELL AVE

139 COPE RD

3,162.07

8,814.67

REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID

18-1326

HUNTINGTON TWP
{JACKSON TWP
{JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

-00A-27B-000

WATKINS WILLIAM

67 REGISTER RD

2,927.85

18-1409

18-1406

181411
18-1386

18-1414

{JENKINS TWP
{JENKINS TWP

{JENKINS TWP

iKINGSTON BORO WARD 1

3-F11S5A-003-VAR-000

3-F11S5 -01A-003-000

3-G12S1 -001-13B-000

4-G9SE1 -002-018-000

BUCHOLTZ KEVIN J

280 PRINGLE ST

8,944.26

18-1417

18-1420

18 1451

KINGSTON BORO WARD 1
,KINGSTON BORO WARD 2

IKINGSTON BORO WARD 3

KINGSTON BORO WARD 4

i34-G9SE4 -001-015-000

4-HINE1 -001-002-000

4-G9SE1 -020-021-000

i34-G9SE2 -019 007 000

PERRONE THOMAS

MEIER LAWRENCE & PATRICIA K

CORNER OF CUBA ST

52 w UNION ST

$
$ 357495
$

18 T11187.09

NO BID

18-1458

18-1489

18-1486

tKINGSTON BORO WARD 5

{KINGSTON BORO WARD 7
iKINGSTON BORO WARD 7

134-G9SE3 -004-008-000

4-HINE3 -005-013-000

4-HINE2 -025-002-000

GALLAGHER PAUL E & PATRICIA A

548 RUTTER AVE

17,720.91

2,637.97 B

NO BID

181498 K'NGSI9M£,mw,mw,i§§£§,,;22é£9&929mm" N Bl e eeeeeeeeremrrree e e
18-1531 :LAFLIN BORO 6-F11S7 -001-007-000 SOLD $17, 668.20 / BIDDER # 317

181549 iLAK 00A-059-01 3 3

18 1546 :LAKE TWP H -00A-010-047 DEPUE DOTIE & ALLEN 154 EVERGREEN ESTATES DR S 4,976.03 iNO BID

.1_2?—1557 iLAKE TWP 537-F5 -00A-38A-003 SEGEDA JOHN & SOPHIA OFF CEMETERY RD S 1,782.77__ NO BID

LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1

LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1

:LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 2

-00A-13A-000

:38-H8S3 -001-046-000

DAVISON WILLIAM B & DEBRA A

CARVER ST

S 2,439.68

NO BID




18-1570 iLARKSVILLE BORO WARD 2 -001-044-000 DAVISON WILLIAM B ETAL 433 CARVER ST S 13,209.36 iNO BID

18-1600 :LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4

MORTON DOLLIER & 208 CHESTNUT ST S 6,921.02 iNOBID

18-1596 iLARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4 -008-002-000

{LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 6 4752.96

iLARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7

-002-42A-000

DANIELS DONALD & JEFFREY 31 MURRAY ST 5,208.05 :NO BID

$
LARKSVILLE BOROWARD 7 YUDICHAK JOHN J & CATHERINE E 112 WALLER ST S 8,505.49 iNO BID
:LAUREL RUN BORO

iLEHMAN TWP

COOLBAUGH RONALD A SR

GLOVA LILLIAN & MICHAEL & JOSEPH TROJAN RD

LEHMAN TWP 8 103. 42 NO BID

iLEHMAN TWP KING WILLIAM A JR & APRIL L PEARL ST 15,388.07 iNO BID

18-1717 ENANTICOKE CITY WARD 2-J7NE3 -002-13A-000

GROHOWSKI JOHN S LOOMIS ST

1,013.60 :NO BID

1
18-1720 :NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1 i42-J7NE4 -018-015-000

,NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4 2-J7NW2 -011-006-000

iNANTICOKE CITY WARD

YOUELLS MELVIN D & LISA A

$
374 E MAIN ST $ 7,604.18 iNO BID
$

18-1782 :NANTICOKE CITY WARD 2-K7S1 -016-005-000

18-1767 INANTICOKE CITY WARD 2-K751 -009-01A-000

18-1803
18-1804

2-J7SE2 -006-009-000

2-J7SE2 -015-007-000

INANTICOKE CITY WARD 9

18-1789 :NANTICOKE CITY WARD 9 2-)7SE1 -009-011-000 TORRES HECTOR F & PATRICIA 377 E WASHINGTON ST S 9,368.67
18-1808 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 142-)7SE1 -027-31A-000 BURGER MAE C CRNR S HANOVER ST S 23,823.65 :iNO BID
18-1806 ,NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 142-J7SE1 -027-017-000 S

iNANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 2-)7SE1 -027-018-000

18 1825 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 142-J7SW2 -007- 012 000 BELNOSKI JOHN R ETAL 143 W CHURCH ST ; S 5,964.51w NO BID

18-1826 :NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 142-J7SW2 -008-013-000 CP MANAGEMENT LLC 163 W NOBLE ST S 9,121.98 :iSOLD $9,121.98 / BIDDER # 322

8,082.98

Z-l8—1834 :NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 2-)7SW2 -012-32A-000

18-1852 iNANTICOKE CITY WARD 12 2-J7SE1 -026-012-000

18-1891 :NESCOPECK TWP i44-Q3 -00A-51C-000 ,378. NO BID

18-1902 ,NEWPORT TWP WARD 1 6-J751 -009-005-000 ,029.70 iNOBID

181923 INEWPORT TWP WARD 1 {46-K752 -004-010-000 “INEWELLDAVID 87 E KIRMAR AVE 18558519 (CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
18-1939  INEWPORT TWP WARD 2 {46-K6S1 -005-002-000 BOVA PASQUALE & MELISSA 5 ARCH ST S 5,250.33 INO BID

NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 6-K6S1 -018-020-000 4,535.34"

6-K651 -023-028-000

146-K6S2 -001-039-000 KREIDLER JONATHON R 58 ARCH ST S 6,210.90 iNO BID

18-1956 :NEWPORT TWP WARD 2

18-1961 :NEWPORT TWP WARD 2




18-1940

18-1941

18-1931

iNEWPORT TWP WARD 2

iINEWPORT TWP WARD 2
{NEWPORT TWP WARD 2

{NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
iNEWPORT TWP WARD 2

-007-018-000

-003-015-000

-002-001-000

-016-003-000

MARTIN KEVIN J &

POWELL GARY A

8 ROCK ST

19 W ENTERPRISE ST

S 4,785.82

2,581.13

174873

9,046.29

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

:NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
iNEWPORT TWP WARD 2

NEWPORT TWP WARD 2

-002-002-000

POWELL ROBIN & GARY

BONITA JAMES T

96 ENTERPRISE ST

$
$ 7,286.15

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

NUANGOLA BORO -008-41A-000 BONITA JAMES T 5113 NUANGOLA ROAD S 2 568. 88 NO BID
:NUANGOLA BORO -003-31B-000 STIER RICHARD & PATRICIA RIDGE ST S 1,917.45 iNO BID
. NUANGOLABORO _003_010-000
5-N12S2 -002-010-000

18-3201

iPITTSTON CITY WARD 3

2-E11NE2-002-08A-000

2-E11NE2-002-004-000

2-D11SE3-011-011-000

COLLINS HELEN

385 N MAIN ST

15,500.11

18-3210

PITTSTON CITY WARD 3
,PI'I'I'STON CITY WARD 4
iPITTSTON CITY WARD 4

PITTSTON CITY WA D

:72 E11NE2-015-010-000

2-E11NE2-013-005-000

2-E11NE2-005-033-000

O BOYLE EDWARD F

60 PARSONAGE ST

9,616.32

18-3250

18-3241

183270

{PITTSTON CITY WARD 6
IPITTSTON CITY WARD 6

2-E11NE3-029-01A-000

2-E11 -00A-004-000

2-E11NE3-027-039-000

18-3279

2-E11SE1-008-027-000

18:3277 IPITISTONCITYWARD S . 2:£115£2:013-001-000 ... I3 MARKET LG eeeeeeeemest s seeesssssssssseee I3 MARKET ST e eeeeesmsssssseeseees b Bennnenn e 00 e
18-3289 iPITTSTON CITY WARD 10 2-E11SE1-045-09B-000 HEALEY FRANCIS A 31 E FROTHINGHAM ST $ 7,845.48 INOBID
18-3291 :PITTSTON CITY WARD 10 172-E11SE2-018-009-000 WATKINS DAVID 310 TEDRICK ST $  10,351.33 INOBID

$

18 2325

,PI'I'I'STON CITY WARD 10
iPITTSTON CITY WARD 11

PI'I'I'STON TWP

2-E11SE1-023-05E-000

i51-E12 -00A-01F.:(J)00

AMD LAND DEVELOPMENT LLC

182651

NO BID

18-2303

18-2200

18-2235

iPITTSTON TWP

PLAINS TWP WARD 1
iPLAINS TWP WARD 2

i51-D13S1 -T03-009-000

0-F10SE4-007-008-000

0-G10SW2-017-019-000

CAPWELL RAY & GERALDINE

1,679.37

111538

NO BID

SOLD $5,915.89 / BIDDER # 317

182236 PLA'NiTMﬁ,Mw,mw,iiﬂf}Pﬂfﬁ,E&?&}E“%?mmw N Bl e eeeeeeeeremrrree e e
18-2254 :PLAINS TWP WARD 6 0-G10NE4-004-027-000 SOLD $7,056.02 / BIDDER # 330

i .

182259 iPLAINSTWPWARD 6 i50.GLONE4-034-025-000 B ) 3

18 2262 PLAINS TWP WARD 7 H 0 GlONE4 012 019 000 BAUTJACOB 51 ADJ S MAIN ST 1,714.87 iNOBID

.1_2?—2268 iPLAINS TWP WARD 8 550-61154 -002-006-000 GURDOCK DANIEL & JANE ETAL RIDGEWOOD RD S 4,057.35 ..iNOBID

PLAINS TWP WARD 10
PLAINS TWP WARD 10
iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1

0-G11 -T02-312-000

:48-H8SE2 -007-004-000

BURGOS JOSE

61 PIERCE ST

1371.60

S 7,427.99

NO BID
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18-1999
18-2007
18-2020

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 2

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3

8-H8SE4 -024-24B-000

:48-H8SE2 -008-03A-000

148-H8SE3 -004-05A-000

8-H8SE3 -016-013-000

8-H8SE4 -023-017-000

COLON LUIS

SINKEWICZ JEROME J

57 MECHANICS ALY

107 WASHINGTON AVE

S 3,951.73

3,172.22

REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL

PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3

,PLYM UTH BORO WARD
iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6

148-H8SE4 -023-003-000

148-H8SE4 -020-001-000

SOLOMON DAVID R & JUANITA

PARKER ROBERT S SR

VISNISKI ELAINE TRUSTEE

WALNUT ST

317 W SHAWNEE AVE

$
$ 1,500.66

11, 301 41

NO BID

18-2088

PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6
8

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD

{PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11

8-ISNW2 -11A-005-000

8-H8SW3 -013-012-000

8-18NW2 -021-005-000

8-H8SE4 -035-10A-000

8-H8SE4 -035-010-000

BANKOVICH JEFFREY JOHN

CHABALA JOSEPH

821 BEVERLY DR

149 CENTER AVE

20,284.17

4,290.44

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-2089

PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11

,PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12

:48 H8SE4 -035-012-000

8-H8SE1 -006-001-000

8-H85W3 -018-011-000

DAVIES JAMES E & MARGARET

137 CENTER AVE

REY! OLDS ST

6,709.61

18-2098
18-2146

182149
182168

{PLYMOUTH TWP

iPLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12

iPLYMOUTH TWP

9-1752 -012-29A-000

8-H8SW3 -017-015-000

9-1752 -012-023-000

9-1757 -001-001-000

461 SECOND ST

6,667.38

163529

18-2186 iPLYMOUTH TWP 9-1852 -002-026-000 CALLAHAM MARY JANE 6 SMITH ROW S 5,089.99
18-2145 PLYMOUTH TWP '49 17S2 -012-022-000 EGET ROSE & EDWARD EMPTY LOTS BLOCK 12 S 2,453.26 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
18-2167 ,PLYMOUTH TWP 9-17S6 -005-005-000 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18 2136

iPLYMOUTH TWP

PLYMOUTH TWP

9-H8

-00A-027-000

i49-17S1A -007-006-000

HILLARD LOUIS D

Route 00011

HE 426659

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-2126

182169

18-2139

iPLYMOUTH TWP

iPLYMOUTH TWP

iPLYMOUTH TWP

149-H8

9-1851 -003-007-000

9-1752 -003-005-000

-00A-35C-000

HILLARD LOUIS D & SHERRY

W MOUNTAIN RD

4,562.28

3,153.46

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-2379
18-2363

,RICE TWP

RICE TWP

i53-M8

-T01-134-000

3-L854 -001-007-000

6,941.79

NO BID

NO BID

18
18 2362 RICE TWP :53-18511 -012-012-000 ZIELINSKI THOMASJ & DEBORAH A 907 DEER RACK RD 19,414.67 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018
18-2419 :ROSS TWP 554-65 -00A-05D-000 BAKER CLARA MOORE PALL RD S 4,175.48 iREMOVED - AGREEMENT

i54-H3

-00A-021-000

HUDACK KENNETH & NANCY

GRANGE HALL RD

1490.23

1,707.35

NO BID
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18-2390 LANNING RICHARD A T-572 ; S 4,163.14 :SOLD $4,163.14 / BIDDER # 304
18:2397 iROSSTWE e sssss OGDEN SUSAN E & MAXE o eeeeesseseeeeeeesssssesnneennns MAHONEY RD. ... oo eeeessssssseeesnni 3 e 2236872
18-2384 5,965.58

2,879.34

iSALEM TWP i55-04 -00A-46G-000 LYONS ALBERT W SR & BARBARA A KILITI RD S 2,879.34
SALEM TWP {55-P3NW?2 -008-002-000 MORGAN DARLENE E E EIGHTH ST S 2,245.79

,SALEM TWP

{SALEM TWP 5-P3NW4 -004-01A-000

[SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 {SG:LASE1 003-006:000  SHUNTERWILUAME . N

SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 i56-L4NE4 -001-018-000 MCDANIELS HAROLD A ETAL ALLEY H SMITH $ S82831
ESHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 6-LANE4 -001-019-000 MCDANIELS HAROLD A ETAL CHESTNUT RD $ 1,583.58

iSHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 6-L4ANE4 -001-01A-000

SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 6-L4SE1 -006-001-000

6-L4SE1 -029-04B-000

6-L4SE1 -016-010-000

18-2501 £SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 3 i56-L4SE1 -015-03A-000 ABERNATHY GORDON LEE CREEK ALY S 1,778.42
18-2514 SLOCUM TWP {57-L7S1 -003-001-000 MASKALUK CAROL NUANGOLA RD S 1,610.91
,SLOCUM TWP 7-L7 -00A-049-000 S

iSUGARLOAF TWP

SWOVYERSVILLE W RD
18-2632 :UNION TWP

18-2615 UNION TWP

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

NO BID
-00A-04F-000

182625
182626 LUNION TWP

18-2627 :UNION TWP -00A-28B-000
18-2622 :UNION TWP 161-1451 -002-007-000

18-2680 ,WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 163-T7SE2 -006-024-000

{WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 11,858.75

-00A-003-000

FTORKOWSKI ENTERPRISES
TOLSMA NORMAN & JAMIE L

5,353.20
21,272.81

{63-T7SE2 -016-014-000 ROMERO JOSE ETAL 207 WINTERS AVE ; S ) 3,861.30 REMOVED - 2016 TAXE;PAID
163-T7SE1 -002-020-000 SHILALA JOSEPH & WIFE 313 W GREEN ST 6,476.22

18 2698 WEST HAZLETON WARD 3
18-2686 :WEST HAZLETON WARD 3

REMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID

182752 IWEST PITTSTON WARD 1 5-E11NE1-020-030-000 6,317.58

18-2744 {WEST PITTSTON WARD 1 5-E11NE1-003-034-000

18-2789 :WEST WYOMING BORO 166-E10SE1-008-026-000 NO BID
18-2801 ,WEST WYOMING BORO 166-F1054 -009-007-000 _iNoBID

182866 {WILKES-BARRE TWP {69-110NW4-005-018-000 BOCCOLINI RONALD D & PATRICIA A 754 METCALF ST 79.835.29  IREMOVED - 2016 TAXES PAID

18-2847 :WILKES-BARRE TWP 169-H10S5 -001-14A-000 COLORS HOSPITALITY LLC MUNDY ST S 6,124.81 iNOBID

WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 3-H10NW4-017-021-000

18-3322 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 3-H1I0NW1-005-011-000

18-3323 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 :73-H10NW1-006-012-000 THOMAS RICHARD C 42 W HOLLENBACK ST S 2,467.46 iNO BID
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i73-H10NW2-018-026-000 VIEW JOLEEN 3 AUBURN ST S 6,266.71 iNO BID

3-H10SW2-009-013-000 CORBETT MARGARET MARY 45 PENN ST S 9,592.06 iNO BID

18-3329 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 1

18-3366 :WILKES-BARRE WARD

DINOSKI ANTHONY & MARY ANN 30 MUNDY ST S 7,474.76 iNOBID

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 3-H10SW2-017-034-000

18-3377

.............. [WILKESBARREWARD 3 173-H10SW4-017-029-000  :LEE S 439386 iNomID
'WILKES—BARRE WARD 3 i 3-110NW1-005-009-000 PRENDERGASS REGINALD 43 N EMPIRE ST S 7,185.10 :NO BID
WILKES BARRE WARD 6 173-110NW1-014-007-000 ARNONE CHAS E 417 NEW MARKET ST S 7,499.20 :iNO BID

PIZARRO TOMAS GARCIA & | BRISENO

{73-110NW1-012-020-000 YASHKUS JUDITH 311/2 TAFT ST

WILKES-BARRE WARD

9 599. 53 NO BID

3-HISE3 -004-009-000

:WILKES-BARRE WARD D&D REALTY GROUP SCRANTON LLC 47 E NORTHAMPTON ST

{WILKES-BARRE WARD

43,488.67

3-19NE2 -005-045-000

3-H9SE4 -006-001-000

3-HISE3 -001-004-000

18-3524 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 10 3-HISE4 -010-022-000

REISINGER JOSEPH R 31 ACADEMY ST 76,156.64

18-3539 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 :73 HISE4 -015-003-000

,WILKES -BARRE WARD 12 3-HISE4 -033-021-000

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 3-I9NE1 -004-018-000

ALTAMIRANO MILTON R 155 WOOD ST 6,190.43 iNOBID

20 SULLIVAN ST

18-3548 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 3-HISE4 -025-001-000

18-3549 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 3-H9SE4 -025-002-000

448 S FRANKLIN ST

18-3566
18-3560 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 12

18-3631 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE2 -041-010-000

3-H9SE4 -033-012-000

3-HISE4 -027-14A-000

62 HUTSON ST 9,765.24 :iNO BID

AUDI MANAGEMENT LLC

18-3623 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 {73-19NE2 -032-012-000

18-3618 ,WILKES -BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE2 -024-019-000

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE1 -027-16A-000

AVENA LOUIS A JR

$
259 DANA ST $ 3,528.36 iNO BID
$

18 3625 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 {73-19NE2 -032-037-000 DUNBAR KRISTINE o 286 HAZLE ST ; S ) 6,523.35w NO BID

18-3587 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 $73-110NW1-007-05A-000 FLORES SUHEIRY 447 E SOUTH ST S 6,628.01 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

3,343.91

8,827.24

2-18—3601 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-I9NE1 -028-002-000

18-3608 i WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE2 -011-006-000

CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

a

18-3600 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 {73-19NE1 -028-001-000 S 10,539.47 :iNOBID
18-3627 ,WILKES -BARRE WARD 13 i73-I9NE2 -032-44B-000 _iNoBID

183668 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 i73-19NE3 -001-006-000 CAMPBELL ANDRE 65 LOOMIS ST

18 6.136.95 ino BID
S

18-3686 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 i73-19NE4 -004-011-000 CASTRO IGNACIO O 95 HOLLAND ST 7,196.36 iNO BID

430115

WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 3-19NE1 -029-005-000

3-19NE1 -029-033-000

173-19NE4 -013-009-000 FUTURE HORIZONS PA LTD 447 NEW GROVE ST S 60,798.66 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019

18-3661 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

18-3696 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
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18-3712

18-3747
18-3727

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 14

I9NE4 -021-010-000

3-19SE2 -004-024-000

3-19NE4 -032-019-000

3-19NE3 -021-023-000

JONES DAVID W & DEBORAH

109 JONES ST

3 331884
R
$spsags

8,024.12

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 15

18-3766

WILKES-BARRE WARD 15

3-19NW2 -005-003-000

3-19NW2 -026-09A-000

3-HISE4 -016-027-000

3-H9SW3 -032-014-000

SULLIVAN KATHLEEN

28 CATLIN AVE

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 i73-19NE3 -015-014-000 ORELLANA MANUEL FELIPE LEON 451 BLACKMAN ST S 4,989.28 :iNO BID
WILKES BARRE WARD 14 i ROHN KENNETH C 7"§Mﬂ'ﬂmmmmmwm ”,im . ,,"2'";3’,.89;19 N BID
24 CHERRY ST S 2,567.46 iNO BID
SGREGENTST .................................... $935463 NOBID .............................................................................
ERICKSON JoH D, T S L Y L
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 {73-19NE1 -002-012-000 FARRELL JOHN & DENISE 92 WOOD ST S 13,737.69 iNO BID
{WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 3-I9NW2 -020-03A-000 HUNGARTER PENNY L TRUST 578 -580 CAREY AVE S 11,330.23 iCONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

14,239.05

18-3799

WILKES BARRE WARD 15

,WILKES -BARRE WARD 16

{WILKES-BARRE WARD 16

:73 I9NW?2 -011-044-000

3-H10NW3-020-009-000

3-H10SW1-006-002-000

WZJ CONSTRUCTION LLC

34 ROWLAND ST

145 MADI ON ST

6,386.92

18-3895 :WILKES—BARRE WARD 16 80 BEAUMONT ST
53856 (WILKES.BARRE WARD 16
1
;
18-3844 3-HIONW2:011-002-000  iKWAKKURTS """ """ {792 NPENNAAVE 1S ) 81030 inomio
18-3884 {WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 '3-H10NW4-018-029-000 MARTIN ELLON X 212 MADISON ST S 2,882.05 :NOBID
ig s MUCTSAMEWADLS BHIONEOI802.000, | MATNELONK o ZZMADISONST. e
},8,;%292. WILKEE(EM"WA@“:?'MW'E}SMngg%m" REISINGER JOSEPH R 237 N MAIN ST "LW'ETSAZZ&;OZ ’\Q.,Bvlfwnw,mw,mw,mw,mw,mw,m
18-3914 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 3-H10SW1-006-049-000 S 8,121.20 :NO BID

S .. TR ... ] e S B

848 SCOTT ST

18 3924 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 17 i73-H10NE1- 011 011 000 ZIEMBA LARRV & SHEILA ; S ) 5,211.22w NO BID
18-3934 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 18 173-G10SE4-012-009-000 MURGAI VIKRAM 147 GARDNER AVE S 12,022.09 iNOBID

18-3958

18-3951

:WILKES-BARRE WARD 19

!WILKES-BARRE WARD 19

3-G10SE1-011-024-000

3-G10SE1-006-007-000

1372.03

18-3960 W'LKEE,%WW"W&&?“@,MMLZ?,E}PEEH}EMEPMW N Bl e eeeeeeeeremrrree e e
18-3962 :WILKES-BARRE WARD 19 173-G10SE2-014-022-000 NO BID

1 ......... .

183956 i73-G10SE1.011:005-000 B )

18 3977 WILKES BARRE WARD 20 H 3 GlOSE3 015 033 000 GRABKO PAUL & PAULINE 1326 SCOTT ST 7,838.18 CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

.1_2_5—3978 fWILKES-BARRE WARD 20 573-GIOSE3-015-034-000 GRABKO PAUL & PAULINE SCOTT ST S 1,337.28__ CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

fWYOMING BORO WARD 1

4-N8S1 -005-005-000

4-N8S1 -005-003-000

167-E10SE3-015-034-000

YALE EDWARD

112 E SIXTH ST

161544

S 2,664.28

REMOVED - ASSESSMENT ERROR
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{67-F10S1 -002-05B-000 FETCH DAVID JR 913 WYOMING AVE S 47,584.31 :CONTINUED BY COURT ORDER TO OCT 25, 2018

18-2823 {WYOMING BORO WARD 3

18-2821 {WYOMING BORO WARD 3 {67-F1ONE2-004-24B-000 MORREALE DAVID & LISA SUSQUEHANNA AVE S 2,353.24 iNOBID




