UPSET SALE - SEPTEMBER 23, 2021 at 10AM

LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM SALES
TAX CLAIM BUREAU
TAX SALES NOTICE

***ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, AND THE LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM BUREAU IS
STRICTLY ADHERING TO THE COVID-19 GUIDELINES AS PUT IN PLACE BY THE
ADMINISTRATION OF KINGS COLLEGE. ALL ATTENDEES OF ANY EVENT HELD BY ELITE
REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, WILL BE REQUIRED TO WEAR A MASK COVERING THEIR MOUTH
AND NOSE AT ALL TIMES.**¥

TO ALL OWNERS* OF PROPERTY DESCRIBED IN THIS NOTICE AND ALL PERSONS HAVING
LIENS, TAX JUDGMENTS OR MUNICIPAL CLAIMS AGAINST SUCH PROPERTIES:

NOTICE is hereby given by ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, as agent for the Luzerne County Tax
Claim Bureau, in and for the COUNTY OF LUZERNE under Sections 601-609 inclusive of the Real Estate Tax
Law of 1947, as amended, that the Bureau will expose at public sale at the King’s College Scandlon Physical
Education Center, 150 N. Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania, at 10:00 A.M., on September 23, 2021 or
any date to which the sale may be adjourned, readjourned or continued, for the purpose of collecting unpaid
2019 and any PRIOR REAL ESTATE TAXES, PRIOR LIENS, MUNICIPAL CLAIMS, and all costs hereto, the
following described set forth. Please make reference to the Tax Parcel Number and Property Identification
Number with all correspondence.

The sale of this property may, AT THE OPTION OF THE BUREAU, be stayed if the owner thereof or any
lien creditor of the OWNER, before the date of the sale, enters into an agreement with the BUREAU to pay the
TAXES, Claims and Costs in installments in the manner provided by said Act, and the agreement to be entered
into. The Bureau is prohibited from entering into a new installment agreement to stay sale within three (3)
years of any default on an agreement to stay sale. (Section 603).

These Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.
THERE WILL BE NO REDEMPTION PERIOD AFTER THE DATE OF THE SALE.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any
property in which they may be interested. Every effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error.
However, in every case the TAX CLAIM BUREAU is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is
offered for sale by the TAX CLAIM BUREAU without any guarantee or warranty whatever, either as to
structure or lack of structure upon the land, the liens, title or any other matter or thing whatever. Elite
Revenue, in accordance with the statute, made diligent and reasonable efforts to provide notice to the record
owner. Lien holders were not notified and all properties are being sold subject to any existing liens.

It is repeated that there is no redemption after the property is sold and all sales will be final. No
adjustments will be made after the property is struck down.

THE PROPERTY MAY BE REDEEMED from the Tax Sale by paying the delinquent taxes, fees, interest
penalties and costs prior to the day of the public auction. The payments must be cash, cashiers check, money
order or certified check. The right to redeem the property expires on September 23, 2021.

THERE IS NO RIGHT OF REDEMPTION ON THE DAY OF OR AFTER THE PUBLIC AUCTION. If no
payment has been received prior to the time of the sale, the property will be sold on September 23, 2021.

Pursuant to 68 P.S. 2117(c)(3), properties in the following municipalities may be subject to a trump bid by
North East Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority prior to public auction: Avoca Borough, Duryea Borough,
Hughestown Borough, Jenkins Township, Pittston City, West Pittston Borough.



Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 56860.619a, a successful bidder
shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real
estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County**, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another
individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne
County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder
shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying
municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of
another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities
within Luzerne County.

3. Prospective bidders must register prior to sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN THE DAY OF
THE SALE.

4. A successful bidder shall not tender a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing property in the
sale. If this should occur that bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and will
be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under Pennsylvania Crimes
Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A §4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

5. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders
must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and
that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

PAYMENT BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER IS DUE THE DAY OF SALE AND SHALL BE MADE
IN THE FORM OF CASH, CERTIFIED CHECK, OR MONEY ORDER. In the event that a successful
bidder does not tender payment in full for any bid by 4:00 p.m. on September 23, 2021, the bid will be nullified
and the bidder will not be permitted to bid at future tax sales conducted by the Luzerne County Tax Claim
Bureau.

Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau or on-line at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com.
Click on Upset Sale and bidder’s certification.

IMPORTANT: Right to surplus sale proceeds. If the property is not redeemed from public sale and you are
the record owner, then you are entitled to sale proceeds which exceed taxes, interest, penalties, costs,
Commonwealth Liens, Municipal Liens, Government Liens and Judgment Liens.

Interest accrues at the rate of 9% per year, at %% each month effective February 1, of each year.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age,
disability, or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

The Scandlon Physical Education Center is a facility accessible to persons with disabilities. Please notify
this Tax Claim Bureau if special accommodations are required. The Tax Claim Bureau can be contacted at
(570) 825-1512 or by fax at (570) 820-6339, or by TDD (570) 825-1860.

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS AS TO WHAT YOU MUST DO PLEASE CONTACT THE TAX CLAIM
BUREAU AT (570) 825-1512.

Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director
* “Owner,” the person in whose name the property is last registered, if registered according to law, or, if
not registered acording to law, the person whose name last appears as an owner of record on any deed
or instrument of conveyance recorded in the county office designated for recording, and in all other
cases means any person in open, peaceable and notorious possession of the property, as apparent owner
or owners thereof, or the reputed owner or owners thereof, in the neighborhood of such property.
**  The successful bidder is also certifying that they are not the owner of the property, as the owner has no
right to purchase his own property pursuant to Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law. A change
of name or business status shall not defeat the purpose of this section. For the purpose of this section,



“owner” means any individual, partner, shareholder, trust, partnership, limited partnership,
corporation or any other business association or any trust, partnership, limited partnership,
corporation or any other business association that has any individual as part of the business
association who had any ownership interest or rights in the property.
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Winninﬁ Bidder

.ASHLEV BORO WARD 2

S MAIN ST

$ 1,885.75

01-19SE4 -009-027-000 LANGDON GERALD J 2 ROSS ST
AVOCA BORO WARD 2 02-D12SE4-009-002-000 :CONNOLLY BRIAN J & DEBRA A 528 GROVE ST
BEAR CREEK TWP ............... 4- | 1453 .006-015.000 ..... DEPASQUAI_E SAMUEI_ &VERA ...................... FoREsTsT ...................................
BEAR CREEK TWP 4-114S3 -007-010-000 FULLER MARTIN FRANCIS JR ADJ LAKE ST
BEARCREEKTWP ............... 0441453-007_011-000 ..... FULLERMART|NFRANC|SJR .......................... LAKEST ............................ i 5,4828 . oI Seass e e
BEAR CREEK TWP 04-11152 -004-005-000 MOSLEY ROBERT OLD EAST END BLVD $ 4,554.34 SOLD - $4,554.34 #345
BEAR CREEK TWP 04-111S3 -002-010-000 MURPHY BEATRICE Route 00115 $ 2,528.66 NO BID
B

B,

G

COl

3,107.06

BLACK CREEK TWP 3-U5S1A -008-026-000  :JACOB DENNIS T & IROQUOIS CIR

BLACKCREEKTWP ............. 03-U553-001.098.000 KUR|AJUD|THN ........................................ TURNBERRYI_N ..................... 2,58508

BLACK CREEK TWP :03-U5S3 -001-010-000 MAGAT MARILOU V & MYRA V SILVERCLOUD LN i$  3,063.57

BLACK CREEKTW P ............. 3- U 551_002_ 003-000 MCGRORYKERRY A .................................... HURo N c|R .......................... 2,58612

BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S3 -001-037-000 SONG HANXIANG TURNBERRY LN $  3,144.26

BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S5 -005-160-000 SONG XIANGLI YAZOO DR $ 4,114.41 NO BID

BLACK CREEK TWP 03-T351 -001-015-000 VAN BLARGEN WILMER + BETTY C MAHONEY ST $ 5,185.45 SOLD - $5,185.45 #275

BLACK CREEKTW P ............... 3- U 551A .009.008.000 VARGASMAR |A ANGEI_ES& .......................... WALDENDR .........................

BLACK CREEK TWP -U5S2 -004-006-000 ZHAN RUILONG 21 -B LAKE VALLEY DR

BUTLER TWP WARD1 {06-Q858 -004-05A-000  ANGELI BARBARA & WILLIAM OAKDR 87258667 | SOLD- $2,586.67 #87

BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-P8S5 -002-13F-000 HIGGINS LAWRENCE W OLD TURNPIKE RD 12,047.50 NO BID

BUTLERTWPWARD1 ......... 06-Q752.001.03A-000 HoRWATHjoHNMK:HAEL ........................... 82KL|NGERSRD 28,20945 SoLD.$2,820945 ............. # 275 .......

BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-Q7S2 -001-03C-000 HORWATH JOHN MICHAEL KLINGERS RD $ 4,126.15 SOLD - $4,126.15 #275

BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8512 -006-018-000 BARRY KEITH LAWRENCE & AVALANCHE LN $ 1,931.57 NO BID

BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8511 -004-004-000 CONAHAN JOHN JR DEBBIE DR 1,844.56 NO BID

BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q9S2 -003-015-000 GOGICK GARY BUCK SAW DR 1,624.85 NO BID

BUTLER TWP WARD 2 :06-Q9S2 -002-024-000 KEELER JOSEPH H & EVELYN M SHINGLE MILL DR i$ 215496 NO BID

BUTLERTW P WARDz ......... 6- Q 952_005.0 14.000 RoBB|NsDANA ......................................... TRAPPERSPR| N G sclR ............. 2,5406 - soLD - 52,54060 .............. #87 ........
21-0213 CONYNGHAM TWP 9-M4S1 -009-005-000 GLADYSZ WITOLD & MARZENA 138 1/2 RIVER ST 4,247.75 NO BID
21-0224 CONYNGHAM TWP 09-M5S4 -004-014-000 TANEY CARL 42 PLANTATION RD .............. $ 8,28913 SOLD N $8,28913 .............. # 275 .......
21-0234 CONYNGHAM TWP 09-05S1 -003-001-000 TURNER DON & JUDITH ANN 476 S RIVER ST $ 7,038.10 SOLD - $7,038.10 #275
21-0204 COURTDALE BORO 07-G9S2 -002-010-000 SHIELDS DORIS 21 HARRINGTON ST $ 12,500.87 NO BID

$

DALLAS BORO

11-D8SW4 -009-001-000

LAKEWOOD DEVELOPMENT COMPANY INC

MEMORIAL HWY ST

DALLAS TWP :10-C7S3 -002-004-000 BOVO RENATLS Il LLC WARREN AVE i$ 2,561.81
DALLAS TWP -009-006-000 COVERT JACK & ALICE ETAL WARREN AVE 996.84
DALLAS TWP COVERT JACK P WARREN AVE 1,693.89
D,

D

D,

D

8

39

DALLAS TWP 10-D8S6 -001-030-000 DANIELS MARK PHEASANT RUN DR $ 4,817.30

DALLAS TWP 10-D8S6 -001-031-000 DANIELS MARK PHEASANT RUN DR $ 4,428.11

DALLAS TWP -001-059-000 GOODLEIGH MANOR HOMEOWNERS ASSOC SCENIC VIEW DRIVE 2,850.42

DALLASTWP ............................... - 001-065.000 ..... GooDLE| GHMANOR Ho MEo w N ERS A SSOC ..... MEADOWV|EW DR| VE .............

DALLAS TWP -004-004-000 HOYT RAYMOND C 909 KUNKLE ROAD

DALLASTWP ........................ .T02-135.00 0 ....... KRESGEJU D|TH A ...................................... 135VA|_|_E V DR ....................

DALLAS TWP -00A-013-000 STRUTHERS THEODORE E & ESTHER S 634 KUNKLE RD RD

DALLASTWP ........................... .T02-125 -00 0 ....... VAN = ORDEN MA RY ..................................... 125VA|_|_E VV|EW TRA | LER PARK

DALLAS TWP 10-D8 -T03-051-000 WILLIAMS MARYANN 15 DALLAS MHP $ 1,084.71 SOLD - $1,084.71 #330
DENNISON TWP 13-01251 -004-011-000 CESSNA CHARLES C & VERONICA T WALNUT ST $ 235321 NO BID
DORRANCE TWP 12-N7 -00A-30A-001 JENKINS E & NORMA 11 GEORGES RD 1,212.29

DURYEA BoRo WARD 1 ..................................... GA| ALEX ................................................. 3125 MAlN - ST ...................................

14-D12NW2-009-011-000

12,904.64

D
D

iF

T

15

12

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 1

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4

18-G9S3 -009-019-000

18-G9S2 -010-048-000

DOONANRITA A

CROSSLEY LAINIE

265 LAWRENCE ST

88 BUNNY LN

2,975.11

8,334.43

SOLD - $8,334.43
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21-0514 EDWARDSVILLE WARD 6 $18-G9S1 -010-04E-000 SHURNICKI ROBERTA ANNE 161 ADJ ARCH ST i$  2,365.84 } NO BID
21-0392 EXETER BORO WARD 1 6-D11S1 -006-03B-000 TROY WILLIAM & MARIE 4 OLD EXETER AVE
21-0407 EXETER BORO WARD 2 6-E11NW4-005-08A-000 :BOWEN RAYMOND & DEBBIE 116 CEDAR ST 14,705.27

EXETER BORO WARD 2

6-E11NW3-008-040-000

HOGREBE DOUGLAS J & CHERY A 78 MEMORIAL ST

14,678.15

21-0424 EXETER BORO WARD 4 -00A-015-071 A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 262 BIRCHWOOD EST $ 1,788.87 NO BID
21-0431 EXETER BORO WARD 4 -00A-015-245 A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 254 BIRCHWOOD EST $  2,092.37 NO BID
21-0432 EXETER BORO WARD 4 -00A-015-248 A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 175 BIRCHWOOD EST $ 1,149.37 NO BID
21-0438 EXETER BORO WARD 4 00A-12A-020 A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 251 BIRCHWOOD EST i$
210435 IEXETERBORO WARD4 -T01-245:000 A HUNTER PROPERTY MANAGEMENT INC 245 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES $
21-0445 EXETER BORO WARD 4 6-E10S2 -007-01B-000 GALLAGHER JOSEPH J & KAREN ANTHRACITE AVE $
210446 IEXETERBOROWARD4 GALLAGHER JOSEPH ) & KAREN ANTHRACITE STREET $ 110772

$

EXETER BORO WARD 4

GARCIA JOSE 199 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES

1,532.54

21-0415 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-D10 -T02-020-000 GESUALDI PAZQUALE 20 MT LOOKOUT TRAILER CT $ 1,188.83 NO BID

21-0426 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-096 HECK EDWARD & SONIA M TERRY 277 BIRCHWOOD EST $ 1,139.33 NO BID

21-0420 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-018 LAUSON JOSEPH 197 BIRCHWOOD EST $ 1,103.32 NO BID

21-0457 EXETER BORO WARD 4 LIPPI EUGENE & ESTHER J 5 MOSIER ST i$ SOLD - $12,500 #275

21.0455 ...... EXETER BO ROWARD4 ......... L|PP|EUGF_N E SR ETAL ................................. 5AD]M05| ERsT .................. : SOLD - 53_34824 .............. # 275 .......

21-0448 EXETER BORO WARD 4 MRUK STANLEY A & GRACE MARIE 454 WILSON ST $ SOLD - $29,500 #143

21_0419 ...... EXETERBOROWARD4 ......... VA5||_ ROBERT .......................................... 293B|RCHWOODEST ............. ST NoBm .................................

21-0473 EXETER TWP GENTILE GEORGE & PHILOMENA 1833 state route 92 $ 10,623.02 SOLD - $10,623.02 #378

21-0471 EXETER TWP 17-B10S1 -008-006-000 KASTNER EDWARD 10 COOLIDGE AVE $ 1,522.60 NO BID

21-0472 EXETER TWP 17-B10S2 -004-004-000 RUGER BARBARA 2092 STATE ROUTE 92 HWY $ 6,662.80 NO BID

21-0468 EXETER TWP 17-B10S1 -007-009-000 ZELLNER MARGARET A & RIVERSIDE DR $ 1,574.70 NO BID

21-0533 FAIRVIEW TWP 0-K9S1 -002-003-000 SMITH WILLIAM R BROWN ST i$ SOLD - $1,208.44 #251

21-0539 ...... FORTVFORTBOROWARDl 1-G10NW1-012-013-000 : AUDI MANAGEMENT Il LLC 107 RIVER ST $ SOLD-$1,896194 ............. # 292 .......

21-0542 FORTY FORT BORO WARD 1 1-G10NW4-009-001-000 :KELLY EDW E & FRANCES 3 CAYUGA ST $ SOLD - $32,000 #143

21-0624 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... 3-Q11S6 -005-001-000 ANDERSON JOANNE M 40 HOLIDAY DR $ SOLD-$1,04218 .............. # 330 .......
FOSTER TWP 3-Q11 -T01-006-001 CULL ROBERT & ELAINE 42 HESS LANE $ SOLD - $731.48 #330

21-0607 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11 -T01-059-001 CULL SHAWN & PETRUCE CANDICE 63 HESS LN $ 1,113.21 SOLD-$1,11321 .............. # 330 .......

21-0639 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S8 -010-032-000 DUGAN GEORGE & ROSE MARIE FAWN TER $ 4,381.00 NO BID

21-0599 FOSTER TWP 23-Q10 -T01-116-000 GIVINS EILEEN 116 RED MAPLE LN $ 686.62 SOLD - $686.62 #330

21-0600 FOSTER TWP 3-Q10 -T01-121-000 GUERRERO IGRID 121 RED MAPLE LN i$ SOLD - $2,000 #330

21.0515 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... S OiS14.005.003-000 TANNA FOREST CIT PP : NoBm .................................

21-0670 FOSTER TWP 3-RINE3 -010-008-000 HELLER HELEN V 805 HAZLE ST $ NO BID

21-0669 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... 3-RINE3 -010-007-000 HELLER JOHN & HELEN 104 CENTER ST $ 4,678‘.‘37 SOLD-$4,67837 .............. # 330 .......

21-0645 FOSTER TWP 3-Q9S1 -008-004-000 LAURENT LAURENTIS 102 MAIN ST $ 6,733.07 SOLD - $6,733.07 #330

21-0668 FOSTER TWP 23-RONE3 -009.—.0.03-000 LINDSEY LOUIS W & EILEEN T 148 WASHINGTON ST $ 14,239.92 NO BID

21-0614 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11512-001-012-000 :LOWER ROBERT D & SUSAN E 392 POND CREEK RD $ 28,954.63 NO BID

21-0597 FOSTER TWP 23-MINACT-00A-000-004 :NO 1 CONTRACTING CORP $ 660,438.15 NO BID

21-0617 FOSTER TWP 3-Q11S2 -003-010-000 OCONNOR CHARLES P LAKE DR i$

21.0538 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... faaiiss _009._ .0.04_000 0|)0R| CO Do MEN| co & jEANNE .................... co UG ARDR ........................ :

21-0664 FOSTER TWP 3-RINE1 -005-002-000 PAULEUS MARIE A 321 FERN ST $

21.0541 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... 3_Q12 - ooA.01 1_053 ..... Po LAN LcAscoTr & D ENN|5 & TR|5H ............... 53 LADNER A cREs ................. : 1,711...5 5

21-0657 FOSTER TWP 3-R10S1 -003-014-000 POPA IOANA 31 HIGHLAND DR $ 5,518.43 NO BID

21-0615 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11514-002-006-000 :PRATICO MARK ANTHONY RD $ 4,989.31 SOLD - $4,989.31 #275
21-0636 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S8 -005-028-000 RAIMONDO JEFF F & LORRAINE WINTERS WOODHAVEN DR $ 1,083.68 SOLD - $1,083.68 #10

21-0627 FOSTER TWP 23-Q1156 -006-038-000 SCHULTZ PAUL G & LINDA J 1259 WOODHAVEN DR $ 1,163.74 SOLD - $1,163.74 #10

21-0621 FOSTER TWP 3-Q1154 -004-005-000 SEARFOSS KENNETH R SR & SHEILA M 115 S SHEAMAN RD i$ REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21.0529 ...... FOSTERTWP ..................... aauise _013._ .0.14_000 VENTRE jo SEPHP & DO LoREs ....................... sU N5H| N E D R ...................... :

21-0688 FRANKLIN TWP 4-B8 -T01-013-000 BERLEW RICHARD 113 COUNTRY VILLAGE LN $ 1,111.83

21_0703 ...... FRANK|_| N Tw P .................. K||_E TERR | |_VN N ........................................ 43 v A|_|_Ev V | Ew PA RK ........... : - 1, 0530 -

21-0694 FRANKLIN TWP TALL PINES ESTATES ASSOCIATION PINE DRIVE $ 1,612.93

21-0574 ...... FREELAND BORO WARD3 ....... 22-Q9SE3 -021-014-000 BELL ASHLEY 1117 CENTRE ST $ 6,833.03 SOLD - $6,833.03 #304
21-0584 FREELAND BORO WARD 4 22-R9NEL1 -012-011-000 DIAZ RONALD & VERONICA 921 WALNUT ST $ 3,636.95 SOLD - $3,636.95 #20

21-0709 HANOVER TWP WARD 1 25-1851 -009-018-000 BRUNN JOAN M 532 CHESTNUT ST $ 3,244.52 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
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21-0708 HANOVER TWP WARD 1 $25-1851 -008-005-000 PYLE HERBERT & CAROLINE J ASHLEY ST 18 1,766.77 } NO BID

21-0733 HANOVER TWP WARD 2 5-19SE3 -003-010-000 BLY KEVIN ADJ JOHNSON ST $ 1,933.60 NO BID

21_0737 ...... HANo VER TWP WARDZ ....... 5_JgNE4 - o 03.04A.000 - CO LBco |_Lc ............................................. RT E 309 ............................. : - 4, 89311 e N o B|D .................................
21-0730 HANOVER TWP WARD 2 5-19SE1 -016-005-000 WILLIAMS EVELYN H 17 W LIBERTY ST $ 8,915.98 SOLD - $8,915.98 #396
21-0740 HANOVER TWP WARD 3 25-J9NE4 -001-10C-000 BARAT MICHAEL B & JOANNE 29 RUTZ LN 11,254.69 SOLD-$11,25469 ............. # 222 .......
21-0749 HANOVER TWP WARD 4 25-1I9NW2 -006-001-000 :BAGGETT THEODORE M 23 LUZERNE ST 4,884.15 SOLD - $4,884.15 #34
21-0788 HANOVER TWP WARD 6 25-)852 -004-024-000 KACZMARCZYK DANIEL BAUER ST 1,963.72 NO BID

21-0789 HANOVER TWP WARD 6

5-J852 -004-025-000 KACZMARCZYK DANIEL & MAE BAUER ST

21-0790 HANOVER TWP WARD 6 :25-J852 -004-026-000 KACZMARCZYK DANIEL & MAE 235 BAUER ST { REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-0787 HANOVER TWP WARD 6 5-J852 -004-022-000 KACZMARCZYK DANIEL JR & MAE R 225 BAUER ST REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21.0314 ...... HANOVERTWPWARD7 ....... 5_I95w1_002_003_000 BROWN M|CHAE|_G&10ANNE|( ................... 290|_EEPARKAVF_ ................. 25_063‘_‘0 5 soLD.$25,06309 ............. # 252 .......
21-0808 HANOVER TWP WARD 7 5-I9NW1 -011-017-000 :ROVINSKI RITA 184 PHILLIPS ST 10,285.85 SOLD - $20,500 #53
21-3390 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6S2 —005—‘665-000 CARPIN ADAM 70 OUTLET RD $ 27,480.77 SOLD-$27,48077 ............. # 275 .......
21-3378 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C6S5 -001-01A-000 SWITZER JOHN 99 PINE ST $ 12,653.48 NO BID

21-0855 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-U5S8 -002-027-000 HAN SEUNGYEON 241 CORN SILK AVE $  4,429.95 NO BID

21-0848 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 6-5857 -003-006-000 KASARDA ANTHONY F 241 EBERVALE RD i$

21-0816 ...... HAZLE TWPWARDl ............ 6-MINACT-00A-000-007 :NO 1 CONTRACTING CORP $

21-0819 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 6-R852 -003-011-000 ROSARIO JESUS & AIDA 231 PARDEESVILLE RD $

21.0334 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 1 ............ 5_5752 - 001.08 F. 000 ..... V|ECH F_c CHELSEA ...................................... 11050 UT H sT ...................... : 12_033‘_‘15

21-0932 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -008-366-000 ADLAWAN MARIA AZUCENA & PIERRE N LOT 366 LAUREL VALLEY $ 3,800.32 NO BID

21-0965 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5514 -001-487-000 AHO FRANCIS G AND GEORGE J WHITE OAK LN 3,392.45 NO BID

21-0966 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5514 -001-488-000 AHO FRANCIS G AND GEORGE J WHITE OAK LN 3,392.45 NO BID

21-1022 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -004-010-000 ALFEREZ RODOLFO JOSE P & ROSEMARIE 135 CHEROKEE DR 3,472.55 NO BID

21-0919 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 ARCILLA RAQUEL & ROMEO DOGWOOD DR

21-1006 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 :26-U554 -006-007-000 ARMAS EDGAR C AND MARIA JENNIFER C PINE VALLEY DR

21-1007 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S4 -006-036-000 ARMAS EDGAR C AND MARIA JENNIFER C GREENBRIAR LN

21.0985 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ 5_U55 15_001_ 457_000 - BA L|_ANO A GN Es ....................................... HONEVSUCKLE DR ................. 3,949.,.5 -

21-0960 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5514 -001-355-000 BASHEER BASHAR M & WHITE OAK LANE 1,922.61 NO BID
21-0977 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-182-000 BEERS DOLORES L BUTTONBUSH LN $ 3,41217 NO BID
21-0995 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S2 -008-016-000 BUCKLEY WILLIAM E TUSCARORA DR $  2,411.59 NO BID
21-1018 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S6 -007-009-000 BUENVIAJE AURIMEL & CHARLES S PEBBLE BEACH DR $ 10,282.38 NO BID
21-0883 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-T552 -001-121-000 CALAOAGAN IMELDA D LINE MTN LN i$

21-0978 ...... HAZLETWPWARDZ ............ 6-U5S515 -001-248-000 CARIN LINO O AND IMELDA A BUTTERNUT LN $

21-0915 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -001-006-000 CHEN YAXIN SILKY WILLOW DR $

21.0361 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ 5_T551 _001_03 1_ 0 oo ..... cHo N G(‘_HA EHUN &jAsoN .......................... APPALACH |AN W AV ............... : 1,550.,.4 5

21-0918 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -001-034-000 CRAFTON MARY T & MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR $ 5,446.46 NO BID

21-0938 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5512 -001-074-000 DIOLATA ARIEL G & BUTTONBUSH LN 3,498.41

21-0887 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T552 -001-321-000 EDQUIBA VENICE ENCINA 7,419.18 NO BID
21-0981 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S515 -001-280-000 ENRIQUEZ PATRICK EUGENE CRANBERRY LANE 3,627.77 NO BID
21-0902 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-T7SE1 -013-018-000 FRANKLIN CHERIE 735 WINTERS AVE

21-0927 ...... HAZLE TWPWARDZ ............ 6-U5510 -002-229-000 GARCIA BERNADETTE DELPRADO LAUREL VALLEY RD

21-1014 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S5 -008-012-000 GARCIA RHODORA & WILLIAM PINE VALLEY LN

21_1029 ...... HAZLE TWPWA RDz ............ 5_U553.003. 021_000 GARGOPRZEMV 5|_Aw PETER ........................ 219|_|1'r|_E BEARLN ............... 3,877.,.9 -

HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-T552 -001-345-000 GOMEZ MAE M AND 3,489.80

21-1023 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S7 -006-006-000 GRANT JACQUELINE 163 COMANCHE DR $ 3,886.54 NO BID
21-0962 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5514 -001-411-000 GUAN DEYU CASHAW DR $ 3,160.01 NO BID
21-0856 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-57S9 -005-007-000 HAZLETON KINNEY SHOE CORP SUSQUEHANNA BLVD $ 18,183.53 SOLD - $18,183.53 #275
21-0872 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-T551 -001-583-000 HOEFFLIGER JAMES JOHN JOE CARL J CATAWISSA i$

21-0989 ...... HAZLE TWPWARDZ ............ 6-U5S2 -003-010-000 JACOBS JENNIFER LYNN 56 JANHANNA CIR $

21-0935 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -013-400-000 JAMORABON MARIO & FELY LAUREL VLY $

21-0987 ...... HAZLE TWPWARDZ ............ 6-U5515 -001-507-000 JEDAVID SCOTS PINE $ 3,820‘.‘32

21-0920 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -001-069-000 JOHNSON JOSETTE M CRNR REDBUD DR $ 4,415.43 NO BID
21-1032 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -008-030-000 KELLER MARC J & KAREN G UNAMI CIR $ 3,552.87 NO BID
21-0942 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5512 -001-137-000 KOKUBO CHIKAKO BUTTONBUSH LN $ 5,569.92 NO BID
21-0870 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-398-000 KUPERMAN SUSAN | AND ISAACS SUSAN S MOUNTAINS VIEW DR $  3,144.45 NO BID
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21-0863 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 $26-T551 -001-108-000 LEAL OFELIA & MARCELINO APPALACHIAN WAY P8 1,293.20 } NO BID
21-0874 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -001-600-000 LEE MOON & CHARLES MOUNTAINS VIEW DR $

21.0378 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 .................. - 001.56 2_ 0 oo ..... L| LANP| NG A ND ........................................ Mo U N TA|N V|Ew DR ............. : 5,104.,.5 B

21-0885 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -001-203-000 LIU SHAOMIN $ 1,988.86 NO BID
21-0929 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -002-237-000 MARANAN FRANCISCO V JR LAUREL VALLEY RD 3,412.45 NO BID
21-0888 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T552 -001-326-000 MARCELO ANGELICA & DIWA 3,251.41 NO BID
21-1000 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S4 -001-024-000 MAYUGBA GERONIMO & AURORA 24 PINE VALLEY LN 4,053.16 NO BID
21-0975 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 MEHRA KISHOR & RAJNI BUTTONBUSH LN

210803 HAZLE TWPWARD2 126-U552 -007-008-000  MENDOZA PHILIP M & MARITONNE SEMINOLE IR

21-1010 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S4 -007-044-000 MORTON GEORGE O 161 MUIRFIELD LN

21.0958 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ 5_U55 14_001_ 320_000 - Mo scA R |T0 |_0 N E||_ j . &VANESSA .................. CA MEL |_|A |_N ....................... 3,605.,.11

21-0939 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S12 -001-107-000 MWANGI ELIZABETH & BUTTONBUSH LN 5,010.61 NO BID

21-0884 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T552 -001-164-000 NATIMDIM ERIC N R AND GRACE S 3,670.89 NO BID
21-0990 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S2 -003-016-000 NIGGEBRUGGE ROBERT & DEANNA JANHANNA CIR 5,009.67 NO BID
21-0964 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5514 -001-484-000 ONUOHA JOY EGO & EMMANUEL C WHITE OAK LN 3,757.19 NO BID
21-1012 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -012-030-000 OSTIQUE ROSENDO JR & SOUTHERN HILLS CT

21_1040 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ YT PA | sLEv D AV|Dj ........................................ 70 C RVsTAL RDG ...................

21-1041 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 -003-006-000 PAISLEY DAVID J 69 CRYSTAL RDG

21_1024 ...... HAZLE TWPWA RD 2 .................. _008_ 001_000 . PA QU Eo R 0|_AN DC&CA ROLVN D .................. 194CAD D oDR ..................... 36385

21-0971

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

-001-562-000
26-U5515 -001-116-000

PAREDES FERNANDO AND JASMIN
PAUL ROOPOUTIE AND MUNESHWAR

CRNR BUCK MOUNTAIN BLVD
SWEET BIRCH DRIVE

4,059.06
3,076.86

21-0972 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5515 -001-117-000 PAUL ROOPOUTIE AND MUNESHWAR SWEET BIRCH DRIVE 3,076.86 NO BID
21-0947 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5513 -001-119-000 PINEDA-JOHNSON MAYBELLINE & MAPLE LN 3,272.93 NO BID
21-1025 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S7 -009-017-000 PWANI DAN OLUKO 214 CHIPPEWA DR

21-0877 ...... HAZLETWPWARDZ ............ 6-T551 -001-633-000 RABE RANDY C & NENITA L APPALACHIAN WAY

21-0928 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5510 -002-232-000 RAIZ JESUSA F LAUREL VALLEY RD

21_1030 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ o 558 . _004_ 0 14_000 s RECTO BELLA & RENE .................................. MA N AVUNKAVE .................. 3,829.,.15

21-0930

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U5514 -001-193-000
26-U5510 -003-261-000

REMPONI LUISA
RIVERA LUCILA M

SASSAFRAS LN
LAUREL VALLEY DR

3,949.68
3,949.68

21-1001 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U554 -001-038-000 RODRIGUEZ MCARTHUR & EMMA B PINE VALLEY LN 3,360.39 NO BID
21-0914 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -001-003-000 SAGUIL BERNARDO SILKY WILLOW DR 3,325.88 NO BID
21-0924 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 SALADAGA LUCRECIA LAUREL VALLEY RD

21_0925 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ TP iet sALA DAGA LUC REC|A .................................. LAURELVALLEV RD ................

21-0959 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5514 -001-330-000 SANTIAGO MA THERESA MARLOUE E & CASHAW DRIVE

21.0373 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ 5_T551 _001_59 7_ 0 oo ..... scHuE LE STE FA N M .................................... Mo U N TA|N5 v | Ew . DR ........... 3,929.,.5 -

21-0996

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

6-U5S7 -010-012-000
26-U5S2 -009-001-000

SERQUINA REMEDIOS
SHAUGER DONALD EDWARD

231 CROW ST
CALUMET DR

2,279.46
2,113.08

21-0933 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5510 -011-470-000 SHRESTHA SANJAY K & RASHMI WILD GINGER WAY 7,227.35 NO BID
21-0940 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5512 -001-122-000 SHRESTHA SANJAY K AND RASHMI BUTTONBUSH LN 3,915.19 NO BID
21-0941 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 SHRESTHA SANJAY K AND RASHMI BUTTONBUSH LN

21_0991 ...... HAZ |_F_ TWPWA RD 2 ............ sm|TH W| |_L|AM WJR & LA U RA ..................... j.zs cAl_UmF_T D R .................

21-0866 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 SUAZO EMMANUEL B & ANELYN C BUCK MOUNTAIN BLVD

21_1015 ...... HAZLE TWPWA RDz ............ PR TEVES ESTF_LAN|EF ..................................... RoYALABERDEEN DR ............ 3,199...2 4

21-0892

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

-001-004-000
-001-361-000

26-T552

TOLENTINO ISMAEL G & VIVIAN V
VIADO JANET & ALYANA

KICKAPOO DR
SPRING MTN RD

2,050.18
2,521.06

21-0880 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551 -001-667-000 WAINWRIGHT STEVEN D & CARRIE M MOUNTAINS VIEW DR 3,906.54 NO BID

21-0890 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T552 -001-337-000 WOINAR CRAIG AND 3,852.05 NO BID

21-1009 HAZLE TWP WARD 2 6-U5S4 -007-040-000 YARCIA ANALYN & RITCHIE MUIRFIELD LN

21-2458 ...... HAZLETONCITVWARDZ ...... 1-T8SW31-015-010-000 :NORTHEAST KITCHES INC 41 E CHESTNUT ST

21-2480 HAZLETON CITY WARD 3 1-U8BNW21-016-007-000 :FERMIN JEFENI L 321 E BEECH ST

21-2506 ...... HAZLETONCITVWARDS ...... 1-U8NW44-001-045-000 : KOKINDA JAMES & PATRICIA 45 NEWPORT DR 4,654‘.‘09 SOLD-$4,65409 ........... # 370 .......

HAZLETON CITY WARD 5

1-U8SNW44-001-013-001

MORALES DAVID & VIGILLO

13 NEWPORT DRIVE

3,318.99

SOLD - $3,318.99

21-2505 HAZLETON CITY WARD 5 71-USNW44-001-029-000 :ROJAS RAUL 29 NEWPORT DR $ 4,605.92 SOLD - $4,605.92 #370
21-2498 HAZLETON CITY WARD 5 71-T8SW43-015-009-000 :RUIZ MIGUEL 127 S LAUREL ST $ 8,307.94 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21-2499 HAZLETON CITY WARD 5 71-T85SW43-015-09A-000 :RUIZ MIGUEL 124 S MANHATTEN CT $  3,206.39 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
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21-2554 HAZLETON CITY WARD 11 $71-T8SW11-013-011-001 i SCHNORR MARK 606 W 1ST ST i$ 807845 } SOLD - $33,000 #312
21-2572 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 1-T7SE22-002-004-000 HALYE PATRICIA 614 LINCOLN ST $ SOLD - $26,500 #312
21-2576 ...... HAZLETONCITVWARDIZ ..... 1-T8NW11-002-009-000 :IMHOF ALICE M 986 N LOCUST ST $ 4,452‘.‘33 SOLD—$13,000 ............... # 150 .......
21-2577 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 1-T8NW11-002-010-000 :IMHOF ALICE M 986-988 LOCUST ST $ 10,591.41 SOLD - $63,000 #370
21-2613 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 71-T8NW44-018-003-000 :KOCH JOAN 654 656 N JAMES ST 22,377.04 SOLD—$69,000 ............... # 370 .......
21-2561 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 71-T7NE31-001-004-000 :METZGER JEFFREY E MCNAIR ST 24,295.63 NO BID

21-2562 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 71-T7NE31-001-006-000 :METZGER JEFFREY E FIFTEENTH ST 19,128.98 NO BID

21-2563 HAZLETON CITY WARD 12 1-T7NE31-001-007-000 :METZGER JEFFREY E 1235 W FIFTEENTH ST

212628 {HAZLETON CITY WARD 13 :71-T8NW31-005-001-000 ;SHOEMAKER STEPHEN & LIZANNE SEYBERTST

21-2622 HAZLETON CITY WARD 13 1-T8NW24-007-007-000 :TARSELLI THOMAS J 775 N LAUREL ST

21-2639 ...... HAZLETONCITVWARD14 ..... 1-T8NE44-015-005-000 :NOVITSKY EDWARD F & ELEANOR M 530 HARRISON ST 14,238.84 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-2640 HAZLETON CITY WARD 14 1-T8NE44-015-01A-000 :SALUTA STELLA V 539 FREEMONT CT 6,817.75 SOLD - $6817.75 #275

21-2674 HAZLETON CITY WARD 15 71-USNW42-002-028-000 : MARTONICK ANDREW & VERNA 119 CARLETON AVE $  4,607.00 NO BID
21-1096 HUNLOCK TWP 29-H5 -00A-12D-000 KEPHART DEAN AND BRENDA VIZCARONDO 478 SORBERTOWN RD $ 12,339.02 SOLD - $32,500 #275
21-1102 HUNLOCK TWP 29-15 -00A-051-000 RUMMAGE HILDA MAIN RD $ 1,470.99 SOLD - $37,500 #11
21-1140 HUNTINGTON TWP -00A-016-000 GOWER KEITH 530 STATE ROUTE 239 i$ REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21_1139 ...... HUNT|NGTON TWP ............. .:ooA.013.ooo GOWER KE| THGLENN ................................. 5405TATE R ouTEz39 ............ : i REMOVED. pA | D |NF U|_|_ ......................
21-1127 HUNTINGTON TWP -00A-31A-000 KRAMER DARIN M & WENDY C REGISTER RD $
21.1153 ...... jAcKsoNTWP .00A.48A.ooo ...... jAMEsTHoMAs&mENE ............................. ZZOWEAVERTOWNRD ........... : 13'213.'.45
21-1185 JENKINS TWP -T01-401-000 BELLONE ANTHONY 401 HEATHER HIGHLANDS $ 1,119.91 NO BID
21-1167 JENKINS TWP 33-E1151 -015-013-000 BOHN FREDERICK IV 115 GAFFNEY DR $ 7,496.97 SOLD-$7,49697 .............. # 214 .......
21-1179 JENKINS TWP 33-F11 -T01-031-000 CONNELL JOSEPH & 31 HEATHER HIGHLANDS $ 730.79 NO BID
21-1208 JENKINS TWP 33-F1258 -003-005-000 COSTELLO JOSEPH G & COSTANZO JOANN NEW BOSTON RD $ 2,052.72 NO BID
JENKINS TWP 3-F12 -001-13B-000 JEC LAND TRUST WESTMINISTER RD i$
JENKINS TWP 3-F1151 -001-001-000 MONKO ALBERT G & ALBERT G JR $
21-1198 JENKINS TWP 3-F11510-001-20D-000  :WHISPERING WOODS HOMEOWNERS ASSOC $
21-1199 ...... JENKINSTWP .................... 3-F11510-001-20E-000 WHISPERING WOODS HOMEOWNERS ASSOC $ 1,237...20
21-1224 KINGSTON BORO WARD 1 4-G9SW3 -002-015-000 : MARSH BARBARA 40 PAYNE AVE $ 12,999.09 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-1222 KINGSTON BORO WARD 1 34-G9SE4 -001-013-000 MUNICIPALITY OF KINGSTON 130 CUBA ST $ 6,980.32 NO BID

21-1265 KINGSTON BORO WARD 6 34-G9SE4 -006-015-000 MACKESY BLAKE 394 RIDGE ST $ 11,845.94 NO BID

21-1311 KINGSTON TWP 35-E9 -00A-009-304 COLLETT WILLIAM & MARGARET 310 ECHO VALLEY DR $ 5,349.58 SOLD - $5,349.58 #206
21-1287 KINGSTON TWP 5-E853 -002-004-000 DALE F W HALE ST i$ NO BID

21_1323 ...... K|NG5TONTWP .................. T NIy T ATT: P, : NoB|D .................................
21-1297 KINGSTON TWP GLASSER CHARLES J & ANNA 12 W CENTER ST $ NO BID

21_1315 ...... K| N GsToN TWP .................. KW ASTAV|CH sTANLEY L F_TAL ....................... 227CARVERTON RD .............. $ioeees . 50|_D - 553_000 ............... # 143 .......

KINGSTON TWP MUZZY LAURA 116 OWL DR $ 3,303.85 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-1335 LAFLIN BORO 36-F1257 -001-012-000 AMB INVESTMENTS OF PA INC. Route 00315 $ 5,397.80 NO BID

21-1337 LAKE TWP 37-C5 -00A-39F-000 COVERT JACK P ETAL ASPEN LN $ 5,038.62 SOLD - $5,038.62 #361
21-1363 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 2 38-H8S3 -001-57A-022 EVERHART LEONARD & DARLENE 35 MIDTOWN VLG $ 1,541.08 NO BID

21-1361 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 2 -001-53A-000 GEORGE ANDREA 386 1/2 CARVER ST i$

21_1394 ...... LARKSV| |_ LEBoRo WARD 4 .......... _005_ 003_000 ..... |TR|AVEN TUREs |_L c ................................... 104 na rmws rd ..................... :

21-1393 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4 -008-13A-000 MILLER SARAH J LANCE HILL RD $

211378 LARKSVILLE BOROWARD 4 :38-H8S5_ ~004-05B-000  SHAWNEE READY MIX CONCRETECO OFFMAINST $ 447,803.65

21-1397 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 5 -004-027-000 ELLSWORTH ASA & MARIAN 70 E BROADWAY ST $ 14,837.52 NO BID

21-1402 LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7 38-G9S1 -004-010-000 WHITE CARLJR 21 FRANKLIN ST 15,544.48 NO BID
21-1425 LAUREL RUN BORO 39-110 -T01-127-000 CADDEN SUSAN 127 LAUREL RUN EST 1,016.08 NO BID
21-1422 LAUREL RUN BORO 39-110 -T01-112-001 LETTEER BERNICE 112 LAUREL RUN EST 4,132.16 NO BID

LEHMAN TWP

0-G5 -T02-011-000

KITCHEN JAMES

17 COUNTRY CREST LN

LEHMAN TWP 0-G6S2 -004-04A-000 LABUS STANLEY & J T WAWRZYNSKI MAPLE ST
21-1505 LUZERNE BORO WARD 4 1-F9SE4 -002-008-000 RED GATE REAL ESTATE CO LLC MAIN ST
21-1506 ...... LUZERNEBOROWARD4 ....... 1-F9SE4 -002-009-000 RED GATE REAL ESTATE CO LLC MAIN ST 11,069.66
21-1535 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4 2-J7NW1 -005-013-000 :ODONNELL ANN MARIE 32 MINDEN CT 5,217.31 NO BID

21-1559 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 6 42-J7SE1 -019-001-000 LEE DONNA MARIE 101 E GREEN ST $ 19,626.04 SOLD - $19,626.04 #52
21-1563 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 7 42-J7NW3 -005-019-000 :LYNCH DONNA M 121 ORCHARD ST $ 833094 SOLD - $8,330.94 #79
21-1575 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8 42-K751 -012-015-000 AUDI MANAGEMENT LLC 109 WELLES ST $ 14,990.47 NO BID
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21-1594 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 $42-J7SE1 -027-015-000 WASHINGTON NANTICOKE LLC 540 S MARKET ST 18 22,896.71 } NO BID

21-1595 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 2-J7SE1 -027-016-000 WASHINGTON NANTICOKE LLC 8 W RIDGE ST $ 16,191.79 NO BID

21.1511 ...... NANT|COKEC|TVWARD11 2_J7sw2_008_038_000 BADowsK“osEPH .................................... 178w R|DGEST ................... 56,64077 50|_D_$1s_500 ............... # 387 .......

21-1615 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 2-J7SW2 -012-035-000 DAUKSIS ROBERT J 417 W MAIN ST $ 9,651.81 SOLD - $9,651.81 #396

21-1626 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 42-J7SW3 -009-002-000 MALAVENDA DAVID 435 W UNION ST $ 952214 SOLD—$13,000 ............... # 390 .......

21-1606 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 42-J7SW2 -007-002-000 MURPHY CHRIS 185 W CHURCH ST $ 21,274.77 SOLD - $21,274.77 #275

21-1619 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 42-J7SW2 -015-009-000 RUTTER DENNIS & SUSAN 159 W BROAD ST $ 11,391.42 SOLD - $11,391.42 #34

21-1614 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 2-J7SW2 -009-040-000  :WALKO JAMES R FAIRCHILD ST i$ NO BID

21.1530 ...... NANT|COKEC|TVWARD12 KAROSHELENJ ......................................... 3QWR|DGEST ..................... : som.szs_ooo ............... ”34 ........

21-1635 NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12 KOPIAK DOROTHY & DONNA & NICOLE 1215 NEW GRANT ST $ REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21.1559 ...... NEsco PEC K Twp ................ BURG ERMA R VJANE ................................... 445 BE RW|C K H AZLETON H wv . : 4,829.,.14 RE MoVED - pA | D |N F U|_|_ ......................
NEWPORT TWP WARD 1 AUDI MANAGEMENT LLC 228 ROBERTS ST $ 19,305.93 NO BID

21-1678 NEWPORT TWP WARD 1 46-K654 -005-13A-000 SUTTON JOHN ALLEN 137 BROWN ROW $ 5,158.04 NO BID
21-1720 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S2 -005-006-000 JAD UNLIMITED LLC E MAIN ST $ 1,129.34 NO BID
21-1707 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S1 -022-008-000 LOUIS HOGARTH 82 W MAIN ST $ 29,902.11 NO BID
21-1693 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 -007-019-000 MARTIN KEVIN J & 6 ROCK ST i$ SOLD - $6,023.43 #34
2111714 INEWPORTTWP WARD2 -003-015-000 | MELNIKOV OLEG 20 ENGLE ST $ TUsolD-$5,696.90 & W
21-1711 NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 -025-009-000 PRZEKOP PETER 75 W MAIN ST $ SOLD - $4,558.98
21.1708 ...... NEWPORT TWPWA RDZ ............. 3 023_030_000 ..... R|o S A LBERTA .......................................... 17 RA||_ROADST ................... : 7,075...7 B
$

NUANGOLA BORO

-008-044-000

CANNON JOHN J

GAY RDG

1,075.15

21-1743 NUANGOLA BORO 47-L851 -008-046-000 CANNON JOHN J GAY RDG $ SOLD - $986.68

21-1744 NUANGOLA BORO 47-L851 -008-047-000 GITTENS MATTHEW GAY RDG $ 5,275.75 NO BID

21-1745 NUANGOLA BORO 47-.851 -009-12C-000 STORM CP & A PAUL NUANGOLA RD $ 5,408.66 NO BID

21-1750 NUANGOLA BORO -001-031-000 STORM C P AND A PAUL HIGH ST i$ NO BID

211747 INUANGOLABORO . -003-010-000 _ :ZIELINSKI THOMAS MEVERS ST $ 'SolD-$17,600.68 wrs
21-3406 PENN LAKE PARK BORO 5-N1252 -002-002-000 MCGUIRE EDWARD V 1530 LAKEVIEW DR $ SOLD - $60,000 #38
21-2684 ...... PITI'STONCITVWARDZ ....... 2-D11SE3-04B-008-000 :BURNSIDE THOMAS P LYNNE DR $ 2,895.38 SOLD-$Z,89538 .............. #99 ........
21-2680 PITTSTON CITY WARD 2 2-D11SE2-005-030-000 :POPLAWSKI MATTHEW S 599 N MAIN ST $ 15,841.44 NO BID

21-2691 PITTSTON CITY WARD 3 72-D11SE3-011-011-000 :BRUCE DOUGLAS 385 N MAIN ST $ 19,912.68 NO BID
21-2693 PITTSTON CITY WARD 3 72-E11NE2-014-013-000 :VEBINA CESAR A 273 N MAIN ST $ 10,696.20 NO BID
21-2698 PITTSTON CITY WARD 4 72-E11NE2-016-023-000 :BOOS JOHN W & MARYLOU 2 DRUMMOND ST $ 9,794.90 i REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21-2709 PITTSTON CITY WARD 4 2-E11NE2-023-003-000 :DIAMOND CITY PROPERTIES LLC 9 PARSONAGE ST i$

21.2708 ...... P|1TSTONC|TVWARD4 ....... i 2.E11N52.ozi:i‘)45_ooo MAUKMUHAMMADS ................................ 18MORGAN|_N .................... :

21-2720 PITTSTON CITY WARD 5 2-E11NE3-004-025-000 :BURNSIDE ROBERT & ANGIE 100 MILL ST $

21-2736 PITTSTON CITY WARD 6 2-E11NE3-029-01A-000 :ORTH MATTHEW J & GUARNIERI ELAINE 97 CARROLL ST $ 18,374.61 NO BID
21-2727 PITTSTON CITY WARD 6 2-E11NE3-003-018-000 :OWEN MILTON 30 CARROLL ST $ 17,983.32 NO BID

21-2728 PITTSTON CITY WARD 6 72-E11NE3-003-019-000 :OWEN MILTON CARROLL ST $ 2,709.40 NO BID
21-2739 PITTSTON CITY WARD 7 72-E11NE3-011-006-000 :LAVELLE PAUL 135 BROAD ST $ 11,618.61 NO BID
21-2751 PITTSTON CITY WARD 9 72-E11SE1-007-01B-000 :YOCKERS PATRICIA A & CHARLES A ALLY PINE ST $  4,060.94 NO BID
21-2757 PITTSTON CITY WARD 10 2-E11SE1-030-002-000 READSOTO INVESTMENT COMPANY 5 E COLUMBUS AVE i$

212769 IPITISTON CITY WARD 11 172-E11SE1-018-012-000  iDIAMOND CITY PROPERTIES LLC 8SPLANKST $

21-2001 PITTSTON TWP 1-D13 -00A-000-000 JUST ANTHONY + JOSEPHINE YATESVILLE TRL $

21_2002 ...... P| 1'rsToN TWP ................... A 13 - ooA.ooo. 001 ..... jUsT A NTHoNv ETux .................................. RoUT E 315 ......................... S ey

21-2012 PITTSTON TWP 1-E11SE2-002-17A-000 :PAGLIANITE ERMA ROCK ST $ 5,024.44 NO BID
21-2004 PITTSTON TWP 51-D1351 -001-31D-005 :WEBB LEONARD & AUDREY 167A GLENDALE RD $ SOLD-$1,500 ............... #47 ........
21-1926 PLAINS TWP WARD 1 50-F10S1 -011-014-000 RILEY MAUREEN A 625 N MAIN ST $  2,920.56 NO BID
21-1928 PLAINS TWP WARD 1 50-F10SE4-001-017-000 STEPHENS DONNA & KENNETH JR ROBERTS ST $  2,441.50 NO BID
21-1929 PLAINS TWP WARD 1 0-F10SE4-001-16A-000 ;STEPHENS DONNA & KENNETH JR ROBERT ST i$

211852 IPLAINS TWPWARD 3 {50.G11INWA4-004-017-000 }SECRETARY OF VETERANS AFFAIRS SUNIONST $

21-1966 PLAINS TWP WARD 6 0-G1ONE4-034-025-000 :TOKACH EILEEN JEAN 13 N MAIN ST $

21-1974 ...... PLAINS TWPWARDS .......... 0-G1ONE4-009-008-000 :NIKOLOFF JOHN 23 BANK ST $ 2,317‘.‘49

21-1995 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 0-G11S5 -003-021-000 E & P HENDRICKS BRIAR CREEK RD $ 1,136.28 NO BID

21-1985 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 50-G10SE2-006-13A-000 :HORTON TYLER CLEVELAND ST $ 2,978.95 NO BID
21-1976 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 50-G10SE2-005-009-000 :KARG KIMBERLY 199 FIRST ST $ 5,746.81 SOLD - $22,500 #275
21-2000 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 50-H11S2 -001-004-000 MANTUSH PATRICK L & BETTY JO 38 LITCHEY DR $  1,934.96 NO BID
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21-1983 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 $50-G10SE2-006-04D-000 i RUGGERE EDWIN & CONSTANCE 94 REAR CLEVELAND ST i$ 529974 } NO BID

21-1987 PLAINS TWP WARD 10 0-G11 -T01-031-000 TERPAK SHARON 31 E MOUNTAIN RIDGE MHP $ 658.25 NO BID

21.1762 ...... PLVMoUTHBoROWARD1 s_H8553.004.053.000 MACR|W||_|_|AMV& 5H|R|_EVM ..................... 59MECHAN|C5|_N ................. 54,0375 = NOB|D .................................
21-1763 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1 8-H8SE3 -004-05C-000 MACRI WILLIAM V & SHIRLEY M 59 1/2 MECHANICS ALY $ 4,335.09 NO BID

21-1761 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1 48-H8SE3 -004-005-000 ROMANOSKI FRANCIS 55 MECHANICS LN $ 4,272.36 SOLD-$4,27236 .............. # 358 .......
21-1777 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3 48-H8SE4 -024-018-000 DOBLADO ANIZXO | & BENIGNO 159 WILLOW ST $ 5,061.53 SOLD - $7,000 #387
21-1771 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3 48-H8SE2 -002-015-000 HENRY DAVID JOSEPH SST $ 10,946.61 NO BID

21-1788 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 5 8-H8SE4 -044-018-000 RIVERS MELISSA 127 W MAIN ST i$

21-1785 ...... PLVMOUTHBOROWARDS 8-H8SE4 -029-08A-000 SHONK GEORGE & CHERYL 10 ACADEMY ST $

21-1792 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6 8-H8SE4 -019-010-000 DOUBLER BAYT INVESTMENT GROUP CORP 121 ACADEMY ST $

21-1831 ...... PLVMOUTHBOROWARD9 8-H8SE4 -037-014-000 DOBLADO ANIXA | & BENIGNO 90 HIGH ST $ 8,043.25

21-1825 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9 8-H8SE1 -012-001-000 JALOUDI BASSAM 106 ADJ SHAWNEE AVE $ 1,772.72 NO BID

21-1826 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 9 48-H8SE1 -015-012-000 TATTERSALL JOSEPH & RICHARD JR 27 CAMBRIA ST $ 1,976.25 NO BID

21-1839 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11 48-H8SE1 -006-001-000 OBRIEN TED L 276 GARDNER ST $ 5,762.59 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-1848 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12 48-H8SW3 -005-018-000 :NOVAK HENRIETTA (ESTATE) NOTTINGHAM ST $ 1,028.65 NO BID

21-1856 PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13 8-H8SW3 -015-013-000 ;PROIETTO JAMES P & RUTH E TEMPERANCE ST i$

21.1399 ...... PLVMoUTH Tw P ................ Doy .005.0‘;0 o BLAZ|C|( LEoNARDRETAL ............................ 3835 POPLARST .................. :

21-1889 PLYMOUTH TWP 9-1753 -005-015-000 HIGH ROAD PROPERTIES LLC 1256 HIGH ST $

21.1377 ...... PLVMoUTH Tw P ................ 9_|7.s. 2 _001_ 001_000 ...... jANUSZEW5K| Z|G MUND E & D oN N A .............. Po P LAR sT .......................... : 4,617.,.9 "

21-1875 PLYMOUTH TWP 9-17S1A -003-06A-000 JOYCE GERALD P & LINDA J Route 00011 $ 1,665.61 NO BID

21-1921 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1851A -013-023-000 KUPREVICH MARY E ETAL MILTON AVE $ NO BID
21-1906 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1851 -003-002-000 PEARSON SUSAN ET AL HUNLOCK ST $ SOLD - $794.78 #61
21-1907 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1851 -003-004-000 SKUDALSKI MARYANN + JOSEPH F HUNLOCK ST $ SOLD - $794.78 #61
21-1905 PLYMOUTH TWP 9-1851 -003-001-000 SUSAN PEARSON ET AL HUNLOCK ST i$ SOLD - $794.78 #61
21.1390 ...... PLVMoUTHTwP ................ Doy .02;\‘.‘005.000 TROTHW||_L|AMB|V .................................. 175HARV EvsT .................... : i REMoVED.pA|D|NFU|_|_ ......................
21-1919 PLYMOUTH TWP 9-1851A -006-013-000 VITALE JOSEPH S 1ll MAX AVE $ NO BID
21_1920 ...... PLVMoUTHTwP ................ 9_|851A.009_03A.000 V|TA|_EJOSF_PHS||| .................................... MAXA\[E ........................... $ s NOB|D .................................
21-1922 PLYMOUTH TWP 9-1851A -013-11A-000 VITALE JOSEPH S 1ll MILTON AVE $ 1,399.31 NO BID
21-1885 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1752 -012-028-000 WBL SPE Il LLC 39 ALLEN ST $ 40,245.72 NO BID
21-1902 PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1757 -001-002-000 WBL SPE Il LLC 12 S MILL ST $ 13,262.52 NO BID
21-2039 PRINGLE BORO 52-G9S2 -003-024-000 ALDAOUD FADWA ABDELGAHNI 29 MCANDREW ST $  4,041.07 NO BID

RICE TWP 3-M8 -00A-11E-103 HUNLOCK KEVIN & MARY 77 VALLEY STREAM PARK i$ NO BID

ROSS TWP -00A-034-000 BENOSKI ANN MARIE KYTTLE PIKE $ SOLD-$13,87233 ............. #89 ........
21-2089 ROSS TWP -00A-35E-000 H YOUNG ASSET PROTECTION TRUST BLOOMINGDALE RD $ SOLD - $15,500 #162
21.2064 ...... RossTWP ........................ TR T e PR : 10_573‘_‘98 NOB|D .................................

$

SALEM TWP -T02-047-000 BENSHOFF CLAUDIA KATHLEEN & 47 2ND LN 1,261.96

21-2092 SALEM TWP 55-1451 -023-002-000 COSTANZO ANTHONY 1096 SHICKSHINNY VALLEY RD 4,643.12 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-2128 SALEM TWP 55-P4 -00A-002-000 TAVOC IOSIF AND CLAUDIA 4032 MARKET ST 6,782.93 NO BID

21-2119 SALEM TWP 55-P3NW1 -002-011-000 :WYSHINSKIJOHN & PROXIDA 931 BELAIR DR 14,805.04 SOLD - $62,000 #152
21-2143 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 3 6-L4SE1 -001-015-000 WHITEBREAD JOSHUA CHARLES 125 W UNION ST REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

21-2147 SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 4

6-L4SE4 -002-14A-000

MANGINO LOUIS S MAIN ST

21-2149 SLOCUM TWP 7-L7 -00A-17K-000 RINEHIMER MICHAEL AND SUSAN SLOCUM RD
21_2155 ...... slocumTWP .................... 7_M6_00 A_21B_ooo ..... ZA\[ADA PAUL&CATHERmEMETAL ............... OFFSLOCUMRD ................... 1,110...3 -
21-2223 SUGAR NOTCH BORO 0-J9SW1 -004-032-000 LAWSON WILLIAM + MARIE 572 R MAIN ST 8,792.61 NO BID
21-2216 SUGAR NOTCH BORO 60-J8SE3 -001-05A-000 RICHARDS MARK 900 REAR MAIN ST $ 2,815.64 NO BID
21-2161 SUGARLOAF TWP 58-Q551 -004-005-000 BRUCE MATT REAR OLD BERWICK HWY $ 2,914.67 SOLD - $2,914.67 #87
21-2158 SUGARLOAF TWP 58-Q5 -00A-20R-000 HERBAL VYBZ LLC OAK RD $ 3,362.94 SOLD - $3,362.94 #87
21-2187 SWOYERSVILLE WARD 1 9-F10NW4-007-015-000 ; DEMJANOVICH MIKE & MARY 22 HILL ST i$
21-2211 ...... SWOVERSVILLEWARD3 ....... SCOTT DARAH LYNN & DOUGLAS SCOTT 32 BRODERICK ST $
21-2254 UNION TWP CRAGLE KEVIN PAUL 86 MCKENDREE RD $
21.2235 ...... UN|0NTWP ...................... FToRKow5K|ENTERPR|sEs .......................... SENECA .............................. : 11_523‘_‘3 5
$

UNION TWP FTORKOWSKI ENTERPRISES MAIN 5,730.17

21-2244 UNION TWP 61-J4 -00A-37A-000 HAUK CHERYL ANN 329 REYBURN RD $ 9,755.52 NO BID
21-2278 WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 63-T7NE3 -015-013-000 PERALTA NELSON & 15 E MADISON AVE $ 8,451.03 SOLD - $8,451.03 #52
21-2276 WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 63-T7NE1 -005-020-000 PICHARDO WENDY Y & ELIZABETH Y BROAD ST $ 1,592.03 NO BID

Page 7 of 8




21-2279 WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 $63-T7NE3 -016-005-000 VARGAS ROBERTO E N BROAD ST 1S 272067 } NO BID
21-2280 WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 3-T7NE3 -016-006-000 VARGAS ROBERTO E N BROAD ST 1,830.19 NO BID
21-2290 WEST HAZLETON WARD 3 3-T7SE1 -003-002-000 HERNANDEZ JESUS 336 W GREEN ST 14,183.09 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL

WEST PITTSTON WARD 2

5-E11NE4-017-001-000

ARDOLINE MICHAEL & LOUISE

615 THIRD ST 14,187.49

21-2354 WEST PITTSTON WARD 2 65-E11NW3-001-003-000 :KOURY ANDREA 923 TUNKHANNOCK AVE $ 7,366.20 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21-2337 WEST PITTSTON WARD 2 65-E11NE1-012-017-000 :LIW INVESTMENTS INC 504 WYOMING AVE $ 35,677.92 : REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21-2345 WEST PITTSTON WARD 2 65-E11NE1-024-023-000 :ORGIE JUDITHH 310 MONTGOMERY AVE $ 12,244.05 NO BID
21-2340 WEST PITTSTON WARD 2 5-E11NE1-015-008-000 ;WILLIAMS JEAN M & JOHN J 326 FRANKLIN ST i$
21-2371 ...... WESTWVOMINGBORO ........ F 6—E105E1—016‘-‘6 2-000 DEMARCO PAUL F & MARY ANN 453 HOLDEN ST $
21-2398 WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1 :68-P12NW1-032-005-000 :BOVE MICHAEL 410 BUFFALO ST $
21-2408 ...... WILKES-BARRETWP ............ 9-H10S5 -001-14A-000 COLORS HOSPITALITY LLC MUNDY ST $ 5,041‘.‘08
21-2439 WILKES-BARRE TWP 9-19SE2 -006-008-000 DUBINSKY EDWARD & HELEN 165 NICHOLSON ST $ 14,849.73 SOLD - $66,000 #275
21-2434 WILKES-BARRE TWP 69-19SE2 -004-014-000 HOUSSEIN FISAL & HANA 222 NICHOLSON ST $ 9,780.04 SOLD—$Z4,000 ............... #73 ........
21-2441 WILKES-BARRE TWP 69-19SE2 -007-09G-000 TORRES LUIS A & PETRA 112 SOLOMON ST $ 11,372.93 SOLD - $61,000 #314
21-2782 WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 73-H10NW1-004-027-000 :BASAN ANTONIO SOSA 21 O'NEILL AVE $ 11,699.37 i REMOVED - PAID IN FULL
21-2794 WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 3-H1ONW4-004-021-000 : MMS HOLDING GROUP CORP 41 COURTRIGHT AVE i$ SOLD - $15,000 #340
21_2795 ...... W| LKES.BARREWARD 1 ....... i 10Nw4_004:623_000 TEAMGET | TDo N ELLC ............................... 45 cou RTR|GHT sT ............... P ey 50|_D_ . 516_500 ............... # 270 .......
21-2820 WILKES-BARRE WARD 2 3-H10SW2-010-045-000 :DE LA CRUZ EDUVIGES REAR GRANT ST $ NO BID
21-2807 ...... WILKES-BARREWARDZ ....... 3-H10SW1-010-018-000 :GILROY STEVEN D & ERIN M 148 SCOTT ST $ 8,462...94 SOLD B $Z3,500 ............... # 292 .......
21-2827 WILKES-BARRE WARD 2 3-H10SW2-014-022-000 :WALLACE CHRISTOPHER R 272 SCOTT ST $ 8,758.02 SOLD - $21,500 #244
21-2869 WILKES-BARRE WARD 3 73-110NW1-004-047-000 :DOMINGUEZ PERALTA LUZ DILENIA & 15 DOCK LN $ 8,172.57 SOLD—$16,000 ............... # 275 .......
21-2867 WILKES-BARRE WARD 3 73-110NW1-004-026-000 :WEIHBRECHT SHARON LEE 16 N EMPIRE ST $  6,605.12 SOLD- $6,605.12 #330
21-2957 WILKES-BARRE WARD 9 73-110NW1-022-022-000 :PRICE JOELD 419 421 E NORTHAMPTON ST $ 9,926.39 SOLD - $20,500 #73
21-3009 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 3-HISE4 -023-016-000 GUERRERO GERSON 437 S RIVER ST i$ SOLD - $16,500 #34
21-3019 ...... WILKES-BARREWARDlZ ...... '3-HISE4 -027-037-000 HORNLEIN DONALD E & JANET 541 SRIVER ST $ SOLD-$1,69176 .............. #34 ........
21-3020 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 3-HISE4 -027-038-000 HORNLEIN DONALD E & JANET S RIVER ST $ SOLD - $1,545.27
21-3024 ...... WILKES-BARREWARDlZ ...... '3-HISE4 -033-005-000 ONE STOP SHOP RENOVATIONS LLC 38 MONROE ST $ 17,456.51

$

WILKES-BARRE WARD 12

3-HISE4 -033-035-000

REID JAMIE

19 ELIZABETH ST 3,081.91

21-3011 WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-HI9SE4 -024-020-000 STEWART ROBERT A 403 S FRANKLIN ST $ 24,112.00 SOLD - $24,112 #305
21-3086 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -034-033-000 AUDI MANAGEMENT LLC 150 DANA ST $ 30,912.65 NO BID

21-3087 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -034-039-000 AUDI MANAGEMENT LLC 21 FOGEL LN $  1,260.64 SOLD - $1,260.64 #47
21-3061 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE2 -012-019-000 BOYD RICHARD A & MARY R 330 PARK AVE i$ SOLD - $15,500 #268
21-3101 ...... WILKES-BARREWARD13 ...... 3-19NE3 -011-001-000 CT CONNELL PROPERTIES LLC 280 SHERIDAN ST $ NOBID .................................
21-3102 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE3 -011-002-000 CT CONNELL PROPERTIES LLC 485 DANA ST $ SOLD - $8,000 #73
21-3067 ...... WILKES-BARREWARD13 ...... 3-19NE2 -021-012-000 CONCEPCION LISSETTE C VENTURA LEHIGH ST $ 2,745‘.‘22 NOBID .................................
21-3057 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE1 -037-015-000 GEORGE DONALD E & JACQUELINE 36 MOYALLEN ST $ 6,686.25 SOLD - $16,000 #275
21-3044 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1 -008-005-000 MESSERSMITH GEORGE D & WENDY S 38 BELLLN 734211 § SOLD-$734211 .............. # 275 .......
21-3052 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1 -026-012-000 PACHUCKI ROBERTA 79 GROVE ST 4,766.91 BIDDER FORFIET

21-3048 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1 -025-018-000 SHIMKOSKI STANLEY & DONNA J 57 GROVE ST 6,983.05 SOLD - $7,500 #127
21-3050 WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 3-19NE1 -025-18A-000 WALLACE RALPH & ROSEMARY 55 GROVE ST SOLD - $13,000 #141
213178 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 3-19NE4 -033-01C-000 | BROWN DWAYNE 325 BLACKMAN ST TUSolD- $6,159.63 w330
21-3119 WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 3-19NE1 -024-003-000 LOUIS WEIHBRECHT ETAL 650 S MAIN ST NO BID

21-3153 ...... WILKES-BARREWARD14 ...... 3-1I9NE4 -009-011-000 METZGER JEFFREY E 352 BLACKMAN ST 30,071‘.‘53 NOBID .................................
21-3246 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 3-I9NW2 -018-031-000 :DELOS-SANTOS RAISBEL 157 WALLER ST 9,607.05 BIDDER FORFIET

21-3222 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-19NE1 -022-011-000 GILMORE TIMOTHY 54 OREGON ST $ 11,119.21 SOLD—$15,500 ............... #54 ........
21-3232 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-1I9NW1 -005-026-000 :KUTZ RICHARD 22 REAR SIMPSON ST $ 9,027.67 NO BID

21-3206 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-H9SW3 -036-009-000 :PHILISTINE JOS & ROSE 43 ADJ CORLEAR ST $ 1,780.39 NO BID

21-3223 WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 3-19NE1 -022-06A-000 WEIHBRECHT LOUIS MAX RACE ST i$ NO BID

21-3323 ...... WILKES-BARREWARD16 ...... 3-H10SW1-005-009-000 :KASPER DONALD 231 N WASHINGTON ST $ g REMOVED-PAIDINFUI.L ......................
21-3275 WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 3-HIONW2-011-006-000 :KOSCIELSKI CELIA 782 N PENNA AVE $ SOLD - $11,000 #206
21-3327 ...... WILKES-BARREWARD16 ...... 3-H10SW1-006-003-000 :MASKINAS FABIAN 27 WYOMING ST $ 10,560‘.‘25 SOLD—$11,500 ............... #73 ........
21-3308 WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 3-H10NW4-006-028-000 :SAMH & JACK LLC 36 BUTLER ST $ 1,633.62 BIDDER FORFIET

21-3351 WILKES-BARRE WARD 19 73-G10SE1-003-010-000 :GILROY PHILLIP S & JOAN A 226 ST CLAIR ST $ 8,246.81 SOLD—$35,000 ............... # 275 .......
21-2305 WRIGHT TWP 64-M9510 -00A-008-000 :BURKE JOHN A & PEGGY A ELBE RD $ 2,519.47 NO BID

21-2308 WRIGHT TWP 64-N8S1 -005-003-000 MYERS DAVID L JR 13 ORCHARD ST $ 6,651.46 SOLD - $7,500 #171
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