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NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Northeast Revenue Service, LLC as agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE
under the Pennsylvania Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 25th day of October, 2018 in the Auxiliary Gym of King’s
College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 North Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The properties exposed to sale will be sold Free & Clear of
all tax and municipal claims, mortgages, liens, charges and estates of whatsoever kind, except ground rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every
reasonable effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST
and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without guarantee of warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on
behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. Inaccordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to
the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting
on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.

3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord
license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the owner shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.
TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording costs shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is

completed and must be made in the form of cash, certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the close of business
on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing a property in any sale the bidder shall not be
permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and the matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under the
Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.
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Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN ON THE DAY OF THE SALE. Registration and
Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders must present one (1) form
of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the Sale. Failure to present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a
Prospective Bidder from being registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the bidder from receiving his
bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who believes that by no reason of some defect said property should
not be exposed to sale, should immediately make known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability or familial status in employment
or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Northeast Revenue Service, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2015 inter alia.
Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 18, 2017. Petitioner exposed
certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on April 27, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was
advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on March 24, 2017.Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale
on September 20, 2016 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader,
Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 19, 2016.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act, however the following properties were not sold at the
respective Upset Sales, because the upset sale price was not obtained:



Docket #

2018-02061
2018-02062
2018-02031
2018-02064

2016-02702

2017-05753

2017-05754

2018-02117
2018-02019
2017-05848
2017-14255
2017-14254
2017-05809
2018-02023
2018-02312
2018-02310
2018-02311
2017-06494
2017-06496
2017-06553
2018-02305
2018-02139
2018-02222
2018-02221
2018-02334
2018-02001
2017-14241
2018-02000
2018-01999
2017-05747
2018-02010
2018-02006
2017-14057
2017-07273
2018-02058
2017-14215
2017-14291
2018-02166
2018-02172
2018-02167
2017-05717
2018-02163
2018-02143
2018-02151

PIN No.

01-19SE4-001-049-000
01-19SE4-002-16B-000
01-19SE4-018-011-000
01-19SE4-009-012-000

01-J9NE1-011-015-000

01-J9NE1-T01-186-000

02-D12SE4-003-08A-000

03-U5-00A-013-000
03-U5S53-001-094-000
03-U452-003-001-000
04-K12-00A-033-000
04-K12-00A-33P-000
04-N1253-004-001-000
04-N12S2-002-028-000
05-K14-00A-022-000
05-K14-00A-18A-000
05-K14-00A-19A-000
05-J145S1E-009-028-000
05-J145S1E-009-029-000
06-R754-002-065-000
06-R854-001-028-000
06-R854-001-029-000
06-R854-001-032-000
06-Q8510-006-012-000
09-M453-002-008-000
10-C9-T02-172-000
10-D8-00A-072-000
10-D8-T03-025-000
10-D8-T03-039-000
12-N7-00A-33A-000
14-D11NE3-001-011-000
14-D12NW3-011-020-000
14-D12NW2-010-19A-000
14-D12NW3-004-01A-000
16-D10-T02-027-001
16-E11NW4-011-002-000
17-B10S1-008-05A-000
17-B10-00A-019-002
17-B10S3-002-007-000
18-G952-008-036-000
18-G952-012-027-000
19-G2-00A-020-000
22-R9NE2-028-007-000
22-R9NE1-020-005-000

Owner

Nancy Bernal
Augustino Albanese
Harold & Carol Langan
Mark J. Clinton

Edward & Marja Satkowski

Donna Gyle

Community Banks, N.A., as Custodian for Thomas Lyons, IRA

Donna Pursel

Ronald & Lorrie Dalley

Vincent A. Catrone & Ann Catrone
Landview Properties Inc

Landview Properties, Inc.

Robert A. & Allen V. Bell

Helen & George M. & Paul J. Bogansky
Charles J. & Gail A. Murray

Charles J. & Gail A. Murray

Charles J. & Gail A. Murray

Louis & Jean DiPierdomenico

Louis & Jean DiPierdomenico

Casa Dominicana Inc.

Walter David Heckrote

Walter Heckrote

Walter D. Heckrote

Heather Emerson

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
James Davenport

Mountainside Manor Real Estate Associates, LLC
Stephine Price

Ralph R. May, Sr.

Michael Habib

Dolores Griffin

Gerald Hulse & Janet Hulse

John & Marie Yaverski

T.P. Corporation

Robert J. Fox

Kristin A. Alu, Nicole Alu, Joseph Alu & Brian Alu
Thomas Ksiezopolski & Joyce Wash
Nellie Mae Williams

Cheryl McCloskey

Keirand Daniels

Lewis & Cerena Casterline

James Philip Kester & Lisa Ann Kester
Gregory Guarino

Donna M. & Raymond J. Schlauch

Location

98 R. Ashley St.
Brown St.

63 N. Main St.
29 N. Main St.

15 Rodgers Ave.

186 S. Grafton Way

McAlpine St.

Mountain Rd.
Turnberry Ln.

1418 Tombhicken Rd.
Farrington Tract

Old Ford Rd.

Fern Ridge Rd.
Chestnut Ln.

12 Chestnut Ln.
Chestnut Ln.

Indian Lake Trl.
Indian Lake Trl.

High Meadow Dr.

W. Foothills Dr.

W. Foothills Dr.

W. Foothills Dr.

Bear Run Dr.

144 Lincoln St.

172 Valley View Trailer Park
Route 309

25 Dallas Park

39 Dallas Mobile Home Park
St. Marys Rd.

803 N. Main St.

277 Columbia St.

241 1/2 Rear Main St.
Foote Ave.

27 Mount Lookout Tr. Ct.
33 Mason St.

206 B Coolidge St.
Box 438 RR4

Sutton Creek Rd.

123 Adj. Bunny Ln.

13 Hillside Ave.

Rear Bethel Hill Rd.
709-711 Main St.
Hemlock St.

Ashley Borough
Ashley Borough
Ashley Borough
Ashley Borough

Ashley Borough

Ashley Borough

Avoca Borough

Black Creek Township
Black Creek Township
Black Creek Township
Bear Creek Township
Bear Creek Township
Bear Creek Township
Bear Creek Township
Buck Township

Buck Township

Buck Township

Buck Township

Buck Township
Butler Township
Butler Township
Butler Township
Butler Township
Butler Township
Conyngham Township
Dallas Township
Dallas Township
Dallas Township
Dallas Township
Dorrance Township
Duryea Borough
Duryea Borough
Duryea Borough
Duryea Borough
Exeter Borough
Exeter Borough
Exeter Township
Exeter Township
Exeter Township
Edwardsville Borough
Edwardsville Borough
Fairmount Township
Freeland Borough
Freeland Borough

Minimum Bid

1,136.85
1,159.11
1,159.00
2,020.62

2,334.24

- %23 v N n n

1,541.92
$  2,005.49

$  1,128.54
$  1,660.18
$  1,867.11
S 1,479.56
$  1,518.69
$  1,385.15
$  1,309.37
$  1,425.26
$  1,387.46
$  1,365.27
$ 191814
$  1,966.14
$  1,868.01
$  1,694.29
$  1,622.50
$  1,683.30
$  1,238.44
$ 1,512.03
$  1,599.77
$  6,667.90
$ 1,878.63
$ 972.62
$  1,352.70
$ 1,148.46
$  1,793.78
$  2,285.23
S 9,477.83
$  1,260.99
S 2,762.85
S 2,260.14
$  1,526.85
$  1,260.51
$  1,132.53
S  2,105.48
$  1,350.21
S 4,204.86
S 941.63

Comments

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

SOLD $2,334.24 - Bidder # 86
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,660.18 - Bidder # 203
SOLD $4,500 - Bidder # 7
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

REMOVED -PROPERTY IN FLOOD BUYOUT

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
NO BID

NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $10,000 - Bidder #63
SOLD $15,000 - Bidder #198

NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

NO BID

SOLD $20,000 - Bidder #11
REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
REMOVED PER COURT ORDER
SOLD $5,000 - Bidder #323
SOLD $941.63 - Bidder #63



2018-02152
2018-02142
2018-02154
2018-02145
2018-02220
2018-02229
2018-02752
2018-02463
2018-02722
2018-02230
2018-02462
2017-14249
2018-02520
2018-02522
2018-02636
2018-02464
2018-02466
2018-02232
2018-02254
2017-02414
2017-14463
2016-02146
2017-02413
2017-14274
2017-14021
2017-02426
2017-02829
2017-02827
2018-02534
2018-02468
2018-02513
2018-02528
2018-02529
2018-02532
2018-02476
2018-02527
2018-02480
2018-02863
2018-02490
2018-02514
2018-02540
2018-02647
2018-02638
2018-02687
2018-02516
2018-02231
2018-02255
2018-02256
2016-03255

22-R9NE1-020-006-000
22-R9NE2-019-009-000
23-Q10-T01-117-000
23-Q11-00A-26B-000
23-Q1158-010-008-000
23-R1051-002-032-000
23-R1051-003-025-000
23-R1051-003-026-000
23-R1051-003-027-000
23-R11-00A-29K-000
23-R9-00A-04A-000
23-Q1158-007-018-000
24-D9-00A-015-000
25-1851-017-009-000
25-1853-T01-029-000
25-)851-001-024-000
25-)852-010-003-000
25-K8-00A-08D-000
25-K7-00A-0A1-000
25-19NW2-003-009-000
25-19NW2-004-014-000
25-19SE1-013-008-000
25-)9-00A-043-000
26-S7-T02-014-000
26-58-00A-032-000
26-U5510-007-352-000
26-U5510-007-353-000
26-U5512-001-049-000
26-S7-T02-004-000
26-5855-001-007-000
26-5953-002-015-000
26-U5510-001-011-000
26-U5510-001-018-000
26-U5510-001-078-000
26-U5510-010-488-000
26-U5512-001-078-000
26-U5513-001-341-000
26-U5514-001-197-000
26-U5515-001-041-000
26-U5515-001-323-000
26-U554-006-004-000
26-U557-003-079-000
26-U853-001-006-000
26-V752-002-06A-000
28-E12NW4-010-004-000
29-H5-00A-28N-000
29-1451-004-007-000
29-)552-003-027-000
30-J2-00A-027-000

Donna M. & Raymond J. Schlauch

Gregory Guarino

Luis Conner-Figueroa

White Haven Estates, LLC

Joann Braumann

Michael R. & Margaret Pavlovich Durange
Albert & Linda Wheeler

Albert & Linda Wheeler

Albert & Linda Wheeler

Fantastic, LLC

Lee D. Belles

Edward W. Paschik

Thomas & Arlene Zibuck

William Amann & Anita Wanyo

Drinker Realty Corp.

Equivest Investment, LLC

St. David the Builder Georgian Orthodox Church
RJ Investments LLC

Reading Company

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Ennis Johnson

John, Maria C. and John M. Hannon

Paselo Logistics, LLC

Ryan James Morresi

Remmel W. LaBar, Arthur C. James & Israel Wagner
Marion Harvey & Edmund D. Callaghan
Marion Harvey & Edmund D. Callaghan
Roberto & Cynthia Grandeza

Debra Loomis

Francisca Rodriguez

Sandra A. Tausendferunbt & William E. Herwig
Srikanth Reddy-Singireddy & Srujana Bobba
Maria Carmelita Almirante-Mariano

Osman B. Lawalli & Lydia F. Tambis

Peter A. Collins

Stewart J. Carter & Winie A. Carter

Ik Cho Kwon

Virginia Granados

Keun T. Suh & Won Seo Suh

Ranell T. Santa Cruz & Criselda A. Dela Pena
Anjanette G. Zozobrado

Keirand Danieis

Michael & Catherine DeMelfi

James F. Tuggle, Jr. & Mattie M. Tuggle
William Jo & Marian Weitz

Helen Czajkowski

Robert J. Kozlowski

The Wilbur V. Shields and Ernestine F. Shields Revocable

Leonard & Betty I. Dzock

693 Hemlock St.

622 Center St.

117 Red Maple Ln.
Hillary Dr.

25 Gail Dr.

264 Highland Main St.
18 Highland Vlg.

Adj. 18 Bank Street St.
Back Street St.

Caplos Rd.

101 St. Anns Dr.

36 Hillary Dr.

Mt. Olive Rd.

521 High St.

29 Sans Souci Ct.
3128 S. Main St.

55 Stanley St.

Slope St.

Near

21 1/2 Dexter St.

7 Woodbury St.

707 Hazle St.

Sugar Notch Lands

14 Holly Lynn Cir.
Harleigh Terrace
Laurel Vly.

Laurel Vly.

Spice Bush Dr.

4 Holly Lynn Mbhlhm Park
78 W. Main St.

39 Main St.

Mountain Laurel Dr.
Mountain Laurel Dr.
Elderberry Ln.
Buttonbush Ln.
Buttonbush Ln.

Lot 341 The Vistas
Sassafras Ln.

Lot 41, TW - Eagle Rock Resort
Blue Spruce Dr.

Pine Valley Dr.-Eagle Rock
Kickapoo Dr.

Main St.

215 Beaver Brook Rd.
Drake St.

Swamp Rd.

Park Ridge Dr.

19 Short Trail Dr.

Adj. Pine Creek

Freeland Borough
Freeland Borough
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Foster Township
Franklin Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township
Hanover Township - Coal
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hazle Township
Hughestown Borough
Hunlock Township
Hunlock Township
Hunlock Township
Huntington Township
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1,641.93
4,829.90
1,618.17
3,497.62
1,580.45
1,426.58
1,652.02
1,611.66
1,592.62
1,316.00
1,583.03
1,831.05
1,329.84
2,088.25
1,249.97
1,227.68

443.65
1,679.32
1,414.18
2,069.58
1,570.36
2,609.94
2,643.97
1,318.29
2,283.48
1,409.78
1,399.78
1,445.37
1,306.89
1,325.97
1,312.59
1,353.95
1,137.38

937.90
1,425.41
1,317.73
1,410.73
1,572.01
1,444.74
1,733.67
1,406.76
1,210.41
1,467.99
1,375.64
1,229.77
1,213.26
1,519.89
1,126.17
1,303.15

SOLD $2,500 - Bidder #64
SOLD $4,829.90 - Bidder #269
SOLD $1,618.17 - Bidder #317
NO BID

SOLD $5,000 - Bidder # 233
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

SOLD $1,329.84 - Bidder #337
SOLD $11,000 - Bidder #3
SOLD $4,000 - Bidder #68
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $2,069.58 - Bidder #58
SOLD $6,000 - Bidder #3
SOLD $5,000 - Bidder #12
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $6,500 - Bidder #203
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,444.74 - Bidder #203
SOLD $1,733.67 - Bidder #203
SOLD $1,406.76 - Bidder #203
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

SOLD $1,229.77 - Bidder #337
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019



2018-02336
2018-02252
2018-02745
2018-02747
2018-02539
2018-02452
2018-02749
2018-02750
2018-03319
2018-02554
2018-03313
2018-02906
2018-03330
2017-14227
2017-03084
2017-05805
2016-04907
2018-02867
2018-02874
2018-02695
2018-02696
2018-02697
2018-02698
2018-02881
2018-02909
2018-02686
2017-14242
2018-02715
2018-02651
2018-03456
2018-02650
2018-02649
2018-02776
2018-02904
2017-03143
2017-03226
2017-03230
2016-05027
2018-02931
2018-02763
2018-02756
2018-03320
2018-03336
2018-03455
2018-03544
2018-03304
2017-05814
2017-05778
2017-05835

33-E1152-003-016-000
33-F1053-001-017-000
34-G9SE1-033-005-000
34-G9SE4-001-013-000
34-G9SE4-016-032-000
34-G9SE1-031-063-000
34-G9SE2-002-027-000
34-G9SE3-08A-008-000
34-G9SE4-008-01A-000
34-H9NE1-011-019-000
35-D10S1-001-18A-000
35-E9-T01-071-000
38-H855-009-002-000
38-H851-007-016-000
41-G9NE1-008-044-000
42-)7SE4-008-021-000
42-J7SW2-015-016-000
42-J7SW2-001-003-000
42-J7SW2-002-009-000
42-J7NW2-009-021-000
42-J7SE1-038-015-000
42-J7SE1-038-15A-000
42-J7SE2-006-006-000
42-J7SW2-008-027-000
42-J7SE1-014-001-000
44-Q3-00A-075-000
44-Q3-00A-044-000
46-K654-002-04A-000
46-K7NW2-005-010-000
46-K551-004-004-000
46-K651-004-002-000
46-K651-004-03A-000
46-K651-025-025-000
46-K651-025-09A-000
46-K651-025-010-000
46-K655-005-002-000
46-K752-005-020-000
47-L851-008-011-000
48-H8SE3-004-004-000
48-H8SE2-001-010-000
48-H8SE4-011-004-000
48-H8SE4-047-004-000
48-18NW2-013-011-000
48-H8SE1-012-001-000
48-H8SE1-012-01A-000
48-H8SE4-003-001-000
48-H8SE3-010-006-000
48-H8SW3-023-019-000
48-18NW2-025-011-000

Joseph Valyo

Keirand Daniels

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Target Table Industries, Inc.

Kimberly Flynn, deceased

Samuel A. & Helene L. Austin
Mountain Vista Rentals Inc.

James J. Sterner, Jr. & Helen Sterner
Rose Marie Kreider

Joseph Kearney

Alice Solinsky

Lou Forte

Earl & Mae Wallace

David L. Sutton, Jr. & Susan M. Sutton
Kenneth Trudgen, Jr. & Mary Trudgen
Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Grace Nagle

Steven Greco & Pei Pei Liu

George R. Seletski

Thomas Romanchik

Joseph F. Skipkoski, deceased

Joseph F. Skipkoski, deceased

Alfons T. Jean C. Ormanowski

Randy Casey & Kileigh Casey

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Brenda L. Steinruck

Louis A. Carville, llI

James Griffith & Janet Griffith

Frank J. Capozzi Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser
Geraldine Repotski, deceased

Craig J. Pollick

Craig J. Pollick

Daniel Masakowski

Peter Przekop

Matthew Ruch

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Clem J. Krzynefski

Annie Bohlin

EYW Global, LLC

Keri Occhipinti

Sustainable Wyoming Valley Inc.
Joseph E. & Beverly A. Swartwood
Chinh Vo

Victor & Judy Judzikowski

Victor & Judy Judzikowski

Stanley Judzikowski

Russell Case & Jody Stash

Victor Cruz

William & Phyllis Stock

1232 Main St.

15 Tennant St.

232 Pringle St.

130 Cuba St.

925 Market St.

153 Pringle St.

111 Sharpe St.

549 N. Gates Ave.
50 E. Hoyt St.

40 S. Loveland Ave.
1623 W. Eighth St.
71 Cardinal Circle-Pad 71
295 Poplar St.

51 Barney St.

471 Vaughn St.

1213 S. Hanover St.
135 Rear W. Broad St.
334 W Main Street
268 W. Main St.

158 Garfield St.

164 E Ridge Street
166 E. Ridge St.

383 Grove St.
104-106 W. Ridge St.
63 W. Union St.

Overlook Rd.-Black Creek Rd.

Black Creek Rd.
1050 W. Main Ave.
138-140 Robert St.
Newport St.

5 Enterprise St.

7 Enterprise St.

26 Orchard St.

73 W. Main St.
69-71 W. Main St.
450 Old Newport St.
96 Newport Ave.
Gay Ave.

63-65 Mechanics Ln.
203 McGinnis St.
111-113 E. Main St.
63 Center Ave.

89 Coal St.

106 Adj. Shawnee Ave.
Shawnee Ave.
Duffys Ln.

238 Beade St.

126 Nottingham St.
606 W. Main St.

Jenkins Township
Jenkins Township
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Borough
Kingston Township
Kingston Township
Larksville Borough
Larksville Borough
Luzerne Borough
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nanticoke City
Nescopeck Township
Nescopeck Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Newport Township
Nuangola Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough
Plymouth Borough

R Vs ¥ ¥ Y R Y ¥ o ¥ ¥ ¥ e Ve Y 2 ¥ o Y Y Y R ¥ e Vs e ¥ ¥ ¥ Y Y 2 ¥ e ¥ o ¥ o Y ¥ Y ¥ Y Y o ¥ Y R V2 Vo i Vo B Vs e ¥ ¥ RV R V2 RV B V2 S Vo S Vo R V2 Y

1,459.38
1,384.88
1,369.27
1,567.85
1,902.82
1,257.33
1,560.51
2,272.29
1,467.81
1,425.93
1,848.90
1,318.16
1,404.80
1,514.90
2,629.23
2,411.98
3,037.90
1,489.12
1,717.46
1,411.66
3,105.83
3,054.18
1,459.16
1,366.05
1,521.59
1,687.36
1,894.37
2,001.24
1,189.96
1,537.16
1,216.95
1,213.69
1,263.55
1,353.78
2,419.49
2,461.27

382.43
1,411.91
1,228.94
1,300.53
1,091.46
1,198.38
1,745.84
1,345.98
1,298.81
1,291.04
1,562.11
1,679.55
2,223.09

SOLD $5,000 - Bidder #36
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $16,000 - Bidder #220
SOLD $8,000 - Bidder 3337
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $14,500 - Bidder #218
SOLD $20,000 - Bidder #307
SOLD $16,000 - Bidder #278
REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019 PER COURT ORDER
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $8,000 - Bidder #13
SOLD $10,500 - Bidder #1
SOLD $12,000 - Bidder #11
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $4,000 - Bidder #338
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $4,000 - Bidder #312
SOLD $3,500 - Bidder #263
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $2,000 - Bidder #76
SOLD $1,700 - Bidder #263
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,353.78 - Bidder #317
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019 PER COURT ORDER
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

SOLD $4,500 - Bidder #343
NO BID

SOLD $1,091.46 - Bidder #242
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,345.98 - Bidder #25
NO BID

SOLD $1,291.04 - Bidder #233
SOLD $7,000 - Bidder #233
NO BID

SOLD $7,500 - Bidder #316



2018-03309
2018-03528
2018-03511
2017-14231
2018-03518
2018-02754
2018-02910
2018-02751
2017-14020
2017-14043
2017-14028
2017-14251

2018-02902

2018-02858
2018-02644
2018-02877
2018-02633
2018-02635
2018-02632
2017-14452

2018-02725
2017-07252
2018-03318
2018-02642
2018-02641
2018-02843
2018-02653
2018-02721
2018-02719
2018-02655
2018-03307
2018-02755
2016-05002
2017-05734
2017-07276
2017-07274
2017-05727
2017-05749
2017-07277
2017-07278
2017-14262
2018-02760
2018-02758
2017-14038
2017-03094
2017-03106

49-17S1A-004-004-000
50-G10NE1-017-003-000
50-G11-T02-208-001
50-G11-T02-314-000
51-E1255-002-013-000
55-0451-003-004-000
55-P3SW1-006-018-000
55-P3SW1-007-029-000
55-L451-009-002-000
55-L451-009-003-000
56-L4SE1-004-006-000
56-L4SE1-021-022-000

58-Q5-00A-16A-000

63-T7SE2-023-003-000
63-T7SE2-006-007-000

63-T7SE2-006-012-000
63-T7SE1-007-008-000

63-T7SE1-007-009-000
63-T7SE2-026-014-000
65-E11NE1-018-015-000

66-E10SE1-007-011-000
67-E10SE3-001-002-000

69-110NW3-007-029-000
70-F1153-001-042-000
71-T8SW31-011-025-000
71-T8SW13-017-01A-000
71-T8SW42-002-02A-000
71-T8NW43-006-004-000
71-T8NW41-002-11A-000
71-T8NW41-005-006-000
71-T8NW42-009-013-000
71-T8NW24-003-02H-000
71-T8NE44-007-002-000
71-T8NW44-019-010-000
71-T8SW13-008-007-000
71-T8SW13-008-07A-000
71-T8SW31-06A-08A-000
71-T8SW33-008-005-000
71-T8SW42-001-008-000
71-T85SW42-001-009-000
71-T8SW42-002-001-000
72-E11SE1-009-007-000
72-E11SE1-033-038-000
72-D11SE2-001-022-000
72-E11NE2-024-005-000
72-E11NE3-017-003-000

Stephen Hussa

Donald & Marion Tregaskis
Theodore Mosier

Lina Genovese-D'Onofrio
Rosemary Borkowski

Herbert Estus

Stephen D. Lynch

Frank P. Mazza & Chris M. Brown
Herbert L. & Shirley J. Derby
Herbert L. & Shirley J. Derby
John & Kay Baskett, deceased
Robert A. & Karen L. McLaughlin

Roland E. Wenner, Rita Wenner, Clyde L. Wenner & Barbara

Wenner
Richard Gould
Rosa Guzman

June A. Lehman
Hazleton Homes, Inc.

Hazleton Homes, Inc.
Bernard & Sharon Gaizick
Alan P. & Eileen C. Rosen

Rose Marie Mudrian
JPM Realty, Inc.

Eugene Gray & Joseph Antulov
Donna Maria Cresho

Michael D. & Margaret Ann Bono
Carmen Genao

Hazleton Partners, L.P.

Gregory A. & Ronnie A. Tutko
Dorel Valentin Screciu

Michael J. & Laura J. Scherff
Thomas E. Donahue

Gino L. Andreuzzi

Robert Zukowski

Marco Lavezzari

Ganija Gianni & Muradija M. Vucetovic
Ganija Gianni Vucetovic

Joseph W. Sanon

Kevin & Kathryn Pursel

Ganija Vucetovic & Adam Lizbinski
Ganija Vucetovic & Adam Lizbinski
Hazleton Partners, LP

Eleanor Theresa Cawley Evans
Paula Fuhrman

Andrew & Lizzie German

Jerome M. & Lois Romanski
Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges

390 E. Canal St.

192 Rear N. River St.

209 E. Mountain Ridge MHP
314 E. Mountain Ridge MHP
Laurel St.

Salem Blvd.

501 E. Front St.

437-439 E. Second St.

1006 Shickshinny Valley Rd.
1006 Adj. Shickshinny Valley Rd.
20 Search St.

26 Susquehanna Ave.

Merry L Dr.

210 E. Green St.
22 Tamarack St.

50 Tamarack St.
516 W. Green St.

514 W. Green St.
111S. Broad St.
115 York Ave.

415 W. 6th St.
55 W. Seventh St.

796 E. Northampton St.
26 Stout St.

9 E. Broad St.

77 N. Vine St.

117 Rear W. Broad St.
336 W. Fourth St.

817 Hanover Ct.

710 N. Locust St.

673 Alter St.

Meade St.

504-506 E. Diamond Ave.
621 Peace St.

133 W. Green St.

139 W. Green St.

326 1/2 E. Broad St.
413 E. Walnut St.

328 W. Broad St.

320 W. Broad St.

141 W. Broad St.

123 Vine St.-60 Oak St.
19 Rear Swalow St.
108 Cliff St.

65 Parsonage St.

19 Carroll St.

Plymouth Township
Plains Township
Plains Township
Plains Township
Pittston Township
Salem Township
Salem Township
Salem Township
Salem Township
Salem Township
Shickshinny Borough
Shickshinny Borough

Sugarloaf Township

West Hazleton Borough
West Hazleton Borough

West Hazleton Borough
West Hazleton Borough

West Hazleton Borough
West Hazleton Borough
West Pittston Borough

West Wyoming Borough
Wyoming Borough
Wilkes-Barre Township
Yatesville Borough
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Hazleton City
Pittston City
Pittston City
Pittston City
Pittston City
Pittston City
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1,352.30
1,590.88
1,115.44
1,535.23
1,171.32
1,157.97
1,476.23
1,477.20
1,493.19
1,287.01
1,715.47
1,894.73

1,207.46

1,757.33
1,410.16

1,556.83
1,406.09

1,396.79
1,604.15
1,617.14

1,290.21
3,020.17

1,625.10
1,349.96
2,096.05

977.29
1,889.37
1,498.77
1,168.86
1,488.31
1,458.86
1,299.51
1,439.42
3,889.16
2,658.02
1,943.94
1,665.94
3,598.41
2,678.63
1,568.22

13,092.49
1,560.66
1,390.05
2,113.62
1,816.52
1,786.14

SOLD $1,352.30 - Bidder #259
SOLD $4,500 - Bidder #13

NO BID

NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,493.19 - Bidder #342
SOLD $1,287.01 - Bidder #342
NO BID

NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

SOLD $15,000 - Bidder #223
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

SOLD $19,000 - Bidder #340
SOLD $20,000 - Bidder #340
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019

SOLD $8,5000 - Bidder #218
CONTINUED - BANKRUPTCY FILED
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $42,000 - Bidder #257
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $52,000 - Bidder #313
SOLD $6,000 - Bidder #289
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $9,5000 - Bidder #289
SOLD $1,299.51 - Bidder #291
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $27,000 - Bidder #238
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $24,000 - Bidder #264
SOLD $29,000 - Bidder #257
SOLD $26,000 - Bidder #253
SOLD $5,500 - Bidder #271
SOLD $400,000 - Bidder #313
SOLD $6,000 - Bidder #230
NO BID

SOLD $2,113.62 - Bidder #334
NO BID

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019



2016-05000
2017-07272
2017-14225
2017-06557
2017-14238
2017-14060
2016-02790
2017-14080
2017-14066
2017-14307
2017-14081
2017-07202
2017-14213
2017-06252
2017-06476
2017-14295
2017-14299
2017-14457
2016-13118
2016-12363
2017-14308
2016-12358
2017-07207
2017-14236
2017-07269
2017-06258
2017-14239
2017-07260
2017-02806
2017-14263
2017-14264
2017-14058
2017-07255
2018-02928
2018-02929
2018-02925
2018-02923
2018-02921
2018-02920
2018-03523
2018-03527
2018-03533
2018-03535
2018-03484
2018-03483
2018-03481
2018-03478
2018-03306
2018-03338

72-E11SE1-010-001-000
73-G10SE1-013-010-000
73-G10SE2-011-002-000
73-H10NW2-019-20A-000
73-H10NW4-004-021-000
73-H10NW4-006-028-000
73-H10NW4-018-011-000
73-H10NW4-018-017-000
73-H10NW4-019-008-000
73-H10NW4-022-025-000
73-H10SW1-006-023-000
73-H10SW2-013-025-000
73-H10SW2-020-016-000
73-H9SE3-025-004-000
73-H9SE4-004-023-000
73-H9SE4-033-034-000
73-H9SE4-033-33A-000
73-110NW1-014-016-000
73-19NE1-003-005-000
73-19NE1-020-004-000
73-19NE1-029-015-000
73-19NE2-038-008-000
73-19NE4-013-004-000
73-19NE4-033-01B-000
73-19NE4-037-029-000
73-19NW2-005-032-000
73-19NW2-011-002-000
73-19NW2-013-016-000
73-19NW2-017-020-000
73-19NW2-018-018-000
73-19NW2-032-011-000
73-19SE1-006-018-000
73-19SE2-002-016-000
73-H10NW1-005-014-000
73-H10NW1-005-025-000
73-H10NW4-026-011-000
73-H10SW1-010-001-000
73-H10SW2-008-006-000
73-H10SW2-012-009-000
73-H9SE1-005-016-000
73-H9SE4-021-014-000
73-H9SE4-021-054-000
73-H9SE4-024-029-000
73-H9SW2-006-017-000
73-19NE1-004-008-000
73-19NE1-025-19A-000
73-19NE1-028-09A-000
73-19NE2-011-026-000
73-19NE2-023-023-000

James & Georgina Costanzo

William Walter Savage, Jr.

Michael Yedinak, Sr.

Thomas & Henrietta Flaherty

Virgil & Victoria Argenta

John A. & Marietta Sninsky

Virgil E. Argenta, Jr. & Victoria C. Argenta
Virgil E. Argenta, Jr. & Victoria C. Argenta
Norman & Evelyn Waters, deceased
Johann Lingl

Virgil E. Argenta & Victoria Argenta
Thomas M. Sokolas

Yvonne Deets Fisher

John L. Grohowski

Debra Hoskins & Lori-Marie Speight
Phyllis L. Smith

Phyllis L. Smith

William P. & Molly E. Kratz

Bernard, Harriet, Howard & Jeffrey Rockman
Diane J. Beaton

Cesar Santana

Thuong Truong

Jeremy Hunter & Lawrence D. Hodges
Eugene D. Sitkowski, Jr.

Mayer Hirsch

Lorraine & Mark Stelma

William C., Julia M., Eugene R. & Jeanette V. Raineri
Vincent P. & Helen Macri

Robert P., Diane L. & Clifford J. Thomas
Sheila Greco

Robert A. & Carol A. Frail

Terrific Transport, LLC

Darrell Williams

Ruth Clarke Schmitt

Ruth Clarke Schmitt

Toni Tenebruso

Ted Turon

Lillian Searles

Luis Saavedra

Peter & Jean Moses

Frank J. Capozzi, Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser
Earl ). & Henrietta L. Wenner

Aparna A. Galilio & Malti Kathuria
Megan Jardine

Frank J. Capozzi, Sr. & Krisandra L. Strausser
Michael J. Bush

Gasper Segundo Mayancela Yupa & Rosa E. Alvarez Loja

Anthony Albert Lovecchio & Donna Lee Kalson
Jason Cohen & Linda J. Jaremko

136 Vine St.

51 Thomas St.

165 Thomas St.

12 W. Chestnut St.
41 Courtright St.

36 Butler St.

321 N. Main St.

345 N. Main St.

129 Madison St.
296 N. Washington St.
97 Wyoming St.

206 Scott St.

82 Chapel St.

75 Park Ave.

244 Academy St.

71 Race St.

67 Race St.

445 New Market St.
12 Oregon St.

114 Westminster St.
187 Stanton St.
245-247 S. Grant St.
19 Gilligan St.

323 Blackman St.
244 Mclean St.

247 Horton St.

126 Hanover St.

848 S. Franklin St.
84 Waller St.

113 Waller St.

164 Carlisle St.

659 Hazle St.

58 Frederick St.
32-34 O'Neill Ave.
59 W. Hollenback St.
316 N. Main St.

112 Scott St.

81 Spring St.

171 Scott St.

47-49 Terrace St.
168-170 Academy St.
Magnolia Ave.
75-77 Sullivan St.
119-121 Old River Rd.
580-582 S. Franklin St.
57 Shiber Ln.

71 Prospect St.

280 Moyallen St.
150 Park Ave.

Pittston City

Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
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1,653.28
3,586.31
2,886.02
2,281.12
2,382.99
1,927.87
2,629.19
3,769.91
1,945.40
2,006.13
3,441.62
2,524.77
2,567.19
3,004.03
2,351.22
1,729.55
1,866.25
2,129.05
8,157.70
3,173.88
1,660.66
2,316.58
1,998.56
2,520.20
2,139.56
2,538.96
1,872.69
2,101.68
1,790.06
2,625.68
2,263.92
3,151.60
1,704.90
1,475.88
1,500.40
1,459.25
1,708.22
1,397.65
1,590.80
2,157.07
1,409.39
1,231.72
1,408.64
2,247.34
1,909.83
1,359.80
1,351.63
1,348.69
1,573.01

SOLD $5,000 - Bidder #246

NO BID

REMOVED - TAXES PAID IN FULL
SOLD $2,281.12 - Bidder #76
SOLD $11,000 - Bidder #81
SOLD $5,500 - Bidder #294
SOLD $20,000 - Bidder #97
SOLD $25,000 - Bidder #97
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $2,006.13 - Bidder #263
CONTINUED PER COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $10,000 - Bidder #336
SOLD #21,000 - Bidder #263
SOLD $44,000 - Bidder #261
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $1,729.55 - Bidder #35
SOLD $2,500 - Bidder #35
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $43,000 - Bidder #60
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $8,000 - Bidder #52

SOLD $8,500 - Bidder #324
SOLD $16,000 - Bidder #282
SOLD $9,000 - Bidder #60
CONTINUED PER COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $11,500 - Bidder #60
SOLD $17,000 - Bidder #226
SOLD $24,000 - Bidder #324
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $8,000 - Bidder #60
CONTINUED PER COURT ORDER TO APRIL 2019
REMOVED TAXES PAID IN FULL
SOLD $2,500 - Bidder #263
SOLD $21,000 - Bidder #309
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019 PER COURT ORDER
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
REMOVED PER COURT ORDER
SOLD $8,000 - Bidder #10

SOLD $1,231.72 - Bidder #60
SOLD $1,408.64 - Bidder #60
SOLD $28,000 - Bidder #47
SOLD $13,000 - Bidder #97
SOLD $7,500 - Bidder #60

SOLD $18,000 - Bidder #327
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019



2018-03492
2018-03491
2018-03333
2018-03471
2018-03470
2018-03452
2018-03445
2018-03475
2018-03476
2018-03473
2018-03460
2018-03502
2018-03453
2018-02897
2018-02892
2017-14301
2018-02885
2018-02916

73-19NE2-027-008-000
73-19NE2-027-009-000
73-19NE2-036-017-000
73-19NE4-018-040-000
73-19NE4-026-028-000
73-19NW2-015-004-000
73-H10NW3-012-006-000
73-H10NW4-020-038-000
73-H10NW4-022-024-000
73-H10NW4-023-025-000
73-H10SW1-007-003-000
73-G10SE2-006-005-000
73-G10SE2-011-001-000
74-C658-002-063-000
74-D655-003-005-000
74-D655-004-005-000
74-D655-004-011-000
74-D756-004-029-000

Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano
Frank A. Pisano & Cynthia Pisano
Kevin Flippines & Joan Flippines
Shannon R. Allen, Jr.

Michael Ranieli

Sharon L. Kipiel

Patrick J. & Jeanne Conway
Martin Reyes

Edward Laux

Stephen Browski

Keirand Daniels

Elma L. Jerr

James W. & Martha L. Conroy
Edward & Charlotte Azarovich
Kathy & Joe Wynne

Kathy & Joe Wynne

Frank J. Capozzi, Sr. & Krisandra L. Capozzi
Edward & Jenna Yanchulis

Almond Ln.

151 Almond Ln.
Columbus Ave.
86-88 Poplar St.
333 Andover St.
136 Regent St.
269 Madison St.
214 Wyoming St.

298-300 N. Washington St.

279-81 N. Main St.
257-259 N. Penna Ave.
Cleveland St.

191 Maycock St.
Gaynor Rd.

Trolley HI.

Trolley HI.

Trolley HI.

Carpenter Rd.

Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Wilkes-Barre City
Harveys Lake Borough
Harveys Lake Borough
Harveys Lake Borough
Harveys Lake Borough
Harveys Lake Borough
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1,179.54
1,662.94
1,420.38
1,729.01
1,437.20
1,876.86
2,214.77
1,158.98
1,470.31
1,963.40
1,717.17
1,164.50
1,524.67

919.51
1,432.16
1,528.70
1,338.97
1,320.67

CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $4,500 - Bidder #263
SOLD $5,000 - Bidder #220
SOLD $12,000 - Bidder #326
SOLD $21,000 - Bidder #324
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
SOLD $24,000 - Bidder #326
SOLD $31,000 - Bidder #326
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
CONTINUED TO APRIL 2019
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID



