JUDICIAL SALE — AUGUST 12, 2021
(FINAL RESULTS)

NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

***ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, AND THE LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM
BUREAU IS STRICTLY ADHERING TO THE COVID-19 GUIDELINES AS PUT IN PLACE
BY THE ADMINISTRATION OF KINGS COLLEGE. ALL ATTENDEES OF ANY EVENT
HELD BY ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, WILL BE REQUIRED TO WEAR A MASK
COVERING THEIR MOUTH AND NOSE AT ALL TIMES.**%*

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Elite Revenue Solutions, LL.C as agent for the Luzerne County
Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE under the Pennsylvania Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as
amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 12th day of August, 2021 at auxiliary gymnasium at the King’s
College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 N. Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The
properties exposed to sale will be sold Free & Clear of all tax and municipal claims, mortgages, liens,
charges and estates of whatsoever kind, except ground rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to
any property in which they may be interested. Every reasonable effort has been made to keep the
proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling the TAXABLE
INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without guarantee of warranty
whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and Costs
can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not
delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County, nor is the
bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate
taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not
delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is
the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal
utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.

3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective
bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in
Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has
been revoked.



In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the owner
shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.

TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording costs
shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is completed and must be made in the form of cash,
certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the close of business
on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be permitted to bid on any properties
in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing
a property in any sale the bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and the
matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for prosecution under the
Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY
OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. NO REGISTRATION WILL BE TAKEN
ON THE DAY OF THE SALE. Registration and Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim
Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders must present one (1)
form of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the Sale. Failure to present photo
identification at the time of registration will prevent a Prospective Bidder from being registered to bid.
Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the bidder from receiving his
bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who believes
that by no reason of some defect said property should not be exposed to sale, should immediately make
known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex,
religion, age, disability or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax Claim
Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 24, 2020 upon delinquent
tax claims filed for the tax years 2018 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times
Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 14, 2020. Petitioner exposed certain
parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 26, 2019 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years
2017 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the
Luzerne Legal Register on August 23, 2019. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on
September 27, 2018 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2016 inter alia. Notice of the Upset
Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August



17, 2018. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon delinquent
tax claims filed for the tax years 2015 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times
Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 18, 2017. Petitioner exposed certain
parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 20, 2016 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years
2014 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the
Luzerne Legal Register on August 19, 2016. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale
September 24, 2015 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2013 inter alia. Notice of the Upset
Sale was advertised in The Times Leader and Standard Speaker on August 21, 2015, and the Luzerne
Legal Register on August 8, 2015.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act, however
the following properties were not sold at the respective Upset Sales, because the upset sale price was not
obtained:
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Sale #
19-0015
20-0014
19-0025
17-0993
19-0050
19-0072
18-0092
17-0087
19-0128

11 [19-0133

19-0144
19-0147

|14 [19-0148

19-0136
19-0143

|17 [20-0076

20-0155
20-0158

|20 [19-0221
|21 [19-0252

19-0257

|23 [19-0258

18-0266
20-0218
20-0219

|27 [20-0215

19-0319
19-0349
19-0318
20-0346

|32 [15-0440
|33 [19-0387

19-0418

|35 [19-0431

19-0439
19-0503
19-0531
19-0545
18-0560

| 41 [20-0494
| 22 [19-0601

19-0617

| 44 [19-0639
|45 [15-0724

18-0639

Municipality
ASHLEY BORO WARD 1
ASHLEY BORO WARD 1
ASHLEY BORO WARD 2
ASHLEY BORO WARD 2
ASHLEY BORO WARD 3
AVOCA BORO WARD 2
AVOCA BORO WARD 3
AVOCA BORO WARD 3
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BLACK CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BEAR CREEK TWP
BUTLER TWP WARD 1
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
BUTLER TWP WARD 2
DALLAS TWP
DALLAS TWP
DALLAS TWP
DALLAS TWP
DALLAS BORO
DORRANCE TWP
DENNISON TWP
DURYEA BORO WARD 3
DURYEA BORO WARD 3
EXETER BORO WARD 1
EXETER BORO WARD 3
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER BORO WARD 4
EXETER TWP
EXETER TWP
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 2
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 2

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4

Parcel
01-19SE4 -017-004-000
01-19SE4 -022-018-000
01-JONE1 -003-01B-000
01-J9-00A-0A1-000
01-JONEI -010-026-000
02-D12SE4-010-002-000
02-DI3NW4-004-09A
02-D13NW4-004-010-000
03-USS1 -002-016-000
03-USS1 -008-020-000
03-USS3 -001-175-000
03-USS5 -001-225-000
03-USS5 -001-226-000
03-USS1A -009-006-000
03-USS3 -001-232-000
03-S4 -00A-25A-000
04-K1254 -001-073-000
04-N1252 -005-014-000
06-Q8S3 -001-18C-000
06-Q8S9-002-017-000
06-Q9S2 -004-008-000
06-Q9S2 -004-009-000
06-Q9S2-006-007-000
06-Q8S11 -006-005-000
06-Q8S11 -006-006-000
06-Q8S11 -001-024-000
10-C7S1 -006-009-000
10-D8 -00A-011-000
10-C7 -T01-013-000
10-E8S5 -005-015-000
11-E8NW2-005-16E-000
12-N7 -00A-30A-000
13-011 -00A-03E-000
14-D12NW4-003-018-000
14-D12NW3-012-001-000
16-D11S1 -005-014-000
16-E11NW1-001-001-000
16-D10 -T02-028-001
16-E10-T01-330-000
16-D10 -T02-072-000
17-B10 -00A-26A-000
17-C10 -00A-054-000
18-G9S4 -005-012-000
18-G9S2-013-019-000

18-G9S2-010-036-000

Owner
MAREK JOHN S & THERESA A
TAYLOR DAMON
TAYLOR DAMON
READING COMPANY
NICHOLS GEORGE

REVESZ RAYMOND, DECEASED & MARIE, DECEASED

GROW LEONAS M, deceased & RUTH, deceased

GROBOSKY, LEO A., deceased & NELLIE B., deceased

ABUAN JUAN C

DEL MAR ESTRELLA B

KANG JESSY

REICH JACK & COLLEEN

REICH JACK & COLLEEN

SOMBITO JOEMAR AND LUIS MA PINKY
TITUS CHRISTOPHER T & VICTORIA O
GALLICK LILLIAN N

KALOMIRIS ANASTASIOS

HORTON TYLER

EUBANKS ROBERT

LAND & RESOURCE HOLDING LLC
LAND & RESOURCE HOLDING LLC
LAND & RESOURCE HOLDING LLC
WINARSKI GERALD

ROKOSZ HENRY

ROKOSZ HENRY

SAZ REALL ESTATE LLC

ANCIN MARY C/O CHARLES ANSON
WILLS EDWARD

MCKAY NOELLE

BRENNAN JOHN T J ETAL

BROKENSHIRE MARY ALICE & PAUL R SELECKY, deceased

JENKINS WILLIAM E, deceased & NORMA J

MENDEZ ACEVEDO JOSE L
TAYLOR DAMON

TAYLOR DAMON

WILLIAMS HAROLD R, deceased
BATTLE, THOMAS J.

HERRON SHERRI

BUSH MAUREEN

LKS ENTERPRISES LLC D/B/A
AMD LAND DEVELOPMENT LLC
APPNEL JOHN E JR, deceased
BRANDEAUX GRANT
SINGLETARY RICHARD I

GILLIS JOHN & FLORENCE

Property Description

E HARTFORD ST

83 N MAIN ST

ADJ CRNJ

[NO LOCATION]

134 S MAIN ST

1008 MCALPINE ST
DAWSON ST

1542 DAWSON ST
HURON CIRCLE
IROQUOIS CIR
PAWNEE AVE

225 DAKOTA DR

226 DAKOTA DR
WALDEN DR
SLIVERCLOUD LN
CEDAR HEAD RD
LAURELBROOK DR
ASH LN

JAMES LN

EDGE ROCK DR
BEAR RUN DR

BEAR RUN DR
SHINGLE MILL CIR
LISA LAKE CT

LISA LAKE CT
DEBBIE DR

KUNKLE ALDERSON RD
182 RANSOM RD

13 COUNTY PINE TRAILER CT
RESERVOIR RD
RICHFIELD ST

11 GEORGES RD

148 TUNNEL RD

204 MEADE ST S

204 MEADE ST S

1131 EXETER AVE
303 W. GRANT ST.

28 MT LOOKOUT TRAILER CT
330 BIRCHWOOD EST
72 MT LOOKOUT TRAILER CT
SUTTON CREEK RD
KITCHEN LN

31 PLYMOUTH ST

86 HILLSIDE AVE

85 SHORT ST

Bid Amount

$1,997.49
$1,558.67
$1,739.03
$1,732.80
$3,160.59
$1,675.17
$1,931.33
$1,617.59
$1,406.18
$1,333.86
$1,498.37
$1,796.71
$1,446.59
$1,435.99
$1,483.48
$1,496.24
$1,612.72
$1,170.69
$1,869.62
$1,292.64
$1,324.32
$1,307.34
$1,768.79
$1,311.91
$1,311.02
$1,187.16
$1,514.88
$1,444.06
$1,665.17
$1,165.95
$2,570.11
$1,344.75
$1,882.61
$1,719.05
$1,582.23
$1,888.78
$1,714.14
$1,935.43
$1,668.11
$1,499.12
$1,637.40
$1,655.14
$2,100.98
$2,449.77

$1,894.08

Results
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $2500 #122
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $24000 #7
SOLD - $31000 #334
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $2000 #224
SOLD - $1901.33 #84
SOLD - $2000 #84
SOLD - $3500 #224
SOLD - $6000 #224
SOLD - 1435.99 #224
SOLD - 1483.48 #224
SOLD - 1496.24 #84
SOLD - $15500 #314
SOLD - $1170.69 #148
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1768.79 #251
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1187.16 #162
SOLD - $1514.88 #321
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1165.95 #321
SOLD - $2570.11 #287
SOLD - $9500 #167
SOLD - $10500 #251
SOLD - $6000 #43
SOLD - $2500 #43
SOLD - $15500 #287
SOLD - $54000 #2
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1655.14 #82
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $41000 #268

SOLD - $43000 #15
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| 47 [18-0638

19-0666

| 42 [19-0667

20-0625

|51[19-0735
|52 [19-0749

19-0750
19-0834
19-0791
19-0780
19-0785

| 58 |17-0797

20-0735

| o [20-0818

|61 [18-0897

19-0962

|63 [19-0946

19-0947
18-0939
17-0993

| [18-0979

19-1054
17-1056
19-1153
19-1219

|72 [19-1220
|73 [19-1134

19-1135

| 75 |19-1136

19-1137
19-1066

| 78 |19-1160

19-1164
19-1079

| o1 [19-1080
|2 [19-1182

19-1102

| 84 [19-1156
|as [19-1232

19-1098

|7 [18-1096

19-1231
19-1078

|0 [19-1309

18-1139

EDWARDSVILLE WARD 4
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7
EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7
FAIRVIEW TWP
FREELAND BORO WARD 1
FREELAND BORO WARD 3
FREELAND BORO WARD 3
FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

FOSTER TWP

HANOVER TWP WARD 2

HANOVER TWP WARD 3
HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 6
HANOVER TWP WARD 7
HANOVER TWP WARD 7
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 1
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2

18-G9S2-009-035-000
18-G9S4 -003-002-000
18-G9S4 -003-006-000
20-L10 -00A-04A-000
22-RINE2 -023-22A-000
22-Q9SE4 -010-011-000
22-Q9SE4 -010-015-000
23-S1181 -001-006-000
23-Q1187-003-001-000
23-Q1183 -T01-129-000
23-Q1186 -008-007-000
23-Q10-T01-117-000
23-Q1188 -004-012-000
25-19SE1 -004-10A-000

25-J9NE4-003-02A-000
25-K8 -00A-08E-000
25-J8S2 -001-003-000
25-J8S2 -001-004-000
25-J8S1-001-026-000
25-K7-00A-0A1-000
25-19NW3-017-001-000
26-S9S3 -009-005-000
26-S983-002-015-000
26-U5S10 -003-161-000
26-U5S15 -001-151-000
26-U5S15 -001-197-000
26-T8S2 -001-019-000
26-T8S2 -001-020-000
26-T8S2 -001-021-000
26-T8S2 -001-022-000
26-S7S10 -T04-016-000
26-U5S10 -007-326-000
26-U5S10 -009-368-000
26-T581 -001-013-000
26-T581 -001-015-000
26-U5S13 -001-175-000
26-T5S2 -001-238-000
26-U5S10 -006-276-000
26-U5S15 -001-476-000
26-T582 -001-115-000
26-T9S1-000-000-000
26-U5S15 -001-380-000
26-S8S9 -012-003-000
26-V7S2 -002-008-000
26-U5814-001-269-000

WHITELONIS LEONARD, deceased & FLORENCE, deceased
SCIBEK JOAN & THERESA M

SCIBEK JOAN & THERESA M

HIGHLAND WOODS INC

LANDERS THOMAS F, deceased & ALICE M, deceased
MARSH JOHN & AMY WAY

MARSH JOHN & AMY WAY

HLIVA CHARLES J & MARY ANNA, BOTH DECEASED
IANNACCONE ROBERT L, deceased

MALONEY JAMIE & AMOURT MELISSA

RANEK JOSEPH JR & DARLENE
CONNER-FIGUEROA LUIS

PASKO JOSEPH

SIZZLIN PROPERTIES LLC

BRISLIN CHARLES, deceased, JOHN, deceased, THOMAS,
deceased, & ELLEN, deceased

RASMUS JOAN

ULOZAS JOSEPH & BEVERLY

ULOZAS JOSEPH & BEVERLY

BARROW BERNIE

READING COMPANY

HEAL HOME OWNERS INC

KLUCK DANIEL J

TAUSENDFERUNBT SANDRA A & WILLIAM F HERWIG
BOVENZI LARRY & EILEEN

CUENCA MIRIAM S ALBANO

DE OCAMPO JUANITO M &

HK PARTNERS

HK PARTNERS

HK PARTNERS

HK PARTNERS

HUNSICKER WALTER & DORIS

JOHNSON PHILLIP J AND MARIA

JOHNSON PHILLIP J AND MARIA

LEAHY WILLIAM J AND DAWN L

LEE ENUJUNG A

RHEE TAIHI & SUNNY

LIGSAY SONIA P AND RICARTE S

LOPEZ CONRADO D JR & JULIE CHRISTINE ANG
MANGONA PIA AND GILBERT O

OBEND STANLEY OMERENMA AND
STOCKTON WATER ASSOCIATION

XIA BING

YANOSKI ROBERT P

ZOVKO ZORAN

CONRADO LOPEZ JR & MICHELLE NATIVIDAD

44 BILBOW LN

251 HILLSIDE AVE
257 HILLSIDE AVE
HIGHLAND RD

545 FRONT ST
NORTH ST

NORTH ST

BUCK MOUNTAIN RD
C COLETTE DR

129 SKYWAY LN

1268 WOODHAVEN DR
117 RED MAPLE LN
PRESCOTT RD
SPRING ST

44 HIGH ST

12 SLOPE ST

2698 S MAIN ST

2694 S MAIN ST

3132 S MAIN ST
NEAR

68 S REGENT ST

40 MAIN ST

39 MAIN ST

LAUREL VALLEY DR
BUTTONBUSH LN
BUTTONBUSH LN
SUNSET BLVD
SUNSET BLVD
SUNSET BLVD
SUNSET BLVD

16 VALMONT PARK
LAUREL VLY
LAUREL VLY
MOUNTAIN VIEW DR
CRNR MTN VIEW DR
CRNR HUCKLEBERRY LN
BIG MOUNTAIN
LAUREL VALLEY RD
SCOTS PINE LN

[NO LOCATION]
STOCKTON
HONEYSUCKLE DR
REAR ALTER ST

320 COAL ST
CAMELLIA LN

$2,380.93
$1,757.08
$1,483.69
$1,229.93
$1,508.49
$1,775.01
$1,428.70
$1,401.12
$1,637.10
$2,000.66
$1,853.98
$2,143.34
$1,105.58
$1,121.31

$1,553.50
$926.50
$1,256.86
$1,726.39
$1,820.24
$2,694.37
$2,315.82
$404.24
$2,019.99
$1,917.53
$1,438.86
$1,884.23
$1,511.06
$1,668.06
$1,476.31
$1,490.34
$1,494.05
$2,148.25
$2,192.95
$1,447.24
$1,733.99
$1,534.32
$1,672.25
$2,084.07
$1,672.80
$1,338.69
$1,602.75
$1,633.08
$1,335.94
$1,458.67
$2,146.13

SOLD - $35000 #253

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1229.93 #48

SOLD - $40000 #348

SOLD - $1775.01 #185

SOLD - $1428.70 #185

SOLD - $1401.12 #287

SOLD - $1637.10 #287

SOLD - $2000.66 #84

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $2500 #293

SOLD - $1121.31 #84

SOLD - $7500 #287

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $6000 #369

SOLD - $9500 #90

SOLD - $5000 #359

SOLD - $22000 #44

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
Removed - paid

SOLD - $20000 #43

SOLD - $1917.53 #224

SOLD - 1438.86 #224

SOLD - 1884.23 #224

SOLD - 3500 #58

SOLD - 3000 #58

SOLD - $5500 #58

SOLD - $6000 #58

SOLD - $1494.05 #12

SOLD - $2148.25 #24

SOLD - $2192.95 #224

SOLD - $8500 #84

SOLD - $3500 #224

Removed

SOLD - $5000 #224

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1338.69 #224

SOLD - $1602.75 #380

SOLD - $1633.08 #224

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
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A

| B

C

D

F

G

| 92 [18-1153
|93 |18-1117

16-0970

|95 [18-0829

16-0983
20-1078
20-1013
20-1015

|100[20-1098

|101[20-1070

20-1120

|103[20-1084

|104[20-1180

19-1333

|10s[20-1305

|107[20-1299

19-1471

|109[19-1458

|110[18-1409

|111[20-1374

|112[20-1370

113|19-1577

[114/19-1591

|115[20-1464

|116[18-1533

|117[16-1370

|116[20-1508

|119/18-1596

18-1603

[121/19-1714

|122[20-1597

17-1741

|12[18-1686

|12s[19-1814

19-1833

|127{19-1836

|12s(17-1857

|129(19-1884

18-1775

|131[18-4100

|132[19-1889

19-1941

|134[18-1825

|135[20-1860

18-1925
19-2048

HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HAZLE TWP WARD 2
HUGHESTOWN BORO
HUNTINGTON TWP
HUNTINGTON TWP
JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

JENKINS TWP

KINGSTON TWP

KINGSTON TWP

KINGSTON TWP

LAFLIN BORO

LAKE TWP

LAKE TWP

LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 5
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7
LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7
LEHMAN TWP

LUZERNE BORO WARD 1
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4

NANTICOKE CITY WARD 6
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8

NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11
NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11
NESCOPECK BORO
NEWPORT TWP WARD 1
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2

26-U5815-001-266-000
26-U5811-001-039-000
26-U5810-007-352-000
26-U585-008-021-000
26-U5812-001-049-000
26-U5S10 -013-385-000
26-T581 -001-519-000
26-T581 -001-602-000
26-U5S13 -001-163-000
26-U5S10 -002-228-000
26-U5S14 -001-335-000
26-U5S12 -001-067-000
26-U5S6 -009-039-000
28-E12NW1-007-067-000
30-K2 -00A-14A-000
30-K2 -00A-010-000
33-F11510-001-017-000
33-F11 -T01-188-000
33-F11S5A-003-VAR-000
33-F11S5 -003-010-000
33-F11510-001-17A-000
35-E8S5 -001-033-000
35-E9 -00A-009-008
35-E8S5 -008-018-000
36-F1158-003-003-000
37-E4-00A-010-072
37-E4 -00A-010-029
38-H8S5-008-002-000
38-H8S4-004-006-000
38-G9S2 -004-026-000
38-G9S1 -005-04A-000
40-F7S3-000-VAR-000
41-GINE2-009-009-000
42-J7TNE3 -002-03A-000
42-JTNW1 -006-015-000
42-JTNW1 -012-004-000

42-J7SE1-038-015-000
42-K781 -011-017-000
42-K781-011-024-000
42-K781-010-014-000

42-K751-016-008-000
42-J7SW2 -015-023-000
42-J7SW2-007-012-000
43-P3SW3 -008-12A-000
46-K752-009-002-000
46-K6S1 -010-031-000

BRUCAL ELENA S & GREGORIO M.
CARIAGA MILANEE T

HARVEY MARION & EDMUND D CALLAGHAN
GRANT BRANDEAUX

GRANDEZA ROBERTO & CYNTHIA

HALL HOWARD W & MAUREEN B

IMASA DERRICK AND ABIGAIL

RAMIREZ RYAN AND CHRISTY S

TAMAYO KRISTEEN S

VILLAMARIA KATHLEEN A

WANG HANGUANG &

WEN NA

WOZNIAK JOHN

MARINO ALGRETA BREYMEIR

BONHAM JAMES K JR

DAGGETT WILLIAM B

AMD LAND DEVELOPMENT LLC

KELLY CHARLES

MANGANIELLO CHARLES M

GREATER PITTSTON MEDICAL CENTER
WHISPERING WOODS HOMEOWNERS ASSOC
BATT FRANCES

WICKHAM DAWNA

PISANESCHI JOAN

TRUSKOWSKI RUTH E, deceased & JANET T MOLL
AGOSTINELLI FRANCINE

OLSON CHRISTOPHER D & STEPHANIE L

MORTON DOLLIE R, deceased & KISHA M REDGUARD

STUBBLEBINE HOWARD W, deceased & MELISSA
TAYLOR DAMON

KOENIG JAMES

EDWARDS EDWARD H, deceased & JEAN, deceased
MURRAY GEORGE, deceased & MARY
GRABOWSKI WILLIAM & LYNN

MAY RICHARD

SALLOGA HENRY

SKIPKOSKI, JOSEPH F, deceased & CELESTING R, deceased

MILLER CHARLES E
CP MANAGEMENT LLC
SHANAHAN ERIN

LUCERO, JESUS SALMERON & JOSEFINA GONZALEZ

MOGUEL

SELETSKI GEORGE R

BELNOSKI JOHN R, deceased & LINDA, deceased
MILLER BENJAMIN & FAHRINGER RUTH A
CARTER JAMES, deceased & CAROL, deceased
GRASSI DANA

BUTTERNUT LN

E PEBBLE BEACH DR
LAUREL VLY

PINE VALLEY LN

SPICE BUSH DR

LAUREL VLY
APPALACHIAN WAY
MOUNTAINS VIEW RD
SWEET BIRCH LN
LAUREL VALLEY RD
CASHAW DR
BUTTONBUSH LN
SPYGLASS DR

10 DICKENSON ST

420 SHICKSHINNY LAKE RD
MARSH CREEK RD
WESTMINSTER

188 HEATHER HIGHLANDS
HIGHLAND HLS
YATESVILLE RD
WESTMINSTER RD

PARK AVE

37 CARDINAL CIR

MT AIRY TER

38 LAURELWOOD RD

139 EVERGREEN ESTATES
146 EVERGREEN ESTATES DR
208 CHESTNUT ST

38 EAST 6TH ST

50 SNYDER ST

88 THOMAS ST

ROUTE 115

260-262 BENNETT ST
LOOMIS ST

24 KEECH ST

153 HONEY POT ST

164 E RIDGE ST
246 FRONT ST
224 FRONT ST
332 FRONT ST

203-205 PHILLIPS ST
210 S HANOVER ST
143 W CHURCH ST
VINE ST

12 W KIRMAR AVE
43 NEWPORT ST

$1,591.59
$1,439.55
$2,088.88
$2,122.75
$2,094.84
$1,438.53
$1,333.92
$1,365.38
$1,199.59
$1,204.03
$1,278.32
$1,334.03
$1,351.25
$1,633.11
$1,432.71
$1,196.21
$1,237.23
$1,442.16
$1,971.85
$1,144.39
$1,506.55
$1,265.93
$1,439.69
$1,101.87
$3,500.08
$2,063.47
$1,479.69
$1,809.70
$1,877.01
$1,577.53
$1,201.53
$1,877.67
$2,132.63
$1,332.39
$1,828.01
$2,031.99

$4,079.98
$1,720.93
$2,148.52
$2,216.01

$1,566.92
$2,122.83
$1,896.88
$2,079.30
$1,952.38
$1,570.43

SOLD - $1591.59 #224

SOLD - $3500 #224

SOLD - $2088.88 #224

SOLD - $3000 #155

SOLD - $2094.84 #224

SOLD - $1438.53 #224

SOLD - $1333.92 #224

SOLD - $5500 #224

SOLD - $1199.59 #224

SOLD - $2500 #84

SOLD - $1278.32 #224

SOLD - 1334.03 #224

SOLD - $1351.25 #224

SOLD - $25000 #2

SOLD - $2500 #84

SOLD - $1196.21 #4

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $1265.93 #99

SOLD - $3500 #99

SOLD - $1101.87

SOLD - $25000 #131

SOLD - $2063.47 #325

SOLD - $1479.69 #325

SOLD - $38000 #206

SOLD - $18000 #15

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $16000 #314

SOLD - $26000 #258

SOLD - $43000 #2

SOLD - $1332.39 #181

SOLD - $15000 #27

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $21000 #345

SOLD - $16500 #27

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $25000 #314

SOLD - $6500 #281
SOLD - $25000 #387
SOLD - $18000 #172
SOLD - $2500 #167
SOLD - $44000 #2
SOLD - $7500 #86
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A

| B

C

F

|136[19-2051

19-2045

|140[18-1943

|141[20-1955

20-1941

|143/18-1976

|142[19-2092

18-2017

|146[19-2119

|147{18-2029

19-2156

|14(18-2088

|150[18-2090

l151[19-2193

|152(18-2093

|153(16-1780

|154[19-2201

|15s[19-2197

|156[19-2271

|1s7[19-2268

|1ss(19-2220

|1s9[18-2132

19-2234

|161[19-2235

|162[19-2229

19-2231

|164[19-2232

l16s(19-2224

19-2225

167[19-2228

|16s[19-2257

18-2186

|170[19-2272

|11[19-2276

19-2279

|13[18-2262

|174[19-2353

18-2303

|176[18-2334

|177{19-2474

19-2477

|179[18-2367

|180[19-2526

19-2527

|162[18-2428

17-2503

NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NEWPORT TWP WARD 2
NUANGOLA BORO
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 4
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 7
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 12

PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13
PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13
PLYMOUTH TWP

PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLYMOUTH TWP
PLAINS TWP WARD 1
PLAINS TWP WARD 1
PLAINS TWP WARD 1
PLAINS TWP WARD 7
PLAINS TWP WARD 10
PITTSTON TWP
PITTSTON TWP
ROSS TWP

ROSS TWP

ROSS TWP

SALEM TWP

SALEM TWP

SALEM TWP

SALEM TWP

46-K6S1 -013-011-000
46-K6S1 -007-009-000
46-K6S1-009-015-000
46-K6S2 -008-003-000
46-K6S2 -001-40B-000
47-L8S1-008-41A-000
48-H8SE2 -011-009-000
48-H8SE2-008-03A-000
48-H8SE4 -010-012-000
48-H8SE4-016-008-000
48-I18NW2 -025-015-000
48-H8SE4-035-010-000
48-H8SE4-035-10A-000
48-H8SW3 -028-005-000
48-H8SW3-006-014-000
48-H8SW3-005-003-000

48-H8SW3 -016-05A-000
48-H8SW3 -013-009-000
49-18S2 -002-011-000

49-I8S1A -014-008-000
49-17S1A -002-02B-000
49-17S1A-002-006-000
49-17S2 -012-25A-000
49-17S2 -012-29A-000
49-17S2 -012-021-000
49-17S2 -012-023-000
49-17S2 -012-024-000
49-17S2 -004-003-000
49-17S2 -004-006-000
49-17S2 -012-020-000
49-17S87 -001-001-000
49-1852-002-026-000
50-F10S1 -001-006-000
50-F10S4 -008-002-000
50-F10SE4-001-022-000
50-G10NE4-012-019-000
50-G11 -T02-401-000
51-D13S1-T03-009-000
51-E12SW1-013-012-000
54-G5 -00A-005-001
54-G5 -00A-05D-000
54-F4S1-008-035-000
55-P4NW2 -003-014-000
55-P4NW2 -003-015-000
55-L4S1-003-002-000
55-P3SW1-006-018-000

TAYLOR DAMON

YETTER LINDSAY
GERONIMO OSMAN

146 E MAIN LLC

POTTER WILLAM WARREN III
BONITA JAMES T, deceased

LIVINGSTONE BRIAN G

SINKEWICZ JEROME J, deceased

COSTA TILLIE MRS

GRULLON RAFAEL DEJESUS JR

WALSKI ALEXANDER J JR

CHABALA JOSEPH, deceased & ANNA BILLY, deceased

BLAKESLEE DAVID, deceased

HAZLETT WILLIAM H IV

PASHINSKI CHARLES, deceased & VERNA, deceased

HOYT, MARCELLA & OSCAR A.

JARENSKI JOSEPH S, deceased & MARY E PEHALA, deceased

JEFFREY JON PAUL

HILLARD JOANNE P, deceased & PETER J JR

KUPREVICH MARY EVELYN, deceased & RITA SHIRLEY

BOLTON, deceased

LISOWSKI ALICE, deceased & PETER, deceased

HUNTER JEREMY & LAWRENCE D HODGES

BANKOVICH JEFFREY, deceased

BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased

BANKOVICH JEFFREY, deceased
BANKOVICH JEFFREY, deceased

BANKOVICH JEFFREY, deceased

BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased
BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased
BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased
BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased
CALLAHAN MARIA JANE, deceased

KEOWN DANIEL B & SANDRA LEE

PISANESCHI SHIRLEY

TIMEK MARTIN

BAUT JACOB S

ZIMMERMAN BRIDGETT
CAPWELL RAY & GERALDINE

GLENNON MICHAEL, deceased & BEVERLY, deceased

BAKER CLARA
BAKER CLARA MOORE
BARDO FRED & RITA

FICCA ROBERT M & MARGARET
FICCA ROBERT M & MARGARET B

FUTOMA JOHN, deceased & KATHLEEN, deceased

LYNCH STEPHEN D

118 W MAIN ST

76 COAL ST

40 ROCK ST

146 E MAIN ST

64 ARCH ST

5113 NUANGOLA RD
127 PIERCE ST

107 WASHINGTON AVE
145 COMMERCIAL LN
300-302 POWELL ST
15 RANSOM LN

149 CENTER AVE

147 CENTER ST

185 ORCHARD ST
REYNOLDS ST

460 FOURTH ST

557 LEE ST
193 FRANKLIN ST
76 SMITH ST

MILTON AVE

12 ADJ PEOPLE ST
361 E POPLAR ST
25 ALLAN ST

47 ALLAN ST

57 ALLAN ST

51-53 E ALLAN ST
27 ALLAN ST

Route 00011
HOUSEMAN ST

59 ALLAN ST

14 MILL ST

6 SMITH ROW

303 FARRELL ST

1 BIRCH AVE

50 MITCHELL ST
51 ADJ S MAIN ST
401 E MOUNTAIN RIDGE MHP
223 EVERGREEN RD
17 REAR POOLE ST
174 PALL RD

PALL RD

OLIVER RD

TOW PATH LN
TOW PATH LN
CARSON ST

501 E FRONT ST

$1,395.59
$2,401.13
$1,791.01
$1,693.31
$1,385.03
$1,392.40
$1,786.46
$2,266.66
$1,749.96
$2,465.31
$1,576.05
$1,447.01
$1,694.25
$4,481.45
$1,446.14
$2,296.45

$1,524.10
$1,307.79
$1,882.46

$2,011.63
$1,817.65
$1,966.17
$3,322.08
$2,489.21
$2,462.33
$3,340.58
$2,409.39
$2,184.97
$2,361.64
$2,569.92
$2,928.73
$1,957.04
$1,664.80
$2,184.35
$2,108.23
$1,582.81
$1,376.43
$1,674.90
$2,101.72
$1,580.26
$1,471.82
$1,589.21
$1,624.61
$2,095.45
$1,997.63
$2,274.45

SOLD - $6500 #112

SOLD - $15000 #27

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $15500 #251

SOLD - $16000 #27

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
Removed

SOLD - $13000 #150

SOLD - $13000 #70

SOLD - $8500 #361

SOLD - $29000 #27

SOLD - $17000 #27

SOLD - $15500 #27

Removed - Bankruptcy

SOLD - $1446.14 #74

SOLD - $9500 #162

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
Removed

SOLD - $9500 #165

SOLD - $4000 #321

SOLD - $4500 #312

SOLD - $12500 #85

SOLD - $6500 #287

SOLD - $2489.21 #90

SOLD - $30000 #251

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $5000 #236

SOLD - $5500 #236

SOLD - $2569.92 #251

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
Removed

SOLD - $43000 #376

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $2500 #19

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $1471.82 #377

SOLD -$1589.21 #123

Removed - Bankruptcy

Removed - Bankruptcy

SOLD - $2500 #59

SOLD - $37000 #391
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A

C

D

F

|200]
|201|
|202|
|203]
|204]
|20|
|206|
|207|
|208|
|209]

J2to

&4
|18s|
|186|
[187]

e

| 18|
|190]
191]
|192]
|193]
|194]
|195|
|196|
[197]
|198|

IE

19-2530
20-2394
18-2514
19-2696
18-2622

19-2671
19-2831
19-2832
19-2833
19-2883
20-2819
18-3008
16-2524
18-3099
19-3149
18-3291
19-3337
19-3321
18-3366
19-3405
19-3427
20-3277
19-3470
19-3465
19-3521
17-3520
19-3654

|211[19-3759

|212]
|213]
|214]
|215]
|216]
[217]
|218]
|21]

220

221

19-3699
18-3678
19-3829
18-3865
18-3896
19-3927
19-3931
18-3927
20-3736
19-3966

SALEM TWP
SALEM TWP
SLOCUM TWP
UNION TWP

UNION TWP

UNION TWP

WEST WYOMING BORO
WEST WYOMING BORO
WEST WYOMING BORO
WILKES-BARRE TWP
HAZLETON CITY WARD 6
HAZLETON CITY WARD 9
HAZLETON CITY WARD 12
HAZLETON CITY WARD 13
HAZLETON CITY WARD 14
PITTSTON CITY WARD 10
WILKES-BARRE WARD 1
WILKES-BARRE WARD 1
WILKES-BARRE WARD 2
WILKES-BARRE WARD 3
WILKES-BARRE WARD 6
WILKES-BARRE WARD 6
WILKES-BARRE WARD 8
WILKES-BARRE WARD 8
WILKES-BARRE WARD 10
WILKES-BARRE WARD 12
WILKES-BARRE WARD 13
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 14
WILKES-BARRE WARD 15
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 16
WILKES-BARRE WARD 17
WILKES-BARRE WARD 17
WILKES-BARRE WARD 17
WILKES-BARRE WARD 17
WILKES-BARRE WARD 20

55-P4S1-003-01A-000
55-P3NW2 -008-003-000
57-L781-003-001-000
61-K4S1 -013-012-000
61-14S1-002-007-000

61-14S1-002-15A-000
66-E10SE2-004-016-000
66-E10SE2-004-017-000
66-F10S4 -004-004-000
69-110NW3-010-013-000
71-T8SW42-007-11A-000
71-T8§NW43-004-01B-000
71-T7SE22-007-05A-000
71-T§NW12-006-014-000
71-T8NE42-003-009-000
72-E11SE2-018-009-000
73-H10NW4-026-016-000
73-H10NW2-018-025-000
73-H10SW2-009-013-000
73-H10SW4-019-007-000
73-H10SW4-010-033-000
73-110NW1-013-021-000
73-H9SE3 -037-027-000
73-HISE3 -006-002-000
73-H9SE2 -025-10D-000
73-H9SE4-021-014-000
73-19NE2-040-005-000
73-19SE1 -003-018-000
73-19NE3 -021-022-000
73-19NE3-021-023-000
73-19NW?2 -024-020-000
73-H10NW3-020-009-000
73-H10NW4-021-005-000
73-H10NE1-009-005-000
73-H10NE1-009-21B-000
73-H10NE1-014-002-000
73-H10NE1-021-009-000
73-G10SE2-022-007-000

CRAGLE, ISAAC, deceased & GENINEVA, deceased
MORGAN DARLENE E

MASKALUK, CAROL & CAROL & CAROL BELMONT
THUMA PAUL & DOLORES

TOLSMA NORMAN & JAMIE L

BANKOVICH, JEFFREY J., deceased

PREBOLA EDWARD A

PREBOLA EDWARD A

TAYLOR DAMON

MALONEY THOMAS, deceased & PAULINE, deceased
CASTEL SIMON

THOMPSON JOHN J, deceased, & MARY A, deceased
YOUNES, LYLA

BISSOL JOSEPH P, deceased & VALERIE C

TINEO RENAN

WATKINS DAVID

302 NORTH MAIN LLC

ABREU CESAR O JR

CORBETT MARGARET MARY, deceased
NAPERKOWSKI LYNDA

ALIYAH HOLDINGS LLC

HOWELL STEPHEN & PEARL KASTENDIECK
CROSS NORMAN M ETAL

MURGAI REBECCA & VIKRAM

MANTIONE SALVATORE JR

CAPOZZI FRANK J & KRISANDRA L STRAUSSER
RYAN, KEVIN

DOMINICK OLIVER

PENNINGTON BRIAN & DAVID ATKINSON
MYERS CHARLES

TEEL HARRY, deceased

GRANT BRANDEAUX

DAVIS WILLIAM J, deceased & DOROTHY M, deceased
BUZINSKI GERALD, deceased

DAVIS CHARLES B

PETROSKI PAUL SR, deceased

HERCULES INVESTMENTS & RECOVERY LLC
VIKING ENTERPRISES LLC

179 MAIN ST

E EIGHTH ST

NUANGOLA RD

10 MCKENDREE RD

97 HUNLOCK HARVEYVILLE RD

61-63 HUNLOCK - HARVEYVILLE RD
SIXTH ST

SIXTH ST

HAMILTON

85-87 HEMLOCK ST

97 S CHURCH ST

132 W 6TH ST

590 MCKINLEY ST
REAR CHURCH ST
THOMPSON ST

310 TEDRICK ST

302 N MAIN ST

1 AUBURN ST

45 PENN ST

29 N SHERMAN ST

39 S FULTON ST
HILLSIDE ST

235 S WASHINGTON ST
JEFFERSON LN

W NORTHAMPTON ST
168-170 ACADEMY ST
330-332 S HANCOCK ST
34 CUMMISKEY ST

29 ESSEX LN

31 ESSEX LN

171 CARLISLE ST

561 N PENN AVE-SHEID LN
119-121 WYOMING ST
29 KADO ST

801 SCOTT ST

103-105 GEORGE AVE
52 JAY ST

221-223 E MAIN ST

$1,754.69
$1,314.80
$1,796.30
$1,418.05
$2,323.09

$2,408.28
$2,167.33
$2,046.75
$1,296.55
$1,631.23
$1,172.28
$1,890.64
$2,482.59
$1,629.67
$1,467.35
$2,018.72
$2,281.64
$1,426.78
$2,345.72
$1,923.45
$1,614.41
$1,143.77
$2,882.18
$1,831.56
$2,628.49
$3,284.60
$1,276.23
$2,457.89
$2,027.84
$2,192.94
$2,148.57
$2,061.27
$2,228.17
$1,666.51
$1,874.68
$3,378.58
$1,486.48
$2,944.67

SOLD - $4500 #48

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD- $1796.30 #53

SOLD - $48000 #226

SOLD - $31000 #226

SOLD - $6000 #362

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $2046.75 #326

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $10000 #306

Removed

SOLD - $38000 #373

SOLD - $7000 #288

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $3500 #240

SOLD - $2018.72 #312

SOLD - $40000 #394

SOLD - $8500 #256

SOLD - $56000 #387

SOLD - $22000 #47

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY
Removed

NO BID - OFF TO REPOSITORY

SOLD - $34000 #251

SOLD - $4000 #311

SOLD - $5000 #259

SOLD - $30000 #49

Removed

SOLD - $20000 #27

SOLD - $26000 #96

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $70000 #295

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
SOLD - $51000 #161

SOLD - $70000 #136

FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY

Removed
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